Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 8 May, 2019 11:15 AM
To: Dylan Chew
Subject: RE: Accident involving Vehicle SJIW 5679U& SKH 434) ON 24/05/2018
Attachments: Accident involving Vehicle SJIW 5679U& SKH 434) ON 24/05/2018
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS
Dear Sir/Madam,

Accident involving Vehicle SJW 5679U& SKH 434]J ON 24/05/2018
We refer to the above matter

Kindly check and advise if your client is still interested to pursue with his third-party claim against our principal M/s
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd.

Please respond and let us know within 10 days from the date of this e-mail. Otherwise, we shall have no other option
but to submit our report to our principal for closure.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 20 August, 2018 11:30 AM

To: 'Dylan Chew' <autoworxhouse@hotmail.com>

Cc: Admin-Yuki Ho <admin@supreme.sg>

Subject: RE: Accident involving Vehicle SJW 5679U& SKH 434) ON 24/05/2018

WTHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,



Accident involving Vehicle SJW 5679U& SKH 434) ON 24/05/2018
We refer to the above matter

We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. There is no conclusive evidence to substantiate
either's parties version. Enclosed herewith a copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal.

Our insured driver reported that your client swerved into his lane.
Meanwhile, kindly forward to us with any evidence (if any) to support your claim

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 8625.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Dylan Chew [mailto:autoworxhouse@hotmail.com]

Sent: Monday, 18 June, 2018 5:09 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin-Yuki Ho <admin@supreme.sg>

Subject: Re: Accident involving Vehicle SJW 5679U& SKH 434J ON 24/05/2018

Hi Vivian,
Thank you for the GIA report.

cc. Yuki for your necessary action.

Best regards,
Dylan Chew

On 18/6/2018 5:02 PM, Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) wrote:

WTHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,



Accident involving Vehicle SJW 5679U& SKH 434) ON 24/05/2018
We refer to the above matter

We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. There is no conclusive evidence to
substantiate either's parties version. Enclosed herewith a copy of our insured's accident report for your
perusal.

Our insured driver reported that your client swerved into his lane.
Meanwhile, kindly forward to us with any evidence (if any) to support your claim

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at her DID 6841
8625.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the
sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of
liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



