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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 June 2018 10:50 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); motorclaims.sg@fwd.com; assignments

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: SLQ1767H - 3RD PARTY CLAIM - AIG - TP (SLB6838H) FWD - SURVEY - 11/06/2018 

- 1000 HRS (FWD Ref: 1201800006915)

Attachments: RE: SLQ1767H - 3RD PARTY CLAIM - AIG - TP (SLB6838H) FWD 

Hi Josey, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

We were informed by TP workshop that claimant convert to OD claim. (refer to the enclosed email) 

 

In view of the above, We will proceed to close file and submit our without prejudice report to your office 

 

Thank You. 

 

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 11 June 2018 10:18 AM 

To: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SLQ1767H - 3RD PARTY CLAIM - AIG - TP (SLB6838H) FWD - SURVEY - 11/06/2018 - 1000 HRS (FWD Ref: 

1201800006915) 

 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 
BEST REGARDS, 

G.Nivitha | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com [mailto:motorclaims.sg@fwd.com]  

Sent: Friday, 8 June 2018 4:35 PM 

To: AsherSng@lkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com; admin-

d@lkkauto.com 

Subject: FW: SLQ1767H - 3RD PARTY CLAIM - AIG - TP (SLB6838H) FWD - SURVEY - 11/06/2018 - 1000 HRS (FWD Ref: 
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1201800006915) 

Importance: High 

 

Hi LKK team, 

 

Please refer to the email below and liaise with TP repairer for survey arrangement. 

 

Attached is the repair estimate, TP GIA report. 

 

Please explore direct settlement with TP repairer and create the case in Merimen. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Kind Regards 

Josey Loh 

Executive, Claims 

  

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. 

6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986 

 

T    (65) 6727 5872 

E    josey.loh@fwd.com 

W   fwd.com.sg 

 

 

 
 

 

 

From: Kuan Wei Loong [mailto:weiloong@motorimage.net]  

Sent: Friday, 8 June, 2018 2:19 PM 

To: Motor Claims SG - SG Common 

Cc: Sayedinah; Daniel Jude; Daniel Lim 

Subject: SLQ1767H - 3RD PARTY CLAIM - AIG - TP (SLB6838H) FWD - SURVEY - 11/06/2018 - 1000 HRS  

Importance: High 

 

Hi Claims Team, 

 

Kindly arrange survey of the above mentioned vehicle. 

 

Thank You, 

 

Best Regards 

Kuan Wei Loong 

Claims Advisor 

Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 
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19 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh Singapore 319255 

HP:90903323 / 86113195 

Email:weiloong@motorimage.net 

Website:www.tanchong.com :: www.motorimage.net 
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