
1

Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 June 2018 9:58 AM

To: Kuan Wei Loong; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Sayedinah; Daniel Jude; Daniel Lim; Admin-D (LKKAuto); Admin A; SUR

Subject: RE: SLQ1767H - 3RD PARTY CLAIM - AIG - TP (SLB6838H) FWD 

Attachments: SLQ1767H GIA REPORTED (2).pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

By copy to Asher. 

 

For your information and necessary action please. 

 

Thank you. 

 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Kuan Wei Loong [mailto:weiloong@motorimage.net]  

Sent: Tuesday, 19 June 2018 9:42 AM 

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Sayedinah <sayedinah@motorimage.net>; Daniel Jude <danieljude@motorimage.net>; Daniel Lim 

<daniellim@motorimage.net> 

Subject: SLQ1767H - 3RD PARTY CLAIM - AIG - TP (SLB6838H) FWD  

Importance: High 

 

Hi LKK, 

 

Attached for your reference. 

 

Customer requested change OD claims to expedite repair.  

 

Thank You, 

 

Best Regards 

Kuan Wei Loong 

Claims Advisor 
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Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 

19 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh Singapore 319255 

HP:90903323 / 86113195 

Email:weiloong@motorimage.net 

Website:www.tanchong.com :: www.motorimage.net 

 

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: 11 June, 2018 10:17 AM 

To: Kuan Wei Loong <weiloong@motorimage.net> 

Subject: RE: SLQ1767H - 3RD PARTY CLAIM - AIG - TP (SLB6838H) FWD - SURVEY - 11/06/2018 - 1000 HRS  

 

Dear Kuan, 

 

Noted, with thanks. 

 
BEST REGARDS, 

G.Nivitha | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Kuan Wei Loong [mailto:weiloong@motorimage.net]  

Sent: Monday, 11 June 2018 10:10 AM 

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SLQ1767H - 3RD PARTY CLAIM - AIG - TP (SLB6838H) FWD - SURVEY - 11/06/2018 - 1000 HRS  

Importance: High 

 

Hi Nivitha, 

 

Our insured vehicle number is SLQ1767H . 

 

Vehicle is in the workshop waiting for survey only. 

 

Thank You, 

 

Best Regards 

Kuan Wei Loong 

Claims Advisor 

Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 

19 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh Singapore 319255 

HP:90903323 / 86113195 

Email:weiloong@motorimage.net 

Website:www.tanchong.com :: www.motorimage.net 

 

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: 11 June, 2018 10:06 AM 

To: Kuan Wei Loong <weiloong@motorimage.net> 

Subject: SLQ1767H - 3RD PARTY CLAIM - AIG - TP (SLB6838H) FWD - SURVEY - 11/06/2018 - 1000 HRS (FWD Ref: 

1201800006915) 
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Dear Kuan, 

 

Is the vehicle SLB 6838H in the workshop? 

 
BEST REGARDS, 

G.Nivitha | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

 
 

 
Disclaimer: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee you may not copy, forward, disclose or use 
any part of this message. If you have received this message in error, please delete it and all copies from your system and notify the sender 
immediately by return e-mail. Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be timely, secure, error-free or virus-free. The sender does not 
accept liability for any errors or omissions.  


