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M5 @ FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited (oReg No 1950001060 GST Reg Mo. M2-0001676-9
6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (65) 6222 2311 Fax (65)6222 3547

Clalms & Mater Underwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877
Tel. (65) 6507 3848 Fax: (65) 6507 3849
www.msfirstcapital.com,sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
08-06-2018 Our Ref No. D18004607MFSH
07-06-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC8390K Third Party Vehicle. SLR5043G

2 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 2 #01-18 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
MELODY CHIN

68420051/ 0 Fax No. 67410510

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

N-51 AUTOMOTIVE PTE

LTD Attention. NIL
NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
MAY CHUA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

A Memter of [EEERNE] NsuRancE GrOUP




6/11/2018

Claim Workflow System

Job Sheet (/ClaimWS/Surveyor/JobSheet/241285) )~ | PRIDocuments Close

PRI Header Details

Claimant
Claim No D18004607MFSH Policy No D-18088936MFSH S.No & 1 & N-51 AUT
Name
oo ET'SI AUTOMOTIVE FIE f""":_" 2 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 2 #01-18 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
ante  * e - :g:'::’:ct Mobile: 0 , Phone: 68420051 , Fax: 67410510
2ot = Emailld: HUIXIN@N51.COM.SG

CHIN) Details
Our LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS Instructions WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM -
Surveyor PTE LTD To Surveyor
Insured COMFORT Insured i

TRANSPORTATION PTE . SHC8390K Vehicle SLR5043G
Name Vehicle No

LTD No
PRI Surveyor Surveyor
Recieved 08-06-2018 07:37:11 PM Appointed 11-06-2018 08:36:48 AM Accept 11-06-2018 1
Date Date Date

Survey Report Upload
SMrveyor Surveyor :3:::
Inspection | ' 11-06-2018 ! Choose File
Date *: i, Report Date l*leport ~ |
Vehicle Particulars
Make Please Select Make ¥ | Model  Please Select Model v Year Select Year v
Chasis No I Engine No I Mileage I
Cubic
Color I Capacity l
Multiple Documents Upload
Ublllo”a‘d‘ ‘M‘ultiple Documents
File Name Action

Surveyor Job Remarks

Remarks

I

Save

https://ficlaims.com:9001/ClaimWS/Surveyar/Details/241285
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Shirlex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 September 2018 9:58 AM

To: MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; 'Claim Workflow System'
Cc: "SUR"; 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)'; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004607MFSH/1

Attachments: SLR 5043G - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear May,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SLR 5043G.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 11 June 2018 10:00 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; "SUR" <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004607MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 11 June 2018 8:37 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004607MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,
Admin Team
Claim Workflow System



Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



| ) 74 74

= Consultanits
F Pte Ltd Company Registration No. 193607198R

51 UBLAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D18004607MFSH Date: 12 September 2018

Our Ref: CS/FCI18010570/Nsd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SLR 5043G .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 11/06/2018 at the premises of M/s N-51 Automotive Pte Ltd and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S$ 10,350.00
Revised Estimate Amount (Lump Sum) : 88 5.600.00
“Check” Items Amount +85

Market Value : S8

LTA Reimbursement Value : S8

Nett Value : S$

Description of Damage: p——

The vehicle sustained damages

at the front n/s & n/s front portion. - @ front

offside

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 5 Days

Yours faithfully,
Muhammad Nazril
Automotive Assessor



MB3HH18074605-03 / Ajax Mars Plo Lid - Bukil Marah
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 08/06/2018 15:31
SUBMITTED BY: Ellzabelh Lee

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correclly the detalls of the accident to speed up the claims process.

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Informalion provided must be as trulhful and accurale as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow Insurance companies lo
repudiate policy abllity. D —

4, The Issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is nol an admission of palicy liabllity on the part of the insurance companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation,

6. This report will be forwarded by the Insurers of the GIA Records Management Cenlre established by the General Insurance Associalion of Singapore (GlA) for
archiving and that coples of this report willl, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties.

7. By the lodgement of this report to the Insurers, you hereby consent lo the archiving of this report al the centre and lo copies of the reporl being made available
aforesald.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 08/06/2018 15:31
Date Of Accident 07/06/2018 14:55
Exact Location Of Accident JUNC OF YISHUN AVE 7 AND AVE 8
Counlry/State of Loss SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
Vehicle Registration Number SLR5043G
Insured!Rolicyh’oidar '
Name Of Registered Owner GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD
Co Reg No 201617200G
Email Address NOEMAIL
Mobile Phone No (LOCAL) +65-96603709
Alternative Phone No OFFICE-96603709
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer HONDA
Model VEZEL
E;ae‘céf:égic:’s;{cr which vehicle was being used at HIRE AND REWARD
Are you claiming under your own Insurance policy NO
for repair to your vehicle?
If No, Please state action to be taken THIRD PARTY
Vehicle Category PRIVATE HIRE
Insurance Company
Name of Insurance Company MSIG INSURANCE (SINGAPQORE) PTE, LTD,
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE
Fleet Policy NO
Policy Number A29069766MKF
Cover Note Number
Driver
Name of Driver SALLEH BIN AMIR
NRIC No S1161792A
Date Of Birth 30/07/1956
Occupation QUTDOOR
Date Of Driving Pass 09/12/1980
Driving Experience 37 YEARS AND 5 MONTHS
Gender MALE
Mobile Number (LOCAL) +65-96603709
Fax Number
Contact Number
EMail Address NOEMAIL

Page 1of 22



‘Address NA
Postcode
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OTHER - HIRER

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle s

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

= e SR

General Information of the Accident S e s iy T
:-i'ﬂ'::',".r‘m:-m'.:—rﬂ'-‘-'uﬁ.' S N s AN i 3 o e F = ete= gt
Type Of Accident SIDE SWIPE

Wealther Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface

|
|
I

-
P
1

Other Information

i3 5 A R Ry P By e

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?
Number of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES
I have been approached by unknown person(s)

soliciting/offering accident claims assistance. HO
Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 8
Passenger 1 NAME:  P1

GENDER: : MALE

Passenger 2 NAME: . P2

GENDER: : FEMALE
Details of Police Action -

Was the accldent reported to the police? NO
If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

ON THE DATE AND TIME MENTIONED, | WAS DRIVING AT THE SAID LOCATION, AND WHEN WAS MAKING A RIGHT
TURN IN TO YISHUN AVE 8. ON THE EXTREME RIGHT LANE, VEHICLE B, COMING FROM MY LEFT, CUT IN TO MY PATH
AND COLLIDED ON TO THE POINT LEFT PORTION OF MY VEHICLE. THIS INCIDENT WAS CAPTURED BY THE IN-CAR
VIDEO WATCH WAS SUBMITTED TO THE N51 WORKSHOP. THE DRIVER OF VEHICLE B, DID NOT GIVE HIS
PARTICULARS AND | WAS ADVISED BY HIM TO LODGE A REPORT. STATEMENT WAS READ TO ME AND |
ACKNOWLEDGE IT. Upen collision, vehicle was pushed and the right rear wheel went up the curb,

A’tt’éféhn'j_ar’ii(s')" SRR | e o ! At ; &

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? YES

Remarks/ Reasons: YES-RETRIEVING
Was there any audio recorded? NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
Vehicle Registration Number SHC8390K
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour HYUNDAI/I40/BLUE
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Category TAXI
Name of Driver UNKNOWN DRIVER
NRIC/Passport Number

Page 2 of 22



Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name

Nalure Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 3 of 22
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Email Attachment Pg. 1

Elizabeth Lee

From: Chin Hui Xin <huixin@n51.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 11 June 2018 5:18 PM

To: group@ajaxmars.com

Subject: Fwd: SLR5043G ACCIENT ON 07/06/2018 @ 14:55HRS ALONG JUNC OF YISHUN AVE 7
AND AVE 8

Attachments: WhatsApp Image 2018-06-08 at 4.44.48 PM jpeg; WhatsApp Image 2018-06-08 at

4.44.49 PM (1) jpeg; WhatsApp Image 2018-06-08 at 4.44.49 PM jpeg

Upon collision, vehicle was pushed and the right rear wheel went up the curb.

Regards,

Melody Chin

N-51 Automotive Pte Ltd
Office : 6842 0051

Fax : 6741 0510

www.n51.com.sg
i =

---------- Forwarded message ------—--

From: Chin Hui Xin <huixin@n51.com.sg>

Date: Fri, Jun 8, 2018 at 5:13 PM

Subject: Fwd: SLR5043G ACCIENT ON 07/06/2018 @ 14:55HRS ALONG JUNC OF YISHUN AVE 7 AND
AVE 8

To: group @ ajaxmars.com

Upon collision, vehicle was pushed and the right rear wheel went up the curb.

Regards,

Melody Chin

N-51 Automotive Pte Ltd
Office : 6842 0051

Page 6 of 22



"&K-57 auTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

K aki Bukit AutoHub

» 1 .
NA2- kX
3 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-17 / #01-18 / Heavy Vehicle #01-08 / Spray Painting #02-27 AR2 <Al [ Y =1 x /)
Singapore 417921 Tel No. : +65 6842 0051 Fax No. : +65 6741 0510 [ A | b
E-Mail : sales@n31.com.sg \J

Company Reg. No. : 200616038C =0 i Lan

GST Registration No. : 200616038C [P

GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD
18 SIN MING LANE #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY
SINGAPORE 573960

Contact : 66550005 96603709
ESTIMATE
Repair Code : CLM14576
Date in: 07/06/2018
Vehicle Num. : SLR5043G
Model : HONDA VEZEL 1.5X HYBRID AT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD
Chassis/Eng# : RU31234471/LEB5934485

Parts and Labour Assesment

Description of part Qty Unit Price Amount
FRONT BUMPER | 801.00~ 5 1V go1.00
FRONT BUMPER LH FOGLAMP | 27500 & 75 Y7500
FRONT BUMPER LH FOGLAMP COVER | as00 R 7R 440
FRONT BUMPER LOWER GARNISH | 433.00 -~ S L 43300
FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER L/R 2 25.00 < 0! 50.00
FRONT LH ABS SENSOR I 16s.00 X ! Preoiims
FRONT LH FENDER 1 387.00 < #at 37,00
FRONT LH FENDER 'HYBRID' EMBLEM | 95.00 et 95.00
FRONT LH FENDER ARCH GARNISH | 187.00 ~ ot 187.00
FRONT LH FENDER INNER SHIELD l 125.00 & U~ 13500
FRONT LH HEADLAMP | 1785.00 }—"Ce(<1,785.00
FRONT LH HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET | 35.00 £-2rade 3500
FRONT LH HEADLAMP SIDE BRACKET ! 500 X " 500K
FRONT LH KNUCKLE ARM i 2500 8700t 24500
FRONT LH KNUCKLE ARM BEARING | 13500 LM 13500
FRONT LH LINKAGE l ss00 ZX M 50K
FRONT LH LOWER ARM I 300 ¥ bt 37100
FRONT LH LOWER BALL JOINT I 98.00 + bMl 9800
c oL3

*#4 This is a computer-generated document which requires no signature.***




“@\-57 auTomoTIvE PTE LTD

K aki Bukit AutoHub
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-17/ #01-18 / Heavy Vehicle #01-08 / Spray Painting #02-27
Singapore 417921 Tel No. : +65 6842 0051 Fax No. : +65 6741 0510

E-Mail : sales@n51.com.sg
Company Reg. No. : 200616038C
G ST Registration No. : 200616038C

GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD

18 SIN MING LANE #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY

SINGAPORE 573960

Contact : 66550005 96603709

#*% This is a computer-generated document which requires no signature. ***

ESTIMATE
Repair Code : CLM14576
Date in : 07/06/2018
Vehicle Num. : SLR5043G
Model : HONDA VEZEL 1.5X HYBRID AT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD
Chassis/Eng# . RU31234471/LEB5934485
FRONT LH SHOCK ABSORBER y L9 | 301004 < V% 30100
FRONT LH SHOCK ABSORBER RUBBER 57t 2 I 55.00}’! M 5500k
FRONT LH SHOCK ABSORBER SPONGE | 30.00 )( w _3erfio X
FRONT LH SHOCK ABSORBER TOP MOUNTING | 45.00 st‘- )5410/ W
FRONT LH SPORT RIM ! 813.00 #% «fL = 81300
# FRONT LH STEERING TIE ROD | 89.00 45  89.00X
-+ FRONT LH STEERING TIE ROD END I 7200 L3RR 72,00 % S
FRONT LH WHEEL HUB 1 221.00 ?/h-h - 221.00
FRONT UPPER GRILLE l-gga7.A) 35100 P 351.00%
% FRONT UPPER GRILLE 'H' LOGO EMBLEM #24;‘ 160540 25.00 < 25.00% V1
REAR RH SPORT RIM 1767 ?_’_f'/"_ §13.00 r’fﬂ e 813,00
+# REAR RH WHEEL BEARING | 275.00 ‘ﬁf—éﬂ/tf‘- 275.00X NI
Subtotal before discount 8.402.00
Percentage discount  20% 1,680.40
Sub-total 1 6,721.60
FRONT BUMPER CLIPS - SET 1 50.00 7l - 5000 5
~¥ FRONT GRILLE CLIPS - SET 1 30.00 < 30.00 X
FRONT LH FENDER ARCH GARNISH CLIPS - SET ! 50.00 Al . ;w‘(e:;\
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“@R-51 AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

Kaki Bukit AutoHub

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-17 /#01-18 / Heavy Vehicle #01-08 / Spray Painting #02-27
Singapore 417921 Tel No. : +65 6842 0051 Fax No. : +65 6741 0510
E-Mail : sales@n51.com.sg

Company Reg. No. : 200616038C

LK Auio Gonaultants . - 01y
the Repairer of the following:

© To resurvey belore/aller spray painling

© To display damaged pars) durin: resurvey

« Parts pricas are subjett o confirmaticn

* Third party survey is on 8 "Without Prejudice” basis
 No llegal modificabons) i sowed

GST Registration No. : 200616038C
« Supplementary iem{s) must be resurveyed and
is subject to final approval from insurance Company

GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD Acnosiadged iy Repsins
18 SIN MING LANE #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY g‘:;‘“"
SINGAPORE 573960
Contact : 66550005 96603709
ESTIMATE
Repair Code : CLM14576
Date in : 07/06/2018
Vehicle Num. : SLR5043G
Model : HONDA VEZEL 1.5X HYBRID AT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD
Chassis/Eng# : RU31234471/LEB5934485
FRONT LH FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIPS - SET _ | 50.00 -‘f‘/,u.t : m@
» FRONT LH TYRE Y0 ! 300,00 <=4 300,005 V¢
» REAR RH TYRE I 300.00 FHer 300.007 VL
Subtotal before discount @ 780.00
Percentage discount 0% 0.00
Sub-total 2 780.00
Parts-total 7,501.60
LABOUR oD
To remove, reinstall electrical wiring harness, check lighting. (to FR) 60.00° 25
To remove, change front suspension parts, absorber, lower arm, knuckle arm, wheel bearing, bearing 250:00" e

hub. drive shaft, anti-roll bar, top-arm and steering rack and pinion. ~

To road test driving, check and resetting wheel alignments system. (P / 4 126-600 )"
To re-spray painting on the change bodyparts. repair portion, and where consistent to the accident. !3"--" 2 .Bﬂﬁfﬂﬁ“é
Tc.) provide labour, workmanship to change the above damaged bodyparts, repair, re-construct and re- . 60000 Yoo
align body structure, body alignments and damaged consistent to the accident. —~
To apply anti-rust chemical on repaired and replaced panel. N D 20607 .
Labour Total V1OV L2707 1 910.00
Parts & Labour Total 9,411.60
0% O
##% This is a computer-generated document which requires no signature.***
page 3 100 705 L ,r'
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&K-51 AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

Kaki Bukit Autohub

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-17 / #01-18 /Heavy Vehicle #01-08 / Spray Painting #02-27
Singapore 417921

Tel No. : +65 6842 0051 Fax No.:+65 6741 0510

E-Mail : sales@n51.com.sg

Company Reg. No. : 200616038C

GST Registration No. : 200616038C

Grab Rentals Pte Ltd Repair Code: CLM14576

18 SIN MING LANE #01-18 Date in: 07/06/2018

MIDVIEW CITY Vehicle No.: SLR5043G

Singapore 573960 Model: HONDA VEZEL 1.5X HYBRID AT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD

Chassis/Eng#: RU31234471/LEB5934485
Contact: 66550005 96603709

SUPPLEMANTARY ITEMS
No Description Of Parts Qty Unit Price Amount
1 [Steering Rack & Pinion .~ “fick- A L 1 $ 1,173.00| S  1,173.00
e oo
Sub total before discount: S 1,173.00
Percentage discount 20%: S 234.60
Sub-total : S 938.40
Parts Total: $ 938.40
rali_‘ Cyyl [,_f Gl -4 C“’-(f—c_'/- ﬁ/(}' 4/:'1 fc/)ﬁ-b";-— 2 7’/@‘6’ 4’4
sl $ g0 Sl @ TE6 -

- — = ) ) ki -~
: - . L;T"”f;-j 79 I LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
b (5,62 0 —— /0 Y the Repairer of the following:
N ~ 75 » To resurvey before/after spray painting
) < « To display damaged part(s) during resurvey
. PRONe, » Parts prices are subject 1o confirmation
B D) / — e * Third party survey is on a "Without Prejudice” basis
B 5 -_,.-é'ﬂdf AV R | * Noegal mosifications) is allowed
} . ¢ - i * Supplementary item(s) must be resurveyed and
My is subject to final approval from Insurance Company

~ £ 5300 | /e Acknowiedged by Reparer
\‘\-._..__ ay ) e ”mt
. Date:




' Vdl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl B B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI18010570/Nsd3e2
neseesenssetmoncoreasssrr o e ||[HHHIINEN
Code: FCI2
A Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 8390K Veh. Inspected SLR 5043G
Policy No. D-18088936MFSH Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18004607MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  MAY CHUA Assign Date 11/06/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA VEZEL c.c 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. RU31234471 Colour BROWN
Odometer - Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [215/60 R16 DUNLOP 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLOP 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLOP 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre [215/60 R16 DUNLOP 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT N/S AND N/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  07/06/2018 ]Inspection Date 11/06/2018
Survey held at N-51 AUTOMOTIVE PL
2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2
#01-17 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
SINGAPORE 417921
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLR 5043G
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (g” (Sl)
IREPLACEMENT OF PARTS

1|FRONT BUMPER SCRATCHED 801.00 801.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LH FOGLAMP BROKEN 275.00 275.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LH FOGLAMP COVER BROKEN 45.00 45.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GARNISH SCRATCHED 433.00 433.00
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER /R @%$25.00 NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1]FRONT LH ABS SENSOR NOT NECESSARY 165.00 -
1|FRONT LH FENDER DENTED 387.00 387.00
1]FRONT LH FENDER 'HYBRID' EMBLEM NECESSARY 95.00 95.00
1]FRONT LH FENDER ARCH GARNISH SCRATCHED 187.00 187.00
1|FRONT LH FENDER INNER SHIELD DEFORMED 125.00 125.00
1|FRONT LH HEADLAMP CRACKED 1,785.00 1,785.00
1|FRONT LH HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET CRACKED 35.00 35.00
1|FRONT LH HEADLAMP SIDE BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 25.00
1|FRONT LH KNUCKLE ARM BENT 24500 245.00
1|FRONT LH KNUCKLE ARM BEARING NECESSARY 135.00 135.00
1|FRONT LH LINKAGE NOT NECESSARY 55.00
1|FRONT LH LOWER ARM BENT 371.00 371.00
1|FRONT LH LOWER BALL JOINT BENT 98.00 98.00
1|FRONT LH SHOCK ABSORBER BENT 301.00 301.00
1|FRONT LH SHOCK ABSORBER RUBBER SERVICEABLE 55.00 -
1|FRONT LH SHOCK ABSORBER SPONGE SERVICEABLE 30.00 -
1|FRONT LH SHOCK ABSORBER TOP MOUNTING SERVICEABLE 45.00 -
1|FRONT LH SPORT RIM SCRATCHED 813.00 813.00
1|FRONT LH STEERING TIE ROD SERVICEABLE 89.00 -
1|FRONT LH STEERING TIE ROD END SERVICEABLE 72.00 -
1|FRONT LH WHEEL HUB NECESSARY 221.00 221.00
1|FRONT UPPER GRILLE SERVICEABLE 351.00 -
1|FRONT UPPER GRILLE 'H" LOGO EMBLEM SERVICEABLE 25.00 B
1|REAR RH SPORT RIM SCRATCHED 813.00 813.00
1|FRONT RH WHEEL BEARING SERVICEABLE 275.00 -
1|STEERING RACJ & PINION SERVICEABLE 1,173.00 B

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18010570/Nsd3e2
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Estimate By | Our Adjusted
n arts Condition
Qty Description of P n Workshop () ($)
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,915.00 -1,443.00
7,660.00 5,772.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 30.00
1|SET FRONT GRILLE CLIPS (SN) SERVICEABLE 30.00
1|SET FRONT LH FENDER ARCH GARNISH CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 20.00
1|FRONT LH FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 30.00
1|FRONT LH TYRE (SN) SERVICEABLE 300.00 -
1|REAR RH TYRE (SN) SERVICEABLE 300.00 -
780.00 80.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE, REINSTALL ELECTRICAL WIRING 60.00 20.00
HARNESS, CHECK LIGHTING (TO FR)
TO REMOVE, CHANGE FRONT SUSPENSION PARTS, 250.00 200.00
ABSORBER, LOWER ARM, KNUCKLE ARM, WHEEL
BEARING, BEARING HUB, DRIVE SHAFT, ANTI-ROLL BAR,
TOP-ARM AND STEERING RACK AND PINION.,
TO ROAD TEST DRIVING, CHECK AND RESETTING 120.00 80.00
WHEEL ALIGNMENTS SYSTEM.
TO RE-SPRAY PAINTING ON THE CHANGE BODY PARTS, 800.00 500.00
REPAIR PORTION, AND WHERE CONSISTENT TO THE
ACCIDENT
TO PROVIDE LABOUR, WORKMANSHIP TO CHANGE THE 600.00 400.00
ABOVE DAMAGED BODYPARTS, REPAIR, RE-
CONSTRUCT AND RE-ALIGN BODY STRUCTURE, BODY
ALIGNMENTS AND DAMAGED CONSISTENT TO THE
ACCIDENT
TO APPLY ANTI-RUST CHEMICAL ON REPAIRED AND NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
REPLACED PANEL.
1,910.00 1,200.00
GRAND TOTAL 10,350.00 7,052.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 5,600.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18010570/Nsd3e2
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Licensed Appraiser




