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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park_ Singapore 408833

TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg Mo 199607188R GST Reg. No 15-9607158-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Das Exparts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 078808

Raf CCa/ICTITB010471/Keb3

Date : 08-08-2018

R0

Code . CTI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBD 5631B Veh, Inspected GT 7227D
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 0B/06/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Frant Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  30/05/2018 Inspection Date 11/06/2018
Survey held at GUAN MOTOR WORKS
176 SIN MING DRIVE
#02-03
SIN MING AUTOCARE
SINGAFPORE 575721
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BiIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
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Yourref: To Be Advised
Qur ref; CC&/CTLIROI04T 1 /Keh3

The Motar Claims Department

M/s CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (8) FTELTD
Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.

Wi refer to the above matter,

Date: 12062018

GT7227D

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on_11.06.2018
al the premises of M/s Guan Motor Works _and have the following to report:-

3,834.25

1.905.85

301.65

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5%
Revised Estimate Amount ' 5%
“Check” Nlems Amount . 8%
Market Value - 8%
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%
Nett Value ;35

Deseription of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
Rear Pormon

Comments/Present Status:
Damuges Consistent
Estimated normal period [or repairs: 5  days

Yours faithfully,

KENNETH KONG
Licensed Appraiser
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e
GUAN MOTOR WORKS

Business Regn. Mo. 08102600E
|76 Sin Ming Drive #02-03 Sin Ming Autocare Singapore 575721 Tel: 6453 6111 Fax: 6453 8292 H/P- 9742 6003

CHUA HUP KIAT ELECTRICAL & AIR CONDITIONING ENGINE

pe.
pc.
pe.
pc.
pc.
pe.
pe.

Lok Pk =—

(7-06-2018

REPAIR ESTIMATE FOR TOYOTA HIACE - GT 7227 D

Tail gate M"‘r 1LI85.00
Tail gate inner lock 7220000 x
LH Rear lamp assy CIP} 268 40 —
Rear bumper lascia 3154 50 —
Rear bumper beam 917 232,00 —
Rear end panel - outer B 37790
Rear end panel - inner 402.20 -7
S 3.059.00
Less 25% T64.75

TS 2,294.25

Check electrical wirings 10.00 Zef

Repair damages & renew parts 700,00 Seogy

Spray paint on affected portions BO0.00 {2_-&(
S 3.834.25

oy Arthossy
C/f, 87
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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping com>

Sent: Thursday, 21 June 2018 11:54 AM

Te: Shu Pel (LKKAuta)

Cc Admin A; Asher Sng (LEKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invelving GBD56318 (O : CT| - SNM1BD02807C02) and

GT7227D (TP : LKK REF -CC&/CT118010471/eb3) on 30.05.2018

Dear Shu Pel,
Insured yet to report

Aegards,

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive

Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pie. Lid.
3 Anson Aoad #18-00 Springleat Tower

Singapore 070909

Cao. Reg, No, 200208384E

DID B3B8E1T1

Fax: 62247175

Email: boonsan.chongidsg.cntmping com

Websie www.sgontaping.com

Diycimimer

Thix message is confidentiol! its contents do not constitute o commitment by Ching Taiping Insuronce (Singtpotel Pre. Lid except where provided for
n @ whTTen agreement between you and Ching Toiping insurance (Singopore) Pre. Lrd. Any unauthorired disclosure, use or dissemungbon, either in
wihore or portaal & profnbted. if you ore not the intended recigient of the mestage, phease natify the sender immediately

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) [mallto:shupel@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 21 June, 2018 9:29 AM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@®sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@l|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBD56318 (0 : CTI - SNM18D02S07C02) and GT7227D (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI1R010471/eb3) on 30.05.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Boon Sen,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action,

Thank you.

Best Regardy,
Shu Pei] Admin



LKK Auto Consultants Pe Lid
Phone: 6366-D055 | email: phapei@lkksuto com | fas: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Chong Boon Sen [mailto boonsen.chong@sg cntaiping.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 13 June 2018 9:18 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto] <shupei@|kkauto.com>
Ce: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto coms; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBD5631B (O : CT1 - SNM18D02907C02) and GT72270 (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/CT118010471/eb3) on 30.05.2018

Dear LKK,

Insured yet to report

Regards,

hong Boan
Claims Execuiive
Claims

China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Lid.
2 Anson Road #16-00 Springlaal Tower

Singapore 078909

Co. Aag. No. 20020B384E

DID: 63896171

Fax: 62247175

Email: boonsen.chong@sa.critaiping.com
Waebsite: www.s0.cntaiping.com

Draciaimes

This messmge & confidentiol, (ts confents da not constitube o commitment by Ching Taiping Insorance (Singopore) Pre. Lid except where provided for
in @ written agreement between pou and Chine Teiping insurance [Singopare] Ple Lid. Any unoutharised disckrsure, wie or disseminalion. @ither in
whole or parnal i profibired, if you are not the infended recipient of the message, pleass notify the sender immediatoly

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto com|

Sent: Tuesday, 12 June, 2018 6:59 PM

To: Claims Dept of CT <claimsdept@sg. cntaiping com:»

Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen chong@sg cntaiping coms>; Lucas Lee <lucas lee@sg cntaiping.com=; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invelving GBDS6318 (01 : CT1 - SNM18D02907C02) and GT7227D (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/CTI1B010471/eb3) on 30.05.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Boon Sen,

We refer to the above matter.

We had Inspected TP vehicle GT 7227D at M/s Guan Motor Works,

Enclosed for your perusal is:

. Estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice



Kindly advice whether Insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our
necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phome; 6I66-0055 | email; Yipel@ikksyte com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51. Pava Ubl Industrial Park. Libl Avenue 1, #0225 | 5(£08933]

From: Lucas Lee [mailto:lucas lee entaiping.com

Sent: Monday, 11 June 2018 4:44 PM

To: Shu Pei |LKKAuto) <shupel@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBD56318 (01 ; CTI - SNM1BD02907C02) and GT7227D (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/CTI18010471/eb3) on 30.05.2018

Dear Sirs,
Kindly refer to the above attachment.

Case Handler: Chong Boon Sen

Lucas Lee

Claims Dapartmant {Molor)

China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleal Tower Singapore 072808
Dhrect (65) 6389 6181

Fax [B65) 6222 7175

Email: lucas | Lerlaiping.com

Website: www. sg.enfaiping.com

Uty

héqq-uuin it

Diselaimer

Thin miessaee o confiddential ity contenis do sof constitile o conmitment by Cliina Taiping Iswrance (Singapore] Pre. Ll exiept
wlvirre prowvaded for iy o werieren ag peemens bepesen ol amd © ke Tatpong siranee i) Pre. Led, Ay iranrhoeized dixelosure,
s o ahissemmimatiom, either i whale o partial. s peohibiied. I yon are not the iniended recipient of the message. please netify. the
vertidier immrediantih



From: Shu Pei [LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto carm)|

Sent: Friday, 8 June, 2018 3:45 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Angie Foo; Chong Boon Sen; Admin A; Asher Sng (LKEKAuto)

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBD56318 (O : CTI - TBA) and GT72270 (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/CTI1B010471/eb3) on 30.05.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Hoon Sen,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case from M/s Guan Motor Works.

Enclosed [or your perusal is:
TP GIA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkksuto cony | fax: 6741-4108
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security cloud service.
For more information please visit http//www svmanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www symanteceloud com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http:/fwww symunteccloud.con
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Our Reference: SNM18D02967/C01/1
Date . 11 JUNE 2018 via Ordinary & Registered Mail

HOW SHUTTER AND ALUMINIUM WORKS PTE LTD
30 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 3

#07-08/10 EMPIRE TECHNO CENTRE

SINGAPORE 417819

Dear Sir / Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD56318B AND GT7227D ON 30 MAY 2018
ALONG ANG MO KIO AVE 5

We refer to the abovementioned accident.

Please be advised that the third party vehicle, GTT227D . is filing a third party property claim
against your vehicle

We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd, to administer the said claim on our behalf and
they will soon contact you for more information about the accident. Kindly render your assistance
and co-operation accordingly

We undersiand that you or your driver has not filed an accident report within 24 hours as per Motor Claims
Framewaork We would urge you to comply with the condition to file your accident report with your vehicle
(whether damaged or not) to us IMMEDIATELY through LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd or any of our

authorized workshops. You may log onto our website www.sg cntaiping com for location of the respective

workshops.

We regret to advice that we and/or LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd will not be handling the third party claim
and your NO CLAIM DISCOUNT will be penalized upon renewal of your policy If you fail to comply
with the condition of reporting

Yours truly,
Claims Department

(This s a computer generaled lefter and no signafure s required. )

CC - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Aftn ASHER
Ref CCECTIBO0471/EBI
Contact No = 68416051
via Email ASHER BLEKAUTO.COM

CC - Agant - (ANO138A) - LEE HIANG CHEAK JEROME

FOZLKKDSANR-2013
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S| LUBLAVE 1, 501-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (b65) 62563561 FAX : (0651 62564315

Our Ref: CCA/CTTIR010471/Keb3
22™ June 2018

HOW SHUTTER AND ALUMINIUM WORKS PTE LTD
30 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 3 #07-09/10

EMPIRE TECHNO CENTRE

SINGAPORE 417819

Dear Sir /f Madam.
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 56318 AND GT 7227D ON 30.05.2018 ALONG ANG MO

KIO AVE 5 IN FRONT OF ITE BUS STOP

We, LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid has been appointed 1o act on the behalfl of your insurer,
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD 1o settle a THIRD PARTY claim
against you for an accident which happened on the above-mentioned date and location.

Our record shows that to date, you/your driver have not reported the accident to us. We would
appreciate it if you could urgemly file a repont at any of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE
SINGAPORE PTE LTD Authorized workshops/reporting centre. You may refer (o vour
Certificate of Insurance for the list of the reporting centre,

Please note you had been notified via post from CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE
SINGAPORE PTE LTD dated 11 JUNE 2018

To enable us to look into the matter immediately, please let us hear from you within seven (7)
days from date of this letter (by 30 JUNE 2018),

Please be reminded that in accordance with the terms and conditions under your policy. failure of
compliance, our principal M/s CIIINA TAIPING INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD
reserves the right to repudiate liahility.

If you need further assistance or clarifications, please contact the undersigned.

Yours faithfully,

-

Asher Sng

Case Handler

Tel : 6841 6051

Fax: 6741 4108

Email : AsherSng @lkkauto.com

L China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
(Maotor Claims Dept)



gl/87/2013 @553 gvalales

Anson Road

3 !

#16-00 Springleaf Towel
Singapore 079909

Agmn: Motor Claims Dept

Dear Siv Madam

CCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO.GT 7227D & GBD S6318 ALONG

A
A 0 51N

UT“M

We understand that wuuemmsmﬂufmﬁllﬂwﬁdc.

"We wish to inform you that my/our vehicle

290 have been completed repuirs 10

my/ous satisfaction by M/s GUAN MOTOR WORKS. /We therefore propose 10 claim from

your a8 follows.

L Coat of Repairs
2z Loss of Uye/Rental (S$100 x 5 days)

LTA Search Fee/GIA Repons

LF3 ]

TOTAL

Pleuse lel us have your reply soonest possible.

Thank you.

5% 2,500.00
s§  500.00

S8 7.45

58 _ 300745



Asher Sna {LKKAutu!

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 1 August 2018 2:06 PM

To: AGNES@HOWSHUTTER.COM.SG

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 56318 AND GT 7227D ON 30/05/2018

Our Ref: CCG/CTIIRDID471/Keb3

01 AUG 2018

HOW SHUTTER AND ALUMINIUM WORK PTE LTD

Dear Sirr/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 56318 AND GT 7227D ON 30/05/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid to resolve
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Hased on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed 1o
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

I"lease call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler
D10 6841 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

IEmail: ashersnpf@|lkkauto.com

ce. China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



03/07/2019 B8E:22 64538292 PaGE

ON

1/We, b viaf AR EECTRVAL Y, MR conarhioning ‘"{Eﬂﬁ thind party claimant™) of 144 Jueonl
Wil 3161 75 #1111 Swepme. 640749 (arddrest), owner of __ QT 33230 (vehi. le
no.) hereby authorize __ Gudn Mmofort wokey _ _ __("the workshop™)
o act for me with respeel to my claim for repair custs andfor rental amlor loss of use
(“claum’) for my vehicle no. GT#ILY0 (hwt was damaged pursuamt 10 the aecident which
sccurved on 3a[S (208 (date) alony Auy mo o AES iy FRANT oF L1E RS 3o
‘location) involving vehicle no/m Gen siile {“the scedent™).

[ funber authoruze the workahop tu serle oy above mentioned claim in a manner tha 'ley
deem fit and the workshop is funher authonized 1o receive payment further 1o setilemen of
my claim with payrient cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.

I further ackoowledye thal uny settlement tbe workshop may resch on my behalf 1§ 60 8
withou prejudice and wathout admisgion of liability basis insofar as the drivet/ownerinnwers

uf e ather velucle/s is concerned.

Signed by “the third party claimam”
(with chop if applicable)



Jiale

goliey Ro = OMCVIF1558351702 cisim Ne | SHWIEDOZ307C02
claimant 1 CHUA ACF ¥IAT ELSTTRICAL 4 RIR CCHLITIOHING ERGINE
Aponint :  %53,000.00

singapore -nllars ToTes Thousand Snly

I/We sgres o accept Toe above mancioned smcuat to ke paid o mafue in full &
final settlement of ail claims, costs & 4istursamants for injurles / damages
gustaimed by nme/fus through an excident invoiving

riaimant vehicle dpo. ¢ &T 72270
=peured Yahicie Ho. 1 GRD 56318

pate of luss : INSPS/AUle
Piace of Aocident . ANS MO ETO AVE 5 [W FRONT OF ITB BUE-8T0P

't CONBIDERARTION cf tha paymenT Made o Eesun pf the afcrementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING IHSURANCE {SINGRPOEE) FIE. LTD., 1/He agrea absolucely L2
discharzge CEINA TRIPING TNSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. ama/er

Insured Narme i MOW SHITTER R0 ALUMINIUN WORHS PTE LTD
priver MName 3 CHFEY LI

#rom all clpims, presert Or futuse in respact of all lasa, dnjury o damage
auscaines by ma/us arising c¢ut 9% the #aid mccloant,

T ackrowladge that Chis peymans is wads without admission of liabiliry on the
part of CHINA TAIFING [NSURANCE (SINGAFOURE! PTE. LTD.

(1) Slebal Sum 55 3,000.90

PORL i s s 6 s % om o= o= o5 @ . . 3% 3,C00.00

e we « LT/ 2

w1 G247

Claimant Wama i

Signature x
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GUAN MOTOR WORKS

Husiness Regn. Noe 081026-00E
|76 Sin Ming Drive #02-03 Sin Ming Autocare Singapore 575721 Tel: 6453 6111 H/P: 9742 6003

esrs _CHUA HUP KIAT ELECTRICAL & AIR CONDITIONING ENGI

nvoice No: 4 906

Date . 29-08-2018

TOYOTA HIACE - GT 7227 D

T b e e ——

Lump sum for total repair cost inclusive of spare parts
and labour charges.
5  2.500)00

Dollars Two thousand Five hundred only.

E.&O.E.




Enguire Vehicle & Owner Information ( Vehicle No. GBD56318 As At 30 May 2018/

15:45:00)

LawFirm Saarch Datalls

Senn Beason Inzuance clalm in relation to traffic accident

Liw Firm Case No. TCEWITLTAZODLE GM

Current Owngr Detalls

O 1D Type Company

Cwner Ok 201418821R

rwrner Mame: HOW SHUTTER AND ALUMINIUM WORKS PTELTD.

Heglstored Address Type:  Private Resldential (Cordo Aot or House)/ Shopplng / Office Compleces
Registered Block/House .,

Mo

Registored Siregt Mame:  KAKIBUKITROAD 3

Registered Uinlt Mo kQ7-0%

Hagistered Bullaing Name: EMPIRE TECHNOCENTRE

Reglstered Postal Code: 417819

Curresnt Viehicie Detulls

Vahicle MNa. GBOSsAE
wake Deccription/Model: MITSUBISHI/ CANTER FEADIBRISDEE ICBU]
Insurance Company Name:CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE SINGARORE) PYELTD




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #07-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL 6258 3567 FAX B256 4315

Reg. No: 19860T198R GST Reg. No. 18-8607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Dos Exparts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00

Rel : CC&/ICTI18010471/Kdb3qg2

SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079809 Hate pzos20e M"M‘"‘Il“m II N
Code : CTI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBOD 56318 Veh. Inspected GT 72270
Policy No. DMCVSN1555351702 Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. SNM1BDO02907C02 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 08/0B/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA HIACE c.c 2086
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2000
Chassis No. LH1620012660 Colour BLUE
Odometer 471916 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Medification NIL
General GOOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185 R14X8 MICHELIN 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre |185R14X8 MICHELIN 5mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[185 R14X8 MICHELIN 4 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |1B5R14X8 MICHELIN 4 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 30/052018 Inspection Date 11/06/2018
Survey held at GUAN MOTOR WORKS
176 SIN MING DRIVE
#02-03
SIN MING AUTOCARE
SINGAPORE §75721
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408832
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg Mo 199607198R GST Reg Mo. 19-9807198-R Page No. 1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GT 7227D
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Worksh W?Sﬂl "ﬁ;
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|TAIL GATE DENTED / WARPED 1,185.00 1,185.00
1| TAIL GATE INNER LOCK TO REPAIR SEE 208.00
LABOUR
1|LH REAR LAMP ASSY CRACKED 298 40 288 40
1|REAR BUMPER FASCIA BUCKLED 354 .50 354.50
1|REAR BUMPER BEAM DISTORTED 23200 232 .00
1|REAR END PANEL -OUTER BUCKLED 377.80 377.80
1|REAR END PANEL -INNER TO REPAIR SEE 402 20
LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -784.75 611.085
2,294 25 1,835.85
1| TAILGATE GLASS RUBBER (ADDITIONAL) (50%) (SN) NECESSARY 24920 124 60
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -62.30
186.90 124 B0
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1| TAILGATE '‘BOKM/H' STICKER (SN)ADDITIONAL) NECESSARY 10.00 10.00
10.00 10.00
LABOUR
CHECK ELECTRICAL WIRINGS 40.00 20.00
REPAIR DAMAGES & RENEW PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE T00.00 600.00
REPAIR OF TAIL GATE INNER LOCK AND REAR END
PANEL -INNER
SPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED PORTIONS 800.00 450.00
REMOVE AND REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN. (ADDITIONAL) 100.00 60.00
TUFF KOTE ON AFFECTED PORTIONS. (ADDITIONAL) BO.0D 50.00
1,720.00 1,180.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,211.15 3,160.45
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,500.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CCG/CTI18010471/Kdb3g2
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Page No.2 of 2
Report Ref No. CCB/CTI18010471/Kdb3g2

Y iva

KONG SENG CHEONG
Licensed Appralser

DISCLAIWER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Rapon s mads solery for the ies ani Densi of mae Client namea on 1hae fron) pags of 1nis Repan.




