11:2072019 Claim Portal

<« RE: Re:TP MANDATE |A < S8MO0JHD>

Type
© Question

Message
Hi. third party repairer did not provide cost price as they are not under the panel workshop for AXA. Kindly

let us have your mandate after review the matter. Thank you. Hsiao Tong - 20 Nov 2019

https:ivp smartclaims.axa.com.sgickaim-poral/htmlfindex-vendor-service-roguests htmi# service-requestsiview-message/ ?serviceRequesthNumbe,... - 11



11730520158 Claim Portal

<« Re:TP MANDATE IA < SBMOOJHD>

Type
© Question

Message
we will not agree to the cost of repair if it is not on cost price.

hitps:/ivp.smartclaims.axa.com. sglclaim-portal’htmlfindex-vendor-service-requests_htmi#/service-requestsiview-message/TserviceRequestNumbe... 11



120612019 Claim Portal

<« RE: Re:TP MANDATE IA < SSMOOJHD>

Type
© Question

Message
Hi, we have spoken to third party repairer on the above. For an amicable settlement, third party repairer

proposed to less 10% on the total repair cost. The breakdown of third party propose is as follows: - 1)Cost of
Repair (w/GST):$20,330.00{$19,000.00 + 7%GST) + 2.)Loss of Rentaliw/GST) (16days x $100.00): $1,712.00
+ 3}, LTA/GIA Search Fee: $2.00 = TOTAL: $22,044.00. Kindly let us have your instruction after review the
matter. Thanks. Hsiao Tong - 06 Dec 2019

https://vp smariclaims axa.com.sg/claim-porta Phtmifindex-vendor-service-requests. himi#/service-requestsiview-message/ 7serviceRequestNumbe... 11



Hsiao Tnna (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAUto)

Sent: Friday, 6 December 2013 917 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: New message for service request 50133, vehicle number SIEB545R

] [20411/12 2:01 PM *TAN Jas*Meassagewes will not agree to the cost of repairifitis noton CHT !‘321 Iggm'
caaiprme s

[j TP wksp called in. F'ropused RC less 10% (L'Sum $19K) CHT fgflﬁgfm

Message RIEA Ha we have spnken to third party repalrer on the above. For an amicable
\settiement third party repairer proposed to less 10% on the total repair cost. The

l |breakdown of third party propose |s as follows: - 1)Cost of Repair iw/GST}):§20,330.00 \oHT 611252019
[{19.000.00 + T%GST) + 2.)Loss of Rental(w/GST) (16days x $100.00): $1,712.00 + 3) 5 B:34:32 AM |
[LTA/GIA Search Fee: $2.00 = TOTAL: $22,044 00. Kindly let us have your instruction after
ireview the matter. Thanks. Hsiao Tong - 06 Dec 2018 |

6/12/19 8:50 AM TAN Jas—hi, please propose 13 d'a!.rs max on rental and pruceed with |LSP 161212019 |

0| {othars. thanks, 9:03:32 AM |
COE- 2033w ax ”{[;"']
Best Regards, 1 t_'?m'n__’** (R CT RS
Shu Pei| Admin . R L
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd _,__f-*”_f__——_ v L Ao
Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 s A ko) D1 L
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
"L Al T
L“._Ill q-l W F) = E—
————— Original Message----- =4 P
From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto. com= s

Sent: Friday, 6 December 2019 9:10 AM
To:; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: New message for service request 50133, vehicle number SIE9545R

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue

1, #02-25 | 5(4085933)

----- Criginal Message—--

From: jas.tan@axa.com.sg <jas.tan@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 6 December, 2019 9:00 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 50133, vehicle number SIES545R

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number S8MOOJHD.
Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message in Vendor Portal.



1/28/2020 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) ~ Menu

& RE: Re:RE: Re:TP MANDATE IA < S8MOOJHD>

Type
© Question

Message

Hi. For LOR, third party rejected our offer at 13 days and proposed 15 days. The breakdown of third party
propose is as follows: - 1)Cost of Repair (w/GST):$20,330.00($19,000.00 + 7%GST) + 2.)Loss of
Rental(w/GST) (15days x $100.00): $1,605.00 + 3). LTA/GIA Search Fee: $2.00 = TOTAL: $21,937.00. Kindly
let us have your instruction after review the matter. Thanks. Hsiao Tong - 28 Jan 2020

hups:h'vp.smartclalms.axa.mm.sgh-;laim-purtahfhtrnl.-'inde:--.rendm-servic&-reuuasts.htrnImsewice-requestsmm-massagef‘?sewim RequestMumbe... 11



Hsiao TonE (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 31 January 2020 2:24 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: CC4/ASM1B8010406/Gpb3

29/1/20 2:50 P\ ***

Messageyour surveyor recommended 9 days for repair. we have offered 13 days which we deemed fair. we shall
maintain our offer therein. - TAN Jas



2182020 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TR} = Men

& RE: Re:TP MANDATE IA < SSMOOJHD>

Type
@ Question

Message

Hi. surveyar recommended 11days for repair. Kindly refer to the revised estimate & A uploaded on 18 July
2019. Kindly let us have your further mandate after review the matter. Thanks. Hsiao Tong - 18 Feb 2020.

hitps:fivp.smartclaims axa.com.sglclaim -pﬂrtﬂh’htmr.l'index-v&ndnr-s&wice-r&quasts.htmI#.-'sewi::Earequesls.hiaw-m&ssagef?sewioeﬁ equestMumbe... 111



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 19 February 2020 9:34 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: New message for service request 50133, vehicle number SJE9545R

19/2/20 8:54 AM *** MessageRevised 14 days max. no further adjustment. please offer. thanks. -
TAN Jas

----- Original Message--—--

From: jas.tan@axa.com.sg <jas.tan@axa.com.sg>

sent: Wednesday, 19 February, 2020 8:55 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 50133, vehicle number SJE9545R

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number S8M0OOJHD.

Please click here https:ﬁvp.sr'nartcIaims.axa.cnm.sgfclaim—pnrtalj to view the message in Vendor Portal.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided forina
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.



Hsiao Tona (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 28 February 2020 2:02 PM

To: 'city auto’

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SJE9545R // DOA: 03/06/2018 J/LKK REF:
CCA4/ASM18010406/Gpb3(SLW1328K-AXA)

Attachments: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT FORM_SJE9545R.pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Mrs Quek,

As per our tele-conversation yesterday, we confirm settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GS5T) 5 20,330.00
2. Loss of Rental (14days x $100.00)(w/GST) S 1,498.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee s 2.00

Total | $ 21,830.00

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“please note that our proposal and correspondence with you s strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policy holder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: city auto <cityauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 20 January 2020 5:12 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SJE9545R // DOA: 03/06/2018 //LKK REF: CC4/ASM18010406/Gpb3(SLW1328K-AXA)

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Refer to above claim, we already giveway for the repair cost, but as for rental we ash
For another 4 days was due to weekend and public holiday, and wait for survey.

Kindly revert. Urgent.
Best Regards,

Mrs. Quak

City Auto Pte Ltd

Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate
#01-58/60/62 Singapore 575643



Tel: +65-6453 1235 ( 6 Line)
Fax: +65-6453 7944

Email: cityauto@singnet.com.sg

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Saturday, December 7, 2019 10:03 AM

To: City Auto <cityauto@singnet.com.sg=

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SJE9545R /{ DOA: 03/06/2018 //LKK REF: CC4,J’.&SM1SDIMEIpr3{SLw1323K—AEA}

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.
We have reviewed the matter and we have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of $21,700.00 all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“please note that our proposal and correspondence with you Is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not he construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: City Auto <cityauto@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 15 November 2019 3:43 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SJE9S45R // DOA: 03/06/2018 //LKK REF: CC4!A5M1Bﬂlﬂ@ﬁfﬁphﬂSLWlSlBK-A}{M

Dear Hsiao Tong,

As we are not under then panel workshop for AXA, we would not have to follow their guidelines for Authorised
workshop.

We appreciate if you could review our claims and respond as soon as possible.
Thank you

Best Regards,

Vronica Law

City Auto Pte Ltd

Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate,

#01-60/62 Sin Ming Road,
Singapore 575643



Tel : 6453 1235

Fax ;: 6453 7944

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto;chewht@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 15 November, 2019 2:45 PM

To: 'cityauto@singnet.com.sg'

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Your Ref: SJE9545R // DOA: 03/06/2018 //LKK REF: CFC4.H'ﬁSM13D1ﬂ406;"pr3[_SLW1328K=A)(ﬁ}

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
we refer to the above matter,

As per AXA instruction, we would like to request a copy cost price for SJE9545R as the repair is under part by part
basis.

Appreciate an early reply.

*Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatscever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4080933)



CITY AUTO PTE LTD

Stop Aulomotive 5
BLK 8, SIN MING IND. ESTATE, #01-60/62, SN MING ROAD, SINGAPORE 575643
TEL: 6453 1235, 6452 0850 FAX: B453 7944
2dnhrs Towing Services  Tek 9823 8898
Co. Reg. No.: 199503435C GST Reg. No.: M2-B920973-4

AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD Tax Invoice : 12019-004549

NOD. 8 Date : D5/07/2019
iﬁ%ﬁ'ﬁi‘g‘“’ Vehicle No. : SJE9545R

SINGAPORE 068811 Make / Model : HONDA VEZEL 1.5X CVT
Attention: Motor Claim Depariment Mileage (km) : 50816

Contacl : 6338 7288 Fax Mo. : 6880 4838 Chassis No. : RU11118048

Accident Date : 03/06/2018
Claim No. . CC4ASM18010406/Ghb3
Reference | JOZ01806-0144
Policy No. : 5082236810-01

LIST ITEMS :

1 Bonnet 1.0 TRZ.50 782.50
2 Bonnet hinge 2.0 48.50 97.00
3 Bonnetlock 1.0 87.70 87.70
4 Bonnet insulator 1.0 122.30 122.30
5 Bonnet Insulator clip B.O 3.80 30,40
f  Front bumper - upper 1.0 459,80 459.80
7 Front bumper side retainer 2.0 20060 41.20
8  Front bumper bracket 2.0 35.00 70.00
9 Front bumper towing cover 1.0 18.00 18.00
10 Front bumper - lower 1.0 210,00 210.00
11 Front bumper lower spoiler 1.0 351.00 351.00
12 Front bumper lower grille 1.8 77.50 T7.50
13 Front bumper reinforcement 1.0 321.00 az.oo
14  Front bumper reinforcement moulding 2.0 2420 48.40
15  Front grille base 1.0 268.890 268.90
16  Front grille cover 1.0 203.40 203.40
17 Front grille chrome 20 56.90 113.80
18  Front grille logo 1.0 24.00 24.00
19 Headlamp 2.0 1,784.50 3,569.00
20 Washertank 1.0 75.00 75.00
21 Washer motor 1.0 549,60 50.60
22  Washer tank neck 140 28.00 28.00
23 Washer lank cap 1.0 14.00 14.00
24 Front grille bracket LH 1.0 19.60 19.60
25  Front grille bracket RH 1.0 19.60 19.60
26 Front grille bracket cir 1.0 38.70 38.70
27  Support panel 1.0 576.20 576.20
28  Support top gamish 1.0 85.00 85.00
289  Supporl lop garnish clip 9.0 390 35.10
30 Airintake resonator box 1.0 180.00 180.00
31  Foglamp RH 1.0 327.70 327.70
32  Foglamp base RH 1.0 24.20 24,20
33  Foglamp cover RH 1.0 45,00 45.00
34  AJ/C condenser 10 450.00 450.00
35  AJC discharge pipe 1.0 210.00 210.00
a6 AJC suction pipe 1.0 185.00 185.00
37 AJC liguid pipe 1.0 195,00 195.00
38 Hom 1.0 55.00 55.00
38 Radiator 1.0 1,150.60 1,150.60

CONTINUE NEXT PAGE



CITY AUTO PTELTD

One Stop Aulomotive Solation
BLK B, SIN MING IND. ESTATE, #01-60/62, SIN MING ROAD, SINGAPORE 575643
TEL: B453 1235, 6452 0BS5S0 FAX: 6453 T944
24hrs Towing Services Tt S823 9698
Co. Reg. Mo.: 199503435C  GST Reg. No.: M2-8020979-4

£ - TAXINVOICE
AXA INSURANGE SINGAPORE PTE LTD Tax Invoice : 12019-004549

NO. 8 Date : D&/0T/2019

SHENTOM AN, Vehicle No. : SJE9545R

SINGAPORE DG85811 Make / Model : HONDA VEZEL 1.5X CVT
Allention: Motor Claim Department Mileage (km) : 50816

Conlact : 6338 7288 Fax MNo. : GB80 4838 Chassis No. : RU11118046

Accident Date ; 03/06/2018
Claim Mo, : CC4/ASM18010406/GhE3
Reference : JO201806-0144
Policy Mo. : 5082236810-01

40  Radiator top hose 1.0 40.00 40.00
41  Hose clip 6.0 8.00 48.00
42  Radiator top bracket 2.0 32,50 65.00
43  Radiator top mounting 20 32.50 65.00
44  Radiator bottom maounting 2.0 16.50 33.00
45  Radiator air guide 2.0 31.60 63.20
46  AC fan motor 1.0 308.00 308.00
47  AJC fan blade 1.0 58.00 58.00
48 AJC fan cowling 1.0 9800 98,00
49  Radiator fan motor 1.0 293.00 298.00
50  Radiator fan blade 1.0 57.70 57.70
51  Radiator fan cowling 1.0 125.00 125.00
52  Front RH fender 1.0 558.70 558.70
53  Front RH fender brace bracket 1.0 82.00 82.00
54  Front RH fender inner shield 1.0 130.00 130.00
55  Front RH fender wheel arch garnish 1.0 153.00 153.00
56  AJC comprassor 1.0 1,179.20 1,179.20
57 AT oil cooler 1.0 285.00 285.00
58  Intake manifold 1.0 37210 arzin
59  Engine lower cover 1.0 96.80 96.80
60  Driver air bag 1.0 1,640.30 1,640.30
61  Driver clock - spring 1.0 268.90 268.90
62  Passanger air bag 1.0 2,236.80 2,236.80
63 Dashboard 1.0 800.00 800.00
64  Seat belt 2.0 6B0.00 1,360.00
65 SRS ECU 1.0 860.00 980.00
66 SRS Impact sensor 2.0 155.00 30.00
67 Engine coolant 1.0 56.00 56.00
68 Bumper clip 12.0 3.80 45.60
69 AT fluid 20 40,20 180.40
List Total : 22,662.90
20% Discount 5% 4,532.58
18,130.32
LABOUR :
*To check wiring and lighting 30.00 30.00
“To change Afc parts and vacuum and recharge Alc gas 100.00 100.00
*To remove and install alternator, engine mounting, AT oil cooler, Adr 120.00 120.00
filer box, starter motor and intake manifold
*Ta remove and install dashboard, SRS air bag units, and elc 300.00 300.00

CONTINUE NEXT PAGE



CITY AUTO PTELTD

One Stop Aulomotive Solutlon
BLK 8, SIM MIMG IND. ESTATE. #01-60/G2, 51N MING ROAD, SINGAPORE 575643
TEL: 6453 1235, 6452 0850 FAX: 8453 TO44
Zahrs Towing Services Tt 9823 9558
Co. Reg. No.: 199503435C  GST Reg. No.: M2-89209794

~ TAXINVOL

: 12019-004549

AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD Tax Invoice

NO.8 Date : 05/07/2019
b Vehicle No. : SJES545R

SINGAPORE 068811 Make / Model - HONDA VEZEL 1.5X CVT
Attention: Motor Claim Department Mileage (km} : 50818

Contact ; 6338 7288 Fax Mo, : GBBO 4838 Chassis No, : RUT1118046

Accident Date : 03/06/2018
Claim No. : CC4/ASM18010406/Ghb3
Reference ;: JO201806-0144
Policy No. : 5082236810-01

*To pull and realign chassls member 200.00 200.00
*To use diagnostic computer to check and reset various syslems 150.00 150.00
*Computerized wheel alignment 60.00 60.00
*To towing 50.00 50.00
- To knock jackout damaged parts, panel beating, welding. align, refix S00.00 a00.00
and to renew accident pars
- Spray painfing on affected & replace parts 1,100.00 1,100.00
LABOUR Total 5%: 3,010.00
Total 5% 21,140.32
GST @ 7% 5%: 1,479.82

Grand Total S§: 22.620.14
—————

CASH [ METS | CREDIT CARD PAYMENT ONLY

Jojer—

for CITY AUTO PTELTD

Customer's Signature/Co. Stamp

Flease note all works performed by City Auto Pte Ltd as performed in this invoice is subjected to the following Warranty
conditions:

1) Any replacement of electrical components will carry 1 month warranty period from date of this invoice.

2) Any replacement of mechanical components will carry 3 months warranty period.

Please note that all warranty does not cover wear and tear conditions regardless of any components.

City Auto Pte Ltd reserves the right to determine any warranty conditions.

Thank You For Your Business !



CITY AUTO PTELTD

BLK 8, SIN MING IND. ESTATE, #01 5062, SIN MING ROAD, SINGAPORE 575643,
TEL: 6453 1235, B452 0850 FAX: 453 7944

24hrs Towing Services Tel: 9823 G298

Ca. Aeg. No.: 199503435C GST RAeg. No.: M2-8920979-4

¥rref :CCA/ASM18010406/Ghb3
Our ref: SIE9545R
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

27" March 2019
Dear Sir/Mdm,

AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD
NO. 8

SHENTON WAY

AXA TOWER

SINGAPORE 068811

Accident involving SLW1328K and SJE9545R on 03/06/2018

We refer to the above said accident.
We enclosed herewith relevant documents as stated below:-

1) Accident report of SIE9545R

2) Repair tax invoice

3) Letter of authorization

4) Rental agreement receipt

5) GIA search receipt

6) Claimant injury will submit separately

As instructed, we are claiming the following as stated below:-

1) Cost of repair s 23,420.84
2) Loss of rental (18 Days x $128.40) Include GST 5 2,311.20
3) GIA search fee 5 2.00

TOTAL -$  25.734.04

We do not have the survey report and photographs as our client's motor vehicle was
surveyed by your appointed surveyor,

Please kindly let us know whether you are prepared to settle our client’s claim & we
look forward to hear from you soonest.

Thanks & regards

Ao

Vronica Law (Claim dept.)
Tel: 6453 1235
Fax: 6453 7944

Email: cityauto@singnet.com.sg




1

CITY AUTO PTE LTD

BLE 8, SIN MING IND, ESTATE. #01-60/62, SIN MING ROAD, SINGAPORE 575643,
TEL: 5453 1235, 6452 0850 FAX: B453 TH44

24hrs Towing Services Tel: 9823 5808

Co. Reg. No.: 199503435C GST Reg. No.: M2-8920978-4

25" June 2018

Soh Kee Hock

Re: Accident on 03/06/2018 involving SJE9545R and SLW1328K

Please let this letter confirm we have agreed to settle my injury claim separately.

If you have any further questions or clarification, please don't hesitate to contact me.

Yours truly,

Your namaﬁsignature



v LIl

JECI

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R

Afflliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automabile

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

8 SHENTON WAY #24-01

Ref : CC4/ASM18010406/Gpa3s2

BT

AXA TOWERSINGAPORE 0686811 Refe [0
ATTN: JAS TAN Code: ASM
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLW 1328K Veh. Inspected SJE 9545R
Policy No. VAT/GAI13484 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SAMO0JHD Excess () 0.00
Assign From JAS TAN Assign Date 07062018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDAVEZEL1.5 c.c 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. RU11118046 Colour SILVER
Odometer 050816 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [215/60 R16 FALKEMN B mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 FALKEN 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R18 FALKEN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R18 FALKEN & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  03/06/2018 Inspection Date 07/06/2018
Survey held at  BLK 160 SIN MING DRIVE #05-01
Repairer CITY AUTO PTELTD
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

11 Working Days




Asn BE B

LL

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJE 9545R

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-B507198-R

Page No.:1 of 4

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | FeiEe B8 {sj}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BONNET (CONSISTENT) BUCKLED B892.30 782.50
2|BONNET HINGE @ $48.50 (CONSISTENT]) BENT 97.00 a7.00
1|BONNET LOCK (CONSISTENT) BENT a7v.v70 87.70
1|BONNET INSULATOR (CONSISTENT) TORN 122.30 122.30
8|BONMET INSULATOR CLIP @ $3.80 (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 30.40 30.40
1|FRONT BUMPER - UPPER (CONSISTENT} DISTORTED 459 80 459 80
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @ $20.60 MECESSARY 41.20 41.20
(CONSISTENT)
2|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET @ $35.00 {COMNSISTENT) BROKEN 70.00 70.00
1|FRONT BUMPER TOWING COVER (CONSISTENT) MISSING 18.00 18.00
1|FRONT BUMPER - LOWER (CONSISTENT) DISTORTED 351.00 351.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER SPOILER (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 351.00 210,00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 77.80 77.50
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT (CONSISTENT) BENT 321.00 321.00
2|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT MOULDING @ $24.20 DEFORMED 48.40 46.40
(CONSISTENT)
1|FRONT GRILLE BASE (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 268.90 268,90
1|FRONT GRILLE COVER (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 203.40 203.40
2|FRONT GRILLE CHROME @ $56.90 (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 113.B0 113.80
1|FRONT GRILLE LOGO (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 24.00 24.00
2 |HEADLAMP @ $1784.50 (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 3,569.00 3,569.00
1|WASHER TANK (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 75.00 75.00
1|WASHER MOTOR (CONSISTENT} DAMAGED 58,60 58,60
1|WASHER TANK NECK (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 28.00 28.00
1|WASHER TANK CAP (CONSISTENT) MISSING 14.00 14.00
1|FRONT GRILLE BRACKET LH (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 19.80 19,60
1|FRONT GRILLE BRACKET RH (CONSISTENT) MISSING 19.60 19.60
1|FRONT GRILLE BRACKET CTR (CONSISTENT) DENTED 38.70 38.70
1|SUPPORT PAMEL (CONSISTENT) BENT 576.20 576.20
1|SUPPORT TOP GARNISH (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 86.00 B5.00
g|SUPPORT TOP GARMNISH CLIP @ $3.90 (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 3510 3510
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Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop [;]} ()
1|AIR INTAKE AIR DUCT (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 77.50 ;
1] AIR INTAKE AIR FILTER BOX (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 166.80 -
1| AIR INTAKE RESONATOR BOX (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 180.00 180.00
1|FOGLAMP RH (CONSISTENT) DISTORTED 327.70 327.70
1|FOGLAMP BASE RH (CONSISTENT) DISTORTED 2420 24.20
1|FOGLAMP COVER RH (CONSISTENT) DISTORTED 45.00 45.00
1|A/C CONDENSER (CONSISTENT) BENT 568.10 450.00
1|A/S DISCHARGE PIPE (CONSISTENT) BENT 210.00 210.00
1|A/C SUCTION PIPE (CONSISTENT) BENT 185.00 185.00
1|A/C LIQUID PIPE (CONSISTENT) BENT 195.00 195.00
1| AMBIENT TEMPERATURE SENSOR (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 4260 :
1|HORN (CONSISTENT) DAMAGED 55.00 55.00
1|RADIATOR (CONSISTENT) BENT 1,250.80 1,150.60
1|RADIATOR TOP HOSE (CONSISTENT) TWISTED 40.00 40.00
1|RADIATOR BOTTOM HOSE (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 42.00 g
1|RADIATOR FILLER JOINT (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 65.00 :
1|RADIATOR FILTER HOSE (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 16.00 .
&|HOSE CLIP @ $8.00 (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 48.00 48.00
2|RADIATOR TOP BRACKET @ $32.50 (CONSISTENT) DENTED 65.00 65.00
2|RADIATOR TOP MOUNTING @ $32.50 (CONSISTENT) DENTED 65.00 65.00
2|RADIATOR BOTTOM MOUNTING @ $16.50 (CONSISTENT) |DENTED 33.00 33.00
2|RADIATOR AIR GUIDE @ $31.60 (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 63.20 63.20
1|COOLANT SPARE TANK (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 62.50 g
1|A/C FAN TANK (CONSISTENT) NOT WORKING 308.00 308.00
1|A/C FAN BLADE (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 58.00 58.00
1|A/C FAN COWLING (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 98.00 98.00
1|RADIATOR FAN MOTOR (CONSISTENT) NOT WORKING 298.00 298.00
1|RADIATOR FAN BLADE (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 57.70 57.70
1|RADIATOR FAN COWLING (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 125.00 125.00
1|FRONT RH FENDER (CONSISTENT) BUCKLED 558.70 558.70
1|FRONT RH FENDER BRAGE BRACKET (CONSISTENT)  |BENT 8200 8200
1|FRONT RH FENDER INNER SHIELD (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 130.00 130.00
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1|FRONT RH FENDER WHEEL ARCH GARNISH CuT 153.00 153.00
(CONSISTENT)
1|A/C COMPRESSOR (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 1,780.00 1,179.20
1|ALTERNATOR (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 1,850.00
1|A/T OIL COOLER (CONSISTENT) DAMAGED 28500 285.00
1|STARTER MOTOR (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 1,100.60 -
1{INTAKE MANIFOLD (CONSISTENT) cuT 372.10 372.10
1|ENGINE - MOUNTING RH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 154 60 .
1|BONNET STAND (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 38.00 <
1|ENGINE LOWER COVER (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 96.80 96 .80
1|FRONT RH LOWER SPLASH GUARD (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 65.00 ;
1|DRIVER AIR BAG (CONSISTENT) ACTIVATED 1,640.30 1,640.30
1|DRIVER CLOCK - SPRING (CONSISTENT) ACTIVATED 268.90 268.90
1|PASSANGER AIR BAG (CONSISTENT) ACTIVATED 2,236.80 2.236.80
1|DASHBOARD (CONSISTENT) ACTIVATED 800.00 800,00
2| SEAT BELT @ $680.00 (CONSISTENT) ACTIVATED 1,360.00 1,360.00
1|SRS ECU (CONSISTENT) ACTIVATED 980.00 980.00
2|SRS IMPACT SENSOR @ $155.00 (CONSISTENT) ACTIVATED 310.00 310.00
1|FRONT RH CHASSIS MEMBER (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 755.00 .
1|FRONT RH CHASSIS BACK PLATE (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 11550 -
1|ENGINE COOLANT (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 56.00 56.00
2|A/T FLUID @ $90.20 (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 180.40 180.40
1|FAN BELT (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 70.30 :
1|WATER PUMP (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 210.80 ;
12|BUMPER CLIP @ $3.80 (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 4560 4560
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -5,713.32 -4,532 58
22,853.28 18,130.32
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING AND LIGHTING. 80.00 30.00
TO CHNAGE AJC PARTS AND VAGUUM AND RECHARGE 150.00 100.00
AIC GAS.
TO REMOVE AND INSTALL ALTERNATOR, ENGINE 280.00 120.00
MOUNTING, AT OIL COOLER, AIR FILTER, STARTER
MOTOR AND INTAKE MANIFOLD
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Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ()
TO REMOVE AND INSTALL DASBOARD, SRS AIR BAG 350.00 300.00
UNITS, AND ETC.
TO PULL AND REALIGN CHASSIS MEMBER. 250.00 200.00
TO USE DIAGNOSTIC COMPUTER TO CHECK AND 250.00 150.00
RESET VARIOUS SYSTEMS
COMPUTERIZED WHEEL ALIGNMENT 80.00 60.00
TO TOWING. B0.00 50.00
TO KNOCK JACKOUT DAMAGED PARTS, PAMNEL 1,200.00 a00.00
BEATING, WELDING, ALIGN, REFIX AND TO RENEW
ACCIDENT PARTS
SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED & REPLACE PARTS. 1,500.00 1,100.00
4.220.00 3.010.00
GRAND TOTAL 27,073.28 21,140.32
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | I [ 21,140.32]
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