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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Kong Kok Chee <kong.kc@portek.com>

Sent: Friday, 29 June, 2018 6:55 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLZ 6844M_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ 6844M / SJX 1034B / OTHERS 

ON 05/06/2018

Attachments: T201806067012_Police Report from 1st Car_SJX 1034B.pdf

Hi Vic, 

Message received. I do not know whether this might be useful to you. I have a report from the driver of the 1st 

vehicle, SJX 1034B indicating that my car, SLZ 6844M has actually come to a stop. There is a time lag which means 

that the impact on his car by mine was caused by the 3rd vehicle. So, it is 3rd vehicle hits 2nd vehicle (my car) leading 

to it hitting the 1st vehicle 

 

Regards, 

Kong KC 

 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Friday, 29 June, 2018 15:45 

To: Kong Kok Chee <kong.kc@portek.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Your Ref: SLZ 6844M_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ 6844M / SJX 1034B / OTHERS ON 05/06/2018 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Our Ref:  CC6/AIG18010394/Ahb3 

 

29 JUNE 2018                      

   

KONG KOK CHEE                                                                                                      By Post and By Email 

BLOCK 318B ANCHORVALE LINK 

#15-263 

SINGAPORE 542318 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ 6844M / SJX 1034B / OTHERS ON 05/06/2018 

 

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against 

you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 

                 

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information given 

us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to 

negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant. 

 

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us 

within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
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You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD – if applicable) will be withheld for the time being. Pending for final 

allocation of liability in settlement by our principal AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd. 

 

Please call us if you have further queries. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

Portek Disclaimer: This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the 

use of the individual or Entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error or 

mistake please notify administrator@portek.com. You should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-

mail; and delete this e-mail from your system. If you are not the intended recipient you are notified that 

disclosing, copying, distributing or taking any action in reliance on the contents of this information is 

strictly prohibited.  

 

 

 

Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. You should check this email and any attachments for the 

presence of viruses. The company accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by 

this email. E-mail transmission cannot be certain to be secure as information could be intercepted, 

corrupted, lost, destroyed, arrive late or incomplete, or contain viruses. The sender therefore does not accept 

liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message, which arise as result of e-mail 

transmission.  
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