Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 14 September 2018 5:36 PM

To: '‘Pegasus Engineering'

Subject: RE: Acc Inlv SLS4731E & SKT6110R on 20/04/2018 ***LKK REF:CC6/AIG18010327/ub3
Attachments: Video - Accident.mp4

Without Prejudice,

Dear Ying,

We refer to the below matter.

Our insured has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the negligence of your client.

Based on video footage, it can be seen that our insured vehicle was travelling along within in his own lane and your
client’s vehicle cut into our insured lane and collided with our insured vehicle.

Under such a circumstances, we are denying liability and unable to look into your client’s claim.
Yours faithfully,

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pegasus Engineering <claims2 @pegasusengrg.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 29 August 2018 10:07 AM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Acc Inlv SLS4731E & SKT6110R on 20/04/2018 ***LKK REF:CC6/AIG18010327/ub3

Hi Thin Thin,
Please be informed, there was no camera / video footage in our client's vehicle.

Thanks & regards
YING

On Tue, Aug 28, 2018 at 8:25 PM, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Sebastian,



We understand that there is CCTV in your client’s vehicle.

We would like to request the video footage for our necessary action.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pegasus Engineering <claims2 @pegasusengrg.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 27 August 2018 2:13 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Acc Inlv SLS4731E & SKT6110R on 20/04/2018 ***LKK REF:CC6/AIG18010327/ub3

Hi Thin Thin,

Any update.

Thank you

Sebastian



On Mon, Aug 20, 2018 at 2:52 PM, Pegasus Engineering <claims2@pegasusengrg.com.sg> wrote:

hi Thin Thin,

Any update for this case??

Kindly advise..

thanks

ying

On Sat, Jul 14, 2018 at 9:51 AM, Pegasus Engineering <claims2 @ pegasusengrg.com.sg> wrote:

Hi Thin Thin,

Any update on the CCTV footage ?

Thank you

Best Regards,

Sebastian

On Wed, Jun 27, 2018 at 11:50 AM, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@I|kkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sebastian,

We are seeking further instruction from our Principal and will revert back to you.

Meanwhile, we would like to request the CCTV footage / accident scene photos / PIR result / evidence in order to
support your client’s statement.



Thanks.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pegasus Engineering [mailto:claims2 @pegasusengrg.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 27 June 2018 11:45 AM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Acc Inlv SLS4731E & SKT6110R on 20/04/2018 ***LKK REF:CC6/AIG18010327/ub3

Hi Thin Thin,

Can you provide us your insured scene video? Your insured mention in the report "our car has in-car camera" .

Thank you

Best Regards,

Sebastian

On Wed, Jun 27, 2018 at 11:01 AM, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@I|kkauto.com> wrote:

“Without Prejudice"



Hi Sebastian,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is unclear for the
above mentioned case. There is no conclusive evidence to substantiate either party’s version. Enclosed herewith is
a copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our Ol we
will revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until
you heard further from us.

Meanwhile, we would like to request the CCTV footage / accident scene photos / PIR result / evidence in order to
seek further instruction from our principal.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pegasus Engineering [mailto:claims2 @pegasusengrg.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 June 2018 10:37 AM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Acc Inlv SLS4731E & SKT6110R on 20/04/2018 ***LKK REF:CC6/A1G18010327/ub3

Hi Thin Thin,



Please advise liability.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Sebastian

On Wed, Jun 6, 2018 at 5:15 PM, Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Gary,

We refer to the below email.

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our insured’s report.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Thin Thin at 6841 2360.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Thank you

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 6 June 2018 3:56 PM

To: 'Pegasus Engineering' <claims2 @pegasusengrg.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Acc Inlv SLS4731E & SKT6110R on 20/04/2018

Dear Gary,

Thank you for your email.

Dear Shu Pei,

Kindly assist. (new case)

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pegasus Engineering [mailto:claims2 @pegasusengrg.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 6 June, 2018 3:48 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Acc Inlv SLS4731E & SKT6110R on 20/04/2018




Hi Catherine,

Our Ref:SLS4731E

Your Ref : SKT 6110 R

Please advise liability.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Gary Seah

Pegasus @ SME Motor

Hp: 83388418

Best Regards,
Gary Seah
Pegasus @ SME Motor

Hp: 83388418

Best Regards,
Gary Seah
Pegasus @ SME Motor

Hp: 83388418



Best Regards,
Gary Seah
Pegasus @ SME Motor

Hp: 83388418

Best Regards,
Gary Seah
Pegasus @ SME Motor

Hp: 83388418

Best Regards,
Gary Seah
Pegasus @ SME Motor

Hp: 83388418

Best Regards,

Gary Seah

Pegasus @ SME Motor
Hp: 83388418



