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PRECISE AUTO SERVICE

NO. 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-34/36 SINGAPORE 4178483
TEL : 67457367 FAX : 68413390
C0. REG, NO. : 35766600C GST REG. NO. : 35766600C

16-08-18 X,

A o ¢ v
Date of Accident : 05-06-18

Dude 10 fgut - Ospoblts 12 5[]

OUR REF : GY 767G/T/18

CHARLOTTE PUXLEY FLOWERS PTE LTD Nt W

/0. Precise Auto Service

No. 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 .

#02-34 o /g «L&Do
Singapore 417883 6‘
LISTITEM
Rear Fender RH 28(F ‘r&p 3,280.00_—
Rear Fender Protector £ 0 110.00 -
Rear Fender Protector Clips 2pes @ B.00  geA 16.00 /
Sliding Door RH /58 00 4,{5 D lf__ﬂﬂ.ﬂﬂf_,.
Sliding Door Protector JJ.?/A* 7 le-.lJ?’#,
sliding Door Protector Clips Bpcs @800 AL m.uxlﬂ
Rear Control Arm RH AA ﬁﬁﬁ,ﬂﬂ){
Rear Wheel Bearing Hup Do? 4 58000 _~
Rear Absorber A1 490.00 X

e o

7.384.00

Less Discount 10% : 73840

f,645.60

SPECIAL NETTITEM

sliding Door Work Art Sticker A& 38000 02\'9{
floar Tyre 5y 0 I }f.loa e €EnT 331}.00&1
ﬂ[ g Rim Assy (Sport) 0 /5,“-{ 750.00 (7

Page1af2



Used Mercedes-Benz Vito Car for Sale in Singapore. Net Link Partners Pte Ltd - sgCarMan

sGCARMART.COM
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Upfront Payment

$316 800
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Slesk, Fowerful, Comfortatls And Fisl EMcent Van
Wl Taken

Liphoistery, Carpeted Interior And Soundproafing
Reverss Semor, Rado!

Call Faat To Amange For A Yiewing! Fast Loan
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S17.865

38 22
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Nivitha !LI{K Auto)

From: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg»
Sent: Wednesday, & June 2018 9:30 AM
To: Precise Auto Service; 'sur@Ikkauto.com”: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)
Ce: Manivel Priyadarshini
Subject: RE: Pre-repair Inspection for GY 767G. Your Insured Vehicle no : SHD 4365E.
Attachments: 05062018160608 pdf

qz2am@) 6(6 e
Dear Sir / Mdm, Prsor @ ML
Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle G 7476 and let us have your report urgently. ‘ﬁ“["d. n

This claim will be handled by Ms Priya.
*Kindly upload this survey request email to merimen

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Mator Claims Dept

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecll Streat | 205 108 Bullding | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: Precise Auto Service [mailtu:suppnn@preciseautn,sg]

Sent: 05 June, 2018 5:51 PM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Cc: C Meenachi - 111 <Meenachi@iii.com.sg>; Gabriel Wee <Gabriel@iii.com.sg>
Subject: Re: Pre-repair Inspection for GY 767G. Your Insured Vehicle no : SHD 4365F

Dear Mr. Gabriel,

We refer to your email on dated 05-06-2018. Kindly be informed that we would like to choose Mr. Marcus
Chua from LKK Auto Consultants as our mutual survevor.

Thank You.

Best Regards
Arine

On 5 June 2018 at 16:45. Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg> wrore:

Dear Sir / Mdm,

We acknowledge receipt of your email,



notified that any use, distribution. transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
-intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of ¢nvironment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No, 198703792-K

T:67457367 | F:6841 3390

E : support@preciseauto.sg

wW: ;

A : 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-33/34/36 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883

Follow us on social media:

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree 1o the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person 10 whom it has been addressed.

[t may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

Il you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful,
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.



Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
- India International Insurance Pte Lid.
Registration No. 198703792-K



PRECISE AUTO SERVICE

NO 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-34/36 SINGAPORE 417553
TEL : 67457367 FAX : 68413390

Date: 05-0b-1F (& 4 &frw-n

Mis India International Insurance Pte Lid By Fax 5224 4174 Only
64 Cecil Street

#05-01 10B Building

Singapore 049711

Diear Sirg

ACCIDENT BETWEEN VEHICLE No, O 707 & AND  VEHICEL NO.
SHD A5 E on 05961 & @ (0! Soewmpr Mlome Lok ¢ ot R4

. (outstole 7 -.ﬂ?ﬂ-hl‘}
We refer to the above matter.

[
We are the appointed repair workshop of vehicle no Gl‘f ¥ .
We understand that you are the insurer of vehicle no. SHD 43ESe

The owner of vehicie no. _GY 16 has authorised us to carry out e repairs to his
vehicle which was damaged your insured's vehicle. The owner inlends 1o make a claim

against your insured andior insured's authorised driver for the accide' which |s causad

whaolly andior contributed by your insured andior your insured's sulhorised driver's
negligence.

We hereby give you notice of the accident and an gpportunity to inspect ihe damaged to the
vehicie prior to the commencement of the repairs. ‘

Kindly take nete that we hereby give you 2 days’ notice to conduct a pre =pair inspection of
vehicle no._OY #

at my premises.




10732018 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

Thits miall is assoclated with

*GYTGTG (MCT1B0601348)
[SHDA3B5E]
TR
PRECISE AUTO SERVICE
Jun 5 J018 12:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION FTE LTD)
Precise Auto Services

| Reply | Reply All | Mark as Unread | Print Message | Delete ““’!Ei Forward |

India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (I11_SG), sent on 03/10/2018 16:44 PM,

From
To LKK_HG
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$6914.00) - GY767G - Claim Handler: Priya

Approved:5914.00:

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY

There are no documents.

hiips:/singapore. merimen comiciaimsfindex ofm?fusebox=SVCmai&luseaction=dsp_viewamode=1&inboxid=138471B&iDomainld=11&0bjid=3, n



PRECISE AUTO SERVICE

NO. 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 # 02-34 /36 AUTOBAY SINGAPORE 417883
TEL: /7457367 FAX!:68413390
CO. REG, ND, : 35766600C GST REG. NO.: 357666000
28-08-18

Your Rel. : SHD 4365E
Vehicle No.: GY 767G/T/18

M/s INDIA International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street

#05-01 10B Building

Singapore 049711

ATTN : Ms. Vivian {(LKK Motor Claims Department)

Dear Sir

RE : ACCIDENT INVOVLING VEHICLE NO.GY 767G AND SHD 4365E ON 05 JUNE 2018
@10:50 HRS ALONG KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4

We are the repairer for vehicle no. GY 767G and instructed by the owner,
Charlotte Puxley Flowers Pte Ltd. on his behalf to submit the claims against your
insured's vehicle no. SHD 4365Ethat was involved in the above mentioned accident.

The accident was clearly caused by your insured's negligence. In order to save
the legal cost, we will process the claim to you directly as follows:

1. Cost of Repair (Survey By LEK) 5 6.206.00 (Including GST)
2. Loss OF Use - PRI (2 days X $100.00) 5 200.00
3. Car Rental (7 days X $150.00) 5 105000 [Including GST)
4. LTA Search s 8.00

$ 7.464.00

Please let us have your payment in our favour of "Precise Auto Service”.
Your prompt reply of the above claims will be much appreciated.

Yours faithfully

Jiang Yanhong



TO: PRECISE AUTO SERVICE
NO. 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &

#02-34/28
SINGAPORE 417883
LETTER OF AUTHORITY & INDEMNITY
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. = [0 1 AND SHD #05 &

We, Charlphbe Puxioy Flowers Bre Ui NRIC No.
owner of vehicle no. _ &1 1615 . hereby authorise M/S PRECISE AUTO
SERVICE to commence repairs to my motor vehicle and to forward the claim for damages
sustained In the above accident to the third party driver and/er his employer and/or the
vehicle owner and/or the insurer concerned. |1/We agree that in consideration of you giving
up your repairer's llen | agres to assign the whole proceeds of my/our third party claim to
you and if applicable, our solicitors (to be appointed by you en my/our behalf) shall accept
this as my/our irrevocable authority to pay the amount compensated direct to you after
deduction of their costs on a Solicitor & Client basis. 1/\We undertake to co-operate fully
with you and our solicitors to see the claim to a successful conclusion. In the event the
proceeds of claim for damages, interest, costs and expenses including legal costs are paid
to me directly by the third party Insurar, | undertake to indemnify and/or reimburse the said
proceeds of claim to you.

If the third party driver and/or his employer and/or the vehicle owner and/cr the
insurer reject liability, | will be fully responsible for the repair costs.

I/We also authorise you to sign all discharge vouchersfindemnity forms and all
necessary papers in connection with the above claim in my/four absence.

I/We authorise you to appoint such a firm of solicitors on my/our behalf as you shall
deem fit for the purpose cf the third party/own insurers’ claim,

I/'We undertake to inform you and/or the solicitors appointed by you on
my/our behalf in the event the third party's insurance company communicates with
mefus directly by telephone or in writing and l/we further undertake not to enter into
any compromise Settlement Agreement with the third party insurance without your
consent as | understand that this may jeopardise a falr recovery of the third party
claim.

My vehicle is repaired by the repairer on my own free will without any inducement,
threat and/or promise.

In the event of any breach of my undertaking and the repairer is compelled to
enfarce this undertaking, | agree that | shall pay for the legal costs Incurred by the repairer
ona mm;"itnr and client’s full indemnity basis.

ﬁa . ; Lot Puxiey Flowers PTE LT
i < t:lj*} - P me
“Owner Signature a 76 Chay Yan Street

Company Stamp, if Applicable #01-02 S(160079)
( pany P PP ) :H;:;&:'“ 6508633510
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ClaimaniRef G4 $e 3§
wan, _ Precise Auto Service il workshop™] heseby confirm that we'l have reached on agreement
with the appoinied Slrveyor of Indl Intermaton Inzumnes Pio Lid LK Auto Consubants Pt Lid {raabrries
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Ine matter on hisher behall In & mannsr (hat we!l desm L Waell enclose hatein tha jetler of ndiharily given by Ttha Ihimd
party cliversant”,

Wall further confimm that well will indemnily ndia Interational Insuranca Ple Lid for all dimbges losa andior axpensa Dt
ihesy will of have Alfeady ncumed I he avent that tha third party claimant” after the aboyve sald agreement Iodoes
turthes cimim againet thi former for eny joss and expenses wuflerec peraining 1o cost of repairs andior rental andior loss
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[ I EriA I TERMATIONAL INSURANCE 'TF LID

Wall authorize you to pay the icinl amount of 5§ _6.814.00 1o _Preciss Auto Service
Detegins 22 gaye NIV _s0l¥
CLAIMANT: / ’ WITNESS:
Sgnmture £ L / Sgrinture 3
Sigried by "this wor ko™ (a0 ) Sigrms by sppointed Surveyor

NRIC (‘.‘!‘19& 4390 g L. NRIC  LKK Auto Consuftants Pte Ltd

Autiitiss Addrins: 51 Libi Ave 1 M01-25,
Piya UBI Widuabial Park
408933

Hamarsliny = __—= ) ) TBmEnAlly

Cescupatian Cooupation



PRECISE AUTO SERVICE
N0 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-33/34/36 AUTOBAY SINGAPORE 417883
TEL : 67457367 FAX : 68413390
CO. REG. NO. : 35766600C  GST REG. NO.: 35766600C

T =====s=Z== T ===z=======2 T T T e ZS=EEE=ESEE
Accident Date : 05-06-18

OUR REF : GY 767G/T/18

TAX INVOICE

STRTENI Invoice No. : TP1808-006
FIE LTD
DATE : 28-08-18

daAPOILE 01008

FINAL BILL ON VEH. NO.: GY 767G
VEHICLE MODEL : MERCEDES BENZ VITO

PART BY PART REPAIR

INCLUDING SUPPLY OF PARTS & LABOUR

PANEL BEATING & SPRAY PAINTING 5,800.00
SUB-TOTAL 5,800.00
ADD GST 7% ¢ 406.00

TOTALAMOUNT SGD 6,206.00

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.



RENT-A-CAR

TAX INVOICE

GSTREG. NO_: 201062760

AT INVOICE ND
INVOICE TO DATE
PRECISE ALITO SERVICE 21 -Jun-2018 A 1790
C/0 CHARLOTTE PUNLEY FLOWERS PTE LTD
70 CHAY YAN STREE]
#01-02 TIONG BAHRL ESTATE
SINGAPORE 160079
VHA NO DUE DATE VEH. NO.
A 37901 21-Jun-2018 GBG 4215 K
DESCRIPTION MO, OF DAYS RATE AMOUNT
RENTAL FROM 05 JUNE 2018 TO 12 JUNE 2018 2 140,187 98131
YOUR REF- GY 767 G
GST@ 7% S68.69
TOTAL $1,050.00

Al chegues musi be made payable 1o BKW Renr A Car Pie Lid,
Please write the vehicle and invatce number an the reserve,

BKW Rent-A-Car Pte Ltd

120 Lower Delia Road #02-15 Cendex Centre (5) 169208 Tel: G738 7777 Fax: G738 6666

ACRA No: 2001062760
A nhslidiary

GST Reg, No: 20-0106276-D

Webmsite: www.bkw.sg
of BEKW Automobile Pte Ltd

= i




BKW RENT A CAR PTE LTD

120 Lower Delta Road #02.15 Cendax Centre Singapora 169208 Tel: 6738 7777 Fax: 6738 6666
ACHA Mo; 20-01(E27T8-0 GST Reg ho- 20-0106276-0
24 HOURS HELPLINE : 8223 1122

VEHICLE HIRING AGREEMENT

wano:A 37901

BKW
RENT-A-CAR

-
-

HIRER'S PARTICULARS " Hirer's Own Vehicle No Raplace Veh No
Paarna (s n VO] == Loan Vehicle No: VA Mo
HAK Passpoet Mo Cruite ol Barth) Maka & Model AutoManual Group
. o CHARGES $ et
1] ¥
el | 1 day WS Par day
Name A Addresa of Employer =
WeeklyManthly weeh 05 Par wask/Monthly
Cecupation DOrhvanig Exp Others
D+iving Licence Mo: Passod Dale: — COWPA @5 Por diryfMoniily
DV Type: LocalinfCihers Delivery/Collection Sve
‘\Tﬂhﬂ] e HP J GST
o w ST
- I [ i | = F
4 Patrod | el GUT'_E'
e i s v
NAIC Passpon Ne Duabe of Birth = || s | | | |
‘“ g o Farat km EEIEE par dary asT
- Si ) Excese milsage & chargsabls
il cmrln pee km TOTAL CHARGES |
Dcoupatioen - 1 Dietyirg Exp _Yra . 1 7
Driving Lcence No: Passna / Expary Date: ( Security Daposit - § Hank: )
\DL Typs- Lacalbs Wt Clom Ne: — | CASHINETSVISAMC/AMEX/CHO No:
( Expiry Date | Card ID Mo
MName as in Card:
[ LW 2 (1] T ..- - I P | -.-_l
- ACCESSDRIES CHECK

o] Data Curds J Camora Systema ) Hob Cap | U] Radia | CD Cartrdge

-+ Camail Py Powars PRELTR ) o 1
AT

Additionsi Driver's Signature

I h!! rend and agres 1o tha tarms and condition on boin sides of this sgresmant. IT] have preseniad a charge/credil card for payment, | agres hat &l pmounts
payable under this agresment and for parking and traffio infringements may be billed 10 thal accoun! and my signature above will be considered 1o have been
\mede on the chatgaicredil card voucher. All information | have been given BKW Ranl A Car Pte Lid in conneclion with Ifis agreamant s Wue.

' METHITANT

Date Qui |  Time Oul hiimage | Chock By | Hemaths

\ F | ! - | | Hirer o Tiuer Bigratuss S|

* Retiern OF Vehicle: The Hirer Driver 1s Required To Sign In The Coluren “Sigrature OF Hirer Drives Failirg Which The Dy And Time insened Below Shall Be Deomed To Ba The ™
Dy Ana Time The Yehicke 1n Retumed To BEW Rent A Car P Lid And The Same Shall Be Accepied As Conclusive Evidence OF The Same And Shall Mot Be Challengea Or

| Oumitionnd On Any Account Whatsoever. And | had clesred my belonging Ilems from ihe rental vahics (cashcard. parking cougana. alol’

Dt Iny | Tima In Milaage Check By | Rematks

=) |
| |

Harar wlirver Signature = y

=0
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+Enquire Vehicle & Owner Information ( Vehicle No. SHD4365E As At 05 Jun 2018 / 10:50:00)

Laws Firm Search Details

Search Reason! Insurance claim n relation to traffic accident
Law Firm Case Nou: PRECISE-GY 747G

Current Owner Details

Cwnar D Type: Comparny

Owner ID3: 199303821R

Orwner Name: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTELTD
Registered Address Type:  Private Residential {Condo Apt or House] / Shapping / Office Compleses
Raglstered Block/Hause No. 383

Registered Street Name:  SIN MING DRIVE

Registorad Unit Ne. -

Aegistered Bullding Name:  GAS BUILDING

Registered Postal Code 575717

Current Viehicle Details

‘Vehicle Mo
. take Deseriptian/Model:

Insurance Company Mame:

SHDE345E
HYUNDA| / SONATA NF 2.0 CROI AT ABS ZWD ADA TURBO
INDIA INT'L INS PTELTD

'
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settlement

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

| Case | Notified Est Suumut_.-__c;_ |Ad) Assigned = -Aufnpl.' ..A.u] Submieg |inl| A ed |Status |
My |07 Jun 2018 Soma Y sss.e0000  s$5,800.00 m"“"'" e
n !
— | Eai Reg I E“M}“I Edil Estimates I Wiew Bt I C Caes I

Main Clalm Detalls

[CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS ‘[Created by adjuster]
Insured! | COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co feg. No.. -

Main .
| Claimant: .Hm AUTO SERVICE, Co. Reg. No.: ISTE6G00C

[Vehicle Reg , | D5/08/2018 DO10D - 59
No.: Lirele Date of LOSS" (161 Mantns and 15 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]
Palicy, Cover
| Note Ne.; |H_C0Mn1.‘r:5
Pallcy Mo
(Claimant): |

SHO4365E

Excess: |

Pracise Auto Service (HQ) No | Kaki Bukit Ave &, #02-34/36, 417883 Kaki Bukil - Tel: 67457367
India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 ... [Handled by Priya]

India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100
|LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tei: 6256-3561 .. [Handied by MARCUS CHUA] . [Final Rpt due 18/06/2018)

|ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view All |  Campose Case ma |
I 115G (03/10/2018) Alert - Ad) Mandate Approved (556914.00) - GY767G - Claim Handler: Priya
+ 115G (12/06/2016): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$0.00) - GY767G - Claim Handler: Priya

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View Al | Sesrch Tasks | Croate New Task | Complete |

Dus Date Priarity Type Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Complated On Created On pane?
Moy resiuis

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_c... 5/4/2019
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Claim Documents

*GY767G (MCT18060138)
[SHD4365E]
TP
PRECISE AUTOD SERVICE

Jun 5 2018 12:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]

Precise Auto Service

Uplaad Documents |  Usioad Photes | Compose New Letter | View [View m Browser | <]
Photos/Images - - ~ [oerose (V]| M|
!Hﬂ | Relabel fReordar I.KKIHIHMHH-'IIIHILH[HQ} | Thumbnall Print
I T TTT T, T— 1@ | tmdve | B
2 03/10/18 14:45 | General View — _ | @ | tosaws B |
3 DI10/18 14145 Gemeral View | @  teenws | B
4 (0310718 14145 General View | | weaws | B
|8 |03/10/18 14:45 | General View - - O lwws W
& 03/10/18 1445 | General View 0| wmirs | A
7 [03/10/18 14145 Generl View O waws | ¥
B |03/10/18 14:45 | General View o - o | @ wedws |
5 |0WA0/18 14:45 | General View 0D | tedws | A
?m 03/10/18 14145 | Genaral View O | waws M
{11 |G3/10/18 19:45 General View D | Loeowc é
:IJ ?ﬂﬂlﬂa’tl:ﬂ-:li General View n .L;d}ﬂ-—- ﬁ
13 | 0N10/18 1445 | General View O i=iws | B
18 0310/16 14:45 | General View D | icadgres | A
15 03/10/18 14:45 | General View O | Lwws | A |
118 | 03/10/18 14:45 General View 0 | oadiws | (A
17 03/10/18 14:45 | General View © | aows | 2
{18 |03/10/18 14:45 | General View 0D | tcaws
;'1; [03/10/18 14:45 | General View D | caewc | A
120 [03/10/18 14:45 General View 0 | tcedrc | BA
i_u_l_qmnm 14:45 | General View O wews &
22 |03/10/18 14:45 | General View O | toadwc | M
{23 |o3/10/18 1445 | General View 0  weawe | A
,rzn 1,1:11.r:4:|,r1n 14:45 —Hﬁu.ml View 0D | waws || A
'l_zs (03/10/18 14145 | General View 0  weows | 4
|26 |03/10/18 14:45 | General View © | isediws | M
27 031018 14145 | General View O weows [ B
’_'__' OIA0/1E 14:45 | Ganersl View © | Loadies | B
29 03/10/18 14:45 | General View 0 | lLades | B
30 03/10/18 1445 | General View 0 | loadws | A
31 [03/10/16 14:45 | Genersl View © | osaws | @4
32 [03/10/18 14:45 | Genersl View O | waaws | B
33 03A0/18 14:45 | Genaral View 0| wadirs | &
34 OV10/18 14:45 | General View € | weers | A
35 03/10/18 1445 | General View g Load G | [ |
36 0I10/18 14045 | Genaral View 0 | ews | A
37 DY/10/18 14:45 | General View ©  losws A
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Merimen e-Claims
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1!hnlll."lml|u - 3 per page m ) |
Ptn [Relabul/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall Print
I!I]im.l'_l! 1445 [General View | @] esares | B4
39 0/10/18 1445 General View O waiws | @ |
40 [D/10/18 14145 | General View S @ | 1oeaws | A |
|41 [03/10/18 14:45 | Genaral View 0  teors | F |
42 0110181445 | General View © | wirs | @
43 |DII0/18 14:45 | Genersl View © | waows 4
44 [0I/0/18 1445 Reinspection Photo O | sdws | 4|
_!_._'m.uum 14:45  Reinspection Photo O  lairs &
{46 'Efnwm 14:45 |l;-lp-dim1;hntn - i Loaad %G | B2 |
47| 03/30/18 14145  Reinspection Photo | 6y | waairs | A |
48 | DI/10/18 14:45 | Reinspection Photo 0 wesws & |
149 |03/10/18 14145 !m_m - 0D  w=dws | M
|50 | 03/10/18 14:45  Reinspection Photo [ : JTETE
5_51 [03/10/18 14:45  Reinspection Photo 0D | wedrs | B
.;J_lu:.rwmu}s HReinspection Photo | @ | Loadies | A
53 Tn!rzwu 1445 | Reinspection Photo | @ | woaaws |
54 m,-:o.rm 1445  Reinspection Photo | @) | wenrs | B
'S5 |03/10/18 14:45 | Reinspection Photo | @ | wedws |
56 |03/10/18 1445 | Relnspection Photo _ | @ | woarws | B2
57 031018 14145 | Reinspection Photo | @ s R
[_bu:ﬁmﬂnn B = = 1 per page > )|
[Wo | Rolabel/Aeorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (HG) Thumbnail  Print
1 |08/06/18 14:43 | EMAIL FROM III DD 06062018 0 | Loadror
i.“ ﬂj..l'ﬂ_l;f_l!_l_‘-"-! w'ﬂm g Load Pﬂ:___ ]
]q 07/06/18 19:16 | TP GIA REPORT - - Load POF
4 I7/09/18 11:04  WORKSHOP INVOICE g Load POF |
|5 27/09/18 11:04 | RENTAL RECEIPT S Load POF
{6 |27/09/18 11:04 LTA SEARCH Load POF
7__|IT0S/B1lDd (0D 00 = = || Load POF |
& 05/04/18 16:51  AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM © | Losa por
5 05/04/19 16:53 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER © | oearor
Mo |Finalized On India International Insurance Pte Lid (M) Thumbrnall | Print
1 07/06/18 08:46 | Singapore Accident Statement © [ Loac ror

Documents Checklist

| DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

| There are no document checklists configured,

Show Remarks Tor [ Handling Tnsurer
Npte Beendens drn DowBlE uriest pid $how it B Offver Gerties
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ce regno 1sss0r1sam)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25  Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Emall: sur@lkkauto com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur File No:  CC4/118010284/UWB302

Date: 05/04/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Ple Lid  Paolicy No MCOMOD15
ST Velion: oy s Insured Vehicle No :  SHD4385E
Date of Loss: 05/08/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT18080138
RIPTION & IDENTIFICATI F VEHI
Reg No: GYTETG
Maka & Model: MERCEDES-BENZ VITO 111, 21D L (M) Engine No. B4688250080703
Reg Date 21112/2004 (Man. Year: 2004) Chassis No: WODFB83960323095978
Colour: Silver Odometer: 2296804 km
Engine Capacity: 2148 cc
Marke! Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S$) Market Value/New Car Price
Tl F I F SURVEY
Gensral Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 225/60 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 225/60 R16
Front Left Side: Continental 6 mm Rear Left Side Continental & mm
Front Right Side: Continental & mm Rear Right Side: Continental 6 mm
The above vilues eoresent e remaining fyre freads depth
COST OF CLAIMS - Repairer's Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %
Parts 8,155.60 5498 60 2,657.00 3258
Miscellanecus tems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3.400.00 1,820.00 1.580.00 45 47
Faintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 11,555.60 7,318.60 4,237.00 36.67
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 5,800.00
(S5) 11,55560 5,800.00 5,75580 40.8
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S8§) B03.89 406.00 402.89 40.81
Nett Amount (5§) 12,364.49 6,206.00 6,158.40 49.81
+ Loss of Use (7.0 x $5100.00/day) (55) 700.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (55) 8.00
Nett Liability (S§) 6,914.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 06062018
Date Inspected: D6/06/2018 Inspected At Precise Aufo Services (HQ)
NO.1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-34/36
Singapore 417883

https://singapore.menimen.comv/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_p... 5/4/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 0f 4

Estimaled Period of Repair: 6.0 days

Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: VIVIAN LAU PE| FENG

NOTE: Thig repor regresents our findings af fhe ime and phice of ingpecton stated herewn. Such mepection fas been camed ouf io fhe best of ouwr
knowledge and abiity but any other fability under any other circumatances is heshy sxpressly axcluded.

hitps:/singapore.menimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusecbox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_p... 5/4/2019



Adjuster Report

Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

|Part Source: (Last Synchronised: 28 Sep 2018)

|Parts; MNIA MERCEDES-BENZ VITO 111 2.1 D L (M) (Model not available in databasa) |
|Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard Lisl)

\Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for GY767G)

| Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the prinl code (above) on all estimale pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate papge

EFurtI_wr lnfni _!tgm;lms not in rﬂl'ammmtabnge are EI_'EIhﬂd' wﬂhf_n asterisk *

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR FENDER RH Badly Dented 3,280.00FL *2,615.00FL
2 1 *REAR FENDER PROTECTOR Broken 11000FL *11D.00FL
3 2 “‘REAR FENDER PROTECTOR CLIPS Necessary 16.00FL *16.00FL
4 1 *SLIDING DOOR RH Badly Dented 1,880, 00FL *1,685.00FL
5 1 “SLIDING DOOR PROTECTOR Bent / Cut 184.00FL *184.00FL
8 8 *SLIDING DOOR PROTECTOR CLIPS MNecessary B4 00FL "B4 D0 FL
7 1 ‘REAR CONTROL ARM RH Not Necessary BBO.00FL *-FL
B 1 *REAR WHEEL BEARING HUP Damaged 580.00FL *5B0.00FL
8 1 ‘REAR ABSORBER Mot Necessary 480.00FL *-FL
10 1 *SLIDING DOOR WORK ART STICKER Necessary 380.00FS “200.00FS
" 1 *REAR TYRE 0/S (LOCAL PURCHASE) ($200.00) (60%) Cut 380.00FS *120.00FS
12 1 “‘REAR RIM ASSY (SPORT) Dented / Bent 750.00FS “450.00F%
FeFmnchise pan. S=Spchett. L=LilemDsc

Sub Total (S§) B,894.00 6,024.00

- List ltem Discount on L ltems 10.00/10.00% (55)

Total Parts (55)

738.40 525.40

8,155.60 5498.60

Repon was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellanecus items selected,
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repalrer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TOWING Mew 80.00 0.00
2 TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM Mew 50.00 20.00
3 TO CHECK & ADJUST COMPUTER WHEEL ALIGNMENT MNew 240,00 80.00
(BEFORE & AFTER)
& TO TUFF COAT AFFECTED AREAS New 180.00 60,00
] TO REMOVE & REFIX SLIDING DOOR MECHANISM New 180.00 60.00
6 TO RESPRAY AFFECTED AREAS New 1,000.00 600.00
7 TO RENEW DAMAGED PARTS ,STRAIGHTEN & REPAIR REAR New 1,200.00 800.00
RH WHEEL HOUSING PANEL & ALIGNED ALL PARTS
B TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR RH UNDERCARRIAGE Mew 350.00 100.00
g TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR SPORT RIM & CONTACT WHEEL New 120.00 0.00
BALANCING
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 3,400.00 1,820.00

Repor was unsubmitted during this print-oul.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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