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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg

Sent: Wednesday, 13 March, 2019 2:26 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Rejectr offer for  our client - SLX 5479B accident with India Insured -  SHB6712J 

ON 04/06/2018   YOur Ref: CC4/III18010283/Ghb3

Attachments: Signed DV - SLX5479B.pdf

Dear Vic, 

  

Pls see attached the DV duly signed. We already have an existing Giro payment arrangement with India. As 

such I will not be submitting the Giro Form. 

  

We will post it out to your office too 

  

Thanks 

  

  

  

Regards 

 

Kee Mui Hong 

Ah Lim Motor @ AMK 

No. 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Pk 2A 

#01-09 AMK Autopoint 

Singapore 568047 

Tel : 64831244 Fax : 64836170 
  

From: Vic (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Wednesday, March 13, 2019 1:57 PM 
To: muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg  

Cc: Admin A ; Vic (LKKAuto)  
Subject: RE: Rejectr offer for our client - SLX 5479B accident with India Insured - SHB6712J ON 04/06/2018 YOur 

Ref: CC4/III18010283/Ghb3 

  
Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Mui Hong, 

 

We refer further to our below email. 

  

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability, our principal is 

prepared to improve and increase offer to a  global sum $2,800.00 (all in) to settle your client’s claim. 

  

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV and forward back to us the original signed hard copy for our 

Principal to process the payment.  

  

The above amount is to be made payable to AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY. 

  

Thank you. 
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"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and 

should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement 

should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present 

matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer 

in any other related matters.  

  
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessary.... 

  

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
  

  

From: Vic (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 12 March, 2019 5:18 PM 

To: muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg 

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: Rejectr offer for our client - SLX 5479B accident with India Insured - SHB6712J ON 04/06/2018 YOur Ref: 

CC4/III18010283/Ghb3 

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Mui Hong, 

 

We refer to your below email. 

  

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our principal’s instruction with regards to your appeal. 

  

We will follow up and will get back to you for an update. 

  

Thank you. 

  
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
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From: muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg [mailto:muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 11 February, 2019 1:58 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: Rejectr offer for our client - SLX 5479B accident with India Insured - SHB6712J ON 04/06/2018 YOur Ref: 

CC4/III18010283/Ghb3 

  

Dear Vic, 

I refer to your email offer and thank you for the email. 

However, client is not agreeable to the offer . 

During the period of repair, he has lost usage of his car for his business ( Private Hire ) and our standard 

rental car cannot be used as Grab car due to the different classification of car. 

We had submitted his full 8 weeks of Grab Car earnings to show that his earnings has been consistent at 

$200/day as such we are requesting for $200/day. 

Client is prepared to compromise if Insurer can offer fairly to compensate him for his loss of income due to 

the negligent action of India Insured driver. It is unfair for him to be unduly penalise with loss of earnings 

due to the action of your driver. 

Pls do review and re-offer fairly to our client’s claim. 

Thanks 

Regards 

 

Kee Mui Hong 

Ah Lim Motor @ AMK 

No. 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Pk 2A 

#01-09 AMK Autopoint 

Singapore 568047 

Tel : 64831244 Fax : 64836170 

From: Vic (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Friday, February 8, 2019 3:44 PM 

To: muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg  

Cc: Admin A ; Vic (LKKAuto)  

Subject: RE: Reminder : Claim Documents for our client - SLX 5479B accident with India Insured - SHB6712J 

ON 04/06/2018 YOur Ref: CC4/III18010283/Ghb3 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  

Dear Mui Hong, 

  

We refer to your below email. 

  

On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our 

Insured’s part, we have our principal’s mandate and we offer settlement as below: 

  

Cost of Repair (w/gst) $ 1,982.18   

Loss of Income ($50 x 6 days)  $ 360.00  

LTA Search Fee $ 7.45  

 TOTAL $ 2,349.63  
    

  

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV and forward back to us the original signed hard copy for our 

Principal to process the payment.  
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The above amount is to be made payable to AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY. 

  

Thank you. 

  
"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and 

should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement 

should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present 

matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer 

in any other related matters.  

  
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessary.... 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
  

  

From: Vic (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 29 January, 2019 3:54 PM 

To: muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg 

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: Reminder : Claim Documents for our client - SLX 5479B accident with India Insured - SHB6712J ON 

04/06/2018 YOur Ref: CC4/III18010283/Ghb3 

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Mui Hong, 

 

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted. 

  

Please be informed that we are currently preparing our report for principal’s mandate approval. 

 

We will expedite and will get back to you for an update. 

  

Thank you. 

  
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
  

  

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 21 January, 2019 2:17 PM 

To: muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg 

Cc: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A 

Subject: FW: Reminder : Claim Documents for our client - SLX 5479B accident with India Insured - SHB6712J ON 

04/06/2018 YOur Ref: CC4/III18010283/wb3 

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

Thank you for your email. 

  

By copy to Vic, 

  

Case reassign to you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg <muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 21 January 2019 2:07 PM 

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>; Admin-B <admin-

b@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Reminder : Claim Documents for our client - SLX 5479B accident with India Insured - SHB6712J ON 

04/06/2018 YOur Ref: CC4/III18010283/wb3 

  

Dear all, 
  

Pls do assist to assign New OIC to check on the above claim documents that we submitted on 03/12/2018. 
  

It has been more than 6 weeks. Pls assist to offer on the claim. 
  

Thanks 
  
  

Regards 

 

Kee Mui Hong 

Ah Lim Motor @ AMK 

No. 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Pk 2A 

#01-09 AMK Autopoint 

Singapore 568047 

Tel : 64831244 Fax : 64836170 
  

From: muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg  

Sent: Monday, December 3, 2018 4:03 PM 
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To: Vivian Lau - LKK ; Thin Thin - LKK  

Subject: Claim Documents for our client - SLX 5479B accident with India Insured - SHB6712J ON 04/06/2018 YOur 
Ref: CC4/III18010283/wb3 

  

Dear Vivian, 
  

Pls see attached the Claim Documents for our client - SLX 5479B accident with India Insured - SHB6712J ON 

04/06/2018 YOur Ref: CC4/III18010283/wb3. 
  

We have also attached a summary of client’s 8 weeks Grab Earnings. 
  

Pls assist to offer on the claim. 
  

Thanks 
  

Regards 

 

Kee Mui Hong 

Ah Lim Motor @ AMK 

No. 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Pk 2A 

#01-09 AMK Autopoint 

Singapore 568047 

Tel : 64831244 Fax : 64836170 
  

  

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, June 07, 2018 4:22 PM 
To: Zila - Ah Lim Motor Co ( AMK )  

Cc: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)  
Subject: Your Ref: SLX 5479B,Our Ref: CC4/III18010283/wb3,ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLX 5479B & SHB 6712J ON 

04/06/2018 

  
WTHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Your Ref: SLX 5479B 

Our Ref: CC4/III18010283/wb3 

  

Dear Sir/Madam, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLX 5479B & SHB 6712J ON 04/06/2018 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under 

BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case. 

  

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your 

client’s vehicle.  

  

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the 

days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor. 

  

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 8625. 
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Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be 

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

  

  

  
Thank you 

Best Regards, 

Vivian Lau| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

 

  

  


