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MS @ FirstCapital

& Rafties Quay 42100 Singapone 048560
Tal (6516222 2911 Fau (B5}6222 1547

M3 First Capital injurance Limiied 2o feg v SH000006E  CET fiwm b M3 00600 &

Clismes i Ptnr Undeiveiiing Depy: 36 Robbmon Rosd BIH01 Oy Howse Siogapoes 0588770

Tall: {H5) 6507 I048  Fax! (651 B507 2040

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number,

wiiiwd mrfisatcanitel comsg
MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
31-056-2018
30-05-2018 Claim Type
SHDB708L

BLOCK 3007,UBI ROAD 1 #01-414
MS ALICE YONG

67482010/ 98172032 Fax No.
WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Our Ref No. D18004333MFSH

. Third Party

Third Party Vehicle. SLS1109Y

. 68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST
Cc : Workshop LENG WANG MOTOR Attention
CHEONGHOH LAW
Cc : TP Solicitor CORPORATION TP Solicitor Fax No
Officer Incharge EILEEN LEE
IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

. NIL

. MA

Kindly subrill the surviy repart via CWS wilkin 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-Inspection

This |s-& compuier generated latiar, no signature reguired.
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Claim Workflow Systam

108 Sheet (/ClaimWs/Surveyor/JobSheet/240938) 1 | pRi Documents @ || close x |
PRI Header Details
Claimant
Claim No | D18004333MFSH Policy No D-18088936MFSH S.No & 1 & CHEONGH
Name
Survey ;
Worksh LENG WANG MOTOR Lot BLOCK 3007,UBI ROAD 1 #01-414
Nam ap (Contact Persan : MS &C o Mobile: 98172032 , Phone: 67482910 ; Fax: 0
€ ALICE YONG) 2 Emailld: MAILBCHEONGHOH SG
Details
Our LEK AUTD CONSULTANTS Instructions NITH BREIUI X
Surveyor FTELTD To Surveyor o MBS
COMFORT TP
Insured Insured - .
Naie TRANSPORTATION PTE Vehicle No SHDE70BL Vehicle SLs1109Y
oo No
PRI Surveyor Surveyor
Recieved 04-06-2018 05:52:00 M Appointed 05-06-2018 02:20:21 PM Accept 06-06-2018 1
Date Date Date
Survey Report Upload
SUFsyay i Surveyor :::::: [ChoosaFie
Inspection | s 06-06-2018 : | Choase File
Date *: i, LR FStor
Vehicle Particulars
Make Please Select Make ¥| | Model Please Select Model * Year  Select Year v
Chasis No | | Engine No | | Mileage |
Cubic
Color | Ca by I
Muitiple Documents Upload
I.iplaa::l Multiple Documents [
File Name Action

Surveyor Job Remarks

Remarks ' |

Fttpes ificinims, com: 8001/CIaimWSiSurveyorDelais/240938

L



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@!kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 1 October 2018 4:58 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
e EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; sur@|kkauto.com
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004333MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please be informed that according to the repairer, TP owner already revertéd to QD elaim

We will close this file at our end without billing.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultunts Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assienments@ikkastogom | fax: basé-4315

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industria) Pack, Ubi Avenue {, #ogi25 | Slgn8oz3)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 6 June 2018 9:40 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsm otorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM'
<ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM:

Co: "EILEENLEE®MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG' dE#LEENLEE@MSFIRSTCﬂPITALCGM.SGb; sur@lkkauto.com’
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004333MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thatlk you for the assignment.

Flrase be informed vehicle not in warkshoy, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,
L. Nivitha | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: pssignmens@Ikkaits com | fix: Gagh-a315
BIk 51, Piya Ubi Indystrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{aoBggy)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:ews matorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 5 June 2018 2:20 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTSELKKAUTO.COM
Cc: CW§MQ[QEMIMS@MSFIRSTCJEPITALEDM.SG; EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL COM SG

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004333MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.



Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.,
WWW.aVE.Com



