Hsiao Tnﬂ (LI(I(ﬁutn!

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent Saturday, B June 2019 11:44 AM

To: 'Chong Boon Sen'

Cc: 'Claims Dept of CTI'; Admin A

Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLEB916L (Ol :
SNM18D02731/C02/6) AND GBC8559M (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18010197/Upb3) on
31.052018

Dear Sirs/Madam,

We reter to the above matter.

Case has been settled at a global sum of $5,200.00(all-in) with Third Party repairer,

We are pending for signed DV from third party and will proceed to close file once DV received.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Bik 51, Paya Ui Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Chong Boon S5en <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 21 May 2019 6:00 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLEB916L (O : SNM18D02731/C02/6) AND

GBC8559M (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI118010197/Upb3) on 31.05.2018

Dear Hsiao Tong,
We provide mandate at requested $55217.00.
Pls submit usual note and fee.

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079908
DID: (65) 63896171 | M: (65) XXXX XXXX | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www sg cntaipingcom | FB: www.facebook com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A H§ik Taiping SG 3 Anson
Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
1



DID: (65) 63896171 | M: (65) XXXX XXXX | F:(65) 6222 1033

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 21 May, 2019 5:43 PM

To: Chong Boon Sen <bgonsen.cho iping.com>
Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLEB16L (Ol : SNM18D02731/C02/6) AND
GBC8559M (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT118010197/Upb3) on 31.05.2018

Hi Boon Sen.

As requested.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEKEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chon _cntalping.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 21 May 2019 5:35 FM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLEBI16L (O : SNM18D02731/C02/6) AND

GBCB559M (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT118010197/Upb3) on 31,05.2018
Dear Hsiaochan,

Appreciate you can provide all relevant documents (pls refer your 1" seeking mandate).

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #18-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079808
DID: (65) B3B9B171 | M: (B5) XXXX XXXX | F:(65)6222 1033

W: www.sq.cntaiping.com | FB: www facebook com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: J°F*¥i§ii Taiping SG 3 Anson
Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079809
DID: (65) 63896171 | M: (B5) XXXX XXXX | F: (65)6222 1033

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, May 17, 2019 3:58 PM
To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Admin A; Irene Tay
Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLEB916L (O : SNM18D02731/C02/6) AND

GBCA559M (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT118010197/Upb3) on 31.05.2018
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Dear Sirs/Mdm,

wa refer fo our mandate request dated 01/10/2018.

Kindly let us have your instruction/approval as third party is chasing for offer.

Thank you for your kind understanding.

Hest Regards,
Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 23 April 2019 9:21 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Irene Tay <irene. cntaiping. >
Subject: Re: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLEB916L (Ol : SNM18D02731/C0D2/6) AND

GBC8559M (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT118010197/Upb3) on 31.05.2018

Dear Sis/mdm,

We refer to our mandate request dated 01/10/2018.

Kindly let us have your instruction/approval as third party is chasing for offer.

Thank you for your kind understanding.

Best Regards,



Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email; chewhit@lkkauto,com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuUto)
Sent: Sunday, 31 March 2019 9:56 AM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
Cc: Admin A; Irene Tay
Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLEBI16L (Ol : SNM18D0273 1/C02/6) AND

GBCB559M (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT118010197/Upb3) on 31.05.2018

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We rafer to our mandate request dated 01/10/2018.

Kindly let us have your approval/ instruction.

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lldkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 2:47 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Irene Tay <irene.ta iping.com>
Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLEB916L (Ol : SNM18D02731/C02/6) AND

GBCB559M (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT118010197/Upb3) on 31.05.2018



Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to our mandate request dated 01/10/2018.

Eindly let us have your approval/ instruction.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | emnil: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Hslao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Saturday, 3 November 2018 10:43 AM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' i cntaiping.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>; Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLEB916L (Ol : SNM18D02731/C02/6) AND
GBCB559M (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI118010197/Upb3) on 31.05.2018

Hi Sirs/Mdm.

We reter to our mondate request dated 01/10/2018.

Kindly let us have your approval/ instruction.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Hslao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 1 October 2018 10:57 AM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc: 'Irene Tay' <irene tay@sg cntaiping com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Poh Kin [LKKAuto)

<pohkin@lkkauto.com>
Subject: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLEB916L (O : SNM18D02731/C02/6) AND

GBC8559M (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT118010197/Upb3) on 31.05.2018

Your rel : SNM18D02731/C02/6

Our ref : CC4/CTI18010197/Upb3q2

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 8715L(0O1) & GBC 8559M(TP) ON 31/05/2018

We refer to the above matter.

It is @ head-to-rear collision, Liability s down against our insured.

We did clarify with Insured the nature of the accident and he's oware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval 1o offer Third Party repairer " FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD" af $5,217.00(all-in).



The summary is as follows: -

Amount Amouni Revised

Claimed
1. Cost of Repair [w/G5T) $16.332.37 $4.815.00
2. Loss of Use [Sdays x $85.00) § 42500 $ 400.00(5days x $80.00)
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee % 2.00 $ 200

Total $16759.37  $5.217.00

**04 days recommendation for repair.

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal,

For your approval please.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 26 July 2018 9:40 AM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claim .cntaiping.com>
Cc: Irene Tay <irene.tay(@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

<pohkin@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLEBS16L (O : SNM18D02731/C02/6) AND GBCB559M (TP : LKK

REF - CC6/CT118010197/Upb3) on 31.05.2018

Your Ref: SNM18DD2731/C02/6



LKK REF: CCs/CT118010197/Upb3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

We refer to the above matter,

Enclosed for your perusal is: -

» Estimated cost of repair
e Preliminary advice
+ Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhi@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg. cntaiping.com>
Sent: Friday, 8 June 2018 2:35 PM
To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

0.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLEB916L (01 : SNM18D02731/C02/6) AND GBCB559M (TP : LKK

REF - CC6/CTI1B8010197/Upb3) on 31.05.2018
Importance: High

Dear Hsiao Tong E/or Shu Pei,

Please refer to the attachments and note that the officer in charge is Irene Tay.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jowyn Tay (Behalf of Irene Tay)
Deputy Claims Executive
Claims Department — Motor Division

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.



3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079309

Direct (65) 6388 6174
Fax (65)6224 7175/6224 7478
Email: claim i .cntaiping.

Website: www.sg cnlaiping.com

ANNIVFRSARY
I Simpapecr siure 1918

Diselaimer

This message is confidential; its comtents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid. excep
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd Anmy unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, elther in whole or partial, is prohibited If vou are not the imtended reciplent of the message,
please notify the sender immediately,

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 7 June, 2018 3:46 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Lucas Lee <lucas.lee@sg cntaiping.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewhi@lkkauto.com>; Admin A < in-a@|kk .com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLEB916L (O] : CT1 - TBA) AND GBCB559M (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18010197/Upb3) on 31.05.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

We had inspected TP vehicle GBC 8559M at M/s Fastech Auto Pte Ltd.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
TP GIA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ghupei@|kkauto com | fax: 6741-4108

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
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This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://www.symanteccloud.com
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FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Date : 05.08.2018

China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pre Lid
3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Ann: Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE: GBC 8559M  / SLE 8916L ON 31052018

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no: GBC 8559M | which was involved
in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle no: SLE 8916L . The vehicle owner has requested and
authorized us to assist him in presenting his'her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
your consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

I} Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST) 5 4.815.00
2} LossOfUse( 4 davs+ | Sun X § 85) 5 425.00
31 GIA Search Result S 2.00

s 5,242.00

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:

a) Final Repair Invoice e) Vehicle Registration Log Card
b) 1C & Driving License f) Letter of Authorisation, etc...
¢) GIA Report/ GILA Search Resuli

d) Insurance Certificate

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our customer’s ¢laims
as spon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank vou. -
Yours faithfully, =

Jason Tang (jasoni@fastechauto.com.sg)
FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

Ppaenl by Lty L el ooy
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Our Ref: CC6/CTI18010197/Upb3
19 JUNE 2018

MOHAMMAD NADHIR BIN JASMIN
BLK 330B ANCHORVALE STREET
4]14.543

SINGAPORE 542330

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 89161, AND GBC 8559M ON 31/05/2018

We refer 1o the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to deal with
the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from GBC 8559M against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should vou however wish to further discuss on the mauer prior 10 our negotiations und
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if vou have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

HEW HSIAO TONG

Case Handler

DID: 67423197

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: chewht@lkkauto.com

C.C. China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre Lid
(Maotor Claims Dept)



DATE : 31.05.2018

TO : China Taipina Insurance Singanore Pia Lid
SLE 8816L ONLY
ALONG __"M7VE®
31.05.2018

ON
WE. STRAITS CONSTRUCTIONS SINGAPORE PTE LTD
of (NRIC No./ROC No.) R
of 13 JLN KEMBOJA 5-340421
owner of vehicle no. s in consideration of M/s FASTECH AUTO

. s r GBC 8556M

PTE LTD repairing my/our vehicle at my/our instruction and hereby

authorise M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD to demand claim settlement whatever
WMMWMWWMMMMWMMI@
pruoeedin@,ifmy,mdu-mynme.fnnhemdm car rental and/or loss of use,
mmdmﬂn&qpoinﬁngsuﬁciwmmﬁ:rmdushmpmnfmmmmﬁnmﬂ
aﬂdniundmﬂfnrnﬂﬂadahnﬂbehngmthmahmlm.




—

Policy No : [DMPCSMIES0111701 Claim Mo - SHM18DO2731/C02/6
Claimant : STRAITS CONSTRUCTION SINGAPORE PTE LTD
Amount £ 885,200.00

Singapore Dollars FIVE THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED Only
t/We agree to acocept the above mentloned amount to be pald to mafus (p Full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damagea
sustained by mefus through an accldent involving

Claimant Venicle No. : GBCESSWM

Insured Vehicle Ne. : SLER?1GL
Dare of Loas 3 31/0572018
Place of Accidant : AMK AVE &5

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforemsntioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE] PTE. LTD., 1/We agree absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAFCRE) PTE. LTD. and/or

Insured Name : MOHAMMAD MADHIR BTN JASMIN
Driver Name ¢ MOHAMMAD MNADHIR BIN JASMIN

from all claims, present or future in respecc of all feoss, injury or damage
sustalned by me/us arising out of the sald accidant.

1 acknowledge that this paymont i1s made withour admission of liabilicty on cthe
part of CHINA TAIPING ITHSURANCE (SINGAPORE] PTE. LTOD.

1l) Glopal Sam 53 5,200.00

TORAL . o o o o puene s o m a0 a0 P 5,200.00

Clailmant Mame : KRIT No :

Signature

Cate
—




TAX INVOICE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

I Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #0148 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Tax Invoice 20325

Date 105072018

Vehicle No  :GBC B550M
Make'Model NISSAN CABSTAR
ChassisEng#

Accident Date :31.052018

Claim No 0518- 20325

Atm: Motor Claims Department Reference
Policy No
Amount
To proceed on lump sum repair 5% 4,500,00
E. &D.E. Total : S8 4,500.00
GS5T @ ™ : 5% 315.00
Amount Due - 8§ J.815.00

FASTECH AUTO PYE LTD
All Invoices are subjected to GST

P i e ey



" Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

5 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE 57 21500 Snospor i,
ASBSCUTON Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE CST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-082851

Date of Request: JDE2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchasa

Kim Chwee Auto Pie Lid

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48

AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Date 31/05/2018

Enquiry By Jason Tang Jun Zhong

TP Vehicle No. SLEB918L

Accident Date 31/052018

Enguiry Result

TP Vihicle No.  |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SLEB916L China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. 04/08/2017-03/08/2018  |6389 6111
Thank You.

Thnmnupmuﬂudhroumtﬂmﬂmﬂunﬂginllmwmmmhnmwmﬁmnu{h&nerﬂlmmnm
ﬁmudﬂbndﬂhgumnndw-t.liunnmmnli:i{lyI'nrthnlumumqnrmﬂhnhandlhlllb-undurnuiilblﬂywhmmrfmmy
qumﬂmnﬂngmdurhmmﬁuﬂmhmpﬂmnrﬂmlmlm

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp __ 31-Mav-18



Invoice
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RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE C©ST Registration No: M400017735

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 D010 Fax; +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am o 5pm

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-18-082851

Date of Request: 31/05/2018 Your Ref No. Online Purchase

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Lid

1 Kakl Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@iKaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Dear SirlMadam,

Enquiry Date 31/0572018

Enquiry By Jason Tang Jun Zhong

TP Vehicle No. SLEBG16L

Accident Date 31/052018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S8)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 013
Total Amount Due (GST inclusive) 2.00

Thank You,

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature

For GIARMC Officlal use:
Date:
[X] GIRO [] Cash [ ] Cheque

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsn 11-Mav-18



