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g Consuiants
BN BB Pie Lid Campany Registration Mo, 1996071588
51 UREAVE 1, #0225 PAYA UBLHINDUSTRIAL PARR, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL ; o5 62563561 FAN : (#05) 62564315
Your ref: SGF2872Y/SL/pl
Our ref: CS/EGII8010194/Avb Date : 21/6/2018

The Motor Claims Department
M/s: ERGO Insurance Pte Lid

Dear Sirdadam,

Without Prejudice

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SJS 1699]

We thank you for your instruction on 3/6/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned

vehicle on_3/6/201%  at the premises of M/s MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
"Check"” Items Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle susiained damages at the
front and rear portion.

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING WAL PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

1 5518,479.68

: 5%8,800.00 (LUMP SUM)

(8%

: 5%

: 8%

1 5%




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 21 June 2018 11:12 AM

To: "Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.)'

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SGF2872Y / TP : 5)S1699)/LKK / DOA : 04.06.2018
Attachments: SJS 1699) PRELI REVISED.pdf

Dear Pei Li,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SJS 1699]
Date of survey: 5/6/2018
Number of days :14 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall ;suri@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, & June 2018 10:57 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SGF2872Y / TP : SJ51699)/LKK / DOA : 04.06.2018

Dear Pei Li,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SJS 1699] on 5/6/18 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-2561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 5 June 2018 10:46 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: RE: SGF2872Y / TP : S151699J/LKK / DOA : 04.06.2018

Dear Pei Li,



Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignmentsi@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 8(408933)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg)
Sent; Tuesday, 5 June, 2018 10:05 AM

To: "admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM; SUR (sur@lkkauto.com) <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: O : SGF2872Y / TP : SJ51699J/LKK / DOA : 04.06.2018

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016 in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD,

ADDRESS : BLOCK 3023A UBIROAD 1
#01-61
SINGAPORE 408717

PERSON TO CONTACT : MEI @ 6744 4422 [ 8121 3226

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : STEVE LIM
Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Obtain estimate and advise the consistency of damages to third party
vehicle that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your

office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured and Third Parties’ SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimate was
provided.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.
Thank yaou

Best Regards

Yee Pei Li

Claims Assistant (Motor)
ERGO Insurance Pte. Lid.

& Temasek Boulevard
#04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038985

DID: 65 6625 9194

Fax 656820 9247

Wiebsile: www, ergo.com.sqg



Have you tried our new travel insurance product yet?
TravelProtect comes with comprehensive benefils al some of the most
affordable prices available in the market.

ERGO
TravelProtect

yous Chobal Saety Kt ™ BuY NOW

TrirrilPritieil o welsres Ben by ERGD nesase Pis L




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 6 June 2018 10:57 AM

To: ‘Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)

Cc SUR

Subject: RE: SGF2872Y / TP : SJ51699)/LKK / DOA : 04.06.2018
Dear Pei L1,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SIS 1699J on 5/6/18 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 5 June 2018 10:46 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SGF2872Y / TP : 5J51699J/LKK / DOA : 04.06.2018

Dear Pei Li,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assipnmentsi@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report @ergo.com.sg)
Sent: Tuesday, 5 June, 2018 10:05 AM

To: ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Ce: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM; SUR (sur@lkkauto.com) <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Ol : SGF2872Y / TP : SJ51699)/LKK / DOA : 04.06.2018

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist ta conduct this survey from MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

1



ADDRESS . BLOCK 3023A UBIROAD 1

#01-61
SINGAPORE 408717
PERSON TO CONTACT © ME| @ 6744 4422 / 8121 3226
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE ~ : STEVE LIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Obtain estimate and advise the consistency of damages to third party
vehicle that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your
office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured and Third Parties’ SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimate was
provided.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Have you tried our new travel insurance product yet?
TravelProtect comes with comprehensive benefits at some of the most
affordable prices available in the market.

P ERCO

¢ TravelProtect
T

11 e iPRoliIt i urderat Bon Sy § RGO s




Catherine ChonE (LKK Auto)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 5 June, 2018 10:05 AM

To: ‘admin-d@kkauto.com'

Cc: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM; SUR (sur@lkkauto.com)

Subject: Ol ; SGF2872Y /TP : 5JS1699J/LKK / DOA ; 04.06.2018

Attachments: Ol - SGF2872Y - SAS.pdf; SJ51699) - SAS.pdf; 15T VEH SU3981D - SAS.pdf;

5J51699] - PRS FORM.pdf

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD,

ADDRESS : BLOCK 3023A UBIRDAD 1
#01-61
SINGAPORE 408717
PERSON TO CONTACT : MEI @ 6744 4422 / 8121 3226
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : STEVE LIM
Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Obtain estimate and advise the consistency of damages to third party

vehicle that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your
office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured and Third Parties’ 5AS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimate was
provided.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

ax B5 BE2G 9247

bsite! www.ergo.com.sg



Have you tried our new travel insurance product yet?
TravelProtect comes with comprehensive benefits at some of the most
affordable prices available in the market

&= ERCO
W TravelProtect
et ekl By Nt ¥ BUY NOW
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Date: DS-GE:EDIH Sant via Fax
Our Reference: SGF 137"2"".}5UF*| a
Your Reference: 515 1689
Emall
megihuey@maodernautomotive.com.og

s MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
Pre-Repair Survey (PRS) Acknowledpement
Wehicle For Inspection: 5J5 1699) -
Insured’s Vehicle: SGF 2872Y
Date Of Accident: 04.06.2018
We acknowledge receipt of yaur request for PRS on: 04.06.2018
In compliance with "State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor from
the list below and indicate your selection in the box marked *, ¥ olele

AlS Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd LES L.B.S Auto Consultants Pie Lid

FTa FormTeam Consuftancy Pie Ltd LKK LEK Auta Consultants Pte Ltd

1as Infiniti Appraisal Service Ps Priority Services

JFK JP Enights Pta Ltd VAL Vicam Lid

Yeur request farinspection does not have your elient’s GIA report, kindly farward a copy.

v Cwir Insured's driver has not reported the accident to us todate.

Vour request for inspection does not have your client’s cost of repair estimate, kindly forward 3 copy.

We acknowledge your interest for direct settlement, we will assess & revert soon upon receipt of estimate.

V |owers.  We are therefore notina position to discuss on liability at this juncture,

OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - STEVE LIM

Prepared by: Q—Of\h ik 6829 9194 claims@ergo.com.sg

Signature: FAX : 6829 9247
Assessar use only: Workshop wse anly:
Assessor gttended workshop on:
Assignment Date: Date:
Asslgnment Time: Time T
Inspector:
Remarks: [ vehicle not available at the apgolnted date and time.

Kindly acknowledge our Assessor presence for the above job |

Warkshop Acknowledgement & Stamp.
Note: Qur Inspection is on o without admission to liability bosis,




> Back to OneMotoring

Engquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Owner 1D Type; Singapare MRIC

Owner 1D: &074|

Vehicle No.: 5)5169%)

Wehicle to be Exported: Yes

Intended De-registration Date: 05Jun2018

Vehicle Make: HYUMNDA]

Vehicle Model: 130 [FD} 1.6 DOHC AUTD
Primary Calour; Black

Manufacturing Year: 2009

Engine No.: GAFCRU&6T112
Chassis No,: KMHDCS1DR9U 185480
Maximum Power Cutput: B9.7 kW (120 bhp)
Open Market Value: $13.415.00

Original Registration Date; 31 Jul 200%

First Registration Date: 31 Jul 200%

Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid $13,615.00

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: J0 Jul 2019

PARF Rehate Amount; $7.488.00

COE Expiry Date: 30 Jul 2019

COE Category:; A - Car [1600¢cc & below)
COE Period(Years) 10

QP Paid: $15291.00

COE Rebate Amount: $1.759.00

Total Rebate Amount: $7,247.00

The infarmation cantained herein is correct as at 05 Jun 2018

oK



SGEARMART.COMM

Hew Cars

CAR
THE OFFICIAL FORUM O

Used Cars

Sell My Car

ASK » DISCUSS
LEARN » SHARE

ART.COM

Directory

Products Insurance

= Mew immigrant skills in NZ
= 2018 FIFA World Cup

o Liverpool 2017/18: YNWA with Klopp

Articles Forum

) SEARCH ERE CoT i B ETN (T |

Resources
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CAR DETAILS

Hyunda 120 1.64

Hyumdai 130 Wagan 1.548 Sunroof

Hyundai i30 1.6A Sunroof

NOIMAGE A)

Prica

Instalment
Ragistration Date
Manufactured
Mileage
Transmisshon
Engina Cap

Road Tax

Power

Curb Weight

Features

ACCessories

Description

COE

oMy

ARF
Depreciation
Mo, of Owners
Type of Vehicle
Category

Availability

£13, 600

§390

14-hpr-2009

008

103,940 km

Auto

1,591 cc

$738 iyr

B9.7 kW (120 bhp)
1,314 kg

1.6 DOHC Engine, Auto Transmission,

SRS Alrbags, ABS, EBD, Fog Lamps,
Krockdown Rear Seats,

Sports Rims, Ploneer Car Sterea Systam,
Solar Film, Electrical Retractable Side
Mirrors,

Low Mileage, Average Clocked At
11500Km Yeady Only! Extended
‘Warranty Availl Professional Evaluation
Services Provided! Well Taken Cara
Stylsh Hatch In Tip Top Condition, See
It For Youwrself To Balievs! Buy It Fram
Us With A Peace Of Mind, A Comgpany
Accredited With Dutstanding Awands,
Professional After Sales Service Assured,
Drog By Our AC Showroom To
Appreciate It In Pristine Condition
Today!

$7,000
$12,100
$12,100
$9,070 fyr
4
Hatehback

PARF Car

Available

$16,666

$862

14-Aug-2009

2008

146,307 km

it

1,591 oc

$738 fyr

89,7 kKW (120 bhp}
1,360 kg

Onginal Conditian,

Factary Fithed Interior,

{100% Quality Buy!) Shop With Pesce OF
Mind From CaseTrust Accredited
Compary. Purchase And Enjoy 180 Days
Engine And Goarbox Protection Shiskd
With 24/7 Roadade Assstanoe And
Replacernent Viehicle Coverage Worth
$688! STANICOM/AASTDAC Evaluatian
Friendly, (Viewing Available Daily By
Appointrment.)

$13,658
$14,576
£14,576
$7.860 fyr

1
Statiormagon

Available

$19.900

$854

16-Noy-2009

2004

130,760 km

Auto

1,581 cc

£738 fyr

B9.7 kW (120 bhp)

1,314 ka

Fuel Effichent 1.6L 16 Valves DOHC
Engine Producing 120Bhg, Smooth CWWT
Auto Transmission, ABS, Hulth Steering
Cantrols, Dual Alrbags,

lLeather Seats, Sports Rims, Multi
Function Steering Wheel, Factory Fitted
Audio Systems, Rear Knockdown Seat,
Retractable Side Mirroe,

All Qur Quality Pre Cwned Cars Are
Selling At The Most Reasonable Price
And With A Pepece OF Mind! STANICOM
Evaiuate fre Welcome, Easy Approvall
Do Paymeent 43500, Our Flexible Bank
And In Houge Financing Loan Up To
S16000, Low Uisage! Accident Froe,

Pristne And [mmaculate Condition| View
To Agpredate! Tast Drive Today.

$16,859
$13,350
$13,350
£5,140 fyr
2
Hatchback
ar

Availabla



MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
BLK 3023A UBI ROAD 1 # 01-61

SINGAPORE 408717
Tel : 6748 4422/ G745 4422 Fax : 8747- 8720 REG NO 20050110ZH
Quotation
Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd DATE : 05.06.2018
§ Termasek Boulevard VEH NO : 8J81699.
#04-01 Suniec Tower Five MQDEL : Hyundai i30
Sinpzpore 038985 DOA : 04.06.2018
Tel - 6829- 9170 YR REF T SGF2872Y
Fax . GE29 - 8247
Attn . Motor Claim Dapt (Pls arrange vehicle survey & chack liability)
RE . ESTIMATE FOR ACCIDENT REFAIR 8516994 {Hyundai i30)
ltem cription _ Oty _Amt
NG LISTITEMS - FRONT PORTION
{  FrontBumper sfa-ted 1 45180 7
2 Front Bumper Clips /% 1 gel 30.00 7
3 Eront Bumper Side Holdar- LH&RH " 2 66.00 7
4 Front Bumper Lower Girile e L . 1 2£7.007
5 Front Bumper Reinforcement g 1 253,007
&  Front Grile (el d : 1 220407
- Front Grils Chrome Moulding C—< 1 12030~
8 Front Grille Emblem "™ | 1 45107
5  Headlamp-LH&RH 7 ; 1153.80
10 Bonnet Dittel—c. 1 1,184.007
11 Bonnstlock e —a _ 1 ©6.00
2 Bonnet Insulator  (furplec 1 162007
13 Bonnat Insulator Clips (- 1 set 30.00
14  Front Support Panel r_H'J'I‘i‘":w.*i-E.EL i il 6560
16 Front Support Panel Top Cover Do f‘ir s s 1 127,10 —
16  Front Support Panel Top Cover Clips 0, 1 set 2600 =
{7 Air Con Cordenser &% 1 906.80
18 Air Gon Discharge Fipe 1/ m 1 226.30 -
19 Air Con Suction Pipe ™ 1 214.90
20  Radistor B4 _ 1 685.00 o
21  Radiator Fan Assy (e bt i BE84.00 -
29 Radislor Top Hose 1o/ 1 52.00
23 Engine Top Cover (au e c 0 5 186.40 <
24  Front Fender - LH & RH Ry Buglhs "‘ 2 Qe0.20- 450 10
$ §,046.20
Less 20% (1,608 24)

$ 7,236.96



RE :
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PV TR
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13
14
16
1=
17
16
19
20
21
22
23
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ESTIMATE FOR ACCIDENT REFAIR $J51893J (Hyundal i30}

Raar Number Plate Lamz - LH&R
Fj':'ll'ﬂ}‘ —

Rear Bumper
Rear Bumper Clips

Rear Bumper Side Holder - LFH,S. Rj—i
Rear Bumper Sponge O
Fear Bumper Tow Covel
rear Bumper Reinforcement
Rear Bumper Reinforsement Bracke
Rear End Panel =2 14 _
Rear End Pangel Top Gamish RS
Taillamp - LH & RH %

Tailgate — BA1

Tailgate Lack D0
Tailgate \Weatharstnpe tnd
Taigate Glass Moulding

Hyundai Wording 1

i30 Wording |',u~w

S Wording I

Spare Tyra Panel Pop (
Spare Tyre Panel Top Lover
Spare Tyre Lock Screw

Rear Exhaust Pipe

Rear Exhaust Mounting o

SINETT ITEMS
Front Mumber Flate

Front Number Plate Holdsr

Rear Mumber Plate

Rear Number Plate Hp_lder d

Reverse Sensor

Rear End Pane! Sealant
Tailgate Glass Sealant

LABOUR CHARGE

H 'E“‘jf‘ L4

(AL prts

2
1
sat
2
1
4
1
5
1
1
2

1
1
i
1
1

1
1
1
1
1
1
1

440

To knocking & pull out front & rear pardon & renew above parts

To putty & spray up paint WOorks

1,152.00 <
166.80 7
124 80~
122 40~

38 607
59407
3040
778,20 X
25120 -
46,80
712.004
2780 %

6,078.40
(1.215.68)

486272

30,00
3000
30.00 <
30.00 *
280,00 200

60.00
80.00 o

520.00

12,619.68_

2@em/r’&m

2.2 . |'i_}_.‘. _.f’]



RE: ESTIMATE FOR ACCIDENT REPAIZ 51699, (Hyundai i30)

S =

To chack wiring

L]

4 To underseal

5 Toremove [EVerse Sensor
5] To remove uphaistery

I To transfer tailgate fitings
g8  Toremove tailgete glass

g Toremove exhaust pipe

10 To remove condanser, radiator & (o re-085

GST Will be reflected in the final hills

MNOTE: -

PLEASE INFORM US WITHIN
THE EVENT THAT THE OWNER/DRIVER
WITH YOUR COMPANY, FAILING WHICH WE SHALL
FOR ALL COSTS OF REPAIRS, LO%S OF USE AND STORAGE.

Total Labour

Grand Total

LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
tha Repairer of tna 10ii0

L] resur
T oy
e
® Third pany Survey LU thout Prajudice” based
« Mo Wegal modiicabioni3) i allened
» Supptementary 5t _anl:_l
[ .=...-I.'I|I':i_'.ll._|‘:.i‘:-1| aopraval fnon neyrance Comp

Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:
Daie:

s e |

$ 18000 |/
3 160.00 <
$ qge00 120
K 5,860.00
I $ 18,479.68 |

14 DAYS, FROM THE DATE OF THIS LETTER, IN
IS IN BREACH OF iTS POLICY
HOLD YOUR COMPANY LIABLE

10 11456 &0

LS LA

Fary |
ay £ Ne=T alig )
.{:I L._, { I /'_-’ 128 Y,

i



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

I 74 74
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ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD Ref : CS/EGI1B010194/Avbn2

5 TEMASEK BOULEVARD

(MBI

#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 25-06-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SGF 2872Y Veh. Inspected 5.5 16994
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SGF2872Y/5Upl Excess () 0.00
Assign From YEE PEILI Assign Date 05/06/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 130 HB C.C 1591
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. KMHDCES1DROU1B85480 Colour WHITE
Odometer 200036 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3, Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/85R15 FALKEN & mm
L/H Front Tyre 18565 R15 FALKEN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre [188/E5R15 FALKEN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/65R15 FALKEN & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT AND REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5 General Information
Accident Date  04/08/2018 Inspection Date 05/06/2018
Survey held at MQDERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
BLK 3023A UBI ROAD 1
#01-81
SINGAPORE 408717
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 14 Working Days
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51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
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Reg. No: 193607 198R GST Reg. Mo. 15-96807198-R Page Mo.:1 of3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJS 1699.
Estimate Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition  [© mmp?gn {s!;“
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS

1|FRONT BUMPER DISTORTED 451.80 451.B0
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE HOLDER-LH & RH WECESSARY 66.00 66.00
1|FRONT EUMPER LOWER GRILLE DEFORMED 247.00 247 .00
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT 253,00 253.00
1|FRONT GRILLE CRACKED 220.40 22040
1|FRONT GRILLE CHROME MOULDING CRACKED 120.80 120.80
1|FRONT GRILLE EMBLEM WMECESSARY 4510 4510
2IHEADLAMP-LH & RH CRACKED 1,153.80 1,153.80
1|BONNET DISTORTED 1.184.00 1,184 00
1|BONNET LOCK DAMAGED 96 00 9600
1|BONNET INSULATOR CRUMPLED 192.00 192.00
1|3ET BONNET INSULATOR CLIPS MECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL DISTORTED 855.60 B55.B0
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL TOF COVER DEFORMED 127.10 12710
1|SET FRONT SUPPQORT PANEL TOP COVER CLIPS MECESSARY 25.00 25.00
1|AIR CON CONDENSER BENT 906,80 906 80
1|aIR COMN DISCHARGE FPIPE WNOT NECESSARY 226.30 -
1|AIR CON SUCTION PIPE NOT NECESSARY 214.90 -
1|RADIATOR BENT &89.00 BEG.00
1|RADIATOR FAN ASSY CRACKED 684,00 684 00
1|RADIATOR TOP HOSE TORN 52.00 52.00
1|ENGINE TOP COVER CRACKED 185.40 195.40
2|FRONT FEMDER-LH & RH OIS BUCKLED 880,20 480.10
2|REAR NUMBER PLATE LAMP-LH & RH NS DAMAGED 124.20 B62.10
1|REAR BUMPER DISTORTED 447 .00 447.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER-LH & RH MECESSARY T6.00 76.00
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE DISTORTED 179.30 179.30
1|REAR BUMPER TOW COVER DEFORMED 15.20 16.20
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT 27140 271.40

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18010194/Avbn2
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Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9507196-R Page No_:2 of 3
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ()
5|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BRACKET BENT 80.00 80.00
1|REAR END PANEL DISTORTED 364.70 364 70
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH DEFORMED 85.20 95.20
2| TAILLAMP-LH & RH cuT 895.80 895 80
1| TAILGATE DENTED 1,152.00 1,152.00
1|TAILGATE LOCK DAMAGED 166.80 166.80
1| TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIPE cuT 124,80 12480
1| TAILGATE GLASS MOULDING NECESSARY 122,40 122.40
1|HYUNDAI WORDING NECESSARY 38.90 38.90
1(130 WORDING NECESSARY 30.40 39.40
1|5 WORDING NECESSARY 30.40 30.40
1|SPARE TYRE PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 776.20 -
LABOUR
1|SPARE TYRE PANEL TOP COVER DEFORMED 251.20 251.20
1|SPARE TYRE LOCK SCREW NOT NECESSARY 46.60 -
1|REAR EXHAUST PIPE NOT NECESSARY 712.00 -
1|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING NOT NECESSARY 27.80 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -3,024.92 -2,513.70
12,099 68 10,054.80
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE (SN) MISSING 30.00 30.00
1|FRONT NUMEER PLATE HOLDER (SN) MISSING 30.00 30.00
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE (SN) DISTORTED 30.00 30.00
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE HOLDER (SN) DISTORTED 30.00 30.00
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN DAMAGED 280.00 200.00
1|REAR END PANEL SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 60.00 80.00
1| TAILGATE GLASS SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 60.00 £0.00
520.00 440,00
LABOUR
TO KNOCKING & PULL OUT FRONT & REAR PORTION & 2,500.00 1,800.00
RENEW ABOVE PARTS INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF
SPARE TYRE PANEL.
TO PUTTY & SPRAY UP PAINT WORKS. 2,200.00 1,500.00

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18010194/Avbn2
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Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ()

TO CHECK WIRING 100.00 650.00

TO UNDERSEAL. 150.00 80.00

TO REMOVE REVERSE SENSOR 100.00 50,00

TO REMOVE UPHOLSTERY 150.00 BO.0OD

TO TRANSFER TAILGATE FITTINGS 180.00 80.00

TO REMOVE TAILGATE GLASS. 180.00 120.00

TO REMOVE EXHALUST PIPE NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -

TO REMOVE CONDENSER,RADIATOR & TO RE-GAS. 180.00 120.00

5 B80.00 3.830.00

GRAND TOTAL 18,479.68 14,384.80

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 8,000.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18010194/Avbn2

‘g‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSDE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

HECLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report Is made solely for the use and benefit of tha Client named on the front page of this Report,




