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]’I’]U Auto

=y} Consuifarnis
i Ba B Ple Lid

51 UBL AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBIINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (65) 63564315

Your Ref: D18004445MFSH Date: 13 December 2018

Our Ref: CS/FCI18010178/Agb

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _GU 5986D .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 05/06/2018 at the premises of M/s F-1 AUTOCLINIC. and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :83  8.753.85

Revised Estimate Amount :S%  3.200.00 (Lump Sum)
“Check” ltems Amount : 58 - .

Market Value e -

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -

Nett Value : S% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages

at the rear portion.

Yours faithfully

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B Eng AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A, MMATAI

Licensed Appraiser



MS @ FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited CcR=g No J550001050 5T Beg Ko, M2 00016769
6 Raffles Quay §21-00 Singapore D4B580
Tel (65) 6222 2311 Fax |65} 6222 3547

Claims & Motor Undenwaiting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #1601 City House Singapore OBEB77
Tel: {65) 6507 3848 Fax (656507 3848
wewl msfirstcapitaloom.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

04-08-2018 Our Ref MNo. D18004445MFSH
02-06-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC70502 Third Party Vehicle. GU5986D

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #01-43
CHRIS CHAN PICK YUEN

0/ 92712214 Fax No. O

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MA Fax MNo. 68416315
MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

F-1 AUTOCLINIC PTE
LTD

MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. MNA

Attention. MIL

LURENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kincly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection,

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 December 2018 4:12 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System'; assignments

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004445MFSH/1
Attachments: CSFCI18010178Aqb.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of GU 5386D.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 6 June 2018 12:12 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com=>
Cc: LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004445MFSH/1

Dear Lurene,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GU 5986D on 05/06/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto,com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 5 June 2018 10:39 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: LURENEJAW @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004445M FSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignmentsi@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

1



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 6 June 2018 12:12 PM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System’; assignments

Cc: LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004445MFSH/1

Dear Lurene,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GU 5986D on 05/06/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-9561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 5 June 2018 10:39 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital. com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: LURENEJAW @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004445MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assipnments@lkkauto.com | fax: b256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 5 June, 2018 9:50 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@ELKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; LUREN EJAW @MSFEIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004445M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System
Motor. Claims Department



Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registe: ed Vehicle

fiitpes

" g i

> Back to OneMotoring

Wehicle Owner Particulars
Dwener 10 Type:

Chymier 10

Vehicle Detatls

Metucle Mo

Vemnicle i e Exportied:
Interded e-registeation Date
Wehioe Mike:

Vediiche Misel

Primary Calour:
Manutacturing Year:

Engine Mex

Chassiz N

Mzsimium Pawer Out put:
Open Marker Value,

Criginal Regstration Date:
Firet Rezistration Date:
Transfer Ceagnt:
Adtual ARF Paid;

Intended FARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

FATRF Efigihility Expiry Dhate:
PARF Renate Armsount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Dater

COE Cotegary:

COE Poriodl Years):

PP Paid

COE Rebats Amount:

Tatal Rebate Amount:
Message

Please nole *hat tie S-year COE for this vechicle cannot be further renewed, The vehicle must
reaches it siatutory lifespan (iF applicable), whichever is saclie r,
The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 04 Ju - 2018

vl g sig Imr-.d.*nclrun.':uquircﬂcmml-i!vI’uh-ictiuliml)m:nlupur'-‘FI INCTION [D-F030400u]7]

OK

Campany
nzave

GUSPHALY

Yo,

04 Jun 2018
DAlIHATSU
SEMIRV-ZMLF

Silver

2001

GTas9a7
JOASZIVOC10006 72

$14.437.00
12 Apr 2001
12 Apr 2001
a

$732.00

Na

5000

31 Mar 2023

C - Goods Vehicle & fus
5

$24.394.00

$18.649.00

$18.649.00

Fage | of |

bz de-registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle

42008



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner 1D Type:
Owner 1D

Company
02872

Vehicle Mo

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Yehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No,

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value;
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

GUS786D

Yes

05 Jun 2018
DAIHATSL
S221RV-ZMLF

Sibver

2001

0746947
IDASZ21IVO01000672

$14.637.00
12 Apr 2001
12 Apr 2001
3

273200

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Mo

$0.00

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period{Years):
POP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

31 Mar 2022

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
5

$24,394.00

$18,636.00

%18,6356.00

Please note that the S-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the

vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier.

The infermation contained herein is correct as at 05 Jun 2018



Bk 25 Kaki Bukit Rd 4
# 05.26 SYNERGY @KB

ahesatl

F-1 AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD

Block 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4, #05-26 Synergy (@ KB Singapore 417800

HP: 96583371

- [T
T{/ j s {r‘ra

¥,
X'Hi'* f HEEY

Singzpore 417800

Accident date: 02" June 2018

Estimated repair cost for vehirir no: GU5S386D DAIHATSU

TEL: (65) 67022915  FAX:67022916

04" June 2018
2o 43 I'I_-.- f L

b

sm__Qty ltems Ulprice Amount _ o,
1 1 Rear boot lid Pevdcd %f )
2 1 Rear boot lid 70 kinn/h logo } e : rof )
3 1 Rear boot lid 3 pa logo _$30°00 o/ im)
4 1 Rear BootLid Lock  Deave ¢ :;Z_E:Hﬂ‘&_b__ 5185
5 1 boot lid inner trim tioard € A 420,00 ~
B 1 boot lid inner rubk:ar &t dﬁ_ﬁﬁﬂy 157
7 1 Rear boot lid center Mouiding ¢~ $115.00 «
] 1 Rear boot daihats:.. 'ogo e $25.00 —
g 1 Rear number plate - #tv $50.00 ¥
10 2 Reartail lamp Cmeleed . $240.00 $480 00
11 2  Rear tail lamp pany:l Ve o $88.00 $176.00 ~
2 1 Rearbumper 3¥e—d ! $75000 S50
13 8 Rear bumper clips rév $12.90 $463720 °
14 2 Rear bumper side bracket $121.10 §Zazad ¢
15 1 Rear bumper reverse sensor ™ et ple $350.00-C.
16 2  Rear bumper side chrome %,/ per $83.20 $166.404
17 1 rear bumper centre chrome . $225.00
18 1 Rear end panel Devded $371.50
13 1 Rear End Panel Tc» Garnish At $182.204
20 1 Rear spare tire bracket 4 $171.25%
21 1  Rear spare tire bracket lock [ "7 ™ $181.10"
22 1 Rear Exhaust $680.00 4
Subtotal :- 55,433.5_5
Fage 126 257252

J4k)n1



La r charges
to Remove & install rear windscreen

Gum neC

To remove & re-fix rear exhaust

To remove & re-fix rear reverse sensor
To Check Wiring System

Tuff kote

Panel beating

Spray painting

Sheet1

1550

Subtotal :-

Total:-

$250.00

$12ﬂ.0ﬂ){

$60-00 5
$120.00 50
W?uﬂ
s/apafaﬁgw

$2,320.00

$8,753.85

LKK Auto Consultants hence notity
the Repairer of the following:
» To resurvey ba ter gnray painting

» To dispiay dam | resLTVay
» Paris ptice
Third party surve ] | s
'H"-"I"']" me L
» Sunplementary amis) must berresuneyed and

® subject 1o hinal approval lrem Insurance Lompany

Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:
Diate:

Page 127
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ul Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: B256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607T188R GST Reg. No, 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automabile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAFPORE 068877

Ref : CS/FCHA010178/Agbn2

Date 17-12-2018

BB

Code . FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 70502 Veh. Inspected GU 59860
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. D18004445MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From LURENE Assign Date D5/06/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model DAIHATSU HIJET C.C 1298
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2001
Chassis No. JDAS221V001000672 Colour SILVER
Odometer 355780 Steaering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |155R13C CONDOR & mm
L/H Front Tyre |155R13C CONDOR & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |1585R13C CONDOR & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |155R13C CONDOR 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  02/06/2018 |Inspection Date 05/06/2018
Survey held at  BLK 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE & #01-43
Repairer F-1 AUTOCLIMIC PTE LTD
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR. 6 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GU 5986D

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapare 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 100607198R GST Reg. Mo 19-0607108-R

Paga No.:1ol 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition [ Strare 13}1 “]]
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BOOT LID DENTED 1,250.00 92900
1|REAR BOOT LID LOCK DAMAGED 22500 189.00
1|BOOT LID INNER TRIM BOARD NOT NECESSARY 420.00 -
1|BOOT LID INNER RUBBER CuT 210,00 187 .00
1|REAR BOOT LID CENTER MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 115.00 -
1|REAR BOOT DAIHATSU LOGO NECESSARY 25.00 2500
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
2|REAR TAIL LAMP @$240.00 CRACKED 480.00 480.00
2|REAR TAIL LAMP PANEL @$88.00 TO REPAIR SEE 176.00
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 750.00 58B.00
8|REAR BUMPER CLIPS @$12 80 NECESSARY 103.20 30.00
2| REAR BUMPER SIDE BRACKET @3$121.10 HMECESSARY 24220 64.00
1|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR HWOT MECESSARY 350.00 -
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE CHROME @583.20 NOT NECESSARY 166.40 g
1|REAR BUMPER CENTRE CHROME NOT NECESSARY 225.00 -
1|REAR END PANEL DENTED 3a71.50 371.50
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH NOT NECESSARY 182.20 -
1|REAR SPARE TIRE BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 171.25 -
1|REAR SPARE TIRE BRACKET LOCK NOT NECESSARY 181.10
1|REAR EXHAUST MOT NECESSARY G80.00 -
LESS 15% DISCOUNT - -431.03
6,373.85 2,442 A7
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BOOT LID TOKM/MH LOGOD (SN) MECESSARY 30.00 10.00
1|REAR BOOT LID 3 PAX LOGO (SN) MECESSARY 30.00 10.00
1|GUM (SN} MECESSARY 50.00 50.00
110.00 70.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & INSTALL REAR WINDSCREEN, 120.00 120.00

Report Ref No, CS/FCI18010178/Agbn2




'V Vd LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Adm ma B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
s TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 198807198R GST Reg. No. 19-0607198-R Page No.'2 of 2
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rkshop?:}} l:il}
TO REMOVE & RE-FIX REAR EXHAUST NOT NECESSARY 250.00 y
TO REMOVE & RE-FIX REVERSE SENSOR NOT NEGCESSARY 120.00 2
TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM. 60.00 30.00
TUFF KOTE. 120.00 50.00
PANEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 800.00 700.00
TAIL LAMP PANEL.
SPRAY PAINTING 800.00 600.00
2,270.00 1,500.00
GRAND TOTAL 8,753.85 4,012.47
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,200.00
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI118010178/Agbn2
MARKET VALUE: $22,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $18,649.00=NETT VALUE: $3,351.00

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng.AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATA|

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benelit of the Chent named cn the front page of this Report.,

Mo llabifity of responsibilite whatsoever, in centact of 1ort. |5 accepted to any third pary who may realy on the Report wholly or in parl. Any third party acting er realving en this
Begart. in whole or in part, dees so at his or her cen sk




