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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
&1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

I as s TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo, 199607198R. GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref : CC&/EQI18010156/Ahb3
NI
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 05-06-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 065110
Code: EQI
1. Folicy Parliculars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YP 4395[ Veh, Inspected SLX 82030
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 05/06/20 18
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model Cic o
Engine No. HIDDEN Ycar of Reg.
Chassis No. Crlour
Cdometer : Sicering
Brakes Modification
General
3. “onditions of Tyres
Size ~ [Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre | mm
R/H Rear Tyre rmm
L/H Rear Tyre o mm
4, Description i Damages
5. .ru[.l nalion
Accident Date  03/06/2010 lnspection Date 04/06/2018
Survey held at FASTECH LTO
1 KAKI BURIT AVEN ;
#01-46/48/50 ALUTOEAY
SINGAPCRE 417883
Ba. Rer
ATHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED C/ | -',*JITH IT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR F‘“T JET WE ! :’_}_"-_:'ﬂ ITHORISED REPAIRS




ESTIMATE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay
Singapore 417883
Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520 3
Tax Reg No: 200006262D ke
Estimate Ref: 20332
Date : 04.06.2018
WVehicle Num : SLX 9203D
Make/Model : MAZDA 3
Chassis/Eng# :
Accident Date : 03.06.2018
Claim Mo : 0618-20332
Reference :
Policy No :
Particular Amount 58
List item Unit price
| Pc Head Lamp [ . RH $ 3.598.00
1 Pc Front Fender 05— RH $ 333.00 -
I Pc Front Bumper Side Retainer RH J $ 18.70
I Pc Front Fender Inner Shield P A RH $ 129.00
I Pc Front Bumper "V " ' £ = $ 1,031.00 -
I Pc Wiper Washer Tank Pt $ 240.00
| Pc Front Bonnet $ 1.067.00 *
Parts less 20% b -1,283.34
“/Nett item
1 Set Front Bumper Clips 3 S36.00
1 Set Front Bumper Top Cover Rivet Clips O b 80.00 -
I Set Front Fender Inner Shield Clip 7l $ 50.00
Labour Charge
To Checking Wiring 20 § 80.00
Check Wheel Aligment =i $ 80.00
Labour For Knock Dents and Renew ‘Paqis bt 85000
Respra:f Palnt!ng | 3 1,206:00/

b 7,523.36

-~y



Auto

- - : Consuftants
N Im = Pre Lid Company Registration No. 139607T198R

s

¥ N/
LR ANVE 1, #0225 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGATMORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563501 FAX @ (065) 62564315

Y our ref: TBA
Our ref: CCO/EQIIB010156/Ahh3 Date: 13.07.2018

The Motor Claims Department

M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Dear SirfMadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SLX 9203D
We refer to the above matler.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 04.06.2018
at the premises of M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 7,523.36
Revised Estimate Amount 1 8% 3,5609.76
"Check" Items Amount (85 =
Market Value 55 =
LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -
Nett Value : S% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
Front O/S Portion

o

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 4 days

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING
Licensed Appraiser



Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Francis Ng <francisng@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 7 June 2018 2:34 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuUtD)

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LEEAuUto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving YP4385D (O : EQI - TBA) AND SLX9203D (TP
' LKK REF - CCA/EQI18010156/Ahb3 ) on 03.06.2018

Attachments: YP4395D 03.06.2018.PDF

Dear Shu Pai,

Qur insured’s repart is attached.

Regards,
Francis Ng
Executive | Claims

T

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Comp'rx Singapore 069110 ————
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 656223 9433 ext 115 | fax €5 6223 4190 La) =
WWW.BQINSUrance.com.sg

E=—

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the senc

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei&Eikkaul
Sent: Tuesday, June 5, 2018 6:30 PM

To: Francis Mg <francis.ng@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.coms; Vic (LKKAUto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlernent - Accident Involving YP4395D (01 : EQI - TBA) AND 5LX9203D (TP : LKK REF -
CC&/EQI18010156/Ahb3 ) on 03.06.2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Francis,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TR vehicle SLX 9203D at M/'s Fastech Auto Pte Ltd.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP's G1A report



Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your inzured's GlA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

Thank yvou.

Best Regards

Shu Ped | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{005033)



FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Date : 18.07.2018

EC) Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road

#17-00 Tower Block MND Complex
Singapore 069110

Attn: Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE: SLX 9203D  / YP4395D ON  03.06.2018
We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no:  SLX 9203D . which was involved
in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle no: YP 4395D . The vehicle owner has requested and

authorized us to assist him in presenting his/her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of vour insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
vour consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

1y Costof Repair (inclusive of GST) B 4,708.00
2} Loss Of Use { 4 days X $100) b 400.00
3)  GIA Search Result 5 2.00
5 5,110.00
We enclosed herewith the following documents to suppor the claims:
a) Final Repair Invoice ¢) Wehicle Registration Log Card
b) I/C & Driving License f) Letter of Authorisation, etc...

¢) GIA Report/ GIA Search Result
d} Insurance Certificate

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our customer’s claims
as soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

M

Thank you.
Yours faithfully, ({l"A )

Jason Tang {jasnn@jéstechauiﬂ.cum.ﬁg}
FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

Prepaead by Wirsly e Pok Lewg
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SLUBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLISDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL @ (D65) 62563561 FANX 1 (065) 62564315

Our Ref: CCO/EQIN8010156/Ahb3
I13JULY 2018

M/s KIAT SENG ENGINEERING By Post and By Email
BLOCK 156 LORONG | TOA PAYOH

#18-1183

SINGAPORE 310156

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear SirfMadam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 4395D AND SLX 9203D ON 03/06/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY
LIMITED to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should vou however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and vour NCD will be protected.

Please call us if vou have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Vic Alpeh Sanghilan
Case/Handler

DID: 6841 2096

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh@ lkkauto.com

e.c. EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
(Motor Claims Dept)
hohowseng@hotmail com
fEmail)



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 13 July, 2018 10:32 AM

To: hohowseng@hotmail.com

Cc Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref. YP 43950 _ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 4395D AND SLX 92030 ON
03/06/2018

ALUBLAVE 1800225 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408931 TEL : (065) 62363561 FAN 110631 62504315

Cur Ref: CC6/EQI1B010156/Ahb3
13 JULY 2018

M/s KIAT SENG ENGINEERING By Post and By Email
BLOCK 156 LORONG 1 TOA PAYOH

#18-1183

SINGAPORE 310156

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 4395D AND SLX 9203D ON 03/06/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED to resolve the claim against
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will

be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.



Best Regards,
Vie Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
74 Pl
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 Shve the Forthe Print only when pecessory:

This e-mail contain canfidential and privileged material, and are for the soie use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prahibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in errar, please do not
read this 2-mall or any altached items. Please delste the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all altachments and any copies thereof. Thank you,



DATE

TO
RE - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. -
ALONG
ON
-, Wﬂ, ) A E NE l
of (NRIC No./ROC No.)
ﬂf ! -wll=Tal 'E #1550 254018
owner of vehicle no, " in consideration of M/s FASTECH AUTO
PTE LTD repairing my/our vehicle . .. at my/our instruction and hereby

mmwsmeHAmmmemmmem
ammmﬂeﬂeﬂpayablebyﬁehsmmﬁompanymﬁfm&hﬂpmtymmmmmmlcgal
proceedings, if necessary, under my name, for the cost of repairs, car rental and/or loss of use,
em.mdm&leﬁappninﬁngsaﬁcﬂurmmformdusmmpeanfthesaideMHdmm
all claimed and/or settled shall belong to them absolutely.

.HWeﬁn'ﬂmHagrmmdmdq‘mkemindemﬁfymemagﬁmﬁeabnw-mmﬁomduhhnmm
which may arisen therewith.

Signature of Owner : . _

MName of Owner :




TAX INVOICE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Tax Invoice  :20332
EQ) Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road Date (18.07.2018
#17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Vehicle No  :SLX 9203D
Singapore 069110 Make/Model :MAZDA
Chassis/Eng#
Accident Date :03.06.2018
Claim No 0618 20332
Atin: Motor Claims Department Reference
Policy No
Amount
To proceed on lump sum repair 5% 4.400.00
E.&0.E, Total : S§ 4.400.00
GST @ 7% : S8 308.00
Amount Due - S% 4,708.00

FASTECH AUTO PTF
All Invoices are subjected to GST

irprred ey Wity £ b ¢



Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

G Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 043580
I"SUWCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Menday to Friday 9am to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE ST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: (3R-18-084246
Date of Request: 04/06/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue G #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Dear SirfMadam,

Enguiry Date D4/06/2018

Enquiry By Jason Tang Jun Zhong

TP Vehicle Mo, YP4395D

Accident Date 04/06/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle Mo. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No
YP4395D EQ Insurance Company Ltd 10M1Q2017-09/10/2018 G223 9433
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Asszociation of Singapere and we take no respoensibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any
loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp _g... 04-Jun-18
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Invoice

GENERAL

ASSOCIATION
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Cur Ref Mo;
Date of Request:

GR-18-084246
D4/06/2018

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Lid
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
I"SUME Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
COperating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to 5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

Singapore 417883

Dear SirfMadam,

Enguiry Date 04/08/2018

Enguiry By Jason Tang Jun Zhong

TP Wehicle No. Y P43950

Accident Date 04/06/2018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (5%)

TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRQ [] Cash[] Chegue

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp_g... 04-Jun-18



Vic (LKKAuto)

#

From: Sally Tan <sally.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 13 July, 2018 2:44 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuuto)

Subject: RE- Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YP4395D (O1 : EQI - DM18HOD1418) AND

SLX9203D (TP : LKK REF - CC6/EQI18010156/Ahb3 ) on 03.06.2018

Dear Vic Alpeh
Please proceed to authorize repairs to SLX9203D as per your adjusted amount and submit to us your final report.

Meantime kindly also request the Third Party to submit to us their letter of claim together with all the relevant
documents for us to attend to their claim accordingly.

Thank you.

Regards

Sally Tan

EQ Insurance Company Limited
Email; sally.tan@eginsurance.com.sg

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, July 13, 2018 10:11 AM

To: Joel Goh

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Janet Tan

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YP4335D (OI : EQI - TBA) AND SLX9203D (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/EQI18010156/Ahb3 ) on 03.06.2018

Your Ref: TBA
Our Ref: CC6/EQI18010156/Ahb3

Dear loel,
We refer further to our below email.
Attached herewith for your perusal:
TP Estimate
Preliminary Advice

Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Thank you.



Best Regards,
Vie Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

¥y ISNS Gl

EeRREn W Gaye the Earthe Print anly when necessary”

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sander that you have delated the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you

From: Francis Ng [mailto:francis.ng@eqinsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 7 June, 2018 2:34 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YP4395D (01 : EQI - TBA) AND SLX9203D (TP : LKK REF -
CCe/EQI18010156/Ahb3 ) on 03.06.2018

Dear Shu Pei,
Our insured’s report is attached.

Regards,
Francis Ng
Executive | Claims

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 656223 9433 ext 115 | fax 656223 4190

WwWw . eginsurance.com.sg

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t!

From:; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, June 5, 2018 6:30 PM

To: Francis Ng <francis.ng@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com=

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YP4335D (Ol : EQI - TBA) AND SLX9203D (TP : LKK REF -
CCH/EQI18010156/Ahb3 ) on 03.06.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Francis,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SLX 9203D at M/s Fastech Auto Pte Ltd.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP's GIA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408533)

Total Control Panel

To: joel.gohieginsurance, Com.sg Remove this sender from my allow list

From: vicalpehilkkauto,com

Yau received this message hécause the sender is on your allow list,

Login



' V4l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
- 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Uni Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg, No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref : CCB/EQI1B010156/Ahb3s2
I ToNR o M
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 11-09-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 089110
Code: EQI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. ¥P 43350 Veh. Inspected SLx 92030
Policy No. DMCPHQ17-005318 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 04/06/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MAZDA 3 HATCHBACK c.c 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. JMBEBN24ABI0208415 Colour RED
Odometer 1839 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |235/45R17 CONTINENTAL & mm
L/H Front Tyre |235/45R17 COMNTINENTAL & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |235/45R17 CONTINENTAL & mm
L/H Rear Tyre 235/45R17 CONTINENTAL & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  03/06/2018 Inspection Date 04/06/2018
Survey held at FASTECH AUTC PTELTD
1 KAK]I BUKIT AVENUE 6
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|E5TIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLX 9203D

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R

Page Mo.:1 of 1

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop t;'” ': $ll
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|HEAD LAMP RH cuT 3,598.00 3,508.00
1|FRONT FENDER RH DISTORTED 333.00 333.00
1{FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH NECESSARY 18.70 18.70
1|ERONT FENDER INNER SHIELD RH DEFORMED 129.00 129.00
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 1,031.00 1,031.00
1|WIPER WASHER TANK DEFORMED 240,00 240.00
1|FRONT BONNET TO REPAIR SEE 1,067.00 2
LABOUR
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,283.34 -1,069.94
5,133.36 4,279.76
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (SN} NECESSARY 50.00 30.00
1|SET FRONT BUMPER TOP COVER RIVET CLIPS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 80.00 2
1|SET FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 30.00
18000 60.00
LABOUR
TO CHECKING WIRING 80.00 30.00
CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT NOT NECESSARY 80.00 =
LABOUR FOR KNOCK DENTS AND RENEW PARTS 850,00 400.00
INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT BONNET.
RESPRAY PAINTING. 1,200.00 600.00
PAINT PROTECTION. 400.00 200.00
2,610.00 1,230.00
GRAND TOTAL 7,923.36 5,569.76
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,400.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC6/EQI18010156/Ahb3s2

\g‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefi of the Client named on the front page of this Report,

o Habidity of responsibiity whalscever. in conact.or ler
Report.inwhele or in part, dees 50 at his or her own risk,




