Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdepti®sg.cntaiping.com:=

Sent: Friday, 31 August, 2018 5:11 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Admin A; Thin Thin (LKKAuUto)

Ce: Elaine Cheong; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); KKLau; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Chee
So Chow

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE258Z (O SNM18D02800C02/8) and

SHA2444P (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18010149/K1wa3) on 01/06/2018

LKK REF - CC3/CTI118010149/K1wa3
CTI REF — SNM18D02800C02/8 (GBE258Z)

Dear Vivian

We refer to your emails pertaining to the above matter.

Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 54,052.14.
We await your payment advice to enable Elaine to act accordingly.
Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: +65 6389 6182

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 T175

Email: claimsdepti@sq.cntaiping.com
alfred.tohi@sg.cntaiping.com
www.sg.cntaiping.com

AN FRSARY
lis Simpapare smee 1958

Disclaimer

This message iv confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid Any unauthorized
disclosure, wse or dissemination, gither in whole or partial, is prohibired, If vou are nor the Intended recipient of the message
please motify the sender immediately

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Friday, August 31, 2018 2:18 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Thin Thin
[LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com=>



Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE258Z (O1: SNM18D02800C02/8) and SHA2444P (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18010149/K1wa3) on 01/06/2018

Your Ref : TBA
Our Rel : CCI/CTIIS010149/K Iwal

Dear Elaine,

AC INVOLY AND SHA 2 ON 010672 ONG TOA PAYOH LO
We refer to the above matter

This is a head-to-rear collision.

We have surveyed the vehicle, and relevant supporting documents was enclose for your perusal.

We seek your approval to offer to TP repairer ComfortDelGro Engincering Pte Ltd is as follows:

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

I. Cost of Repair (+GST) 55 4,488.86 883,25535
2. Loss of RENTAL ($125.40 x 4.5days) S§ 627.00 S$ 56430 ( Surveyor recommend 2 days)
3. Loss OF INCOME ( $ 50.00 x 4.5 days) S8 400.00 5% 225.00
3. GIA SEARCH S8 7.49 SE 7.49

55552335 554,052.14

Amount of claim at liability 100% SS 4,052.14
For your approval please,

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lan| Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-B625 | email: Vivianlau®@ |kkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava UThi Indostrial Park, [Thi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(4080793)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 1 August, 2018 12:53 PM
To: ‘claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com' <claimsdepl@sg.cntaiping.com>

Ce: 'elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com' <elaine cheong@sg cntaiping.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
<thinthin@|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE258Z (Ol : CTI - TBA) and SHA2444P (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT118010149/K1wa3) on 01/06/2018

Your Ref : TBA

Our Rel : CC3/CTIIB01D149/K | wald

Dear Elaine,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GHBE 2587 AND SHA 24441 ON 01/06/20 TOA

We refer to the above matter



This is a head-to-rear collision.

We have surveved the vehicle, and relevant supporting documents was enclose for your perusal.

We seek vour approval to offer to TP repairer ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid is as follows:

Amount Claimed

Amount Revised

I, Cost of Repair (+GST) 55 4,488.86 $83,25535
2. Loss of RENTAL (5125.40 x 4.5days) S§ 627.00 §% 564.30 ( Surveyor recommend 2 days)
3. Loss Of INCOME ( § 50.00 x 4.5 days) S§ 400.00 S§  225.00
3. GIA SEARCH 5% 749 5% 749
$$5,52335 S$4,052.14
Amount of claim at liability 100% SS 4,052.14
For your approval please
Thank you
Best Regards,
Vivian Lau| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlsu@lkkautg.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(q08933)
From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 23 July, 2018 7:10 PM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan @Ikkauto.com>; claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
Cc: elaine cheong@sg.cntaiping.com; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

kkauto >

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE258Z (01 : CTI- TBA) and SHA2444P (TP : LKK REF -

CC3/CTI18010149/K1wa3) on 01/06/2018

Your Ref: THA
Our Ref : CCI/CTIB010149/K Iwa3
Dear Elaine,
CID vV NG GBE 2587 S OND

We refer to the above maiter

This is a head-1o-rear collision.

018 NG T AY

We have surveved the vehicle, and relevant supporting documents was enclose for your perusal.

We seek your approval to offer to TP repairer ComforiDelGro Engineering Pte Lid is as follows:

Amount Claimed

I. Cost of Repair (+GST) S$ 4,488 86
3

Amount Revised
5% 3.255.35



2. Loss of RENTAL ($125.40 x 4.5days) 5% 627.00 §% 564.30 ( Surveyor recommend 2 days)

3. Loss Of INCOME ( § 50.00 x 4.5 days) S$ 400.00 S§ 225.00
3. GIA SEARCH S$ 7.49 S$ 749
$% 5,523.35 S§ 4,052.14

Amount of ¢claim at liability 100% S8 4,052.14

For your approval please

Thank you

Best Regurds,

Vivinn Lan| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Mei Kwan |LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 11 June, 2018 12:02 PM

To: claimsdept @sg cntaiping.com
Cc: elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping com; Lucas Lee <lucas.| cntaiping.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

<vivianlau@Ikkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE258Z (01 CTI - TBA) and SHA2444P (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18010149/K1wa3) on 01/06/2018
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/ Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
This is a TP direct settlement case.
We had inspected TP vehicle SHA 2444P at M /s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd (Loyang).
Enclosed for your perusal is:

Estimated cost of repair

Preliminary advice

TP GIA report

- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 8625.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you
Best Rﬂglrdlr



Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwang@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(4080a3)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://www.symanteccloud.com




COMFORIDELGRO

Our Ref - T 06818/ SHA2444P WT(st) ENC‘I NEERING
Your Ref: . .
Date : 05-Jun-18 CDGE Taxi Claims Dept o |

59 Loyang Drive 4th Fir
CHINA INSURANCE CO LTD Singapora S0BSE3
3 ANSON ROAD
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER
SINGAPORE 079508 rores
Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE :
Dear Sir Loyang
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAX]I SHA2444P YOUR INSURED GBE 258Z
AND OTHER ON 01.06.18

We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transporiation Pte Lid, the owner of motor Sandan
Vehicle No SHA2444P which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured
vehicle The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concemed have requested and authorized us to
assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters
arising from the damage to the vehicle

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving GBE 2582
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM
Cost of Repair

5 days Lossof Rental@ $ 12540 perday
Survey Report Fees  (Surveyed by Mis LKK)

5 3,255.35

3

: -
LTA Search Fees ] 7.49

5

(3

627.00

-

GIA | Police Report Fees
Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees

[= 0+ - L %

Sub Total: 5 3,889 84

HIRER'S CLAIM
T 5 daysLossofincome @ §  B80.00 perdays - 400.00

Total Claims : 3 4 289 84

We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

@)  Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs : 7 pcs.
b)  LTA search slip/s of GBE 2582
¢l GlA | Police report/s of SHA2444P

d)  Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
{ ) Traffic Compound ( ) Towing/Medical billreceipts ( ) Certificate of Insurance
{ X ) Photograph/s of Accident Scen ( x ) Downtime/Mileage record { x ) Rental Rate |etter

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settiement of the said claims as
500N as possible

Please note that it is a condition of any settiement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Yours faithfully
‘Wallram "fan

Deputy Manager
CDGE Claims Department
Tel: 6214 8737 Fax. 6214 1843 Email : willlamtan@cdge.com sg

This is a computer generated letter. No signature Is required.

< @ O

COMFORIDELGRO (-



Auta
! !{,U_ C:I}FHM
A s ma B Ple Lid

Z] UBIAVE 1, #0022 PAYA UBHINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563581 FAX @ (65) 62564012

Our Ref: CC3/CTIS010149/K Iwa3
I8 June 2018

First Sight International Pte Lid
998 Toa Payoh North

#02-08

Singapore 318993

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 2582 AND SHA 2444F ON 01/06/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Lid to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under

the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior 1o our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if vou have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Vivian Lau

Case Handler

DID: 6841 8625

FAX: 67414108

EMAIL: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Moror Claims Dept)



CDG VARS.V LettofAuthorisation

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

[NAF / PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING TOYOTA PRIUS SHA2444P , GBE258Z ON 01-Jun-18 10:20
ALONG SLIP RD LOR 6 TOA PAYOH TWDS BRADDELL RD
1/ We ISMAIL BIN EBRAHIM (Hirer) NRIC No.:  S1814607Z
and/or (Relief) NRIC No.;

Taxi Number S5HAZ444p
hereby authorise ComfortDelGro Engineening Pte Ltd(CDGE):

1. To submit my/our clalms for damages, costs and expense, Including loss of income, joss of rental,
medical fee and legal casts,

Page | .

2. To have absolute discretion to agree w any settlement or compensation amount In respect of my/our claim

against third party [except personal injuries and medical claims).

3. To sign Discharge Youcher an my/our behalf.

‘ 4, Te accept any paymant (clam proceeds) in respect of the claim against third party and payment by cheque

shall be forward directly to CDGE In accordance with CDGE's instruction and made in favour of
“"ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd".

| Date 01-Jun-2018
Name of Hirer ISMAIL BIN EBRAHIM
Hirer NRIC S51814607Z Signature :
c_ﬁb'i'
Address 558 ANG MO KID AVENUE 10 #06-17...
560558
Contact No 98316578

h"P-‘-.-'cdyck.‘_'ﬁr'-.:H].-’I{trntinw.-Runtilnu-'lhinlimu-'I{uniEm-:-"'t'iw..-"L'I]I.]_‘U ARS.V | ennfam

NTM&GNT e

5\



MYEOR _CIAINS _DISCHARCY POUCHER

Policy No : DMCVANINS9ETLTOO Clazm Mo @ S¥MIBDOZBOOCOZ/ A
Clatmant 1 COMPORT THAMSFORTATION PTE LTD

Amount 1 S5 §,23L.00
Bingapare Dollar Four Thousand Fifty Only

I/¥e agree to accept the above mentloned amount to be paid to m=fus in full &
fina! ssttlement of all clsims, coste & disbirsements for Injuries [ damages
sustaines by me/us throogh an accident involving

Claimant Vehicle Ha. : SHA Zi44P
Insured Vehicle HNp. 1 GBE 2581

Lats of Losa i 01/06/2018
Place of Accident 3 BLIP AT LOPONG € TOA PAYOH TOWARDS BERADDELL ROARD

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to me/us of the aforementioned aum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (|SINGAPORE) PTE. LID., T/We sgree absclutely o
discharge CHIMA TAIFING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. andfor

Insured Name i FIRST SIGHT INTERMATIOMAL PRIVATE LIMITED
briver Hame 1 SEON CHIN HUAT

from all claims, present of futurs in tespect =f &ll loss. Injury of dandge
sustaines by me/us arising out of the said agoident,

I acknowledge thar this payment is made without acmission of lfability on the
paxt of CAIWA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAFORE) FTE. LID.

Global Sum 85 4,050.00 !
TOTAL 3% 4,050, 00
CLAMIE DEPAS TNY
COWFORTNELGSD EMMME TR St | Th
SRLOYANG DR

Claimant Hame : NRIC Mo 1

Signature 1 { ) ‘* Date % '?"E'-(l L
e i

i a1 i e NATdeE iy

o) famages &g herelmom 3 e COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE 11D

R persana (s
- sgieaion of tis e

o e 00 3



COMFOR‘IDELGRQ ComfiortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
ENGINEERING '

COMRORDELGRD

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE

ComfortixGro Enginecring Ple Lud

vibar of COMOR e ACCOUNT No INVOICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No.

Head OMfice
205 Braddell Road
Singapore 579701

Kindly nate thal no receipt shall be ssued uniess requested
CUSTOMER'S COPY




COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

COMFORDELCGRO

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3

ComfortlelGro Engineering Pre Lud
& et of COMFOET R

Head CMiice
205 Braddell Road
Singapore S79701

Kindly nots that no receipt shall be ssued unless requesiad

CUSTOMER'S COPY

TAX INVOICE

ACCOUNT No

ComtfortDelGro Engineering Ple Lid

INVOICE No.

AMOUNT

BANK/CHQ No




ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd

COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

IMFORTDELGRO

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE

ConfortDelGro Engineering Pre Lid
A muembor of COMPORTN LG ACCOUNT No INVOICE No. AMOUNT BANK/CHO No.

Head Office
205 Braddell Road
Singapore ST

Kindly nole thal no recaipt shal be ssudd unless neguestad

CUSTOMER'S COPY




Our Ref: CT18060018

comrors
Date: 07 June 2018 --‘_'___‘ .
TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN
Dear SirfMadam
ACCIDENT ON 01/06/2018 @ 10:20 hrs
ALONG SLIP RD LOR 6 TOA PAYOH > BRADDELL ROAD
INVOLVING GBE258Z7

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHA2444P (the "Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to ISMAIL BIN EBRAHIM IC NO
S§18146072 a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $125.40 per day
(inclusive of GST).

Flease be advised that the Taxi was insured with India International Insurance Pte
Ltd on a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi ansing from the said accident with a molor
workshop of his cholce.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settlement of claims with third party's insurance company Iin respect of the said
accident

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fieet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapare 575717 Mainling +65 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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AR s rpnrs Paieilare Eanoiey Ry Aneede Malail

Enquire Vehicle Insurer

Viehicle No. IncidentQam/Time Search Status Inaurance Compar

GBE258Z 01 Jun2018/10:20:00 Successful coi

Previous

iF

Insurance Company Nime

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) FTELTD

OK
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