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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: _ / Veron Chen (LKKAuto})

Sent: " Tuesday, 5 June 2018 10:56 AM

To: '‘Ong Chin Kiat'

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Market Value for SKE3388E - Date of Accident: 30.05.2018
Dear Chin Kiat,

The market value of SKE 3388E is $51K-$52K (Estimated) as at May 18.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Ong Chin Kiat [mailto:chinkiat_ong@sg.msig-asia.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 5 June 2018 9:11 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; Wendy Tan <motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>; Mi
<mi@aispl.com.sg>

Subject: Market Value for SKE3388E - Date of Accident: 30.05.2018

Hi all,
Can assist to check market value for SKE3388E?
Date of accident: 30.05.2018

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ong Chin Kiat
Admin Officer, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2558 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | chinkiat ong@sg.msig-asia.com
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2016 insurer Clalma Tearn of the Year
MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | Tel +65 6220

9644 |, Fax +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg o . ®

Amember of JRENTAETRY INSURANCE BROUP
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

" Vehicle Owner Particulars 7/

DA 3lshe

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC el
Owner |D: 8692F ~ 7
Vehicle Details
VehicleNo.: SKE3388E

 Vehicle to be Exported: No

] Ihtended De—registrétion Dat;: 7 31May 2018

Vehicle Make: B.MW. .
Vehicle Model: 1161 AT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD HID 5DR
Primary Colour: White

' Manufacturing Year: 2011
EngineNo: i B302J079N13B16A
Chassis No.: WBA1A120X0E947048
Maximum Power Output: 100.0 KW (134 bhp)
Open Market Value: $28,544.00
Original Registration Date: 30Nov 2011
First Registration Date: 30 Nov 2011
Transfer Count: 0 .
Actual ARF Paid: $28,544.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 29 Nov 2021
PARF Rebate Amount: $18,553.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

 COE Expiry Date: 29 Nov 2021
COE Category: 7 A - Car {1600cc & below)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: ) $55,997.00

"COE Rebate Amount: $19,583.00
Total Rebate Amount: , $38,136.00

The ihfb}rhation éd‘ntained herein is correct as at 31 May 2018 )
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