_I 7L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

ﬂﬂg_. 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: G256 43156

Reg No 199807198R GST Reg No. 19-98071088-R

TAX INVOICE
EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD INV No. AC1901269
5 MAXWELL ROAD
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK e
MND COMPLEX Reference  CCH/EQIIR0I0105/Aha3q2
SINGAPORE 069110 Code EQI
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE FEE |||immm||||||||l
Vehicle No. GBH 3794G
Insured Veh, GBH 3001L
Claim No. DMI18HO02739-1G
Policy No. DMCPHQ18-002319
Accident Date 28/05/2018
Inspection Date 01/06/2018
Deseription Total
Survey Inspection 160.00
Digital Photographs
Transportation
Subtotal 160.00
GST (7%) 11.20
Grand Total 171.20

We shall be glad if you could forward the payment at your early convenience

Cheque should be crossed and made payable to ‘LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid*

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

LA
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Sda ma®m Pl Company Registration No. 199607 198R
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STURIAYE 1, 80225 PAYA URLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE S08933 TEL : (D65) 62563561 FAX : ((65) 62564315

Your ref: TBA
Our ref’ CCH/EQIIRD1I01D5/Aha3 Date: 1271072018

The Motor Claims Department

M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. GBH 3794G
We refer to the above matter,

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 01.06.2018
al the premises of M/s _F-1 Autoclinic Pre Lid have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8§ 4,764.20

Revised Estimate Amount - 5% 900.00

"Check" Items Amount : 5% -

Total (Including Check Items) : S% 900,00

Market Value : 5% -

LTA Reimbursement Value : S5 -

Nett Value : S% -

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the o et
OV/S portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 3.0 days

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING
Licensed Appraiser
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F-1 AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD

Block 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4, #05-26 Synergy ‘@ KB Singapore 417800

HP: 96583371 TEL: (65) 67022915 FAX:67022916

- P =0
NET LINK LEASING PTE LTD Vit
25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD4
# 05.26 SYNERGY @KB

Sincapore 417800

Accilent date: 28" MAY 2018
Estimated repair cost for vehic'2 no: GBH3794G TOYOTA HIA.CE 3.0 18

01* JUNE 2018
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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

— e

From: Vie [LKKAuUto)

Sent: Friday, 14 December, 2018 5:22 PM

To: Joel Goh; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Ce: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving GBH3001L (OI : EQI - DM18HO02739-)G)
and GBH3794G (TP : LKK REF - CC6/EQI18010105/Aha3) on 28/05/2018

Attachments: GBH3001LPDF; VIDEO-2018-10-04-22-15-44.mp4d

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Categories: HMK

Dear Joel,

We refer to your below emall and the contents were noted.
Meanwhile, please find attached TP video footage for your reference.

Thank you.

Hest Regarde,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

LHH =ET Save the Earth Frint omly when mecessary

This e-mail comain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipiant. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law, If you belleve that you recelved this e-mall In error, please do not
read this e-mail or any altached llems. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies theraol, and inform Ihe
sender that you have deleied the e-malil, all aftachmants and any coples thareol. Thank you.

From: loel Goh [mailto:joel goh@eginsurance.com.sgl

Sent: Friday, 14 December, 2018 5:04 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Ce: Vic [LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBH3001L (01 : EQI - DM18HO02739-1G) and GBH3734G (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/EQI18010105/Aha3) on 28/05/2018

Dear Mei Kwan

Attached our Insured’s accident report for your attention.
Please do not proceed with direct settlement for this case at the mement.

We are investigating into a potential breach.

Best Regards,



Pear Sir/ Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle GBH 3794G at M/s F-1 Autoclinic Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer
proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:

- TP GIA report
- TP estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096,

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiEwan®@ kkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408g33)



Vic !LKKAutuZ

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 11 February, 2019 11:03 PM

To: Vie (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: GBH3794G & GBH3001L DOA 28.05.2018 LKK REF CC6/EQI18010105/Aha3
Dear Vic,

Noted . Closed case . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

From: Vic [LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, January 28, 2019 8:08 PM

To: chan pick yuen

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAutn)

Subject: RE: GBH3794G & GBH3001L DOA 28.05.2018 LKK REF CC6/EQI18010105/Aha3

Without Prejudice
Dear Chris,
We refer further to our below email,

We were informed by our principal that our Insured had settle privately with your client. Kindly refer to the attached
signed documents.

As such, kindly confirm that your client will withdraw the claim against our Insured.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, f02-25 | 5{408933)

| -
LKK &= Save the Earth. Print only when necassary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient, Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you belleve thal you received this e-mail in eror, please do nol
read this e-mail or any attached ilems. Flease delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail. all attachments and any copies thersof. Thank you.

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris_chanbebe @hotmall.com)
Sent: Thursday, 10 January, 2019 12:10 PM



"

Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic [LEKAuUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 February, 2019 9:32 AM

To: loel Goh

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving GBH3001L (OI : EQI - DM1BHO02739-JG)
and GBH3794G (TP : LKK REF - CC6/EQI18010105/Aha3) on 28/05/2018

Attachments: Private Settlement Agreement pdf; Re: GBH3794G & GBH3001L DOA 28.05.2018

LKK REF CC6/EQI1B010105/Aha3

Dear Joel,
We refer to your below email,
Please be informed that TP repairer confirmed private settlement and closed case in their side.

As such, we will also close the matter in our end and will forward our WP report accordingly.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone; 6841-2006 | email: yicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

B e
IXK = Save the Earth- Print only when necessary

This e-mail conlain confidential and privileged malerial, and are for the sole use of the inlended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended reciplent is prohibited, and may be a vialation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do nol
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mall and all aachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail. all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you

From: Joel Goh [mailto:joel goh@eqinsurance.com.sg)

Sent: Monday, 28 January, 2019 7:20 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Mei Kwan [LKKAuto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBH3001L (Ol : EQI - DM18HO02739-JG) and GBH3794G (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/EQI18010105/Aha3) on 28/05/2018

Dear Vic

Please assist to check if third party is withdrawing their claim against our insured.
Attached private settlement agreement showing that insured had settled this matter with F-1 Autoclinic directly.

Best Regards,

loel Goh
Executive | Claims



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6258 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No 169807198R GST Reg. Mo 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federatian Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Rel © CCE/EQI18010105/Aha3q2
0 o B IO
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date 14022019
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Coda: EOQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBH 3001L Veh. Inspected GBH 3T84G
Policy No. DMCPHO18-002319 Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. DM18HO02738-JG Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 01/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA HIACE c.c 2082
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. KDH2010208385 Colour WHITE
Odometer 1732 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/60 R15 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Front Tyre |[185/60 R15 DUNLOP & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/80 R15 DUNLOP B8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/50 R15 DUNLOP 8 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE /S BODY
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  28/05/2018 [Inspection Date 01/08/2018
Survey held at F-1 AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD
25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4
#05-26 SYNERGY @ KB
SINGAPORE 417800
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS.
BlIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 3 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Ingustnal Park, Singapore 408633
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX 6256 4315

g No: 188607T188R GST Reg No 16-8607108-R Fage No..1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBH 3794G
y Estimate By | Our usted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | =St ”1;“ “[':i
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|LH REAR SIDE PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 2.800.00
LABOUR
1|LH REAR LOWER PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 105.00
LABOUR
1|TAIL LAMP LH LOWER PANEL TO REPAIR SEE B8.00 -
LABOUR
1| TAIL LAMP -LH CuT 22910 220910
1|REAR BUMPER cuT 482 10 482 10
LESS 25% DISCOUNT 17780
3,704 .20 83340
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM 80.00 30,00
PANEL BEATING INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF LH 500 00 300,00
REAR SIDE PANEL LH REAR LOWER PANEL AND TAIL
LAMP LH LOWER PANEL
SPRAY PAINTING 500.00 30000
1,060.00 63000
GRAND TOTAL 4,T64.20 1,163.40
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS s 900.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CCB/EQI18010105/Aha3q2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE AMIRTE, AMSAE-A,M MATAI

Liconsed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: - This Bepart s mace solaly for the aee sea Benefis of the Slkant named on B tront pege of thas Bepont.




