Vic (LKKAuto)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 11 February, 2019 11:03 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: GBH3794G & GBH3001L DOA 28.05.2018 LKK REF CC6/EQI18010105/Aha3
Dear Vic,

Noted . Closed case . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, January 28, 2019 8:08 PM

To: chan pick yuen

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: GBH3794G & GBH3001L DOA 28.05.2018 LKK REF CC6/EQI18010105/Aha3

Without Prejudice
Dear Chris,
We refer further to our below email.

We were informed by our principal that our Insured had settle privately with your client. Kindly refer to the attached
signed documents.

As such, kindly confirm that your client will withdraw the claim against our Insured.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 10 January, 2019 12:10 PM



To: Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: GBH3794G & GBH3001L DOA 28.05.2018 LKK REF CC6/EQI18010105/Aha3

Dear Vic,
URGENT

Got video, liability clear 100% , small claim all in $ 1300/-.
Why your principal no approve offer yet ?
Please revert to us asap . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, December 14, 2018 5:23 PM

To: chan pick yuen

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: GBH3794G & GBH3001L DOA 28.05.2018 LKK REF CC6/EQI18010105/Aha3

Without Prejudice

Dear Chris,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that the matter is currently under investigation by our principal.
We will get back to you for an update in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the

sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris chanbebe@hotmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 13 November, 2018 11:42 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: GBH3794G & GBH3001L DOA 28.05.2018 LKK REF CC6/EQI18010105/Aha3




Dear Vic,

2ND REMINDER

This case liability is clear 100% with video .
small claim all in $1300/-.
Please let us have your offer in next 7 days . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

From: chan pick yuen <chris _chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, October 20, 2018 6:20 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: GBH3794G & GBH3001L DOA 28.05.2018 LKK REF CC6/EQI18010105/Aha3

Dear Vic,
1st Reminder

Please let us have your offer soon . THANKS

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, October 12, 2018 11:48 AM

To: chan pick yuen

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: GBH3794G & GBH3001L DOA 28.05.2018 LKK REF CC6/EQI18010105/Aha3

Without Prejudice

Dear Chris,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.

Please be informed that we are still pending for our Insured’s GIA report.
We will follow up and will get back to you for an update.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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RLERER WWT Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com]
Sent: Friday, 12 October, 2018 10:34 AM

To: Admin A

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: GBH3794G & GBH3001L DOA 28.05.2018

Dear Sir / Mdm,
Refer : GBH3001L - EQ INSURANCE

Enclosed is our GIA , video, rental agreement, bill , invoice & LOA .
Please advise OIC & claim no .

As request following :

1) RC S900 ( AS AGREED)
2) LOR S 400 (S 100 X 4 DAYS - 3 DAYS recommend + 1 day weekend )

@ 100% ( Video camera to show that your insured reverse from park car lot & hit onto our client's vehicle
GBH3794G which was driving straight on road .

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

F-1 AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD
HP: 92712214



