Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 13 October 2018 11:28 AM

To: 'J-Mart'

Subject: RE: Your ref: GBF 5020D *Our Ref: CC6/AIG18010103/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SFG 877D(AIG) AND GBF 5020D ON 30/05/2018]

Attachments: Statement of SFG 877D.pdf

Without Prejudice

Hi Sirs/Mdm,

We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. There is no concrete evidence(ie: Video
footage) yet to support either party’s version. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's
accident report for your perusal.

Strictly without admission of liability whatever, but with a view towards a resolutions of your client’s claim in
the above matter without resort to litigation, we are prepared to offer 50% towards your client’s claim.

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 11 June 2018 4:43 PM

To: 'jmart jmart' <jmartauto@gmail.com>

Subject: Your ref: GBF 5020D *Our Ref: CC6/A1G18010103/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFG 877D(AIG) AND GBF
5020D ON 30/05/2018]

Your ref: GBF 5020D Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC6/AIG18010103/Apa3

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFG 877D(AIG) AND GBF 5020D ON 30/05/2018

We refer to the above matter.



Please be informed that liability is unclear as our insured reported that your client cut into his lane and
resulted the accident. Attached here with a copy of our insured driver accident report for your easy
reference.

Kindly let us have evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) in order for us to look into the matter.

Appreciate an early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



