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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Nivitha {LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 August 2018 11:02 AM

Ta: ‘Claim Workflow System’; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc mREHTAN@MEFIRSTCAPITALEDM,SG: sur@lkkauto.com
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004400MFSH/N

Dear Sir/ Madam,

Please be informed that we are unable to conduct the inspection after some attempts to inform the workshop to
firesent the vehicle. ' '

This case has been pending for a long time due to the unavailability of the owner, therefore we decided ta
temporarily tlose this case.

Kindly advise us if there is any arrangement made and will be glad to re-open the case accordingly,

BEST REGARDS,

G Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pe Lid

Fhime: 68411073 | email: assign ments@ ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Elk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 8(g08933)

From: Nivitha {LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com)

Sent: Monday, 4 June 2018 5:54 PM

Yo: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmaotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Co: KARENTAN @ MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.S5G; sur@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1RO0A400MFSH/1

bear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment,

Flease b informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

PEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

L KK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phofe 68411972 | emaoil: gssignments®@ | kkauto com | fax: b256-41315
BIK 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #92-25 | Si408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mallto:ewsinotorclaims@msfirsteapital cor

Sent: Monday, 4 June 2018 2:16 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Co: CWSMOTORCLAIMSEMSFIRSTCAPITAL. COM.SG; KARENTAN@EMSFIRSTCAPITAL COM .5G
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004400MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
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MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 01-08-2018 Our Ref No. D18004400MFSH
Accident Date 18-05-2018 Clalm Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHC37E8Y Third Party Vehicle. SKUB327P
Survey Location 10 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 2 #03-25 FIRST EAST CENTRE
Contact Person. MR KENDRICK
Contact No. 92700917/ 92700917 Fax No. 0
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Appointed LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Less of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Ce : Workshop MCS GARAGE Attention. NiL
Cc: TP Solicitor VISION LAW LLC TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge KARENT

IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey repor via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection
This is'a computer generatad lefter, no sigriaturé requirad.
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