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' 74 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e P 51 Ubi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Asamas
TEL 6258 3581 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No- 109607 198R GST Reg No. 19-9607188-R

= ',‘"‘:?,’ TR
S e e g aa ey oy

QBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTELTD __ Rel . CCB/QBE18010008/Awa3

1 RAFFLES QUAY #28-10 SOUTH
TOWERSINGAPORE 048583 Oate>: GR002018 I|||.|'I.III

Policy No. 8-V0015077-MVA-R001 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. VC011525 Excess ($) 0.00

R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
mm
mm

R/H Rear Tyre

Survey held at MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4
(SOUTH WING) #02-03B
VICOM INSPECTION CENTRE,

FRAITIaTa-

AITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
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MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 (South Wing) #02-03 Singapore 415933

Tel: (+65) 6243 1373 | Fax: (+65) 6243 1376
Reg. No: 201427944N

T0 . QBE INSURANCE INTERNATIONAL LTCDATE  : 30-May-18
ATTENTION : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT JOB TYPE : T/P CLAIM
FOTmATERERORY WBAKDSLOLOE WS 1 L¥P
VEHICLE DETAILS
VEHICLE NO : SFW 800 K \/.IW\
MODEL : BMW 3201
CHASSIS NO
ACCIDENT DETAILS  DATE : 23-May-18
TIME - 1040HRS
THIRD PARTY REQUESTOR / CONTACT : DEON
CLAIM DETAIL : PARTS
UNIT LIST TOTAL LIST
SIN DESCRIPTION Qv | “omce mce |
i|rronT BUMPER  TRE_ 1 |s 1essools  tessef| - ¢
7~
2|[FRONT BUMPER SPONGE  (/en—4 1 |s  2m00|s “23800|
~
3|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER 2 |s  saool|s 178.00
4|FRONT BUMPER TOWING COVER X ~——d 1 |s  soools 80.00 [~
5|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE  ®\} :;-‘-—“ 2 |s esools 19800 4
ot
5|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE OUTERGARNISH | 2 |§  8200]s w0 S &
7|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE (CENTER) d4~ | 1 |s  10000]s 100,00 | &
ot
8|FRONT BUMPER FOGLAMPRH '~ = 1 |s 3ss00]s 355.00 | ¥
o|[FRONT BUMPER UNDER COVER 1~ * A~ 1 |s 1s020]s 190.20 | X .
TV
10|FRONT HEADLAMPRH(HID) Gt 1y 1 |'s 380000 s < 360008 L
.*L— % ‘/
11|FRONT HEADLAMP LOWER GARNISH 1 |s  2e300(s 963.00 | 4
12|FRONT HEADLAMP NOZZLE % pd 2 |s 243005 486.00 | A
13| FRONT HEADLAMP NOZZLE COVER b ¥ 2 |s  es00]s 182,00 | ¢
A01Y
TOTAL PRICE s 798220
2
3§17 1O LESS 5% $ 24.30
SUBTOTALPRICE §  7.957.90



SPECIAL NETT ITEMS

DESCRIPTION

Qrty

UNIT SINETT

TOTAL SINETT

FRONT NUMBER PLATE  e~4~

—

d

N

FRONT BUMPER CLIP{SET) />

22.00

w

CENTER GRILLE M

“wr

280.00

oL

CLAIM DETAILS: LABOUR AND SPRAY PAINTING

TOTAL

$ 352.00

PANEL BEATING, REMOVAL AND
1|REPLACING PARTS S

2|TO SPRAY PAINT AFFECTED AREA $

W

TUFF COAT S

4|WIRING CHECK S

TO CHECK DIAGNOSTICS OF VEHICLE
MANAGEMENT/CONTROL UNITS,RESET
MEMORIES TO SPECIFICATION ETC. S

o

100.00

620

TOTAL
ESTIMATE REPORT

TOTALPARTSCOST : §

TOTAL LABOURCOST : §
TOTAL REPAIRCOST = §

8,309.90

1.580.00
8,889.90

APPROVED DETAILS

SURVEYCR
CONTACT NO

PART BY PART / LUMP SUM
NO OF DAYS

$1,580.00
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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

————————— e ——————————— e ——
From: Joyce Foo <joyce foo@®gbe.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 5 June, 2018 9:39 AM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); claims-singapore@qbe.com
Cc Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SFW7881K (OI : QBE - TBA) AND
SFWA00K (TP : LKK REF - CC6/QBE1B010009/Awa3) on 23/05/2018 [VC011525]
Attachments: TP GIA REPORT.PDF; SFW7881K pdf
Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed
Categories: HMK

Our Ref. VC011525
Hi

Attached GIA report for your attention

Thank You & Best Regards

Joyce Foo

Senior Assisian| "a m

JBE Asia Pacilic - rw]a.(rp

QBE |nsurance (Singapore) Pt Lid
Phone. <65 6477 1182

Email; joyce foo@gbe.com

VISl Us on the wob af www . gbe cormn £¢

o Beneral” 49 -
uabm

- - : -r
Engineering &‘?ﬁ 2 l w m

Construction Accidemt ., Motor ‘ Liability SMEs

From: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Monday, 4 June, 2018 6:23 PM

To: Joyce Foo <joyce.foo@qgbe.com>

Ce: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ilkkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com»

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SFW7881K (O1 : QBE - TBA) AND SFWS00K (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/QBE18010009/Awa3) on 23/05/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,



We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

We had inspected TP vehicle SFW 900K at M/s MG Solution Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit.

Enclosed here with a copy of TP's GIA report for your perusal.

Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.

We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 B625.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@ [kkauto com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply
emall or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.



Vivian Lau SLKI(Autoz

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 31 July, 2018 6:00 PM

To: Sharon

Cc Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref: SFW 900K, Our Ref: CC6/QBE1801009/Awa3 Accident involving Vehicle
SFW 900K & SFW 7881K ON 23/05/2018

Attachments: Sketch Plan pdf

WTHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref; SFW 900K
Our Ref: CC6/QBEIR01009/Awa3l

Dear Sir/Madam,
Accident involving Vehicle SFW 900K & SFW 7881K ON 23/05/2018
We refer 1o the above matter

Our insured driver has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client.. your client
turning from major road into minor road has precedence over vehicle turning from minor road to major road. BOLA 9
( ¢) applies.

We attached herewith our insured’s accident report for vour perusal.

Under such circumstances, we have our principal’s instruction to deny liability of your client’s claim.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
rexolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed ! inferred from this negotiation of termy/settlement

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liahilin/damages. either party is not bound, thereafier, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Thank vou

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlon@lkkauto.com/! fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Vivian Lau SLKKAuto)

#

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Hi Vivian

Joyce Foo <joyce foo@qgbe.com>

Tuesday, 12 June, 2018 4:15 PM

Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); claims-singapore@gbe.com

Admin A

RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SFW7881K (Ol : QBE - TBA) AND
SFW900K (TP : LKK REF - CC6/QBE18010009/Awa3) on 23/05/2018 [VC011525]

Please proceed to reject as advised.

Thonk You & Best Regords

Joyce Foo
Senior Assistant - Claims
QBE Asia Pacific - Singapore

QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lig
Phone «856477 1184
Email: joyce foo@aqbe com

Vist us on tha web at www abe comsg

Engineering & =
Construction

eral <_"' ~ _."
e i,

= : ’ v
Acoadl= 4 MatoT® 41T Liability

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@Ilkkauto.com)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 June, 2018 3:43 PM

To: Joyce Foo <joyce.foo@qbe.com>; claims-singapore@qbe.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SFW7881K (Ol : QBE - TBA) AND SFWS00K (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/QBE18010009/Awa3) on 23/05/2018 [VC011525)

Your Ref : SFW 7881K

Our Ref : CC6/QBE1801009/Awa3

Dear Jovee

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFW 7881K (Insured) & SFW 900K ( Third Party) ON 23/05/2018 ALONG

TAGORE LANE

We refer to the above matter

The third party reported that he was exiting out from the junction, checked both side traffic was clear. TP process to
make a right turn, Ol cut across Tagore Lane



Insured reported that he was travelling alone Tagore lane turning right into Tagore Industrial Ave. TP collided OI *s
rear portion,

Based on the circumstances of both parties and available information in hand. We are in the opinion that Vehicle
turning from major road into minor road has precedence over vehicle turning from minor road to major road. BOLA 9

( ¢) applies.
As such, we intend to reject the claim.

Kindly advice on your view/opinion/instruction for this claim.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Joyce Foo [mailto:joyce.foo@qbe.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 5 June, 2018 9:39 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Melkwan@Ikkauto.com>; claims-singapore @qbe.com

Cc: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ikkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SFW7881K (01 : QBE - TBA) AND SFW900K (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/QBE18010009/Awa3) on 23/05/2018 [VCD11525)

Our Ref, VC011525
Hi

Attached GIA report for your attention.

Thank You & Best Regards

Joyce Foo
Senlor Assistant - Clams
QBE Asia Pacific - Singapore

QBE Insurance (Singapore) Ple Ltd
Phone +65 6477 1184

Emall

Visit us on the web al www.gbe com §g



Liability = SMEs

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [malilto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 4 June, 2018 6:23 PM

To: Joyce Foo <joyce foo@gbe.com>

Cc: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ikkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SFW7881K (Ol : QBE - TBA) AND SFW900K (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/QBE18010009/Awa3) on 23/05/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

We had inspected TP vehicle SFW 900K at M/s MG Solution Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit.

Enclosed here with a copy of TP's GIA report for your perusal.

Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet

We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action,

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 8625.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(308933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you
are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of
this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly



inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies
produced.

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you
are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of
this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly
inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies
produced.



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL. 6255 3561 FAX. 6256 4015

Reg. No: 109807196R GST Reg. No. 18-8607188-R

2nt

CCB/QBE 18010000/Awa3a2

QBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD Ref -

1 RAFFLES QUAY #29-10 SOUTH
TOWERSINGAPORE 048583 Dot 10090 I"I.I"IIII

SFW 7881K

SFW 800K
Policy No. 8-V0015077-MVA-RO01 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. VC011525 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 31/05/2018

Make & Model BMW 3201 1865

Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2011

Chassis No, WBAKD52080E492248 Colour BLACK

Odometer 101385 Steering IN ORDER

Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
GOOD

R/H Front Tyre |225/40 R18 MICHELIN |6 mm

L/H Front Tyre |225/40 R18 MICHELIN 8 mm

R/H Rear Tyre |225/40 R18 MICHELIN & mm
MICHELIN

cription of Damag

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS

Accident Date 23052018 31/05/2018

Survey held at MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4

(SOUTH WING) #02-038
VICOM INSPECTION CENTRE,
SINGAPORE 415933

Inspection Date

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT UDICE‘ BASIS.

|B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

2ondng Days




' 74 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Sl Ba B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6266 3581 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-0607108-R Page No 1 of 2

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SFW 500K

P ana ey I RO e Y (T |~ e

'(“‘\/.

1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 1.655.00 1.012.00
1|FRONT BUMPER SPONGE CRACKED 233.00 233.00
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @889.00 NECESSARY 178.00 178.00
1|FRONT BUMPER TOWING COVER DEFORMED 80.00 80.00
2|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE @$98.00 0/S CRACKED 166.00 88.00
2 ?&&WMPER LOWER GRILLE OUTER GARNISH /S CUT 164.00 8200
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE (CENTER) NOT NECESSARY 180.00 .
1|FRONT BUMPER FOGLAMP RH NOT NECESSARY 355.00 .
1|FRONT BUMPER UNDER COVER NOT NECESSARY 18020 -
1|FRONT HEADLAMP RH (HID) cuTt 3,800.00 207200
1|FRONT HEADLAMP LOWER GARNISH CRACKED 263.00 263.00
2|FRONT HEADLAMP NOZZLE @$243 00 NOT NECESSARY 486.00 -
2|FRONT HEADLAMP NOZZLE COVER @$96.00 NOT NECESSARY 192.00 -
LESS 5% DISCOUNT -399 11 -200.90
758309 3.817.10
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE (SN) BENT 50.00 30.00
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 22.00 2200
2|CENTER GRILLE (SN) NECESSARY 280.00 -
352.00 52.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING REMOVAL AND REPLACING PARTS 800.00 250.00
TO SPRAY PAINT AFFECTED AREA 600.00 250.00
TUFF COAT NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
WIRING CHECK 30.00 30.00
TO CHECK DIAGNOSTICS OF VEHICLE NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
MANAGEMENT /CONTROL UNITS RESET MEMORIES TO
SPECIFICATION ETC
1.580.00 530.00

Report Ref No. CC6/QBE18010009/Awa3q2



Report Ref No. CC6/QBE18010009/Awa3q2

—_———J

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
8.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M MATAI

Licensod Appraiser

DIBCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Report i made solely for the use and banniit of the Clinnt namad o0 the front page of this Report.

Heoort in stiole ol sart, does 80 a2 s oo her own dak,




