Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 28 November, 2019 3:49 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Wu Tzu Ying; Subramanian Kasi; Admin A; SUR

Subject: TAX INVOICE & SIGNED DV : SMB3565C ON 27/05/2018 (AXA SLZ 8752G) - LKK
REF: CC4/ASM18009926/T1hb3

Attachments: LOU & GIA search tax inv.pdf; SMB3565C REPAIR COST TAX INV & SIGNED DV.pdf

Dear Vic

We refer to the above matter, please find attached.
Originals will be courier out to your good office by this week.

Thank You

Best Regards

Lynn Ahmad (Ms)

Senior Executive, Claims

Office +65 6248 0987

Mobile +65 9199 0025

Email bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.sg
Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd

21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170
Registration number 201419417K
www.towertransit.sg

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 November, 2019 2:42 PM

To: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg>

Cc: Wu Tzu Ying <Wu.Zy@towertransit.sg>; Subramanian Kasi <Subramanian.kasi@towertransit.sg>; Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINALISATION : SMB3565C ON 27/05/2018 (AXA SLZ 8752G) - LKK REF: CC4/ASM18009926/T1hb3

THIS EMAIL IS FROM AN EXTERNAL SOURCE - Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender/email.
If in doubt, please check with IT Support!

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Lynn,
We refer further to your below email.

On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement without admission of liability, we have our
principal’s mandate and we propose settlement as follows:



Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 2,140.00

Loss of Use ($300 x 3 days) S 900.00
GIA Search Fees S 2.00
TOTAL S 3,042.00

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV and forward back a copy to us together with a copy of the
Authorization to Act Letter for our principal to process the payment.

The above adjusted amount is to be payable to TOWER TRANSIT SINGAPORE PT ELTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ EFES &
i Save the Larth- Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Bazlin Ahmad [mailto:Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 21 November, 2019 9:19 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Taufikh (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Wu Tzu Ying; Subramanian Kasi; Admin A

Subject: RE: FINALISATION : SMB3565C ON 27/05/2018 (AXA SLZ 8752G) - LKK REF: CC4/ASM18009926/T1hb3

Dear Vic

LOD sent to your side on Tues 19/11/2019 at 5.37pm.
Please refer attached.

Thank You

Best Regards

Lynn Ahmad (Ms)

Senior Executive, Claims

Office +65 6248 0987
Mobile +65 9199 0025
Email bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.sg




Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd

21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170
Registration number 201419417K
www.towertransit.sg

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 20 November, 2019 8:50 AM

To: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong
(LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Wu Tzu Ying <Wu.Zy@towertransit.sg>; Subramanian Kasi <Subramanian.kasi@towertransit.sg>; Admin A
<admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINALISATION : SMB3565C ON 27/05/2018 (AXA SLZ 8752G) - LKK REF: CC4/ASM18009926/T1hb3

THIS EMAIL IS FROM AN EXTERNAL SOURCE - Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the
sender/email.
If in doubt, please check with IT Support!

Without Prejudice
Dear Lynn,
Please forward the LOD to us (LKK) for our further action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LI -

RLERER WWT Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Bazlin Ahmad [mailto:Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 19 November, 2019 4:35 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); SUR

Cc: Wu Tzu Ying; Subramanian Kasi

Subject: FINALISATION : SMB3565C ON 27/05/2018 (AXA SLZ 8752G)

Dear Taufikh

We accept COR $2,000 before GST with 3 working days.
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LOD submission to your side of AXA?

Thank You

Best Regards

Lynn Ahmad (Ms)

Senior Executive, Claims

Office +65 6248 0987

Mobile +659199 0025

Email bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.sg
Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd

21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170
Registration number 201419417K
www.towertransit.sg

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 19 November, 2019 3:33 PM

To: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg>

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SMB 3565C ON 27/05/2018 (AXA SLZ 8752G)

THIS EMAIL IS FROM AN EXTERNAL SOURCE — Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the
sender/email.
If in doubt, please check with IT Support!

Hi Lynn,
COR 1/s$2000, 3 days.
Subject to insurance approval.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Sharifah Nusaybah Binte Syed Jamil Binshahab [mailto:sharifah@towertransit.sqg]

Sent: Thursday, 2 May 2019 2:28 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Shu Pei (LKKAuto); Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR; Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Cc: Wu Tzu Ying; Subramanian Kasi

Subject: FW: SMB 3565C ON 27/05/2018 (AXA SLZ 8752G)

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Joy / Taufikh,
Please see attached repair estimate as requested.

Please finalise on the cost.



Thank you.

Sharifah Nusaybah (Ms)
Senior Executive, Claims

Mobile +65 9848 2243
Office +65 6817 1747
Email  sharifah@towertransit.sg

Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd

21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170
Registration number 201419417K
www.towertransit.sg

Tower Tramsit Group
International
Busiiness of the Year
British Experti:
Internathonal ;

. Tower Transit Singapore
Best Workplace
Culture & Engagement
HRAM Awards 2017

Tower Transit Singapore
Winner, Custamer Engagsmeant catezory
18th Annual Business Avwards

. Briticth Chamber of Commerce Singapore

Lo e
Disclaimer: This email and any attached files may be coincidental, privileged and intended solely for the addressee. It may not be reviewed, acted upon, filed or
communicated to or by any other person. If you have received this email by error, please delete it and notify the sender immediately. The views expressed in this
email are not necessarily the views of Tower Transit.

From: Sharifah Nusaybah Binte Syed Jamil Binshahab

Sent: Wednesday, 14 November, 2018 4:44 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto)
<Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Subramanian Kasi <Subramanian.kasi@towertransit.sg>; Wu Tzu Ying <Wu.Zy@towertransit.sg>

Subject: RE: SMB 3565C ON 27/05/2018 (AXA SLZ 8752G)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Joy / Taufikh,

Please see attached repair estimate as requested.
Please finalise on the cost.

Thank you.

Sharifah Nusaybah (Ms)
Senior Executive, Claims

Mobile +65 9848 2243
Office +65 6817 1747
Email  sharifah@towertransit.sg




Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd

21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170
Registration number 201419417K
www.towertransit.sg

Tower Transit Group
International
Business of the Year
British Expertise

nal Aweards 2017

. Tower Transit Singapore
Best Workplace
Culture & Engagement
HRAM Awards 2017

Tower Transit Singapore
Winner, Custemer Engagement ctegory

18th Annual Business Avwards e
gritish Chamber of Comrnerce Singapore - = E
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Disclaimer: This email and any attached files may be coincidental, privileged and intended solely for the addressee. It may not be reviewed, acted upon, filed or
communicated to or by any other person. If you have received this email by error, please delete it and notify the sender immediately. The views expressed in this
email are not necessarily the views of Tower Transit.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 2 November, 2018 1:38 PM

To: Sharifah Nusaybah Binte Syed Jamil Binshahab <sharifah@towertransit.sg>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
<shupei@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Subramanian Kasi <Subramanian.kasi@towertransit.sg>; Wu Tzu Ying <Wu.Zy@towertransit.sg>
Subject: RE: SMB 3565C ON 27/05/2018 (AXA SLZ 8752G)

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sharifah,
Kindly send us your estimate as soon as possible.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Sharifah Nusaybah Binte Syed Jamil Binshahab [mailto:sharifah@towertransit.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 10 October 2018 5:01 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto)
<Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Subramanian Kasi <Subramanian.kasi@towertransit.sg>; Wu Tzu Ying <Wu.Zy@towertransit.sg>

Subject: RE: SMB 3565C ON 27/05/2018 (AXA SLZ 8752G)




WITHOUT PREJUDICE

HiJoy,

Apologies for the delay.

We are in the midst of finalising some costing of the door parts with our workshop.
In the meantime, please see attached after-repair photos as requested.

We will update you again.

Thank you.

Sharifah Nusaybah (Ms)
Senior Executive, Claims

Mobile +65 9848 2243
Office +65 6817 1747
Email  sharifah@towertransit.sg

Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd

21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170
Registration number 201419417K
www.towertransit.sg

Toweer Transit Group
International

Business of the Year
British Expertise
International Aweards 2017

Tower Transit Singapore
Best Workplace
Culture & Engagement
HAM Awards 2007

Tower Transit Singapore
Winner, Customer Engagement ategory
18th Anmuaf Business Avwards

. British Chamber off Comrmerce Singopore
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Disclaimer: This email and any attached files may be coincidental, privileged and intended solely for the addressee. It may not be reviewed, acted upon, filed or
communicated to or by any other person. If you have received this email by error, please delete it and notify the sender immediately. The views expressed in this
email are not necessarily the views of Tower Transit.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 4 October, 2018 8:13 PM

To: Sharifah Nusaybah Binte Syed Jamil Binshahab <sharifah@towertransit.sg>

Cc: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SMB 3565C ON 27/05/2018 (AXA SLZ 8752G)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sharifah,
We refer to the subject.

We have surveyed your vehicle on 01/06/2018.



To date, we are still waiting for your estimate.
Kindly send us a copy for our surveyor’s markings.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@Ikkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

DISCLAIMER: This email and any attached files may be confidential, privileged and intended solely for the addressee. It may not be reviewed,
acted upon, filed or communicated to or by any other person. If you have received this email in error please delete it and notify the sender
immediately. If you do not wish to receive general email communications, or you wish to change/update your email details, please email
grey@towertransit.co.uk to tell us. The views expressed in this email are not necessarily the views of Tower Transit

DISCLAIMER: This email and any attached files may be confidential, privileged and intended solely for the addressee. It may not be reviewed,
acted upon, filed or communicated to or by any other person. If you have received this email in error please delete it and notify the sender
immediately. If you do not wish to receive general email communications, or you wish to change/update your email details, please email
grey@towertransit.co.uk to tell us. The views expressed in this email are not necessarily the views of Tower Transit

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
wWww.avg.com

DISCLAIMER: This email and any attached files may be confidential, privileged and intended solely for the addressee. It may not be reviewed,
acted upon, filed or communicated to or by any other person. If you have received this email in error please delete it and notify the sender
immediately. If you do not wish to receive general email communications, or you wish to change/update your email details, please email
grey@towertransit.co.uk to tell us. The views expressed in this email are not necessarily the views of Tower Transit

DISCLAIMER: This email and any attached files may be confidential, privileged and intended solely for the addressee. It may not be reviewed,
acted upon, filed or communicated to or by any other person. If you have received this email in error please delete it and notify the sender



immediately. If you do not wish to receive general email communications, or you wish to change/update your email details, please email
grey@towertransit.co.uk to tell us. The views expressed in this email are not necessarily the views of Tower Transit

DISCLAIMER: This email and any attached files may be confidential, privileged and intended solely for the addressee. It may not be reviewed,
acted upon, filed or communicated to or by any other person. If you have received this email in error please delete it and notify the sender
immediately. If you do not wish to receive general email communications, or you wish to change/update your email details, please email
grey@towertransit.co.uk to tell us. The views expressed in this email are not necessarily the views of Tower Transit



