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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

300 BEACH ROAD

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 193555

Ref CC4/LPC18009925/R 1eb3

Date: 01-06-2018

[ MRFA I

47 JALAN PEMIMPIN

Code - LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJuU 9937 Veh. Inspected SLH B507G
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 01/06/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mim
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  27/05/2018 Inspection Date 01/06/2018
Survey held at WORLD AUTOPTELTD

#01-02/03 HALCYON 2 BLDG
SINGAPORE 577200

5a. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS.
BJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,




FT
Cansultmmis
Pre Lic

SEUREAYE L#0225 PAY A TR INDUSTRIAL PARK, st A MO RE Jiad T

your refr  To Be Advised
Our ref: CC4/LPCI8009925/R 1eb3

The Motor Claims Department
M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear SirMadam,
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO,

We refer to the above matter,

Company Reglstration No, 19860T158R

WIGS T GESRISHT AN = (IS 62504115

Date: 06.06.2018

SLH6507G

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 01.06.2018
al the premises of M/s World Auto Pte Lid _and have the following to report.-

Workshop Estimate Amount 1 5% 6,568.00
Revised Estimate Amount 155 4.524.00
"Check” Items Amount : 5% 336.00
Market Value 1 5% -
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5% -
Nett Value 8% -

Description of Damage:
I'he vehicle sustained damages at the
/5 Body

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: B days

Yours faithfully.

MOHD. RASUL
Licensed Appraiser




fl. £ 1|__ ILL ;"
Celine Fo ng (LKKAuto)

Fr.nm: tgttan@warldauto.com.sg

Sent; Friday, 12 October 2018 2:08 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuta)

Subject: RE: OUTSTANDING CASES - Rasul - VEHICLE NO. SLH 6607G
Hi Celine

Finalised COR & 3550 and 8 days of repairs.

Rdgs
Sophia Tan
World Auto Pte Ltd (Kranji)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

sent: Friday, 12 October 2018 11:18 AM

To: tgttan@worldauto.com.sg

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OUTSTANDING CASES - Rasul - VEHICLE NO. SLH 6607G

Dear Sophia,
Lump sum 53,550.00, 8 days

Please check.

Hest Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3501 | email; celinefong@ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: tettan@worldauto.com.sg <tgttan@worldauto.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 11 September 2018 5:56 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong @lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: OUTSTAN DING CASES - Rasul

Hi Celine
Can assist these files for Rasul
Rdgs

Sophia Tan
World Auto Pte Ltd (Kranji)



WORLD AUTO PTE LTD

47 Jalan Pemimpin #01-02/03

Halcyon 2, S'pore 577200

Tel No. : 6451 3933 Fax No. : 64557576
E-Mail : worldaut@singnet.com.sg
Website : www.worldauto.com.sg

Tax Reg. No. : 200006765-H Buss. Reg. No.

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
100 BEACH RD #19-00 SHAW TOWER

§'PORE 189702

Attention : Moter Claim Departmant

: 200006765H

Estimate : ES000140

Date : 30/06/2018

Vehicle Num, ; SLH 8507G (LCR) 2a(l pov
Make/Model : HONDA SH
Chassis/Eng¥ :

Contact : 62507388 Fax No. : 62963767 Accident Date : Z7/05/2018
Claim No. :
Reference :
Policy MNo. :
SN Quantity Particular Unit Price  Amount 5%
LIST ITEMS : =
1. 1 FRONT FENDER - RH 550.00 Lo
z 1 FRONT FENDER HYBRID EMBLEM RH 5 100,00 A~ <
3 01 FRONT DOOR - RH 1,200.00 ,l'sf £t
i FRONT DOOR GLASS REGULATOR RH 210,00 2
B 1 FRONT DOOR HINGE LOWER RH 80.00 :9(5 vt
6 1 FRONT DOOR HINGE UPPER RH 80.00.X #,
7. 1 REAR DOOR - RH 1200005 7y
B 1 REAR DOOR GLASS REGULATOR RH 210.00% -7
8. 1 SIDE SKIRT RH 430.00 FUe
10. 2 WHEEL CAP (Lpes 100:00 /L0 20000 Sl
List TotalS$ : 4,260.00
20.00% Discount 5% : 852.00
3,408.00
LABOUR :
TRANSFER DOOR MECHANISM (X2 DOORS) %0 |22
LABOUR TO REMOVE ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS IN ORDER 120000 QU
TO REPAIR INCLUDING PANEL BEAT, CUTWELD , STRAIGHTEN
PANEL WHERE NECESSARY & REPLACE ABOVE ITEMS
PUTTY & SPRAY PAINT ON ALL AFFECTED AREAS 1,508%0 ({7
Labour Total 5§ : 3,160.00
Total 5§ : §,568.00
EE
for WORLD AUTO PTE LTD (.[.]0 quﬂéﬁf

& doy)
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WORLD AUTO PTELTD

47 Jalan Pemimpin #01-02/03

Halcyon 2, S'pore 577200

Tel No. : 6451 3933 Fax No. : 6455 7576

E-Mail : worldaut@singnet.com.sg

Website : www.worldauto.com.sg

Tax Reg. No. : 200006765-H Buss. Reg. No.: 200006765H

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
100 BEACH RD #19-00 SHAW TOWER
S'PORE 189702

Attention : Metor Claim Department
Contact : 62507388 Fax No. : 62963767

Estimate : ES000140

Date : 30/05/2018
Vehicle Num. : SLH 6507G (LCR)
Make/Model : HONDA SHUTTLE HYBRID
Chassis/Eng# :
Accident Date : 27/05/2018

Claim No. :
Reference :
Policy No. :
SIN Quantity  Particular Unit Price  Amount S$
LIST ITEMS :
T
1. 1 FRONT FENDER - RH 550,00 Fef™
2. 1 FRONT FENDER HYBRID EMBLEM RH 100.00 M~
3 1 FRONT DOOR - RH 1,200.00 ' ~
4. 1 FRONT DOOR GLASS REGULATOR RH 210.00 ™
5. 1 FRONT DOOR HINGE LOWER RH £0.00
6. 1 FRONT DOOR HINGE UPPER RH 80.00 X L
7.1 REAR DOOR - RH 1,200.00 ¥ 7
8. 1 REAR DOOR GLASS REGULATOR RH 210.00 % -
9 1 SIDE SKIRT RH 430,00 57
10. 2 WHEEL CAP 100.00 200.00 SCL —
List TotalS$ : 4,260.00
20.00% Discount S§ : 852.00
3,408.00
LABOUR : ik
TRANSFER DOOR MECHANISM (X2 DOORS) 350700 |
LABOUR TO REMOVE ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS IN ORDER 1,20000 YU
TO REPAIR INCLUDING PANEL BEAT, CUT/WELD , STRAIGHTEN
PANEL WHERE NECESSARY & REPLACE ABOVE ITEMS
PUTTY & SPRAY PAINT ON ALL AFFECTED AREAS 1,6pe00 (oW
Labour Total 5% : 3,160.00
E.& O.E. Total S$ : 6,568.00
EEEmmEEEEES
for WORLD AUTO PTE LTD [.{10 qoo( m}é fS/
o{l ( { (¥



Nivitha (LKK Auto) _

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Friday, 1 June 2018 11:37 AM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Ce: MT_Claim_SG; ainee@worldauto.com.sg

Subject: FW: Request for Third Party Motor Claim Resurvey

| 2
a1 dpme | 16118
ckon @ Jnae
| i |

Our Ref : 17/18/18/VP05/020639 Jehice @ In
W L C._'J.;:U‘k

Dear Catherine,

Kindly proceed to conduct the survey as detailed below.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Ainee3l [maiitn:a1nee31@wnrldautn.mm,sg]
Sent: Friday, 1 June, 2018 11:27 AM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: Request for Third Party Motor Claim Resurvey

Good morning/afternoon,
We would like to request for a third party motor claim survey, details as follow;

Our Vehicle: SLHB507G
Your Insured: SJUS937)
DOA: 27-05-2018

Our vehicle is currently in the workshop, address as follow;
AINEE

World Auto Pte Ltd

Mo.1, Kranji Loop

Singapore 739535

Please response immediately upon receiving this request, send us your list of Loss Adjustor for our choice within 48
hours.

Kindly note that should you fail to response to us within the above stipulated timeline, we may, at our discretion,
appoint our own Loss Adjustor to perform this PRI

Ainee
Thanks and Rgds,

Weorld Auto Pre Lid



Kranji: 63621776

Fax: 64557576



Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
I

—= —_ — = — =
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Thursday, 7 June 2018 2:33 AM
To: Shu Pei [LKKAuUto)
ce: MT_Claim_5G
Subject: RE: Request far Third Party Motor Claim Resurvey ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18009925/R1eb3
Attachments: 07062018093026.pdt

Dear Shu Pei,

Attached a copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 6 Juna, 2018 5:28 FM
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN
Ce: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Request for Third Party Motor Claim Resurvey ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18009925/R1eb3
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.,
This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SLH 6507G at M/s World Auto Pte Ltd.
Enclosed for your perusal is:
Estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice
TP GIA report
Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Our case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051,

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Adnun

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 63660055 | erail: shupei@ikkauto com | faw: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408333)

Fram: Admin-D [LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 1 June 2018 12:21 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lgnpac.com>; assignments <assignments@ikkauto.com>
Ce:'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim @lonpac.com>; ainee@worldauto.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Reguest for Third Party Motor Claim Resurvey

Dear 5ir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignmentsi@kkauto.com | fax: h256-4315
Bk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408a33)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@|onpac.com

Sent: Friday, 1 June 2018 11:37 AM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Cec: MT_Claim_5G <mt claim@lonpac.coms; ainee@worldauto.com.sg
Subject: FW: Request for Third Party Motor Claim Resurvey

Our Ref : 17/18/18/VP05/020639

Dear Catherine,

Kindly proceed to conduct the survey as detailed below.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Ainee31 [mailto:ainee31@worldauto.com.sq]
Sent: Friday, 1 June, 2018 11:27 AM

To; MT_Claim_5G

Subject: Request for Third Party Motor Claim Resurvey

Good morning/afternoon,
We would like to request for a third party motor claim survey, details as follow;

Clur Vehicle: SLHE507G
Your Insured: SIUS937)
DoA: 27-05-2018



Our vehicle is currently in the workshop, address as follow;
AINEE

World Auto Pte Ltd

Mo.1, Kranji Loop

Singapore 739535

please response immediately upon receiving this request, send us your list of Loss Adjustor for our choice within 48
hours.

Kindly note that should you fail to response to us within the above stipulated timeline, we may, at our discretion,
appoint our own Loss Adjustor to perform this PRI,

Ainee

Thanks and Rgds,
Warld Anto Pre Ltd
Kranji: 63621776

Fax: 64557576



Asher SHE !LKKAuto}

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 June 2018 858 AM

To: ‘ainee31@worldauto.com.sg

Cc Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Request for Third Party Motor Claim Resurvey ++*| i REF:CC4/LPC18009925/R1eb3

WTHOUT PREJUDICE
Hi Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA
(subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your
client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the
days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051

In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate
settlement.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Cose Handler
LKK Aulo Consultants Ple Lid

ohona: 4841-6051 | email: gshesna@ikkauto.com | fox: 4741-4108

Bl 51, Paya Ubi Inclusiricl Park, Uil Avenue |, #02-25 | 5 (408933}

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]

Sent: Friday, 1 June 2018 11:37 AM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; ainee@worldauto.com.sg
Subject: FW: Request for Third Party Motor Claim Resurvey

Our Ref : 17/18/18/VP05/020639

Dear Catherine,



Kindly proceed to conduct the survey as detailed below.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel; (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Ainee3l [m_a'l:g:ai_rjgﬂl@wgrldau;g.mrﬁg]
Sent: Friday, 1 June, 2018 11:27 AM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: Request for Third Party Motor Claim Resurvey

Good morning/afternoon,
We would like to request for a third party motor claim survey, details as follow;

Our Vehicle: SLHES0T7G
Your Insured: $JUS937)
DOA: 27-05-2018

Our vehicle is currently in the workshop, address as follow;
AINEE

World Auto Pte Ltd

No.1, Kranji Loop

Singapore 739535

Please response immediately upon receiving this request, send us your list of Loss Adjustor for our choice within 48
hours.

Kindly note that should you fail to response to us within the above stipulated timeline, we may, at our discretion,
appoint our own Loss Adjustor to perform this PRI

Ainee

Thanks and Rgds,
World Auto Pie Lid
Kranji: 63621776

Fux: 643557576



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-96071968-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

300 BEACH ROAD

#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 199555

Ref : CC4/LPC18009925/R1eb3n2

Date :

Code: LPC2

11-02-2019

L

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. SJuU 9937J Veh. Inspected SLH B507G
Policy No. Z17TVPO5014161 Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. 17/18/18/VPO5/I020639 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From  GERALD Assign Date 01/06/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA SHUTTLE 1.5 HYBRID |c.c 1496
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. GP71043626 Colour GREY
Odometer = Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/60 R16 PIRELLI 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/60 R16 PIRELLI 5mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/60 R16 PIRELLI 5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/60 R16 PIRELLI 5mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/5 BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  27/05/2018 |Inspection Date 01/06/2018
Survey held at WORLD AUTOPTELTD
47 JALAN PEMIMPIN
#01-02/03 HALCYON 2 BLDG
SINGAPCRE 577200
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

Sb. Estimate Days of Repair

]ESTIMRTED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REFAIR: 8 Working Days




I Pl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

L - ; ; ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
= TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page Mo..1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLH 6507G
Qty Description of Parts Condition ?E::::‘m?:“ il A:;J}ustad
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT FENDER -RH TO REPAIR SEE 550.00
LABOUR
1|FRONT FENDER HYBRID EMBLEM RH NECESSARY 100.00 38.00
1|FRONT DOOR -RH BENT 1,200.00 1,200.00
1|FRONT DOOR GLASS REGULATOR RH SERVICEABLE 210.00 3
1|FRONT DDOR HINGE LOWER RH SERVICEABLE 80.00 .
1|FRONT DOOR HINGE UPPER RH SERVICEABLE 80.00 =
1|REAR DOOR -RH BENT 1,200.00 1,200.00
1|REAR DOOR GLASS REGULATOR RH SERVICEABLE 210.00 -
1|SIDE SKIRT RH SCRATCHED 430.00 430.00
2|WHEEL CAP @$100.00 SCRATCHED 200.00 160.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -852.00 -605.60
3,408.00 2,422 40
LABOUR
TRANSFER DOOR MECHANISM (X2 DOORS). 360.00 120.00
LABOUR TO REMOVE ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS IN 1,200.00 800.00
ORDER TO REPAIR INCLUDING PANEL
BEAT ,CUT/WELD ,STRAIGHTEN PANEL WHERE
NECESSARY & REPLACE ABOVE ITEMS.INCLUSIVE OF
THE REPAIR OF FRONT FENDER -RH
PUTTY & SPRAY PAINT ON ALL AFFECTED AREAS. 1,600.00 1,100.00
3,160.00 2,020.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,568.00 4,442.40
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,550.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CC4/LPC18009925/R1eb3n2
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