Hsiao Tuna (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 October 2018 17:42 AM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTV

Cc Catherine Thia; Alfred Toh; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); KKLau; Admin A
Subject: RE: Your ref : SNM18D02736C02/2 *Our ref : CC3/CT118009911/K1mb3g2

[ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5LG4499P(01) / SHA9540Z(TP)/ OTHERS ON 31/05/2018]

Deaqr Sirs/Maodam,

We refer o the above matter.

Case has been settled at a global sum of $4,650,00(all-in) with Third Party repairer.

We are in the midst of closing our file and will submit all the relevant documents o your good office soon.

Thank you,

Best Regarnds,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKRK Auto Consultanis Pre Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue |, #02-25 | S{408041)

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 11 October 2018 4:27 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@I|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>»

Cc: Catherine Thia <catherine.thia@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Olivia Lau
(LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>; KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref : SNM18D02736C02/9 *Our ref : CC3/CT118009911/K1mb3q2 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
5LGA4453P(0I) / SHAS540Z(TP)/ OTHERS ON 31/05/2018]

LKK ref : CC3/CT118009911/K1mb3g2
CTl ref: SNM18D02736C02/9 (5LG4499P)

Dear Hsiao Tong

We refer to your emall of 10 October 2018 pertaining to above matter.
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 54,689.07.
Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.



3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: +65 6389 6183
FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

alfred.toh@sqg.cntaiping.com
WWW.S0.C ntalglng.t:um
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Disclatmer

This message by confidential; its contents do not constitute @ commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapare) Pre, Ld. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid. Any unauthorized
disclosure, wye or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited If you are not the Intended reciplent of the message,
pease natify the sender immediately

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com)|

Sent: Wednesday, October 10, 2018 8:56 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Catherine Thia <catherine thia@sg. cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)
<plivialau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Your ref : SNM18D02736C02/9 *Our ref : CC3/CT118009911/K1mb3q2 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5LG4499P|01)
/ SHA9540Z(TP)/ OTHERS ON 31/05/2018]

Your ref : SNM18D02736/C01/9
OQur ref : CC3/CTIBO0?1 1 /K1mb3g2

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING S5LG4499P(Ol) / SHAY540Z(TP)/ OTHERS ON 31/05/2018

We reler to the above matter.

The said chain collision involved 3 vehicles whereby our insured was the 27 car.

In occeordonce to the MCF guideline for chain colliision, we have to settle the front vehicle’s claim at 100%.
We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's oware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD * at S (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Amount Revised

Claimed
|. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $9.113.94 $4339.02
2. Loss of Rental (2days x $121.28) § 24256 § 24254 [2days x $121.28)
3. Loss of Income (2days x $80.00) $ 14000 $ 100.00 (2days x $50.00)
4, LTA/ GIA Search Fee 5 7.49 5 7.49

Total $9.523.99 5$4.489.07

**04 days recommendation for repair.

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for vour perusal,
2



For your approval please.

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | emall: ghewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
1k 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Pack, Ubi Avenuoe 1, #oz-25 | S(408033)



COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

QurRef : CC1B050891/SHAS540Z 'WT(st)

Your Ref : 1l

Date ! 12-Jun-18 CDGE Taxi Claims Dept .
59 Layang Drive 4th Fir

CHINA INSURANCE COLTD Singapore S0BSED

3 ANSON ROAD

#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER

SINGAPORE 079809

Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir

ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAX| SHA9540Z YOUR INSURED SLG4499P

AND OTHER SKMT7763L ON 31.05.18

We are the authorised repair workshop for Citycab Pte Ltd, the owner of motor Vehicle No
SHAS5402 which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle.

The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authorized us to assist

them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters arising

from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving : SLG4499P
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair $ 433502

2 2 dayslossofRental@ § 121.28 perday $ 24256

3  Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by Mis LKK) 5 -

4 LTA Search Fees 7.48

5 GIA/Police Report Fees 5

6 Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees s .
Sub Total: § 458907

HIRER'S CLAIM

7 2 days Lossoflncome@ § 8000 perdays $ 160.00

Total Claims : § 4,749.07

We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -
a) Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs g pcs
b) LTA search slip/s of SLG4400pP
¢) GIA/ Police report/s of - SHAS5402
d) Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator

{ X ) Photocopies of Accident Scene Pholos

{ ) Witness stalementfs

{ ) Cenrificate of Insurance
{ x ) Downtime/Mileage recard { x ) Rental Rate letter

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of the said claims as
soon as possible,

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the tax) driver

Yours faithfully

‘Whalltam ‘lan

Deputy Manager

CDGE Claims Department

Tel: 6214 8737 Fax: 6214 1843 Email : williamian@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer generated letter, No signature is required

COMFORIDELGRO
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Our Ref* CCICTTIR00991 VK ITMB3
13 SEPTEMBER 2018

LEE CHONG GUAN

BILK 312C CLEMENTI AVENULE 4
#08-189 CLEMENTI RIDGLES
SINGAPORI: 123312

Dear Sie/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG 4499P / SHA 9540Z / OTHERS ALONG AYE
(MCE) BEFORE ALEXANDRA ROAD EXIT ON 31 MAY 2018

We refer 10 the above accident where we are acting for China Faiping Insurance (Singapore)
Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein vou and/or your authorized driver had amongst
other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the
appointed agent of vour insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable senlement with
third party claimant.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior 1o our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

A

e’

(Mivia

Case Humdler

DID: 6742 8617

FAX: 6741 4108

Email; aliviglou allkkauto.com

o {hina Taiping Insurance (Stngapore) P'te Lid
tMuodor Claimys Dept)



CDGVARS.Y LettofAuthorisation Page | of |

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION
{NAF [ PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING i 40 SHA9540Z , SLGJ499P , SKM7763L ON 31-May-18 08:00
ALONG AYE TWDS MCE BEFORE ALEXANDRA RD EXIT &
1/ We HENG BOON PIN (WANG... (Hirer) NRIC No.: S7T92BB69A
and/or (Redief) NRIC No.,:
Taxl Number SHADS540Z

hereby authonse ComfortDelGro Engineenng Pte Ltd(CDGE):

1. To submit my/four ciaims for damages, costs and expense, including loss of Income, Ioss of rental,
medical fee and legal cocts

4. Ta have absolute discretion to agree to any settlement of compensation amount in respect of my/our claim
agamst third party (except parsonal injunes ana medical clams)

3 To sign Discharge Voucher an my/our behalf.
4. To accept any payment (claim proceeds) in respect of the claim against third party and payment by cheque

shall be forward directly 1o CDGE in accordance with COGE's instructian and made i favaur af
"ComfortDelGro Engineering Pre Ltd”.

Date 31-May-2018

Name of Hirer HENG BOON PIN (WANG WENBIN)

Hirer NRIC ST9218B69A Signature @

Address 677A JURONG WEST STREET 64 £09-,,,
641677

Contact Nn 94570608

hitpr/edeek2srv: 8 Runtime/ Runtime/ Runtime/ Runume View/ CDG.VARS.V LetofAur...  31/052018
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Pnt_i:y N 1z DMECENINAS19LTa0 Clials He @ EWMIBDOZTIESCOLISS
Claimant : CITYCAR FUE LTD
Amount T 554,8%0.00

Singapors Dollars FOUR THOUSAND SIK HUNDRED FIFTY Only

I/We agres to pcoept the pbove mentioned amcunt To be paid vo me/us in fuil &
final settlement of all cslaims, costs & disbusrsements for injuries damages
sustained by ma/us through an accident ilnvolwing

Claimant Yehicle He. : SHASS40Z
inaurad Yehicle Ho. =@ SLG4439P
51/05/2018

bate of Loss :

Place of Accident AYE TOWARDS MCE BEFDRE ALENANDREA ROAD EXIT &

IN CORSICERATION of the payment made to mefus of the afcrsmspticonsd sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSUBANCE (SINRGAPORE) FIE. LTD., L/We agree absolutely to
dischazge CHINA TAIFING INSURAMNCE (SINGAFORE) FTE. LTD. and/or

Insured Hams it LEE CHONG GUAM
Driver MName i LEE CHONG GUAM
from all clalms, prassnt or futurs in reapack of all loss, indury or damage

sustained by me/us arising cut of the s&aid sccident.

I acknowledos that this paymane s mads without admissies of llability on the

pact af CHINA TAIPING IREURAMCE (SINGRPORE] BETE. LTD.
11} Glebal Sum 5% 4,650.00
TOTAL « o 5 4 5 % & & & a & & « & « 55 4,650.00
COMFOATRL A, £
=0T DRs
Claimant Mems 2 EWLASEE L esia HRIC No :
Signature : J Date 2 13 I'l.‘.\lﬁ.
\ I
ol s documesl A0y 1D veRGe (Amages ooty

Al sersona) gures 300 damages asing Miseiom & excluted

Ml o

i g
mm e MiE A0 TCAEN ol tis documen

Metise Jowliiy o chegue made popable [0

COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE 179



COMFORTDELGRO
"~ ENGINEERING

A mamper o COMRORDELCRO

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3

FO10012

CHINA TATPING TNSITRANCE

SFRINGLEAF TOWER

i ANSON ROAD #1600
STNGAPORE SG (7949049

CONTACT NO: BZZZZ3I6H

. Description @ 3P 31.0F5

s/No  Part Ro

PART RECQUISITION

ooo1 FR-01-0103-D009
0002 28-01-0103-D011
W3 04-01-0105-078]7
G044 O4-01-0107=0786
0005 040101030577
0006 D4-01-0103-0800
0007  Os—01-0103-0579

o8 04-01-0103-073RH

ComloriDelGro Engineering Pte Lid

Wik slasos

| 9550 045W

TAX INVOICE RIEATY s Wi Page: 1

VEHCTLE K IRV, NOSDATH
SHAQR40Y NIT6E O07.06.2018
MAK K JOR RO,

HYTUINDAT R HT7HHY

MCHIKI, (HXMETER HEAL R
[—40

DATE (OF HEG

DATR/TIME TN
15.09.2015 1. 05. &

MEB 09: 25

(CHASSIS (CDDR
KMHTRA 1 UMGLUD 93640

'. ooDe  04-01-0103-D739

0010 DA-01-0103-0740
a—G1-0101-=-0111

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
& member of COMPORDE LCAD

Head Office
205 Braddell Road
Singapore 579701

Kindly note thal no receipt shall be issued unless requesied

CUSTOMER'S COPY

gry Umit PFriea WihRC Net
(140 )REAR BOOT LOGO 0 15.00 0.0 15, 00
( TAN JREAR BOOT TRl NIMRKE ! 15.0H 0,00 15. M)
40NVT FMHLFEM=140 i 41.0 A0, () 372 8
| OVE EMBLLEM-TRII i 41 . K {1, (W i
[ 4IVE PANED ASSY-THUNE 1.1 ol .40 (.00 45,
i 40VC SYMBOI, MARK-THUNK . 7.720 i, 00 .76
[V (AIWER AREY-HH HiMPR 1 B3 . kil (M 457 _HR
130V IWER-FEF RIMPKR TWR 1 'h (M 180 _0H
ARSNHER=HR HlIMPER |43 4[] 1. 0 14
! BEAM-RR BIMPER® 1 R4 IR o B} I 403 48
HIIMFER WEH {(1.1F 10} | A0, O 1 7.6l

ACCOUNT No INVOICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No

|OT00T Y1 37hRA1

o — e .




COMFOR'IDELGRO ComiortDelGro Engineering Ple Ltd
ENGINEERING A

A meimber | {'_r‘wf-i"*i[ﬂll.ﬂ-lil'.;r
GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TMEANY HEG. NO 19506 "-"*"i'
TAX INVOICE Page: 2
AN1001 7
. - ) oo VEHCLE RO IRV, hH.I,H‘iA'I K
Il-uhr'w TAIPTHG TRSURANCE OO(5) PTE L SHASS4DY 91376871 07 .06
PRINGLEAF TOWER
= MAK JOIR WD,
ANSON ROAD #16-00 HY1INDAT 1081 R T5R9
SINGAFORE BG 0794909
- ) Bl M (INMICTER  HEAL NG
CORTACT BO: 6277272366 (=40
DATE (F WKG IIA I'H#'f I TN
15.09. 7018 2018 09:25
. CHASSTS (0K
KMALB4 1HIMGHING 3640
S/No Part No gty Init Price Whisc Nat
0012 04-01-0103-1150 | £0VC PROTETIOR MAT 1 50.010) 0.00 50.00
0013 D4-01-0103-0741 120V BTPAY-KK HIMVER RH ' 18000 . 00 144 00
SUB=1OTAI, ] 7 BRhE.16
UB NATUR
(]l L HANEL, HEATIN— WEAK ol . (K i), (W
OO Z2a=-007 SFRAYFAINT ON AFFECTED AHEA 0. O 600. 00
SUR-TOTAI : 1 200, D0

. tems total 4,055.178

A (=1 - T.000 % ’83.86

Tvolos Ameamt 4 339.01

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pre Lid
A mermbas ol COMFORIDELCRG ACCOUNT No INVOICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No
Heaud Office

205 Braddell Road
Singapore STITHN

Kindly note that no recalpt shall be issuesd uniess requesied

CUSTOMER'S COPY



ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid

COMFORIDELGRO |
ENGINEERING

member ol COMFORDELGRO —Sylr -

YIMEANY HEG, N, 199506045W

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE bage: A

010012
VEHT K N IRV, W/TATE
HINA TAIPIRG THSIRANCE O0O(8) PTE | SHAYRAD X 91376821 07,06, ZD1R
SFRINGLEAF TOWEHR
MAK K JO0H R,
HYTINDA 05167569

3  ANSON ROAD #16=00
SINIAPORE S5 079809

P (X METEE HEALDT NG
N1 Al L s 172366 [—a
RTE (F G DATE/TIME 1N
15 09 M1 11 05,2018 09: 75

(HASHTS CLHIE
. KMHTEA T UM ID<93040

[esued DY KATHERINETAN 07.06.2018 17:12:14
nepaEirT type YRO/57)

D=1 il Ty p— Froenen s 3 4 E =

...-.:TM-.. i .;ln.-_ arm: mrasd E YR

ComforiDelGro Engineering Pte Lid

A manpar o COMPORIDTCRD BANK/CHO No.

AMOUNT

INVOICE No.

ACCOUNT No

Head Office 1 e
205 Braddell Road W

Singapore 379701

Kindly nofe that no receipt shall be issusd unless requasted. 0 o M
CUSTOMER'S COPY



OurRel:  CC1B050891 \. o CityCab

Date: 07 June 2018

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sir/fMadam

ACCIDENT ON 31/05/2018 @ 08:00 hrs

ALONG AYE TWDS MCE BEFORE ALEXANDRA RD EXIT 6
INVOLVING SLG4499P, SKM7763L

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that CityCab Pte Ltd is
the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration number SHA9540Z (the
“Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to HENG BOON PIN (WANG WENBIN) IC NO
$7928869A a registered hirer-operator of CityCab Pte Ltd at the time of occurrence of
the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $121.28 per day (inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission lo
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a molor
workshop of his choice,

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

seltlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter, Mo signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 5T5T17 Mainlineg +65 6555 1188 Facaimile +65 6453 3183
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nsurance Particulars Enquiry By Agents Detail hitps:/'vrl ltagov.sg ltavil action/insPanDetail By AATFUNCTION

Enquire Vehicle Insurer

Vehicle No. Incident Date/Time  Search Status Insurance Company Code [nsurance Company Name

SLGAA9FP 31 May 2018/ D8:00:00 Successful om CHINA TAIPING INSLIRANCE |SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
Previous OK

laoll J1052018, 10:59 AM



