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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Thursday, 11 October 2018 4:27 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A
Cc: Catherine Thia; Alfred Toh; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); KKLau
Subject: RE: Your ref : SNM18D02736C02/9 *Our ref : CC3/CTI18009911/K1mb3q2 

[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG4499P(OI) / SHA9540Z(TP)/ OTHERS ON 31/05/2018]

LKK ref : CC3/CTI18009911/K1mb3q2 
CTI  ref:  SNM18D02736C02/9 (SLG4499P) 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong 
 
We refer to your email of 10 October 2018 pertaining to above matter. 
 
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $4,689.07. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Alfred Toh 
Senior Executive  
Claims Department 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
DID:   +65 6389 6183 
FAX:  +65 6224 7478/6224 7175 
Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com 
           alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com 
          www.sg.cntaiping.com  
 

 
 
Disclaimer :  
This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except 
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized 
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, 
please notify the sender immediately.  
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, October 10, 2018 8:56 AM 
To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Catherine Thia <catherine.thia@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) 
<olivialau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Your ref : SNM18D02736C02/9 *Our ref : CC3/CTI18009911/K1mb3q2 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG4499P(OI) 
/ SHA9540Z(TP)/ OTHERS ON 31/05/2018] 
 
Your ref : SNM18D02736/C01/9 
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Our ref : CC3/CTI18009911/K1mb3q2 
 
Dear Sirs/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG4499P(OI) / SHA9540Z(TP)/ OTHERS ON 31/05/2018 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
The said chain collision involved 3 vehicles whereby our insured was the 2nd car. 
In accordance to the MCF guideline for chain collision, we have to settle the front vehicle's claim at 100%. 
We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected. 
 
We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD " at $ (all-in). 
 
The summary is as follows: - 
 

  Amount 
Claimed 

Amount Revised 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 9,113.94 $ 4,339.02 
2. Loss of Rental (2days x $121.28) $    242.56 $    242.56 (2days x $121.28) 
3. Loss of Income (2days x $80.00) $    160.00 $    100.00 (2days x $50.00) 
4. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $        7.49  $        7.49 

Total $ 9,523.99 $ 4,689.07 
 
**04 days recommendation for repair. 
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
 
For your approval please. 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 


