Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 19 September 2018 1:56 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: 4358413236SG *Our Ref: CC3/AIG18009885/pb3 [ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SLB 34835(QOl) & SLU 6860S(TP) ON 23/05/2018]

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Please proceed to settle the claim and request for a copy of original receipt.
Thank you

Norsiah Md Noor

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419-1606 | Fax +(65) 6835-7417
Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any

copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the
recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AIG

for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, September 19, 2018 12:02 PM

To: Md Noor, Norsiah

Subject: RE: Your ref: 4358413236SG *Our Ref: CC3/AIG18009885/pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB 3483S(0I) &
SLU 6860S(TP) ON 23/05/2018]

Hi Norsiah,

Kindly refer to the email below from third party repairer which is self-explanatory.



Wed 19972018 11:54 &M
W.COmsg

RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SLUGEG0S B SLB34835 ON 23/05/2018 " LKK REF:CC3/AIGIBO09885/ph3

15 NG, 30U S0 VYL Ingapore) <snushitangian

To Hsizo Tong (LKMAwbn)

Cc B Admin A; B CS A Team; B assignments

Hi,

There is no doctor memeo, customer just went to GP to seek treatment after accident, there is no further injury claim.
Thank you

Best Regards,

Tang Shu Shi
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Centre Singapore (Macpherson)
1 Kampong Ampat
Singapore 368314

DID: +65 6922-1502
Mobile: +65 9386-7833
Main Line : +65 6305-7299
Main Fax: +65 6285-8620
shyshi tangi@vw com 59
hitp:/fwrww vw. com.sg

Kindly advise if we can seftle the abovementioned medical claim alongside with the PD claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 18 September 2018 12:13 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: 4358413236SG *Our Ref: CC3/AIG18009885/pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB 3483S(0l) & SLU

6860S(TP) ON 23/05/2018]

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Any doctor’s memo and please confirm with TP’s claimant that he is not seeking any medical treatment due to this
accident.

Thank you



Norsiah Md Noor

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419-1606 | Fax +(65) 6835-7417
Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any

copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the
recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AlG

for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, September 14, 2018 3:50 PM

To: Md Noor, Norsiah

Subject: RE: Your ref: 4358413236SG *Our Ref: CC3/AIG18009885/pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB 3483S(0I) &
SLU 6860S(TP) ON 23/05/2018]

Hi Norsiah,

We refer to our below email.

Please informed that Third Party driver is claiming for medical fee of $39.00 under PD claim.
Kindly advise if we can seftle the abovementioned medical claim alongside with the PD claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 5 September 2018 10:00 AM

To: 'Md Noor, Norsiah' <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: 4358413236SG *Our Ref: CC3/AIG18009885/pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB 3483S(0l) & SLU
6860S(TP) ON 23/05/2018]

Hi Norsiah,



We refer to the above matter.
Please informed that Third Party driver is claiming for medical fee of $39.00 under PD claim.
Kindly advise if we can seftle the abovementioned medical claim alongside with the PD claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 13 June 2018 12:44 PM

To: 'Md Noor, Norsiah' <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: 4358413236SG *Our Ref: CC3/AIG18009885/pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB 3483S(0l) & SLU
6860S(TP) ON 23/05/2018]

HI Norisah,
We confirmed that OID was an authorised driver.
Attached is a copy of video footage form third party for your easy reference. Liability is not in OID favour.

We will proceed to direct settlement with third party.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Md Noor, Norsiah [mailto:Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com]

Sent: Thursday, 7 June 2018 11:37 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: 4358413236SG *Our Ref: CC3/AIG18009885/pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB 3483S(0l) & SLU
6860S(TP) ON 23/05/2018]




Dear Hsiao Tong,
No issue if OID was authorize to drive the vehicle.
Thank you

Norsiah Md Noor

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419-1606 | Fax +(65) 6835-7417
Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any

copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the
recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AlG

for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, June 07, 2018 10:51 AM

To: Md Noor, Norsiah

Subject: RE: Your ref: 4358413236SG *Qur Ref: CC3/AIG18009885/pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB 3483S(0I) &
SLU 6860S(TP) ON 23/05/2018]

Hi Norsiah,

We refer to our below email.

Kindly advise as third party repairer(Volkswagen Cenftre Singapore) is chasing for update/outcome.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 5 June 2018 12:25 PM

To: Md Noor, Norsiah (Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com) <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>

Subject: Your ref: 4358413236SG *Our Ref: CC3/AI1G18009885/pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB 3483S(0l) & SLU
6860S(TP) ON 23/05/2018]




Your ref: 4358413236SG
Our Ref: CC3/AIG18009885/pb3

Dear Norsiah,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB 3483S(Ol) & SLU 6860S(TP) ON 23/05/2018

We refer to the above matter and our tele-conversation earlier.

We understand that the driver Mr Michael Soh San Chwan is an employee of insured’s company.
Kindly advise if there is any policy issue and whether we can proceed direct seftlement with third party.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



