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£55 REC. BY: Adnian kiny

ASSIGNMENT

From:; —= Dale; B Veh No: SBA .-J_'I'If‘ 'l_ Yr Regn: -'I_"_--I’ S
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at Workshop mis | Colour _uj L - AIG. Insured | Std | NI/ NA
of - - SpReaging 12 /e TiRatio:Insured Std | NI/ NA
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Palicy No. CiNo: THABA & ‘
Claims Mo, - Gen. Cund;jﬁou:ni‘ I Fair | Poor | Eumt— : _

Sum insured: B Excess: B Steering: !rqﬁ?derl Jammed / Leaked / Burnt or

(Cliant's Rec:;rd} e Brake: !nérdeﬂJammadeaakadeurrrt ar ;_
Make of Veh: Modi: Nil /§RRim | STD AIRim or N
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 19960T198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-8607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CSIFCI18009852/Avd3

36 ROBINSON ROAD

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date: 31-05-2018

(i

Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SH9197P Veh. Inspected SBX 9188H
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim Ne. D18004316MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From CWS (JOANNE YONG) Assign Date 31/05/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  24/05/2018 Inspection Date 31/05/2018

Survey held at J-MART MOTOR PTE LTD

BLK 5 DEFU LANE 10
#01-578

DEFU INDUSTRIAL PARK C
SINGAPORE 538185

5a. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,




Consullants
- Pie Lid Company Registration No 158607 188R

!‘ 'f_' Auta

S1UEIAVE 1, $02-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTHRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065 62263501 FAX : (0651 62364315

Your ref: D180043 1 6MFSH
Owr ref: CS/FCIIB009852/Avd3 Date : 18/92018

The Mator Claims Department
M/s FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SBX 9188X

We thank you for your instruction on 31/5/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

31/5/2018  at the premises of M/s J-MART MOTO D
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 884,251.37

Revised Estimate Amount : §£1,200.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check" Items Amount : 8%

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value 1 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
front portion

Comments/Present Status;
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,
ADRIAM LING WAl PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE,AMSAE-AM.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser



MS. Firstca pital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited Cofes No 1950001060 GST Reg Ko, ME-G0OIGTES

5 Ralles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tet (65) 6222 2311 Faot: [B5) 6222 3547

Clains & Mater Undsreniting Dep: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068677

Tel: (55 6507 3848 Fax: (658307 3849
wvw, mafirstcapital.com.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 30-05-2018 Our Ref No. D18004316MFSH
Accident Date 24-05-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SH9187P Third Party Vehicle. SBX9188H
Survey Location BLOCK 5 DEFU LANE 10 #01-578 DEFU INDUSTRIAL PARK C
Contact Person. ANGIE
Contact No. 653430934/ 0 Fax No. O
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: ACCIDENT NOT REPORTED:
Appciie LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MNA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop J-MART MOTOR PTELTD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge JOANNEY

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection,
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required,




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 18 September 2018 439 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’

Cc: JOANMNEYONG@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG', SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004316MFSH/1, SBX 9188H
Attachments: SBX 9188H PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SBX 9188H
Date of survey: 31/5/2018
Number of days : 3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 1 June 2018 5:21 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: JOANNEYONG@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004316MFSH/1, SBX 9188H

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SBX 9188H on 31/5/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408533)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 31 May 2018 2:39 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: JOANMNEYONG@E MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004316MFSH/1

Dear 5ir/Mdm,



Thank you for the assignment,

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email; assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S5(408033)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 31 May 2018 12:06 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; JOANNEYONG@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004316MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 1 June 2018 5:21 PM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System’

Cc: JOANNEYONG@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004316MFSH/1, SBX 9188H
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SBX 9188H on 31/5/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 31 May 2018 2:39 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: JOANNEYONG@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004316MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Thursday, 31 May 2018 12:06 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; JOANNEYONG@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004316MF5H/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.

Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,
Admin Team



Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



saCarMART.COM Login | Sign up Q
New Cars Sell My Car Directory Pmm  Insurance Articles " Forum Resources
Free Car Valuation

Unsure of how much your car is worth?
Let us tell you how much is the value - no charges & no obligations!

Post an Advertisement
Sedll It yoursell! Advertise it at just

$58 until it's SOLD!

Mew S Years Coe Renewal Toyota Vies 1.54 | ‘Q = A

I CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED
— MERCEDES-BENZ

AR
- | o oy
: 3

T

-
-

Sylphy Arty Any 2009 hny Ay Aty Available

[] Missan Sylphy 1.54 $13,800 §7,910 fyr 15-Ran- 2005 1,496 ¢z . Sedan Avallable

Well Taken Care And Maintained By Cwner. Very Spacious Sedan With Low Maintenance Cost. Highly Recommended Far Daily Usage Or Family User,
Loan Available, Trade In Weloome, Please Call Our Friandly Sa...

S¥L Autornobile Pe Lid
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Intergst Rate. 6 Months Certified Pre Owned Car Warranty Will B,

1 Sy, fatsan Syiphy, Nissan, Syviphy, Lsod Messn

[] Nissan Sylphy 1.54 515,800 $6,990 fyr 27-Fen-2009 1,998 cc 166,000 km Sedan Avallable

0% Downpayment. £1,375/mth, Good Condition. Flexibie Loan Package, [nstant Approval, Ex Bankrupt Weicome, High Trade In.
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[ missan Sylphy 1.54 $14,800 $10,680 fyr 25-Nov-2009 1,458 100,316 km Sedan Avallable
Beautiful Well Kept Interior With Wood Trimmings, One Of The Mast Popular Affordable Sadan With Luxury Looks, 100% Accident Free! Verified By
5TA! Immaculate Condition, Reductant Sale By Owner But Mes, . (AT}
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owiner |0 Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner D 15617
380 0P AR b S i A et v o L e O AR
Wehicle Mo SEXF18EH
Wehicle to be Exported; Yes
Intended De-reglstration Date: 31 May 2018
Vehicle Make; MISSAN
WVehicle Model: SYLPHY 1.5 4AT
Primary Colour: Grey
Manufacturing Year 2009
Engine Mo.: HR15101631B
Chassis No.: IN1BAAG11Z01075364
Maximum Power Output: BO.O kW (107 bhp)
Open Market Value: $20.131.00
Qriginal Registration Date: 15 May 2009
First Registration Date: 15 May 2009
Transfer Count: 1
Actual ARF Paid: $20,131.00
I A R R e e e e ey
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date; 14 May 2019
PARF Rebate Amount: £10,065.00
e O R D e e e e e ey
COE Expiry Date; 14 May 2019
COE Category: A - Car (15600¢ce & below)
COE Period(Years): 10
0P Paid; $£9,489.00
COE Rebate Amount: £810.00
Total Rebate Amount: $10,875.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 31 May 2018

OK



J-MART MOTOR PTE LTD

Block &, Defu Lane 10, #01-578,

Defu Industrial Park C, Singapore 539186

Tel : 6343-0934 Fox : 6343-0921
Email : jmarfauto@gmail.com
Registration No: 2014002460

GST Reg. No: 2014002460
30-May-18

Our ref : TP/4515/18

Loke Guat Bee \

RE : estimate cost for vehicle no : SBX 9188H

%

3,181.37

1pc frt bumper D L— s
1pc frt bumperrh retainer
1pe frt bumper rh fog lamp
1pe frt bumper rh fog lamp cover
2 pes frt bumper chrome  ~—
1pc frt bumper reinforcment 2
1pc headlamp Mt 11
10 pes frt bumper clips
1pc frt grille A
less 10%
1pe frino plate ek

Panel beating.
Spray painting.
Wiring.

4,251.37

Plus 7% GST

4,548.96

5D : four thousand five hundred forty-eight & cents ninety-six only,

808.45 neu

112.45
397.10
85.90

22840 -
397.10 ©
(102045

X

3,534.85
353.49

435.00

40,00 snett -

50000
50000
30.00

297.60

-—



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Lini Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R ST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Ref CS/FCI18009852/Avd3n2

H16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 R SRR M“w“mm"‘mu
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SH 9197P Veh. Inspected SBX 9188H
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18004316MFSH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From JOANNE YONG Assign Date 31/05/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN SYLPHY c.c 1498
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2009
Chassis No. JN1BAAG11Z0107536 Colour PLURPLE
Odometer 127763 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |18565R15 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre 195/65 R15 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/65 R15 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |19565R15 MICHELIN & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
¥ General Information
Accident Date  24/05/2018 Inspection Date 31/05/2018
Survey held at  J-MART MOTOR PTE LTD
BLK 5 DEFU LANE 10
#01-578
DEFU INDUSTRIAL PARK C
SINGAPORE 539186
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapare 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg, Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R Page No.1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SBX 9188H
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop {{“ [Sj}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRT BUMPER (N} DEFORMED BO8.45 BOB .45
1|FRT BUMPER RH RETAINER (N} HECESSARY 112.45 112.45
1|FRT BUMPER RH FOG LAMP (N) NOT MECESSARY 397.10
1|ERT BUMPER RH FOG LAMP COVER (N} NOT NECESSARY 85.90 .
2|FRT BUMPER CHROME (M) NECESSARY 22840 228,40
1|FRT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT (N) NOT NECESSARY 39710 -
1|HEADLAMP (N} NOT NECESSARY 1,020.45 =
10|FRT BUMPER CLIPS (N) MECESSARY 50.00 30.00
1|FRT GRILLE (M} NOT NECESSARY 435.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -353.48 -117.93
3,181.37 1,061.37
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRT NC PLATE (SN} BENT 40.00 40.00
40.00 40.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING. 500.00 200.00
SPRAY PAINTING. 500.00 200.00
WIRING. 30.00 30.00
1,030.00 430.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,251.37 1,531.37
RECOMMEMNDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,200.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18009852/Avd3n2
MARKET VALUE: $17,000.00 (EST)-PAPER VALUE: $10,900.00=NETT VALUE: $6,100.00

KL

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng,

AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Cllent named an the front page af this Repon,

Repor, in whole or in parl, does 80 at his or ber awn sk,

s accented to any third party whe may resly on the Report wholly or in part, Any third party acting of reelving on this




