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Your Ref: FY 18/19/0010
Our Ref: CC2/MIDA18009834/Npg2

HQ-Transport Command
Kranji Camp 3

151 Chua Chu Kang Way
Singapore 688248

Attn __: CPT MERLIN/ 1WO RAVEEN

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 20504 & SLN 5219M ON 22 MAY 2018

We refer to the above matter.

We noted that third party lawyer had submitted Property Damage (PD) & Bodily Injury(BI)
claim together and the case was handled by AGC.

In view of the above, we will proceed to close our file.

Qur note of charges is enclosed for your necessary action.

Summary; -
Date of submission: | Remarks:
Professional Service Fee Completed
Disbursement Fee NA NA
TCA NA NA

Yours faithfully

mlsiau Tong

Claims Section

DID: 6742 3197

Fax: 6741 4108

E-mail: chewht(@lkkauto.com



Hsiao Tung (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Friday, 29 March 2019 12:16 PM

To: 'HQ TPT Safety Branch'

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto); 'CHOY_Kai_Wen@agc.gov.sg’; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Photographs regarding Ref.AG/CIV/ACC/MID/2018/11 *LKK REF;
CC2/MIDA18009834/Npg2

Attachments: LKKInspection.pdf: LKKAdjustment1a.pdf; LKK Survey Photos.pdf; LKK Resurvey

Phatos 1.pdf; LKK Resurvey Photos 2.pdf

Dear 3irs,

Apologised for later response.

we attached herewith a copy of our survey report and photos for your necessary action.
We will proceed to close file and submit our note of charge to you asap.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: HQ TPT Safety Branch <tptsafety@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 25 March 2019 11:11 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>; Kai Wen CHOY
(AGC) <CHOY_Kai_Wen@agc.gov.sg>

Subject: Re: Photographs regarding Ref:AG/CIV/ACC/MID/2018/11

Good morning,
Any updates on this?

Regards,
Raveen

On Mon, Mar 18, 2019 at 2:07 PM HQ TPT Safety Branch <tptsafety@gmail.com> wrote:

Good afternoon Tong and loy,

May | ask if the survey report has been completed? We have send over the photos on the 27th February and it is
close to 3 weeks now with no further updates.

Please update us as soon as possible as the civilian party is close to commencing legal action against us.
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Regards,
Raveen

On Thu, Mar 7, 2019 at 3:44 PM Kai Wen CHOY (AGC) <CHOY Kai Wen@agc.gov.sg> wrote:
Message Classification: Restricted
AGC Ref: AG/CIV/ACC/ MID/2018/11

MINDEF Ref: MID 20504

Dear 1WO Raveen,

The Claimant’s solicitors are threatening legal proceedings against the Government if they do not receive an offer
of settlement soon.

Please let us know if LKK is ready with their re-survey report for this claim. If they are not, please follow up with
them to complete their re-survey report on an urgent basis as we are unable to advise MINDEF on settlement of
the matter until we receive LKK's re-survey report.

Please let us know by 8 Mar 2019 when the LKK re-survey report will be ready.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
CHOY Kai Wen

Manager (Litigation Support) | Civil Division

Attorney-General's Chambers

T (65) 6908 9355 W www agqc gov.sg

Requests for legal advice/assistance, feedback and queries to the Civil Division may be sent 1o AGC CIVILEage gov.sg. Emails sent ta this address

will be retrieved during office hours. If you would like an update on the status aof your request (including any sent directly to a legal officer) for legal
advice/assistance, please send us an email to AGC CIVILE@age goy.59

[CONFIDENTIALITY: If you receive this email in errar, you should delete it and not disseminate it or its contents in any form. Please also inform the
sender that this email has been received in error, This email may contain confidential infarmation and the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213) would
make the unauthorised disclosure of this information a criminal offence. ]
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[35-id=2ed29e38-7669-4eb5-8d81-Tb37cd4b6 18c:395c8990]

From: Kai Wen CHOY (AGC)

Sent: Friday, 1 February 2019 10:04 AM

To: 'tptsafety@gmail.com’ <tptsafet mail.com>

Cc: Cassandra LEE (AGC) <Cassandra LEE@agc.gov.sg>

Subject: RE: Photographs regarding Ref:AG/CIV/ACC/MID/2018/11

Message Classification: Restricted
AGC Ref: AG/CIV/ACC/MID/2018/11

MINDEF Ref: MID 20504

Dear 1WO Raveen,

| refer to your telephone conversation with Sarah on 30 January 2019, requesting for colour photographs of the
civilian vehicle SLN 5219M, and your email below.

As requested, | attach a copy of the survey report dated 6 June 2018 for SLN 5219M prepared by Sincere Appraisal
Services. The report encloses colour photographs of SLN 5219M.

Best Regards,
CHOY Kai Wen
Manager (Litigation Support} | Civil Division
Attorney-General's Chambers

T (65) 6908 9355 W www. agqc qov.sg

Requests for lsgal advice/assistance, feedback and queries to the Civil Division may be sent to AGC CIVIL@age gov.so. Emails sent to this
address will be retrieved during office hours. If you would like an update on the status of your reguest {inciuding eny senl directly to a legal officer)
for legai advice/sssistance, please send us an email to AGL CIY LEage.qov.5q.

[CONFIDENTIALITY: If you receive this email in error, you should delete it and not disseminale it ar its contents in any form. Please also inform
the sendar that this email nas been received in error. This email may contain confidential information and the Official Secrets Act {Cap 213)
wolld make the unauthorised disciosure of this informatien a criminal offence. ]



Taxonomy
[35-ld=f428ch25-246a-4361-acfe-dd9576134d3d: B95c899b]

From: HQ TPT Safety Branch <tptsafet mail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 30 January 2019 4:11 PM

To: Sarah CHUA (AGC) <Sarah CHUA@agc.gov.sg>

Subject: Photographs regarding Ref:AG/CIV/ACC/M |D/2018/11

As spoken,

Please let us have the colour photographs for MID 20504 so that | can follow up on the case

Regards,

Raveen



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusirial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 5256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9807198-R

Affiliated 1o Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MINISTRY OF DEFENCE Ref : CC2MIDATB0O09834/Npg2

HQ TRANSPORT COMMAND
KRAMJ CAMP 3 Date: 29-03-2019
151 CHOA CHU KANG WAYSINGAPCRE 688248

Code : MIDA
1| Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. MID 20504 Veh. Inspected SLN 5218M
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. FY 18/18/0010 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 24/05/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model VOLKSWAGEN GOLFTSI 1.4 |c.c 1380
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2009
Chassis No. WVYWZZZ1KZAW011211 Colour BLUE
Odometer 129683 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/45 R17 TOYO 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/45 R17 TOYO 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/45R17 DAYTON 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/45R17 DAYTON 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5. General Information
Accident Date  22/05/2018 Inspection Date 24/05/2018
Survey held at A-TEC AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD
B KAKI BUKIT AVE 4
#05-27 PREMIER
SINGAPORE 415875
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A'WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

sh. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 6 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 5256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 189607198R GST Reg. No, 19-8507188-R Page No.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLN 5219M
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | SLTE {:}] {$ll
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER ASSY BUCKLED 1,271.20 1,000,00
1|FRONT BUMPER LEFT RETAINER DEFORMED 8B.90 B88.80
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER COVER DEFORMED 450.50 350.00
1|FRONT LEFT BUMPER BRACKET SERVICEAELE 84,30 *
1|FRONT LEFT HEADLAMP CRACKED 1,198.20 1,000.00
1|FRONT LEFT FENDER ASSY cuT 850.10 B50.10
1|FRONT LEFT FENDER INNER COWLING TORBMN 260.70 260.70
1|FRONT LEFT DOOR PAMNEL TO REPAIR SEE 2,480.10 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT LEFT WING MIRROR COMPLETE ASSY NOT WORKING 1,400.80 1,000.00
1|FROMNT LEFT KNUCKLE ARM SERVICEABLE 864.50 -
1|FROMNT LEFT LOWER ARM CARRIER SERVICEABLE 637.20 -
1|FRONT LEFT FOG LAMP CRACKED 282.00 282.00
1|FRONT LEFT FOG LAMP GARNISH SCRATCGHED 165.00 165.00
1|FRONT LEFT SUSPENSION ASSY BENT 890.70 400.00
1|FRONT LEFT WHEEL HUB BEARING MECESSARY 261.80 261.80
1|FRONT GRILLE ASSY CRACKED 262,10 262.10
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -1,154.81 -592.06
10,383.29 5,328.54
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
12| FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (SM) MECESSARY 50.00 50.00
10|FRONT BUMPER LOWER COVER CLIPS (SN) MECESSARY 30.00 30.00
8|FRONT LEFT FENDER INMER COWLING CLIPS (SN) MNECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|FRONT LEFT SPORTS RIM (SN) GRAZED 750.00 580.00
1|FRONT LEFT TYRE (SN) SERVICEABLE 400.00 -
1,260.00 £20.00
LABOUR
LABOUR FOR PANEL 500.00 500.00
BEATING ,CUT ,WELD ,STRAIGHTEN FRONT LEFT
AFFECTED AREA AND REPLACE FRONT LEFT DAMAGED
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT LEFT
DOOR PANEL .

Report Ref No. CC2/MIDA18009834/Npg2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

51 Ubi Ava 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 100607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No..2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition :
£ Workshop ($))|  ($)
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING FRONT LEFT 900.00 500.00
PORTION .
TO APPLY ANTI PROOFING TO FRONT LEFT AFFECTED 100.00 50.00
AREA.
TO REMOVE AND INSTALL FRONT LEFT 280.00 100.00
UNDERCARRIAGE PARTS.
TO CONDUCT WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 80,00 60.00
TO BALANCE FRONT LEFT WHEEL . 50,00 30.00
TOWING SERVICE. NOT NECESSARY 100.00 80.00
2,410.00 1,320.00
GRAND TOTAL 14,063.29 7,338.54
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 5,900.00
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC2/MIDA18009834/Npg2

MUHAMMAD NAZRIL BIN ABDULLAH

Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benafit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.
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1 Vd V' 4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

=y el — il 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
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TEL: 5255 3561 FAX: 6256 4318

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

PHOTOGRAPHS FOR VEHICLE NO. SLN 5218M INSPECTION
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: G256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607188R GST Rey. Mo. 18-9607128-R




| V4 V' 4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
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TEL: 8256 3561 FAX: 6255 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No 19-2507 188-F

PHOTOGRAPHS FOR VEHICLE NO. SLN 5219M RE-INSPECTION
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-A
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PHOTOGRAPHS FOR VEHICLE NO. SLN 5219M RE-INSPECTION




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapare 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 159607198R GST Reg. Mo. 18-98071 88-R




