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Reierence i...lo :

From (Person) :

Date/Time :

TYPE;M'cai'/lrr.c;*ere/Bus/Van/Loiry/Tax.i/primeMover/Truck/Traireror

Vehicle No : SCrl XogSloBS _ D .o.A / lts sr Xb lfIfiaile & l\4o,Jel:

I'i OPS:Yes / tJo DOA:

Ref:

MV:$

NEW CAR PP.tCE:$
Regisiraiion Datexegtstraiion Date: ,, 

tOlrl>nS
COE Expiry Date: al,l_.--ral>l>o>I

MV:$ gSk:5?.F euote b;,-: fY\qvru.g

LTA TotalRebaie Amounr: (PARF) + (COE)

FS:$

I

SV:$



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Dear Chin Kiat,

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Thursday, 31 May 2018 12:M PM
'Ong Chin Kiat'

SUR

RE: Market Value for SCW2808S - Date of Accident: 28.05.2018

The market value of SCW 28085 is $88K-$92K (Estimated) as at May 18.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone:6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya UbilndustrialPark, UbiAvenue t,#02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Ong Chin Kiat Imailto:chinkiat_ong@sg.msig-asia.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 30 May 2018 4:44PM
To: Ml <mi@aispl.com.sg>; Wendy Tan <motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
<veronchen @lkka uto.com>
Subject: Market Value for SCW2808S - Date of Accident: 28.05.2018

Hi all,

Can assist to check market value?

Date of accident:28.05.2018

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ong Chin Kiat
Admin Officer, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2558 | Direct fax +65 622574O2 | chinkiat ong@ss.msie-asia.com
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s/30/2018

> BacktoOneMotoring

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquir_9fARF1c.9F_"Feb:!ef.og$egi*gre,qY€higle
.. vc!!q!g o,vn91 Par!i99ta_rs-

Owner lDType: SingaPore NRIC
. owner lD: 57ggJ

Vehicle Details

DDn: x\s[s"
(Msrg

Vehicle No.: scw28o8s

30 May 2018I ntended De-registralio1 
_D,1f 

e:

Vehicle Make: B.M,W.

PrimaryColour: Grey

ManufacturingYear: 2OL4

-i,t#1X13i3tiit,'.c-tr1s";19j!o.,_ 
.

10OO kw (134 bhp)Maximgm PoverOrtputl

op91u{9J"l9lu-9.
Original Registration Date:

$2Eq?_0_.P__*
10 Feb 2015

09Feb2025

FirstRegistration Date: ." f,p.f-9b 20.15

TransferCount 0

ActualARFPaid: $19,366.00 t(p1*'/
PARF EligibiliW:

ealf rlisili !!w_ lxpi v D{9_;

PARF RebateAmount:

lntended COE Rebate Details

COE Period(Years):

$!4,s24.@

10

COEExpiryDate: O9Feb2O25

COECategory: B - Car above 160occ or 97kW (130bhp)

QP Paid: $70,890.00

._'9oFfi:P"Qenoy1|. -$J2,1_6€-..q
TotafRebateAmoun! $6\99-2.@

The information contained herein is correct as at 3O May 2018
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