Vic (LKKAuto)

gk o T I I I ]
From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 25 July, 2018 11:42 PM
To: Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: SJF8282A & SFB6186B DOA 24.05.2018 / SSMOOIHE *** LKK REF:
CC4/ASM18009780/Aha3
Attachments: RENTAL BILLjpg; CCF07252018.pdf
Dear Vic,

Enclosed is our documents.
Liability is clear .
As request following :

1. RC $8600 ( AS AGREED )

2. LOR$ 2240 ($280 - Our client's car is Mercedes / E200/ 1800cc , replacement car is BMW ) X 8
DAYS - 5 Days recommend + 3 days waiting period PRS ( WE ARRANGE FRIDAY THEN AXA ASSIGN
ON MONDAY + 1 day weekend ) 9 DAYS

3. LTAS7.45

@ 100%
Total S 10847.45/-.

Please let us have your full settlement. Thanks

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen
Workshop Manager
LC AUTOMOTIVE
HP: 92712214

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, May 30, 2018 10:25 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SJF8282A & SFB6186B DOA 24.05.2018 / SSMOOIHE *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18009780/Aha3

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Enclosed is our client GIA report & amend estimate .
Please confirm liability 100% .
Please print out estimate & pass to Mr Adrian .

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen
LC AUTOMOTIVE
HP: 92712214



LETTXR OF AUTHORISATION

LC AUTOMOTIVE

Block 25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4
#05-26 SYNERGY /@ KB
Singapuie 417800

Dear Sir,

Accident on 7__28;3!"\‘ / %
Invelving Vehicle Nos gJ_F' %Lg ‘)'F'\
Along C\rﬂﬂ wu d HHTT Ly

]

/

I We the registered owner /driver of vehicle registration no:_ L‘f /1_— / Q
have involved in the above accident.

I/We hereby authorize M/ LC AUTOMOTIVE 1o commence repirs of the said vehicle forthwith.

I'We agree to assign the whole sroceeds of my/our comprehensive/third party claim to you and our
solicitors o to act on my/our behalf in respect of the above
matter. And if applicable,my/our solicitors shall accept this as my/our irrcvocable authority to pay
the amount as deemed compen:.ied direct to you after deduction of their <osis on a Solicitor and
client basis.

I/'We undertake to co-operate 'y with you and our solicitors to ensure t:at claim is successful,
pe Y 3

I/'We also authorize you to sign ull discharge vouchers/indemnity forms znd all necessary papers in
relation with the above claim i, niv/our absence.

Your Kind co-operation in this 1 atter will be much appreciated.
Fhank vou.

Yours truly.

(s

Owner's Signature

(Company's stamp if applicable
Name: Nm | To }! Vfﬁ’{f‘;H;/'\, g
% 203 ) F

NR'(‘ NU.'Q(L 760{‘{’ I‘? ' . |

Date:




LC AUTOMOTIVE

BLOCK 25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4 #05-26 SYNERGY @ KB Singapore 417800
Tel : (65) 69664526 iP: 92712214 Fax: (65) 69664526
Email :chris chanbebe@hotmail.com

INVOICE

ALAN TOH YEE HONG Date: 27" July 18
BLK 25 Kaki Bukit Rd 4

#05-26 Synergy @ KB

Singapore 417800

Accident date:24'"" MAY 2018
Final Bill For Vehicle No: SJF8282A MERCEDES BEN E200

Descriptions : AMOUNT

L_ump Sum repair cost as recommended by $8,600.00
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Fuweyor : Mr Adrian Ling

Totai $8,600.00

S/DLRS: EIGHT THOUSAN SiX HUNDRED ONLY
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A BRESBLERBIMABTRAS
’ HOCK CHUAN HENG CAR RENTAL & TRADING PTE LTD.
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> Back t¢. OneMotoring

i_and Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Dnive
Singapore 575701

ST Registration No. - M4-0006529-2
Print Date/Time 25 May 2018 / 07:56:06

Receipt Date/Time = 25 May 2018 / 07:56:06
Tax Invoice/Receipt

Feceipt No - ITNET-00000-1805625-00C 1 54

Previous Receipt No

S/N Item Description/ Amount GST Amount :
Business Transaction Referance Before Amount After GST
No. GST (S$) (S$) (S$)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SFB6 186B
As at 24 May 2018/19:00:00

Insurance Co: AXA INSURANCE PTELTD
1 Insurance Enquiry - SFB61866

Enquiry Fee 7.00 0.49 749
20180525075456990874
Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable 7.45
Paid By
20180525075523588 i;:Z?ngteg:ﬁi:E;rs = 745
Total 7 45
Cash Change 0.0
Tendereac Amaunt 7.45
Excess Refundabie Amount 0.00

THANK YQU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institutior: Otherwise, the transaction and receipt ‘s considered void and late fee

may apply.

Print R-ceipt OK Save as PDF

s Al pov sg/dvrl/action/completePayment?FUNCTION _ID=FI1301001TT . 5/25/2018



