Vic (LKKAuto)

S R R ]

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 25 July, 2018 11:42 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SJF8282A & SFB6186B DOA 24.05.2018 / SBMODIHE *** LKK REF:
CC4/ASM18009780/Aha3

Attachments: RENTAL BILLjpg; CCFO7252018.pdf

Dear Vic,

Enclosed is our documents.
Liability is clear .
As request following :

1. RC $8600 | AS AGREED)

2. LORS 2240 ( $280 - Our client's car is Mercedes / E200/ 1800cc, replacement car is BMW ) X 8
DAYS - 5 Days recommend + 3 days waiting period PRS ( WE ARRANGE FRIDAY THEN AXA ASSIGN
ON MONDAY + 1 day weekend ) 9 DAYS

3. LTAS7.45

@ 100%
Total § 10847.45/-.

Please let us have your full settlement. Thanks

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen
Workshop Manager
LC AUTOMOTIVE
HP: 92712214

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe @hotmail.com=

Sent: Wednesday, May 30, 2018 10:25 PM

To: Mei Kwan [LEKAuto)

Subject: Re: 5JF8282A & SFB6186B DOA 24.05.2018 / SBMODIHE *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18009780/Aha3

Dear Sir / Mdm ,

Enclosed is our client GIA report & amend estimate .
Please confirm liability 100% .
Please print out estimate & pass to Mr Adrian .

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen
LC AUTOMOTIVE
HP: 82712214
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29 JUNE 2018

KEE POIR MOK By Post and By Email
125 HILLCREST ROAD
SINGAPORE 288994

Dear SirfMadam,

OUR REF : CC4/ASM18009780/Aha3

YOUR REF : SFB 6186B

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFB 6186B AND SJF 8282A ALONG GREENWOOD AVENUE
ON 24.05.2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third-party claim
against your policy.

We have received a claim from M/s LC AUTOMOTIVE, acting on behalf of the owner of
SJF 8282A against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, it was reported that your vehicle had
collided to the parked Third-Party vehicle SJF B282A. As such, liability may not be on
your favour unless proven otherwise,

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the
claim against your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according
to the rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your
policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your
own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the
following to vicalpeh@lkkauto.com within 7 days from the date of this letter_if not
provided at AXA's reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further
document may be required:

« Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence
and status (if any)

Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)
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« If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third
Party(s), you are to keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the
status of the claim

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with
any of the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or
settlement without AXA's prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any
claim because of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised
driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim{s), AXA shall keep
you informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6256 3561 or email us
at vicalpeh@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more
effectively.

Yours sincerely,

Vic Alpeh

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2086

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

c.c. AXA Insurance Pte Litd (AXA)
(Mator Claims Dept)

keepoirmok@icloud.com
(Email)



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Friday, 29 June, 2018 11:.41 AM

To: keepoirmok@icloud.com

Cc: Admin &; Vic (LKKAuUto)

Subject: YOUR REF: SFB 6186B_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFB 61868 AND SIF 82824 ALONG

GREENWOOD AVENUE ON 24.05.2018

- oawm Consulfants
il BA B Ple Lid

TI7L

51 UBIAVE 1. #01-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62363561 FAX ; (065) 62564315
29 JUNE 2018

KEE POIR MOK By Post and By Email
125 HILLCREST ROAD
S5INGAPORE 288994

Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR REF : CC4/ASM18009780/Aha3
YOUR REF : 5FB 6186B
ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5FB 6186B AND SJF 8282A ALONG GREENWOOD AVENUE ON 24.05.2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third-party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from M/s LC AUTOMOTIVE, acting on behalf of the owner of SIF 8282 A against your motor
insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, it was reported that your vehicle had collided to the parked Third-
Party vehicle SJF 8282A, As such, liability may not be on your favour unless proven otherwise.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights afforded under
the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s)
arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com
within 7 days from the date of this letter_if not provided at AXA's reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive
and further document may be required:

» Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)

* Driver's driving license or foreign driving license [if any)

* Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

» Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

* \ideo footage of accident (if any)

« Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

» If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to keep us
informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim



To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s)
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without AXA's prior knowledge and
consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach of
policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you informed of the final
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6256 3561 or email us at vicalpeh@lkkauto.com.

Please gquote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)
74 7T
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SwSRER S Save the Earthe Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



LETTYER OF AUTHORISATION

L CAUTOMOTIVE

Block 25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4
HI5-26 SYNERGY o KB
Ningzapuce 41 7800

Ihear Sir,

(]

Accidenton _ <7 -~ B - - -
NG e
Invalving Vehicle Nos _ihif‘ Q_- "—-_'rf = I{_H _ -
Along _{f_ll £ 101 yﬂ{if'i_ J”'l”j‘____ B o =
' T - ; , i ; ;. o I/ !
I 'We the registered owner driver nf vehicle registrationno;. &7 | 5 _ -
have ivolved in the above deeitent. ;

I"'We hereby authorize My LC AUTOMOTIVE 10 commence repuirs of the said vehicle forthwath,

"W ngree to assign the whole sroceeds of my/our comprehensivethird party claim 10 you and our
solicitors . P : to act on my/our behalf in respect of the above
matter. And ifapplicable, mviour solicitors shal] accepl this as my/our imevocahlie authority 1o pay
the amount as deemed compen:.red direct 1o you atter dedaction of thewr cosis on a Solicitor and
client basis,

I/We undertake 1o co-operate vy with youand our solicitors to ensure 1.4 claim is successful

I'We also uuthorize vou o sign ali discharge vouchers/indemnity forms crd all nEcessary papers in
refation with the above claim v, miv/our absence.

Your Kind co-operation in this ¢ ster will be much apprecioned.
Thank vou.

Yours trily,

oT's Signature
(Company's stamp il applicable

Name: H'-”' “' 71§

e T N B
NRIC No: > [ =

wlshg

Date.
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CLAIM REF : SEMO01HE
INSURED : KEE POIR MOK

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

We/I, ALAN TOH YEE HONG, NRIC. NO.576030818B hereby agree to accept the sum of dollars NINE
THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED SIXTY SEVEN AND CENTS FORTY FIVE ONLY (5$9,567.45) paid to us/me
by AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD as full and final settlement of all claims of whatever kind including
damages for personal injuries and damages to property that we/l may have against the said AXA
INSURANCE PTE LTD or their Insured or the driver of motor vehicle no. SEB 61868 as a result of an
accident along GREENWOOD AVENUE on 24/05/2018 of which we/| were/was the driver/ owner/
hirer/ passenger/rider/pillion/ insurer of motor vehicle no. SJF 8282A,

We/l hereby declare that the said insurer or owner and/or driver of insured vehicle shall not be
liable for any further claim(s) whatsoever and whosoever present or future that we/l may have
against the said Insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. SEB 6186B in connection directly or
indirectly with the said accident and give our/my full and final discharge.

We/l hereby declare that we/l are/am the person(s) entitled to receive the above settlement and
hereby undertake to indemnify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD against any claim made or to be made in
respect of this settlement.

It is understood and agreed that payment herein is made without admission of liability whatsoever

on the part of the said insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. SFB 6186B.
Dated this - day of Paag 2018
: Y ol Vs
Claimant's Signature WL £

NRIC no./ Company Stamp

Occupation/ Business

Bik §Y3 Jegar koad #72-353
Address . SINGAPORE pIvl}3

Telephone No.

—
g
.

Witness's Name - i)

Witness's Signature

Witness's NRIC No.

ARA Insurance Ple Ltd (Company Reg. No. 1599

B Shenton Way, £24-01 A

AXA Tower, Singapore 06l
Customer Centr

Tal: +55 BBE0 4888 Fax: 65 6338 2527 Websile: www.5xa.com.sg




LC AUTOMOTIVE

BLOCK 25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4 #05-26 SYNERGY @ KB Singapore 417800
lel : ( 65) 69664526 TiP: 92712214 Fax: (65) 69664526
Email :chris_chanbebeahotmail.com

INVOICE

ALAN TOH YEE HONG Date: 27" July 18

BLK 25 Kaki Bukit Rd 4
#05-26 Synergy @ KB
Singapore 417800

Accident date:24™ MAY 2018
Final Bill For Vehicle No- SJF8282A MERCEDES BEN E200

Descriptions AMOUNT

fLump Sum repair cost as recommended by $8,600.00
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Isurveyor : Mr Adrian Ling

_'h:m‘i $8.600.00

S/DLRS: EIGHT THOUSAN SIX HUNDRED ONLY
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= Back t. OneMotoring

g Trarsaarn Authoity

TS Wing Diovve

Sangapore 575701

25T Reqitraton No - Ma-0006529-2

Print DateTime 25 May 2018 07 56 06
Recept Date/Time 25 May 2018 / 07.56:06
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Feceipt Mo ITNET-00000-180525-000 154

Higyious Recespd Mo

SiN ttem Description/ Amount GST Amount .
Business Transaction Referrnce Before Amount After GST
No. GST (5%) (5%) (S%)

rtesull of Insurance Enguiry - SEBA [BER

ihs 3t 24 May 2018/19:00:00

insurance Co AXA INSURAMNCE FTELTD

1 Insurance Enguiry - SFBE1BEE
Enguiry Fae 7o {44 745
2018052507 5456590874

Sub-Total 700 .45 748
Total Before Rounding 700 .49 7 A%
Rounding Difference 004
Total Amount Payable 745
Paid By

201805260756235868 ﬁ:ﬁfﬁ:jn::gs o 745
Tatal T45
Cash Change Q.o
Tendered Amaount 745
Excess Refundable Amount aan

THANK ¥OU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all paymaent: to the Authority are good and promptly settied by the payment service
pravider ! financial institution: Otherwisa, the transaction and receipt s considered void and late fee

may apply,

Print R-ceipt OK Save as PDF

e sl tacgoy sg s rhactioneomplete Payment™FUNCTION [D=F13000601°7T7 55K



