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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent WednesdaY, 30 MaY 2018 5:26 PM

To: 'WANG Peter'

Cc: Kitty Teo Poh Guek; yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg; Winnie Ho; birdie; jas;

peter.xiao@axa.com.sg; richard.angbs@axa.com.sg; SU R

Subject RE: Check Market Value (MV) - S8M00|JH/SW279E DOA:25.05.2018

Dear Peter,

Re-send

The market value of SKJ 279Eis $56K-$60K (Estimated) as at May 18.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-43t5

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue !,*02-25 I 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 30 May 2018 5:23 PM

To:'WANG Peter' <peter.wang@axa.com.sg>

Cc: Kitty Teo Poh Guek <Kitty.Teo@axa.com.sg>; yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg; Winnie Ho <winnie.ho@axa.com.sg>;

birdie <birdie.ong@axa.com.sg>; jas <jas.tan@axa.com.sg>; peter.xiao@axa.com.sg; richard.angbs@axa.com.sg;

SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Check Market Value (MV) - S8M00UH/SKJ279E DOA : 25.05.2018

Dear Peter,

The market value of SKJ 2798 is $56K-$60 (Estimated) as at May 18.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

IKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, UbiAvenue t,#02-25 | 5(408933)

From: AutoProbe Adm i n [ma ilto :admin @a utoprobe.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 30 May 2018 4:14 PM

To: claims@aiaxinspection.com; 'chowautol' <chowauto@sinsnet.com.sg>; motorsurvev@fta.com.sq;

bokhari(Oipkniehts.com; admin@lbs-auto.com; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; 'Priority - Cynthia Ong'

<cvnthia.ong@prioritvservices.sg>; rta@rta.com.sg; collin.wong@a-pac'sg

Cc: Kitty Teo Poh Guek <Kittv.Teo@axa.co >; wonne.ans@axa.com.ss; Winnie Ho <winnie.ho@axa.com.se>;



birdie <birdie.ons@axa.com.sg>; jas <ias.tan@axa.com.ss>; oeter.xiao@axa.com.sg; richard.ansbs@axa.com.ss

Subject: Re: Check Market Value (MV) - S8M00|JH/SKJ279E DOA : 25.05.2018

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to mailtopeter.wans@axa.com.ss and cc to all OD case handler within 48

hours.

Jessie Ong

AutoProbe Consultants
Blk 151A Serangoon North Avenue 2,

#02-8L Sin gapore 55 115 L

Main : 62699235 Fax: 6269t446



30/05/201R PARF/COF Rehata Fnnrriil

> Back to OneMotoring

Enqu i re PARF/CO E Rebate for Registered Veh icle
Vehlcle Owner Particulars
Owner lDType:

Owner lD:
Vehicle Details
Vehlcle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

lntended De-registration Date:

Vehlcle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:

Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:

Open MarketValue:

Original Registration Date:

First Registration Date:

Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

lntended PARF Rebate Details
PARFElleibiliW:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF RebateAmount:

lntended COE Rebat'e Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE RebateAmount:

Total RebateAmount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 3O May 2018
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SKJ279E

No

30 May 2018

VOLKSWAGEN
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V'f\|GZZZLTZDWO39711

103.0kw (138bhp)

$2r,902.00

05Feb2O13 !

05 Feb2013 ', !

o
,

$16,902.00 
1

Yes

O4Feb2023

$11,831.00

04Feb2023
A-Car(160occ&belowl I.'l
10

$91,010.00

$42,604.00

$54,435.00
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