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! '{'I' Auto

e Consultants
B da BREA B Fra L Company Registration Na. 18960719

SR AVE 180225 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (43 62363561 FAX : (065 625643

Your ref: CMTDI1802273/AGC

Our ref: CS/SMO18009752/Avd3 DATE: 30/1/201%

The Motor Claims Department
M/s SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD

Dear SirfMadam
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.GBG 71488
We thank for your instruction on 30/5/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

30/5/2018 at the premises of M/s OUR BRO'S WORKSHOP (5} PTELTD

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :5%8,782.00
Revised Estimate Amount  :53%4,650.00 (LUMP SUM)

“Check"” Items Amount 88
Market Value 58
LTA Reimbursement Value :5%
Nett Value R

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the nearside
rear portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng AMSOE.AMIRTE AMSAE-AMMATAI
Licensed Appraisar



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 29 January 2019 4:22 PM
To: "Veeramani Karuppiah'; SUR
Subject: RE: GBG7148B Sompo insurance
Attachments: MARKING.pdf

Dear Mani,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Offer Lump Sum $4650/- @ 6 working days.

Please check and confirm.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veeramani Karuppiah <veeramani4029@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 23 November 2018 12:55 PM

To: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: GBG7148B Sompo insurance

Hi there,

Pls let me know the status as i have not heard from your side for a while.
My client; GBG7148BG

Your insured; YN994L

Thks

Mani

Director

Our Bro's Workshop (S) Pte Ltd
www.owsproshop-obw.com

10 Kaki Bukit Rd 2 #03-37/38
First East Centre

Singapore 417868

HP: 90217013

OFF: 66361338

FAX: 66361339



On Thursday, 31 May 2018, 3:49:00 PM GMT+8, Veeramani Karuppiah <veeramani4029@yahoo.com.sg> wrote.

Hi, attached will be the estimate and the GIA report.
Adrian was the surveyor. Pls let me know.

Thank you

Mani

Director

Our Bro's Workshop (S) Pte Ltd
www.owsproshop-obw.com

10 Kaki Bukit Rd 2 #03-37/38
First East Centre

Singapore 417868

HP: 90217013

OFF: 66361338

FAX: 66361339




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

e ————————— e ——

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 30 January 2019 11:39 AM

To: 'Teo, Grace'

Ce: 'Chan, Shu Hui Agnes’; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin’; SUR

Subject: RE: CMTD1802273/AGC - SUV(LKK)/ YN994L & GBG7148B ON 25.05.2018
Attachments: GBG 7148B PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Grace,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBG 7148B
Date of survey: 30/5/2018
Number of days : 6 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4085833)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 1 June 2018 4:33 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.tec@sompo.com.sg>

Ce: 'Chan, Shu Hui Agnes' <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: CMTD1802273/AGC - SUV(LKK)/ YN994L & GBG7148B ON 25.05.2018

Dear Grace,
Please be informed that we have inspected vehicle GBG 7148B on 30/5/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Elk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 30 May 2018 12:42 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Chan, Shu Hui Agnes' <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ve@sompo.com.sg>; SUR

<sur@lkkauto.com=
Subject: RE: CMTD1B02273/AGC - SUV(LKK)/ YN994L & GBG7148B ON 25.05.2018




Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone:; 6841-1972 | email; assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.teo@sompo.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 30 May 2018 10:34 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com; assignments@|kkauto.com

Cc: Veeramani Karuppiah <veeramani4029@vyahoo.com.sg>; Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>;
Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: CMTD1802273/AGC - SUV(LKK)/ YN294L & GBG7148B ON 25.05.2018

Our Reference: CMTD1802273/AGC
Your Reference: GBG71488

Dear LKK AUTO,

Please make arrangement to conduct the survey for GBG7148B.

Please be informed that Agnes Chan the handler of this case.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

= . Innovation for Wellbeing A C f T
@/ SOMPO entury of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this infarmation may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Veeramani Karuppiah [mailto:veeramani4029@yahoo.com.sq]

Sent: Monday, May 28, 2018 5:50 PM

To: Teo, Grace

Subject: Re: CMTD1802273/AGC - PRI/ YN994L & GBG7148B ON 25.05.2018

We are ok with any of the LKK surveyors. Vehicle is already in our workshop.

P



Thank you.
Mani

Director
Our Bro's Workshop (S) Pte Ltd

www.owsproshop-obw.com
10 Kaki Bukit Rd 2 #03-37/38
First East Centre

Singapore 417868

HP: 90217013

OFF: 66361338
FAX: 66361339

On Monday, 28 May 2018, 5:27:47 PM GMT+8, Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg> wrote:

Qur Reference : CMTD1802273/AGC

Your Reference: GBGT7148B

Without Prejudice

Date: 28" May 2018

Attention:

M/S OUR BRO'S WORKSHOP (S) PTE LTD

Dear Mani,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN994L & GBEG7148B ON 25.05.2018

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 28/05/2018.



Please be informed that Agnes Chan the handler of this case.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's/your customer’s vehicle jointly with
your client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list
to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as

Motor Survevor Surveyor tick)
I | Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 | LKK Auto Consultants area)
Marcus Chua (East area)

Mohd Rasul {West area)
Mohd Tauofikh (West

area)
3 | Priority Services Jimmy Lee
Lawrence Ng
Jeffrey Ong
4 | JP Knights Adjusters & Surveyors Jason Lek

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these
motor surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will
bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried ocut by the single joint expert.

Best Regards
Grace Teo
Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

—

Innovation for Wellbeing
@/ SOMPO A Century of Trust




Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompaSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
andlor legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Veeramani Karuppiah Imailto:veeramani4029@yahoo.com.&q]
Sent; Monday, May 28, 2018 3:48 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey

Subject: 3rd part claim

Attention: Motor Claims Department

To the Person-In-Charge,

We are writing in on behalf of our client- GBG71488

Our client authorized us to act on behalf with regards to his Third Party Motor Claims against your insured- YN994L

Details:
SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD:
Third Party Claimant. GBG7148B

Date of Accident: 25/05/2018 1600HS
Location of Accident: PAN ISLAND EXPRESSWAY

Car is already in our workshop from 25/05/2018

Please do contact us to make arrangements for the Pre-Repair Survey at our workshop.



Address:
Our Bro's Workshop

10 Kaki Bukit Road 2 #03-38
First East Centre

Singapore 417868

You can contact us at 66361338 (Mani) or e-mail us, veeramani4029@yahoo.com.sq for further clarifications.

Thank you.

Mani

Director

Our Bro's Workshop (5) Pte Ltd
www owsproshop-obw.com

10 Kaki Bukit Rd 2 #03-37/38
First East Centre

Singapore 417868

HP: 90217013

OFF: 66361338

FAX: 66361339



“Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 1 June 2018 4:33 PM

To: Teo, Grace'

Cc ‘Chan, Shu Hui Agnes’; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin’; SUR

Subject: RE: CMTD1802273/AGC - SUVILKK)/ YNI94L & GBGT71488 ON 25.05.2018
Dear Grace,

Please be informed that we have inspected vehicle GBG 7148B on 30/5/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

glk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 30 May 2018 12:42 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Chan, Shu Hui Agnes' <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye @sompo.com.sg>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: CMTD1802273/AGC - SUV(LKK)/ YN994L & GBG71488 ON 25.05.2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.teo@sompo.com.sg)
Sent: Wednesday, 30 May 2018 10:34 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com; assignments@Ilkkauto.com

Cc: Veeramani Karuppiah <veeramanid029@yahoo.com.sg=>; Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>;

Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: CMTD1802273/AGC - SUV(LKK)/ YN994L & GBG7148B ON 25,05.2018

Our Reference: CMTD1802273/AGC
Your Reference: GBG7148B

Dear LKK AUTO,



Please make arrangement to conduct the survey for GBG7148B.

Flease be informed that Agnes Chan the handler of this case.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F. 6221 3147

Innovation for Wellbeing
@ SOMPO A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Veeramani Karuppiah [mailto:veeramani4029@yahoo.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, May 28, 2018 5:50 PM

To: Teo, Grace

Subject: Re: CMTD1802273/AGC - PRI/ YN994L & GBG7148B ON 25.05.2018

\We are ok with any of the LKK surveyors. Vehicle is already in our workshop.

Thank you.
Mani

Director

Our Bro's Workshop (S) Pte Ltd
www, owsproshop-obw.com

10 Kaki Bukit Rd 2 #03-37/38
First East Centre

Singapore 417868

HP: 80217013

OFF: 66361338

FAX: 66361339

On Monday, 28 May 2018, 5:27:47 PM GMT+8, Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg> wrote:

Our Reference : CMTD1802273/AGC

Your Reference: GBG7148B



Without Prejudice

Date: 28" May 2018

Attention:

M/S OUR BRO’S WORKSHOP (S) PTE LTD

Dear Mani,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN994L & GBG7148B ON 25.05.2018

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 28/05/2018.

Please be informed that Agnes Chan the handler of this case.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's/your customer's vehicle jointly with
your client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list
to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as

Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 | Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 | LKK Auto Consultants area)
Marcus Chua (East area)

Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West
area)

3



3 | Priority Services Jimmy Lee
Lawrence Ng

Jeftrey Ong
4 | JP Knights Adjusters & Surveyors Jason Lek

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these
motor surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will
bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards
Grace Teo
Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

Innovation for Wellbeing
SOMPO A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www facebook.com/SompoSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Veeramani Karuppiah [mailto:veeramani4029@yahoo.com.sg
Sent: Monday, May 28, 2018 3:48 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey

Subject: 3rd part claim

Attention: Motor Claims Department



To the Person-In-Charge,

Ve are writing in on behalf of our client- GBGT148B

Our client authorized us to act on behalf with regards to his Third Party Motor Claims against your insured- YN9934L

Details:

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD:

Third Party Claimant: GBG7148B
Date of Accident: 25/05/2018 1600HS

Location of Accident: PAN ISLAND EXPRESSWAY

Car is already in our workshop from 25/05/2018

Please do contact us to make arrangements for the Pre-Repair Survey at our workshop.

Address:
Our Bro's Workshop
10 Kaki Bukit Road 2 #03-38

First East Centre
Singapore 417868

You can contact us at 66361338 (Mani) or e-mail us, veeramani4029@yahoo.com.sq for further clarifications.

Thank you.



Mani

Director

Our Bro's Workshop (S) Pte Ltd
www.owsproshop-cbw.com

10 Kaki Bukit Rd 2 #03-37/38
First East Centre

Singapore 417868

HP: 90217013

OFF: 66361338

FAX. 66361339



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 30 May 2018 10:34 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com; assignments@Ikkauto.com

Cc Veeramani Karuppiah; Chan, Shu Hui Agnes; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin
Subject: CMTD1802273/AGC - SUV(LKK)/ YNS94L & GBG7148B ON 25.05.2018

Qur Reference: CMTD1802273/AGC
Your Reference: GBG7148B

Dear LKK AUTO,

Please make arrangement to conduct the survey for GBG7148B.

please be informed that Agnes Chan the handler of this case.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6320 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F. 6221 3147

@ Siro” T

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Waebsite: www.sompo com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook com/SompoSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
andlor legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes

stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom

disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Paolicy

From: Veeramani Karuppiah [mailtﬂ:veeramaniﬂmzﬂ@vahﬂoimm.sg]

Sent: Monday, May 28, 2018 5:50 PM

To: Teo, Grace

Subject: Re: CMTD1802273/AGC - PRI/ YNS94L & GBG7148B ON 25.05.2018

We are ok with any of the LKK surveyors. Vehicle is already in our workshop.

Thank you.
Mani

Director

Our Bro's Workshop (S) Pte Ltd
www.owsproshop-obw.com

10 Kaki Bukit Rd 2 #03-37/38




_First East Centre
Singapore 417868

HP: 90217013
OFF: 66361338
FAX: 66361339

On Monday, 28 May 2018, 5:27:47 PM GMT+8. Teo, Grace <grace.te0@sompo.com.sg> Wrote:

Our Reference : CMTDH 802273/AGC

Your Reference: GBGT148B

Without Prejudice

Date: 28" May 2018

Attention:

M/S OUR BRO’S WORKSHOP (S) PTE LTD

Dear Mani,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN994L & GBG7148B ON 25.05.2018

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 28/05/2018.

Please be informed that Agnes Chan the handler of this case.

We intend 1o conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/vour customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose 1o use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct the
joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

2



Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as
Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)

1 | Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng

Kenneth Kong (North
LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West
area)

[ g ]

3 | Priority Services Jimmy Lee

Lawrence Ng
Jeffrey Ong
4 | JP Knights Adjusters & Surveyors Jason Lek

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
survevors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of the
pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards
Grace Teo
Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

——

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pie. Lid.
50) Raffles Place, #03-01/06 Singapore Land Tower. Singapore (48623
Wehsite: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www, facebook.com/SompoSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail. including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential and/or legally

2)



privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited. IF you are not the
wntended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated in our
Privacy Poliey. This may include disclosure 1o holding and associated companies. credit burcau. parties to whom disclosure is
permitted/required by laws, our third parly service providers and agents (acting on our hehalf), Please click here for our Privacy Policy

From: Vecramani Karuppiah |_maiIm'.veeramani4ﬂ2‘}@yuhuo,mm.sgj
Sent: Monday, May 28, 2018 3:48 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey

Subjeet: 3rd part claim

Attention: Motor Claims Department

To the Person-In-Charge.

We are writing in on behalf of our client- GHBGT1488

Our client authorized us to act on behalf with regards to his Third Party Motor Claims against your insured- YNOO4L

Details:

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTELTD:
Third Party Claimant: GBGTI-‘-‘SB

Date of Accident: 25/05/2018 1600HS

Location of Accident: PAN ISLAND EXPRESSWAY

Car is already in our workshop from 25/05/2018

Please do contact us to make arrangements for the Pre-Repair Survey at our workshop.

Address:
Our Bro's Workshop
10 Kaki Bukit Road 2 #03-38

First East Centre



Singzpore 417868
You can contact us at 66361338 (Mani) or e-mail us, veeramani4029@yahoo.com.sg for further clarifications.

Thank you

Mani

Director

Our Bro's Workshop (S) Pte Lud
www . owsproshop-obw.com

10 Kaki Bukit Rd 2 #03-37/38
First East Centre

Singapore 417868

HP: 90217013

OFF: 66361338

FAX: 6A361339



1/30/2019 Transfer Fee Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire Transfer Fee

Vehicle Details

Wihicle No. :

Vehicle Type:

Wehicle Attachment 13
Vehicle Scheme :

Wehicle Make :

Vehicle Model :

Chassis Mo.:

Propellant :

Engine Mo.:

Engine Capacity :
Maximum Power Output
Maximim Laden Weight :
Unladen Weight :

Year Of Manufacture :

Criginal Registration Date :

Lifespan Expiry Date:
COE Category :

Quota Premium ;

COE Expiry Date :

Road Tax Expiry Date:
Inspection Due Date :
Intended Transfer Date :
CO2 Emission:
CEV/VES Rebate Utilised
Amount

CO Emission:

HC Emission:

MOx Emission :

P Emission :

Late reneval feels) will be imposed if road tax / lay up has expired. Please use Enquire Road Tax Payable for feels) payable.

GBG71488

AS50 - Goods (Closed) Van/Van Panel (Delivery)
Me Attachment

MNormal

MISSAMN

NV200 1.5 MT ABS AIRBAG 2WD 6DR E5 W/RC
VSKYBAMZ20Z0147020
Diesel
K9KCA00D05T573
1461 cc

2000 kg

1260 kg

2017

13 0ct 2017

12 Oct 2037

C - Goods Wehicle & Bus
£42 801.00

12 Oct 2027

12 Oct 2017

12 Oct 2019

30 Jan 2019

138.00 (g/km)

Road tax, including Over Payment (if any), of a vehicle will follow the vehicle to the new registered owner when its ownership is being

transferred.
Amount Payable

Transfer Fee:
Total Armount Payable :

Amount Before G5T
(%)
2500

You may print this page for reference.

OK Print

RNESLLYrLIE. gov. sganTiacionienguire | ransterresUelalsrogy ' FUMNL | WIN_IL=FubUiuIaE]

GST Amount
(5%

Amount After GST
(55)

25.00

25,00

alal



hiSIFE,

ESTIMATE

OUR BRO'S WORKSHOP (S) PTE LTD DATE: May 31, 2018

10 Kaki Bukit Road 2
#03-37/38 First East centre
Singapore 417868

Phone: 66361338
Fax 66361338

Email: mani@owsproshop-obw.com
RCB: 201129936E
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QUOTE #:

FOR: GBGT71488
MAKE/MODEL: NV200

Insurance Company: SOMPO INSURANCE
SINGAPORE PTE
LTD
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LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:
= To resurvey belore/after spray painting
= To desplay damaged part(s) during resurvey
» Parts prices are subject o conlirmation
= Third party survey is on a "Without Prejudice” basis
* Mo illagal modification(s) is allowed
» Bupplementary iemis) musi be resurveyed and
is subject to final approval from insurance Company

Acknowledgad by Repsirer
Signature:
Date:

Customer Acceptance (sign below):

Print Name:



' P4} LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

T A i 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408633
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. MNo. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobila
SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL Ref :  CS/SMO18B009752/Avd3n2
sosorme " RO
#05-01/06 Date . 30-01-2019
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code: SMO
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YN 994l Veh. Inspected GBG 7148B
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1B022T3/AGC Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  GRACE TED Assign Date 30/05/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN NV200 c.c 1461
Engine No.  HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. VEKYBAMZOZ0147020 Colour WHITE
Odometer 18633 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. ' Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |175/70 R14C GOODYEAR 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |175/70 R14C GOODYEAR & mm
RIH Rear Tyre |175/70 R14C GOODYEAR 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre | 175/70 R14C GODDYEAR 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. =i General Information
Accident Date  25/05/2018 Inspection Date 30/05/2018
Survey held at  OUR BRO'S WORKSHOP
AHIT BUKIT ROAD 2 #03-38 FIRST EAST CENTRE SINGAPORE 417868
5a. Remarks
A)THE [NSPECTION YWAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS.,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5hb. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 6 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

. e ; - I 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No. 199607198R GST Reg. MNo. 19-89607198-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBG 7148B
e Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wnrkshup'{;j ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|RR RH DOOR ASSY DISTORTED 940 00 940.00
1|RR LH DOOR ASSY DISTORTED 1,380.00 1,280.00
1|5 PAX STICKER NECESSARY 10.00 10.00
1|RR RH DOOR GLASS ASSY SHATTERED 485,00 485.00
1|RR LH DOOR GLASS ASSY NOT NECESSARY T98.00 -
1|RR LH TOP NOOR LOCK ASSY DAMAGED 120.00 120.00
1|RR LH TOP RDOOR CATCH NOT NECESSARY 48.00 -
1|RR LH LOWER DOOR LOCK ASSY DAMAGED 135.00 135.00
1|RR LH LOWE R RDOOR LOCK CATCH MOT NECESSARY 48.00 -
1|RR RH TOP DOOR LOCK ASSY NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
1|RR RH TOF DOOR LOCK CATCH MOT NECESSARY 48.00 -
1|RR WEATHER STRIP NOT NECESSARY 135.00 -
1{RR RH DOOR WEATHER STRIP CuT 95.00 95.00
1|RR LH DOOR WEATHER STRIP cuTt 95.00 95.00
1|RR BUMFER ASSY DEFORMED 680.00 680.00
2|RR BUMPER REFLECTOR @$65.00 NOT NECESSARY 130.00 -
1|RR BUMPER TOW HOOK COVER NOT NECESSARY 25.00 -
1|RR END PANEL ASSY DENTED 1.320.00 598.00
1|SILLICONE {(GLASS) NECESSARY B60.00 60.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -449 80
6,672.00 404820
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|TO REDO THE BOTH DOOCR STICKERS (SN) NECESSARY 380.00 300.00
1|REVERSE SENSOR({SN) DAMAGED 140.00 140.00
T0JCLIP @34.00 (5N) MECESSARY 40.00 40.00
560.00 480.00
LABOUR
SPRAY PAIN 750.00 B00.00
TO PANEL BEAT MACUUM REMOVE TRANSFER, 800.00 T700.00
REFIT AND CHECK WIRING.
1,550.00 1,300.00
GRAND TOTAL 8,782.00 5,828.20

Report Ref No. CS/SMO18009752/Avd3n2




Fage Mo 2 of 2

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,650.00
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/SMO18009752/Avd3n2

ADRIAN LING WAl PING

B.Eng AMSOE.AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser
DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TQ THIRD PAR

Mo lability of respongibilly whatsccver, in contast o
Bepodt. In whole or in parl, docs 50 at s r f h:r_lwn.ml..




