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Enguire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
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| Owmer D Type: — o ShexonNRE MR WY 4
| Chwmer I SOAAH

Viehicle Details
| Vhicls No- SIFPP6IK =

Vihicle te be Exgorted: No
| Intended De-registration Dute 1S Jun 2018
| Vishicle Make- HONDA
" Viehicie Model CIVICIMAA J
1 Mmﬂu\hr 208 —-':
| Engine Na: LDA23037651 .
|  Chvassis No.: IHMID362085212100 l

Mandmurm Power Outpur T0.0 kW (93 bhp)

Original Registration Date: 18 Jun 2008 !
| First Registration Dats: 18 Jun 2008 :
| Transfer Count: ) !
| Actual ARF Paid: $16290.00 :

. Intended PARF Rebate Details L ==, —
I PARF ENgibility; . o . S = —i |
| PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: o o A7 Jun 2018 e = ===~ ] |

PARF Rebate Amount: S8 14500

intended COE Rebate Detaits NV
| COE Expiry Date: 17 hm 2018 ) lt

CIOE Category: A-Car below] !
| COE Period{Yuarsk 10 |
| Paick $14590.00
. COE Rebare Amount: $a00
| Total Rebate Amount: $8. 15300 |
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sGCAarMART.CONM
TAL ONLY PLACT TOR SMART CAR BUYIRE
Honda Civic 1.3 Used Vehicle List (5 vehicles)

Honda Civic Hybrid 1.3A (New  $31,500 $6,300 fyr 22-May-2008 13396 - 15t Goar Auto Available
5-yr COE) (Petrol-Electnc)

Well Matained Car. Exeationt Fust Cotsumption. Rellable And Easy Mantenance. View To Betieve: Bank And In House boon Avadiable. 40 Down Payment
Availnbde, Cll Mow To Make A Appointment.

Derrick - 85404117

m Civie Hybeid 138 (Potro $12,500 - OL-J2008 139 - Available
i)

Excetient And Original Condition, Well Maintsined Interior And Exteriar, Selling With Carplate, Call Now Fpr Viewing.
Office No, - -
Wu - 98493636

Honda Civic Hybrid 1,34 (New  $33,888 6,770 Iyr 01-Jul-2008 1,339 cc  110,595km  ABS Auto Holding Fle Lid  Avaitable
Syr COE) (Polral-Blectric) '
mmmtﬁzmmﬁaﬁmmmmmmmmpﬁmur Car [n Guod Conditian, Hmmmmﬁmwwmmm
Ayt 100% Ammad Trade In Welcsine, !wmﬁﬁwlub

Office No. - 64753423 . . )
Aoy Lae - BA15B315 | Alex - BZ298229 | Kanny - 96259995

Honda Civic Hybrid 1.38 (New  $34,700 £6,940 fyr 222008 133%ee 168100 %m  EU Automobde Peltd  Available
S-yr COE) [Potrol-Electric)

e 5 Years COF. Sarvitad O J0J03/ 2016, Viry Gbod Fusl Cortumption, In-Hogse Loan avallabis' With Low Interest Rate: Plesss Call For'f Test Drve
Apptiirrest

Office Na. - 67771515

D3 - 86008130 | Louis - 86282686 | Jacky - 1066106

Honda Civic Hybrid 1.3A (New  $32,999 $6.600 /yr 242008 1339 - Carland Automobile Available
S-yr COE) (Petrnl-Elecific)

32777 Down Payment, $660 For Manthly mmmw-mm,mmm,mcwumw, 5 Yanrs Or 10 Years COE
Avatlable, Low Missgs. Low Depreciation, Excellent Ma...

Oefice Mo. - 62912129

Led - 90044780

m:-ﬂmsutmmmmardnmfwwawwmmmmHnmwmmrimmawmwmwmmhﬁ
caryy CPC £ars, vans, Trucks, i cars, sports cars of stationwagorns. You aleo buy from & car suction, 100k Up caf loans, low misags cars, car brands,
carpark fotes Bcar insrante. mwmm.mwwwaMmMWmm,mmemmeWﬁr
p;tnusto.mmrhunmwmwmm and also maloring advics, car neviis & car hews on th fatest modets, Visik our partner sites-for jobi
mmmmmmmmmmmﬁmhmmrmmnmmmmﬂmmn.mmmwmmku&
rasuiie,

i© 2004-2018 sgCarMart. All rights resanved,

hitp:/iwww:sgearmart comlused_carsésearch,_resull_pricelist_print php7SA=8MOD=Honda%20Civicth201. 34RPG=204VEH-08RGD=20088AVL=280RD=R



Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

— = ——
From: fiudrisy Hwee Ling GOH <sudreygohi@dhs com>
Sent: Tuesday, 12 June- 2018 343 AM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAUTO)
Cc LKK Valuation
Subject: RE; Valuation Reguest

Hi Shiau Chan,

Please proceed to submit the below 2 vehicle valuation reports.
Kindly let us have fax copy of valuation report for SKE3475L.
Thank yau.

Audrey Goh

CBG/WM Credit Collection
Risk Management Group
DBS Bank Ltd

Tel - GB78 9026

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Sent: 31 May 2018 09:48

To: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com>; LKK Valuation <valuation@Ikkauto.com>
subject: [External] RE: Valuation Request

This mall originated from an external party outside DAS - siewsc@lkkauto.com.

Daar Audrey,

The Valuation of vehicles as below.

1) SKE 3475L MV: S40K FS: $32K
2} 'SIF0963% MV: S8K F5: 58.2K
As at May'18.
Bisst Regards,

Shian Chas (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultans Pte Ltd

Phons: b256-3561 | emaoil: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4:415
Bik 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #0225 | S(408933)

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH [mailto:audreygoh@dhs.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 30 May 2018 2:39 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@|kkauto.com>
Subject: Valuation Request

Hi Celine,

please assist with valuation of the following vehicles.

1) SKE3475L



Celine Fonﬂ_[thKAutnz

From: Shiau Chan (LEKAUD)
Sent: Thursday, 31 May 2018 348 AM
T audreygohidbs com: LKK Valuation
Subject: RE: Valuation Request
Dear Audrey,
The Valuation of vehicles as below:
1) SKE 3475L Mﬁu’: SQGK F5: 532K
2) SIF 999X MV: 59K FS: 58.2K
As at May'18.
Hest Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pavii Ubi Industrial Park. Uhi Avenue 1. #o2-25 | S{4086033)

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH [mailto:audreygoh@dbs.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 30 May 2018 2:39 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong @Ikkau >
Subject: Valuation Request

Hi Celine,
Please assist with valuation of the following vehicles.

1) SKE3475L
2) SIF9969X

All the above vehicles are stored at Turf Club (The Grandstand) lot C20. We will fax you a copy of vehicle registration
card.

Thank you.

Audrey Goh

CAG/WM Credit Collection
Risk Management Group
D85 Bank Ltd

Tel - 6B78 9026

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:

The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may
contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of
this message is not the intended reciplent, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of
this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the
sender and delete the mail. Thank you.

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:
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