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. Wehicle Details
I Vehicle Na: SKE475L
Viehicle ko be Exported: Ho i
intended De-registration Date: 15 Jun 2018 i
‘ehicie Model. TOURANM 140 AT T51 173284 |
Primnary Colgus: Brown
Manufacturing Year: 2011 _|
Engine No- CAVITBETS
| Chassis Moz WVGZZZLTIOW04R017
Marirnum Power Output: 100 kW [138 bhg) i
| Open Market Value $21,83600
| Originsl Registration Date: 27 Feb 2012 !
| Firgt Ragictration Date: " 27 Feb 2013 ra 1o |
Tracuber Count =
| Actua) ARF Paid: s [UFLY ;
intended PARF Rebate Details —— e - i
| PARFEIghblity:. o - Eeaes, | —e———ae e i
| PARFElighiity ExpiryDste: . 26Fh200 |
PARF Rebate Amount: $14,15300
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 26 Feb 2022
COE Category: A - Cor (16000 & below]
! COE Period(Years): 10
QF Pai: $4B,006.00
__ COE Rebate Amount: $17.759.00 =
Total Rebate Amount $3195200

[ Transter af ownership or de-registration is nut allowed for this vehicle

The infermation comtained hersin is cormect asat 30 May 2018

OK
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THE ONLY PLACE FOR SMART CAR BUYERS
Volkswagen Touran Used Vehicle List (19 vehicles)

Volkswagen Touran L4A TSI $46,800 55,880 /yr 16-00-2012  1,3%0cc 62,000 km  Zenith Automobile Available

Nisi Arthva|| Genline Milesge, Agent Sirvics Car, In Good Comdifion, 7 Speed Gearbei. By With Confidere Oh This Unlt, Flexible Loan Packoges, Easy
Drive Awary, Immediate Transfor OF Cwnership, High Tr,.

Office Mo, - GEA4EREL
Simon - 98197237 | Nizam - 87471514 | Eugen - B3561250 | Goorga - 94881411

Vollswagen Touran LAATSI 548,800 £9.980 Jyr 09-Mar-2012 1,390 cc - Dicksan Autcsmobile Avallable

Hari Rayn Special With § Year Extended Worranty For Peace Of Ming, Low Depraciation For A Spackns MPV, High Trade In, Well Taken Care by Previous
Ownes, Call To Make Appaintment To View. Buy With A P

Office No, - 68447667
Eric Lo - 91837304 | Tank Ong - 85265670 | Jonathan Guah - S1901666

volkswagen Touran 1L4A TSI $49,666 £10,010 Jy¢ 13-Ape-2012  1,¥90cc 80000 km Creathee Auto Availabli

Excesiont Condition Both Dn Engine And Gearbox Trspected By Dur Mechanic, Solid And Quist Undercarriage. Comfortable 7 Seaters With Rear Alrcon. Call
Or Sms Before Coming Ta Confirm Avallability, Low .~

Ofice N, ==
Gary Tan - G7810506 | Alex Tan - 97556887 | Terence Leow - 90200899

Volkswagen Touran 14A TSI $49,700  $9.930 /yr M-Apr2012  1300c  L17,000km  Hus Hog Motoring Available

Agene Malntalned By Expat Chwier Priviotsdy, Original Cordition., High Demand 7 Sestes MPY Anid Mot Too Big For rban Drive, Inhouse: Loan Avall With
32000 Low Down Paymant Avail, 2 Yesrs Wacranty Om Engl...

Office No. -~
Terence - B1608080 | Randy - 96945139
volkswagen Touran 1.4A TSI $49,800  $3,350 /yr faMay-2012 1390 - Cars Traditon Preltd. Available

Rarmadan Weekerid Sais Gnly 1 Owner! Guarantesd Lewsest Price And Best Condition In Market! No Wasted Trip! Free | Yesr Warmanly, Frée 3 Car
‘Sprvicing| Free Car Spa Pollsh Package! Highest Trade In Wikh.,. i

Dffice No, - 63527286 / 63528525

Aaron - B5114988 | Kalge - 54995988

Volkswagen Touran 1L4A TSI $56,800 $11,550 fyr 21-May-2011 1390 118,000 km | Mova Mtomotive Availabie

| 1 Cownier Onily, Fleibée Loan Package Avallable, 100% Accident Free, Any Wairkehop, STA/VIEOM Imspection Walcom, 6 Months Warranty, Call Us Now For
WiewingTest, Drive!

Office No. - =
Andy Pah - SI388H30 | Jeremy Tian - 91731308

Volkswagen Touran 1L4A TSI $49,800 £9,410 fyr, 18002012 '1,390cc  E6,000km - Top Carz Avallable
iy Glmmick O Pidca, Séting At Abidvs Price, Super Low Milésge Of Dnly 66.000%m With Full Agent Sepvice And Mantasn With Record, Bxpat Dwn, Accident
Free, Tip Top Condiion With Zeno Rapair, Welcome-..

DOffice Mo, - 6645979
Jenisen Chua - 97887307 | Thormas Tan - 93839533

Volkswagen Touran 14A TSI $52,800 $9,880 fyr 2-Aug-i012  1,390cc 92,000 km gunummm Available

frae | Year Extended Warranty, Most Pogular Mid Size Exropean Style MPY, Jieal For Family Comfart And Sperty 7 Seaters. Low Mileage! Please Cansilt Our
Saley Persun,

Office No: - 62850822 )

Jeff - GOBEZ62Y | Michae! - 53877610

Vollswagen Touran Sport 1.44 $55,000 £9,470 Hr 27-Mugel012. 1380¢c 68,000 km  Bavarian Marques PoeLtd  Available
T51

Sipesk, Spiaciciis And Sporty VW Touran Up For Saie! Low Miksge Unit. Stege | Tuned! Wekl Taken Care OF With Reguitable Workshon With Regutar Servicing
And Maitterancs, Al Receipts To Proved. Easy 80% L.,

Office No. - 68162642

Jergmish - 98807671

|




Celine Fonﬁmm}

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh®dbs.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 12 June 2018 9:43 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAG)

Co: LKK Valuation

Subject: RE Valuation Request

Hi Shiau Chan,

Please proceed to submit the below 2 vehicle valuation reports.
Kindly let us have fax copy of valuation report for SKE3475L,
Thank you.

Audrey Goh

CBG/WM Credit Collection
Risk Management Group
DBS Bank Ltd

Tel - 6878 8026

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: 31 May 2018 09:48

To: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com>; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.coms
Subject: [External] RE: Valuation Request

This mail originated from an external party outside DBS - siewsc@lkkauto.com.

Dear Audrey,

The Valuation of vehicles as below:

1) SKE 3475L MV: 40K FS: $32K
2) SIF9969X MV: S9K F5: $8.2K
A at May'18.
Bt Regards,

Shiwu Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Anto Consaltants Pre Lid

Phone: hdge-a561 | email: siewso@ikkauto.com | fax: G256-4315
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4084933)

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH [mailto:audreveoh@dbs.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 30 May 2018 2:39 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkau >
Subject: Valuation Reguest

Hi Celing,

Please assist with valuation of the following vehicles.

1) SKE3475L



Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

E—
From: Shiau Chan (LKKAUtS])
Sent; Thursday, 31 May 2078 5:48 AM
To: audreygoh@dbs.corm; LKK Valuation
Subject: RE Valuation Request
Dear Audrey,

The Valuation of vehicles as below:

1) SKE 3475L MV: S40K F5: 532K
2) SIF9969X MV: $9K FS: $8.2K
As at May'18B.
Best Repards,
Shiou Chan {(Ms) | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phonie: hag6-4561 | amail: sipwse@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Bik 51 Pava Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | SlaoBoa3)

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH [mailto:audrey: dbs.
Sent; Wednesday, 30 May 2018 2:39 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Valuation Request

Hi Celine,
Please assist with valuation of the following vehicles.

1) SKE3475L
2) SIF99EIX

all the above vehicles are stored at Turf Club (The Grandstand) lot C20. We will fax you a copy of vehicle registration
card.

Thank you.

Audrey Goh

CBG/WM Credit Collection
Risk Management Group
DBS Bank Ltd

Tel - 6878 9026

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:

The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may
contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. if the reader of
this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of
this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the
sender and delete the mail. Thank you.

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:
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