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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 30 May 2018 12:30 PM

To: 'Joel Goh'; assignments

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SFY3877P & GBC931C On 26/5/2018 (DM18HO01341-JG)

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 
BEST REGARDS, 

G.Nivitha | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Joel Goh [mailto:joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 30 May 2018 9:55 AM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SFY3877P & GBC931C On 26/5/2018 (DM18HO01341-JG) 

 

Dear LKK 

 

Attached estimates and both parties accident report for your attention. 

 

Best Regards,  

 

Joel Goh  

Executive | Claims 

  

  
EQ Insurance Company Limited  
 

5 Maxwell Road  #17-00  Tower Block  MND Complex  Singapore 069110  

did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190 

www.eqinsurance.com.sg         
  

   
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender i
 

 

 

From: Joel Goh  

Sent: Wednesday, May 30, 2018 9:54 AM 
To: 'Faeaz' 
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Cc: Ary Chua; 'Admin A' 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SFY3877P & GBC931C On 26/5/2018 (DM18HO01341-JG) 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Faeaz 

 

We welcome direct settlement for this matter and will appoint LKK to take over this direct settlement. 

 

Dear LKK 

 

Please assist on the following direct settlement. 

 

Best Regards,  

 

Joel Goh  

Executive | Claims 

  

  
EQ Insurance Company Limited  
 

5 Maxwell Road  #17-00  Tower Block  MND Complex  Singapore 069110  

did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190 

www.eqinsurance.com.sg         
  

   
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender i
 

 

 

From: Faeaz [mailto:faeaz@honda.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, May 28, 2018 2:45 PM 
To: Joel Goh 

Cc: Ary Chua 
Subject: Accident Involving SFY3877P & GBC931C On 26/5/2018 

 

Dear Joel, 

 

Please kindly arrange your surveyor to inspect our client vehicle at our premises soonest possible. 

 

 

Best RegardsBest RegardsBest RegardsBest Regards    

    

Mohd Faeaz Bin YaacobMohd Faeaz Bin YaacobMohd Faeaz Bin YaacobMohd Faeaz Bin Yaacob    

Senior ExecutiveSenior ExecutiveSenior ExecutiveSenior Executive    

Kah Motor Body Repair CentreKah Motor Body Repair CentreKah Motor Body Repair CentreKah Motor Body Repair Centre    

15, Ubi Road 415, Ubi Road 415, Ubi Road 415, Ubi Road 4    

Singapore 408610Singapore 408610Singapore 408610Singapore 408610    

Tel : 68465678Tel : 68465678Tel : 68465678Tel : 68465678    

Hp : 82886304Hp : 82886304Hp : 82886304Hp : 82886304    
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From: Printer Service  

Sent: Monday, 28 May, 2018 2:43 PM 

To: Faeaz <faeaz@honda.com.sg> 

Subject: Attached Image 

 

 

 

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual 

or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from 

disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are 

hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly 

prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete 

the mail. Thank you. 


