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L AL LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i = TEL: 6256 3551 FAX: 5256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8807198-R

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD Ref - CCHBAXA14008437/Kzb3

§ SHENTON WAY #27-01SINGAPORE 068811

Date ; 06-05-2014

IR

Code . AXAZ
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. PH 2672R Veh. Inspected YN 1022K
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 05/05/2014
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer & Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mim
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  02/05/2014 Inspection Date 06/05/2014
Survey held at K KIM HIN AUTO PTELTD
BLK 34 SIN MING DRIVE,
#01-114,
SINGAPQORE 575708
5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

BYIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
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From: Winnie Ho Ping Ping [winnie. ho@axa.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 22 July, 2014 5:16 PM
To: ‘assignments’; 'Team B'; Team AL 'SUR
Ce: Chan Kian Chuan; Jay Leocadio
Subject: DIRECT SETTLEMENT / K. KIM HIN / C0304834 / OD- PH2672R / TP- YN1022K / DOA!
02.05.2014 [ EST: 7026.17 / XS- 1500 / KC
Attachments: TP ESTIMATE.pdf, TP GIA REPORT.pdf; TP POLICE REPORT pdf; Preliminary Advice - YN

1022K.pdf: Full page photo.pdf

Thanks & Regards

Winnie Ho
Claims Assistant — Motor Claims

AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd

8 Shenton Way, #27-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 0686811
winnie hof@axa.com.sq

DID: (B5) 6880 4833

Website: www.axa.com.sg

m redefining / insurance

This message |s confidential; s contants do nol constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and
A%A. Any unauthorised disclosure, use or d sspmination, either whole or partial, is prohibited If you are not the intended rec ipient of the message

please notify the sender immadiately

h‘ril Please consider the environment before printing this email

From: Jojo Ngai [mailtu:admin—b@lkkauto.cum]

Sent: Thursday, July 17, 2014 10:06 AM

To: Winnie Ho Ping Ping; Kitty Teo Poh Guek; Tan Tiong Beng

Cc: Zayyer

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Acc Invl PH 2672R(OI : AXA - TBA) & YN 1022K(TP : LKK - CCH/AXA14008437/Kzb3)
on 02.05.2014

Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise whether we can proceed for direct settlement for this case. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s
accident report for our necessary action.

Thanks & Regards

Jojo Mgai

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1,

#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park,

Singapore 408533

DID : 6742 8617 1



Fax : 67414108

ﬁ Save the trees - Do you really need to print this e-mail?

From: Jojo Ngai ilte: admin-b@lk
Sent: Wednesday, 25 June, 2014 5:21 PM
To: "Winnie Ho Ping Ping'; 'Kitty Teo Poh Guek’; Tan Tiong Beng'

Cc: Jesslyn Soh
Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Acc Invl PH 2672R(0I : AXA - TBA) & YN 1022K(TP : LKK - CCEIA)(A14DDB43?.|"1{v1b3}

on 02.05.2014
Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise whether we can proceed for direct settlement for this case. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s
accident report for our necessary action.

Thanks & Regards

Jojo Ngai

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
61 Ubi Ave 1,

#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Singapore 408833

DID : 6742 8617

Fax : 6741 4108

ﬁ Save the trees - Do you really need to print this g-mail?

From: Jojo Ngai

Sent: Tuesday, 10 ]une, 2014 1 51 PM

To: 'Winnie Ho Ping Ping'; 'Kitty Teo Poh Guek'; "Tan Tiong Beng'

Cc: Jesslyn Soh

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Acc Invl PH 2672R(OI : AXA - TBA) & YN 1022K(TP : LKK - CCH/AXA14008437/Kv1b3)
on 02.05.2014

Dear Sir/Madam,
we refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise whether we can proceed for direct settlement for this case. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s
accident report for our necessary action.

Thanks & Regards

Jojo MNgai

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1,

#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Singapore 408933

DID ; 6742 8617

Fax : 6741 4108



ni Save the trees - Do you really need to print this e-mail?

From: Jojo Ngai [mailto:admin-b@lkkauto.c

Sent: Wednesday, 7 May, 2014 9:57 AM

To: '"Winnie Ho Ping Ping’; 'Kitty Teo Poh Guek’; Tan Tiong Beng'

Cc: KKLau; Jesslyn Soh

Subject: Direct Settlement - Acc Invl PH 2672R(01 : AXA - TBA) & YN 1022K(TP : LKK - CC6/AXA14008437/Kv1b3) on
02.05.2014

Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle YN 1022K AT M/s K.Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd.

Enclosed herewith a copy of TP's GIA report ,police report, estimated cost of repair, photos and preliminary advice for
your perusal.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Jesslyn and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

Thanks & Regards

Jojo Ngai

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1,

#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Singapore 408533

DID : 6742 8617

Fax : 6741 4108

nﬁ Save the trees - Do you really need to print this e-mail?
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o R (AKe 34 ) PIRE 114 57

Blk 34 Sin Ming Drive, #01-114, Singapore 575708.
Tel: 6452 7018 (5 Lines) Fax: 6458 38935

Email: service@kkimhin.com.sg No. : 25991
Vehicle Insured : PH 2672 R
Accident Date : 02-May-2014 Date : 05-May-2014

/1/4"}"’ ,r"/;_{- T‘/‘é &7 ,-’r/
our Ref : 140301 (AXA) / XW Lgmmm,gamspmm PAGE : 1

» Resurvey beloref=fer Spray Painting.

AP TRADING LLP © Ea',‘m‘_lej parts 1o ,-la;:la;r -.'.nlu_:ln_lﬂr?-lnspeutiun.
. . = Parts prices subject to conhirmation. : g
Singapore Ccta,, = Thind Party Survay withoul prejudics.. & _,{j_,,y S Efoey
o fo llegal modilcalion s ahow -

d,
ESTIMATED COST OF REPAIR FOR MITSUBISHI FEB%EEOSRDEA (2009) YN1022K

1 pc rear number plate lamp assy i~ 6§1.56 A
2 pcs taillamp assy (LH&RH) A/ e/ @ $$180.007 360,00 &7
1 pc tailgate 71,750,000 ~—T
2 pes tailgate safety lock (LH&RH) @ §$380.00#7% 760.00 71
2 pcs tailgate rubber stopper @ S§ 30.00%//7160.00
1 pc tailgate "MITSUBISHI" sticker A 150,00 —
1 pc n/s side gate 4 2,440.00 —
5,581.56
Less 25% : -1,395.39
---------- 4,186.17
1 pc rear number plate E‘ 40.00
1 pc rear reinforcement beam 7 600.00
1 pc rear step panel /%7 100.00
1 pc tailgate "60KM/H" sticker e, 25.00
1 pc tailgate "21PAX" sticker e, 25,00
1 pc tailgate inner trim wooden €421 200.00
1 pc n/s side gate company A= 300.00
adverstiment sticker 1

To remove, cut out damaged parts,
panel beating, welding, align,
refix and to renew affected parts. 700.00
To putty and respray on affected
portions. 800.00
To focus taillamps. To check rear
wiring and lighting operation. 50.00

Total : S¢ 7,026.17

gingapore Dollars Seven Thousand and Twenty Six
and Cents Seventeen Only
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From: Zayyer

Sent: Thursday, 24 July, 2014 5:01 PM

To: 'service@kkimhin.com.sg'

Ce: Zayyer

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLYING PH 2672R & YN 1022K ON 02/05/2014
Your Ref: YN 1022K *WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

Our Ref: CC6/AXA14008437/Kzb3

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING PH 2672R & YN 1022K ON 02/05/2014
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that the liability is clear and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above
mentioned case.

Kindly note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of
repair to your client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident.
And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.
Kindly take note that case handler in charge is Zayer and he can be contacted at 6841 2409.

Thanks and Best Regards
Layer

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Avenue 1

#01-25

Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933

DID: 6841 2409

Fax: 6741 4108
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S1URIAVE L #001-23 PAYA UBEINDUSTRIAL PARK. SENG APORE JU8933 TEL ; (b5 62563501 FAN D065 62364315

Our Ref: CC6/AXA14008437/Kzb3
AXA Policy No: P1319960

24 July 2014

WAI LIAN TRADING AND TRANSPORTATION
Block 212 Masling Crescent

#09-31

Singapore 730212

Dear Sir/Madam.
ACCIDENT INVOLVING PH 2672R & YN 1022K ON 02/05/2014

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
(AXA) to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Accordingly your No Claim Discount (NCD — if applicable) may not be preserved.
Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

ZLayer

DID: 6841 2409

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: zayyer@lkkauto.com

Case Handler
ce.  AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
{Motor Claims Dept)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

L: : ‘. = 54 Uhi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
TEL: 5256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 189607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD Ref : CCB/AXA14008437/Kza3n2
8 SHENTON WAY #27-01SINGAPORE 068811 — ”""Immmmm m
ATTN: KWEE MAY Code ;. AXA2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. PH 26872R Veh. Inspected YN 1022K
Policy No. P1319960 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. C0304834 Excess (%) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 05/05/2014
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI CANTER c.c 2877
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg. 2009
Chassis No. FES3BEA20230 Colour WHITE
Odometer 163053 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |700 R16X8 YOKOHAMA 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |700 R16X8 YOKOHAMA 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |1 85 R14X8 (D) FIRESTONE I3mm
L/H Rear Tyre [185R14X8 (D) FIRESTONE 3/3 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  02/05/2014 [Inspeﬂtiun Date 05/05/2014
Survey held at K KIMHIN AUTO PTE LTD
BLK 34 SIN MING DRIVE,
#01-114,
SINGAPORE 575708
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR! 4 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. YN 1022K

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapora 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: G256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Page Mo.1of 2

: b Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop [g}] ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE LAMP ASSY (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 61.56 -
2| TAILLAMP ASSY (LH&RH) @$180.00 (CONSISTENT) N/S CRACKED 360.00 180.00
1| TAILGATE (CONSISTENT) BENT 1,750.00 1,750.00
2|TAILGATE SAFETY LOCK (LH&RH) @$380.00 N/S BENT 760.00 380.00
(CONSISTENT)
2| TAILGATE RUBBER STOPPER @$30.00 (CONSISTENT)  |N/S MISSING 60.00 30.00
1| TAILGATE "MITSUBISHI" STICKER [CONSISTENT} NECESSARY 150.00 150.00
1|MN/S SIDE GATE (CONSISTENT) BENT 2,440.00 2,440.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,395.39 -1.232.50
4,186.17 3,697.50
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE (SN)(CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 40.00 =
1|REAR REINFORCEMENT BEAM (SN)(CONSISTENT) BENT 600.00 600.00
1|REAR STEP PANEL (SN){CONSISTENT) BENT 100.00 100.00
1| TAILGATE "80KM/H" STICKER (SN){CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 25.00 15.00
1| TAILGATE "21 PAX" STICKER (SN){CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 25.00 15.00
1| TAILGATE INNER TRIM WOODEN (SN)(CONSISTENT) CRACKED 200.00 200.00
1|N/S SIDE GATE COMPANY ADVERTISEMENT STICKER ~ |[NECESSARY 300.00 200.00
(SN)CONSISTENT)
1,280.00 1,130.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE,CUT OUT DAMAGED PARTS, PANEL 700.00 540.00
BEATING,WELDING, ALIGN, REFIX AND TO RENEW
AFFECTED PARTS,
TO PUTTY AND RESPRAY ON AFFECTED PORTIONS. 800.00 600.00
TO FOCUS TAILLAMPS.TO CHECK REAR WIRING AND 50.00 20.00
LIGHTING OPERATION.
1,550.00 1,160.00
GRAND TOTAL 7,026.17 5,987.50
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,800.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No, CCB/AXA14008437/Kza3n2
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KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appralser

DESCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report s made solsly for the use and benefit of the Client named an the front page ol this Repost.
Bccapted 1o any third party whe m repdy an the Repor wholly or i

Report Ref No. CCB/AXA14008437/Kza3n2
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