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TEL 6256 3561 FAX 6256 4315

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Libl Industrial Park. Singapore 408933

Reg. No: 198807188R G5T Reg. Mo 18-8607188-R

Affiliated to Federation internationale Des Experts En Automobile
EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref CCe/EQI18008666/wh3
oA, LA
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 28-05-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GZ 861l Veh. Inspected GBE 3487J
Palicy No. Caoverage () 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 28/05/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odomaeter Steering
Brakes Medification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
LIH Front Tyre mim
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  27/05/2018 |Inspection Date
Survey held at MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
BLK 30234 UBI ROAD
#01-81
SINGAPORE 408717
5a. Remarks
ATHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B)IN ACCORDAMNCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS

We refer to the above matter,

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action,

i




Thank you.

Biest Regardi,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ld

Phone: BI66-0055 | ermall: ghyps @ik uio com | fax: 6741-2108

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park. Ubi Avernue 1, #B02-25 | ${408933)



Asher 522 (LKKAuto)

From: Chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 15 November 2019 2:57 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto}

Subject: RE: TP Settlement - GBE3487) (EQ) *LKK REF: CC6/EQI18009686/Awb3
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Asher

As spoke, we accept amount $3000/- (global sum) in settlement of the above claims

Thank you

Regards,

Cirace Chin

Maodern Automotive Pre Lid
Bik 3023-A, Ubi Road | #01-61
Singapore 408717

lel: G748 4422
Fax: 6747 6720

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, November 14, 2019 9:41 AM

To: Chin <chin@modernautomative.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TP Settlement - GBE3487] (EQ) *LKK REF: CC6/EQ118009686/Awb3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS
Hi Sir,

We refer to the emall dated 27/02/19.

Please let us have your acceptance.

Thank You.

Best Regonds.,
Asher Sng | Cose Handles
LEE Auto Consullants Ple Lid



phone: 484]-4051 | emall gshersnaiikkonito, Com | kot 4741-4108
Bk 51. Pava Ui indusingl Pork, Ui Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408%33)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 25 October 2019 9:01 AM

To: Chin <chin@modernautomotive.com sg>

Subject: RE: TP Settlement - GBE3487) (EQ) *LKK REF: CC6/EQI1B009686/Awh3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVEAS TO COSTS
Hi Sir,

We refer to the emall dated 27/02/19.

Please let us have your acceptance.

Thank You.

Basl Regoras

Asher Sng | Cose Hanclles

LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid

phone: 8414051 | emall gshersng@ikkoulo com | fas 47414108
Bk 51. Paya Ubi industial Paork. Ubi Avenue 1. =02-25 | S[408733]

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent; Monday, 8 July 2019 2:17 PM

To: Chin <chin@modernautomative.com.sg>
Subject: RE: TP Settlement - GBE3487) {EQ) *LKK REF: CC6/EQU18009686/Awb3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE”
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Hi Ms Chin,

Enclosed for your necessary action,

Thank You.

fiest Regords,
Ashet Sng | Coawe Handler
LEK Aulo Consultants Ple Lid



phone: 684 1.4051 | emal: asnesng@hkauto.com | faox: 67414108
Bl 51, Paya Ul inciusticd Park, Ul Avenioe |, #02-25 | 5{4089.13)

From: Chin <chinf@modernautomotive.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, B July 2019 2:12 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP Settlement - GBE3487) (EQ) *LKK REF: CC6/EQI18009686/Awb3

Dear Asher
Please forward us your insured report.

Thank you

Regards,

Cirace Chin

Modermn Automotive Pre Lid
Blk 3023-A, LIbi Rood | #01-61
Singapore 408717

Tel: 6748 4422
Fax: 6747 6720

From: Asher Sng {LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, July 5, 2019 4:43 PM

To: Chin <chin@modernautomaotive.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TP Settlement - GBE3487) (EQ) *LKK REF: CC6/EQI18009686/Awb3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir,
We refer to the emall below.

The accident location is a single lane, vehicle should be traveling one at a time.



Based on the scene photo clearly show that our insured is traveling ahead of your client.

»"W l'l"_."?- -

T

e

Therefore on a without prejudice, for a quick and amicable settlement, we propose the settlement at Global Sum
553,000.00 (all-in).



Piease kindly advise your client to reconsider and let us have your acceptance.

Thank You.

Besi Regoards.

Asher Sng | Case Hondked

LKK Aulo Consultonts Ple Lid

phone: s841-6051 | emcl; ashenng@keguio.corm | fox 67414108
Blk 51, Poya Ubd Ingustriol Park, Ukl Avenue |, #02.35 | 5[408933)

From: Chin <chin@modernautomotive.com sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 May 2019 11:44 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP Settlement - GBE3487) (EQ) *LKK REF: CC6/EQI18009686/Awb3

Dear Asher

Regret that our client does not accept 50%.

Regards,

Grace Chin

Modern Automotive Pre Lud
Bk 3023-A, Ubi Road | #0161
Singapore 408717

Tel: 6748 4422
Fax: 6747 6720

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, April 26, 2019 12:19 PM

To: Chin (chin@modernautomaotive.com.sg) <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>
Subject: RE: TP Settlement - GBE3487) (EQ) *LKK REF: CC6/EQI18D09686/Awb3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Hi 5ir,

we refer to the email dated 27/02/20189.

Please let us have your acceptance.

Thank You.



Besl Regaras,

Asher Sng | Cose Handlss

LKK Avto Consultants Fle Lid

phone: 6B41-6051 | emall: ashering@lkkonilo.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubd Industricl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5[408933)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 February 2019 10:15 AM

To: Chin (chin@modernautomaotive.cam.sg) <chin@modernautomaotive.com.sg>
Subject: RE: TP Settlement - GBE3487) (EQ) *LKK REF: CC6/EQI18009686/Awb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We are prepare to propose settlement as follow:-

1. Cost of Repair (w/G5T) $4,601.00
2. Loss of Rental (6days x 5100) S 600.00
Total: $5,201.00

5 2,600.50

3 LTA search fee S 2.00
50%: S 2,602.50

Kindly let us have your acceptance.

Thank You.

Bl Repars

Asher Sng | Coie Handier

LKK Auto Comultants Ple Lid

phons: 48414051 | emall: gehenno@lkkouto.com | lac a74]-4]108
Bik 51. Poyo Ut industriol Pork, Ubi Avenue |, #02-25 | 5(408733)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 25 January 2019 7:38 AM

To: Chin (chin@modernautomotive.com.sg) <chin@modernautomotive com.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
<AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto com>

Subject: RE: TP Settlement - GBE3487) (EQ) *LKK REF: CC6/EQI18009686/Awb3

Without Prejudice
Dear SirsfMdm,



Tharik you for your email.
Please note that this case has been re-assigned to Asher,

Our respective case handler will look info the matter and revert to you in due course.

Hest Regurds,

Hsiano Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1. #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chin <chini@modernautomotive.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 23 January 2019 11:50 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)
<Joylrene@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: TP Settlement - GBE3487) (EQ)

Dear Hsiao Tong
Please refer to our email below and revert asap.

Thank you

Regards.

Grace Chin

Modern Automotive Pre Lid
Blk 3023-A, Ubi Road | #01-6&1
Singapore 408717

Tel: 6748 4422
Fax: 6747 6720



From: Chin [mailto:chin@modernautomotive.com.sg|
Sent: Monday, December 10, 2018 5:38 PM

To: 'Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)' <vivianlau@|kkauto.coms>
Subject: RE: TP Settlement - GBE3487] (EQ)

Dear Vivian
We are not agreeable with 50% liability.

As per your insured statement, he mentioned he was making left turn and he was on the outer lane, where our insured
was on the extreme left lane (inner lane). Obviously, It was your insured cut into the front from the left in order to
enter the gantry. Our client vehicle was pushed to |eft, Attached are some scene photos taken by our client for your
perusal,

Please let us have the revised offer.
Thank you

Regards,

CGirace Chin

Modern Automotive Pre Lid
Bik 3023-A, Ubi Road | 50]-61
Singapore 408717

Tel: 6748 4422
Fax: 6747 6720

From: Meei Huey [mailto:meelhuey@modernautomotive com.sg]
Sent: Monday, December 10, 2018 5:15 PM

To: Chin <chin@modernautomot ve cam.sg>

Subject: FW: TP Settlement - GBE3487] (EQ)

Regards,

Mei Hul, Ho

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd | MM Trading Enterprise
Bik 3023A Ubi Road 1 #01-61 S{408717)

Tel: 6744 4422 /8121 3226

Fax: 6747 6720



From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@|kkauto com>
Sent: 10 December, 2018 5:12 PM

To: Meei Huey <meeihuey@modernautomotive.com sg>
Subject: RE: TP Settlement - GBE3487) (EQ)

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dicar SirfMadam,
Accident involving Vehicle GBE 3487J & GZ 861L ON 270572018
We refer to the above malter

We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. There is no conclusive evidence to substantiate either's
parties version. Enclosed herewith a copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal.

Strictly without admission of liability whatever, but with a view towards a resolutions of your client’s claim in the above
matter without resort to litigation and not jeopardizing our insured claim against the liable party, we are prepared to offer
30% 1o your client’s claim.

For a quick and amicable settlement, our principal offer to settle global sum at SS 2,600.00

Kindly confirm acceptance

Kindly note thar this wegotiation benween parties on thiy matter i prcely on a withont peejudice basis with the sealet rateintiion of
riesalving the marrer anicably withour parties resorring 1o legal proceedings. No admission of liahility, whatsoever shonldd be dveamed
m_p';’rﬂ.'ff from this RERONHON. OF TiErmi setrlement

I the event of now evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either partye that will marertally affect influence on the
isxnes of tahiling damages. either party w5 ool bowmd, thereafter, by the negntiagtion ferms setfemont

Thank vou

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau @@ lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Meel Huey [mallto:meeihuey@modernautomotive.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 14 August, 2018 5:54 PM




To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@|kkauto.com>
Subject: TP Settlement - GBE3487] (EQ)

Dear Vivian,
We refer to the above matter.
Kindly confirm settlement as follow :-

Repair Cost: 54,601.00 (Incl GST)
LOR (6 days x $120): $720.00
Search fee: 52.00

Total: 55,323.00

We enclosed herewith our LOD for your perusal.

Regards,

Mei Hui, Ho

Modern Automaotive Pte Ltd | MM Trading Enterprise
Blk 30234 Ubi Road 1 #01-51 5{408717)

Tel: 6744 4422 / 8121 3226

Fax: 6747 6720

10



Auto
¥ ITES o
Eda mm m  Pwln

S1 U AVE 1, #02-28 PAYA UBELINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J0¥933 TEL : iD65) 62563561 FAN : (M5) 625641315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Company Registration No. 199807 158R

Date: 11/12/2018

THIRD PARTY DIREC ME
: GZ BB1L (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No.: DM18HO01340/JT
e GBE 3487J (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No.: CGB/EQI18009688/Asb3q2
Date of Accident 27/512018
Liability 50% - _|
Final Repair Cost ' § 2,300.50 - -
Lossof Use 'S ~ days - -
Rental (If any) 4 30000  Bdays o
Others: : 5_ 2,1‘.}0_ B -
:$ - -
2.602.50
Final SettlementSum |: § 3,000.00 |GLOBAL SUM
Remarks —
P I n 's
1) |MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD o 1 - 3,000.00
— — X $ _—
JOANNE LEE

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid




5 MAXWELL ROAD

#17-00 TOWER BLOCK
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 089110

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park. Singapore 408533

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No: 169807198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607188-R

EQ INSURANCE EOMP&NY LTD

Ref :

Date: 11-12-2019

Insured Veh.

GZ 861L

'n‘ah Inspintad

EDEIEQI‘EBODEIBMAHW

M

4 Description of Dam:

GBE 3487
Policy No. DMCPHQ17-D0B517 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DM18HC01340/JT Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 11/08/2018
" |Make & Model  NISSAN CABSTAR cc 2953
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. JN1SC2F2420857527 Colour GOLD
Odometer 75152 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOoD
m
Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre 195-"5!] R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/80R15 YOKOHAMA B mm
R/H Rear Tyre [155R13 YOKOHAMA [8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre [155R13 YOKOHAMA 6 mm

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT O/S PORTION.

2’?."0&!'2{}1&

E.STIMA.TED NORMAL PERIOD FDR REPAIR:

Accident Date Inipentlun Date 11/06/2018
Survey held at MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD
BLK 3023A UBIROAD 1
#01-81
SINGAPORE 408717
Re

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B}IN AGGDRDANEE TD YDUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE ‘i"ENOT M.ITHORI.SED REPAIRS

5 "Hnrklng Days




i 4 S S S 1T S 1 S

—

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 5256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8807T188-R

FRONT BUMPER (N)

FRONT BUMPER BRACKET -RH (N)
HEADLAMP -RH (N)

HEADLAMP LOWER GARNISH -RH (N)
FRONT CORNER PANEL -RH (N)

FRONT WING MIRROR -RH (N)

FRONT WING MIRROR STAY -RH (N}
FRONT STEP GARNISH -RH (N)

FRONT DOOR -RH (N)

FRONT DOOR LOCK -RH (N)

FRONT DOOR WEATHERSTRIPE-RH (N)
FRONT DOOR HINGE -RH (N)

FRONT DOOR INNER TRIM BOARD -RH (N)
SET FRONT DOOR INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS -RH (N)
FRONT DOOR LAMP -RH (N)

FRONT DOOR PILLAR -RH (N)

FRONT WINDSCREEN MOULDING (M)
LESS 10% DISCOUNT

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
FRONT DOOR COMPANY ADDRESS STICKER -RH (SN)
FRONT WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN)

LABOUR

TO KNOCKING & PULL OUT FRONT FPORTION & RENEW
ABOVE PARTS INCLUSIVE OF THE REFAIR OF FRONT
DOOR PILLAR -RH

TO PUTTY & SPRAY UP PAINT WORKS.
TO CHECK WIRING.
TO UNDERSEAL

DEFORMED

NOT NECESSARY
CRACKED

NOT NECESSARY
DISTORTED

NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
cut

DISTORTED

NOT NECESSARY
NECESSARY
BENT
DEFORMED
NECESSARY

cut

TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR

NOT NECESSARY

NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY

NOT NECESSARY

Report Ref No. CC6/EQI18009686/Aeb3q2

PagaNo.1of2

833.40| 933.40
174.80 -
482.00 482.00
75.40 -
437.00 437.00
135.80 -
188.90
140.10 140.10
1,3086.50 1,306.50
239.80 -
166.20 166.20)
11220 112.20
755.80 755.80
30.00 30.00
46.50 46.50
1.264.90 -
128.60 -
671.20 4408 98
6,040.80 4 048,82
30.00 30.00
60.00
80.00 30.00
1.200.00 500.00
800.00 600.00
50.00 30.00
150.00




y 7L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
;_l‘ ma = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 35681 FAX: 6256 4115

Reg No: 188607188R GST Reg. No. 18-8607196-R Paga No.:2of 2
B :

TO TRANSFER DOOR FITTINGS. 150.00 80.00
TO REMOVE DASHBOARD, NOT NECESSARY 350.00 -
TO REMOVE FRONT WINDSCREEN, NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -

2,880.00 1,310.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,010.80 5,389.82

FoDS
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:. This Report b made sobely for the ues snd benellt of the Chien nsmed

on the front pags of this Repari.




