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Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April, 2019 5:20 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc: rickteo@eurokars.com.sg; eva.kok@eurokars.com.sg; Admin A; Hsiao Tong 

(LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SKR174G / OUR REF: SKC1770H THIRD PARTY CLAIM (REQUESTING 

FOR A DIRECT SETTLEMENT)  ***LKK REF:CC4/ASM18009670/wb3 

Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
The owner has decided to withdraw his/her TP claim from Trans Eurokars. 
 
Best Regards. 

 

 
 

Jobi Thomas 

Senior Insurance Claims Executive 

27A Tanjong Penjuru, Singapore 609042 

T: (65) 6331 0680 D: (65) 6331 0682 F: (65) 6331 0690 

E: jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg    W: www.eurokarsgroup.com  

 

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: 03 April 2019 4:47 PM 

To: Jobi Thomas <jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg> 

Cc: Rick Teo <rickteo@eurokars.com.sg>; Eva Kok <eva.kok@eurokars.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SKR174G / OUR REF: SKC1770H THIRD PARTY CLAIM (REQUESTING FOR A DIRECT 

SETTLEMENT) ***LKK REF:CC4/ASM18009670/wb3  

 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Your Ref: SKC 1770H 

Our Ref: CC4/ASM18009670/wb3 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

Accident Involving Vehicle SKC 1770H and SKR 174G on 23/05/2018 

We refer to the above matter 

 

Kindly check and advise if your client is still interested to pursue with his third-party claim against our principal M/s 

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd. 

                                                                                                                                                                                  

Please respond and let us know within 10 days from the date of this e-mail. Otherwise, we shall have no other option 

but to submit our report to our principal for closure. 
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Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be 

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

   

 

 

Thank you 

Best Regards, 

Vivian Lau| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

  

 

 

 

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 11 June, 2018 9:17 AM 

To: 'jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg' <jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg> 

Cc: rickteo@eurokars.com.sg; eva.kok@eurokars.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) 

<shupei@lkkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SKR174G / OUR REF: SKC1770H THIRD PARTY CLAIM (REQUESTING FOR A DIRECT 

SETTLEMENT) ***LKK REF:CC4/ASM18009670/wb3  

 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

Thank you for the email.  

  

Please be informed that we are pending instruction from our principal  

  

We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course. 

 

 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be 

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 
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Thank you 

Best Regards, 

Vivian Lau| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

  

 

 

 

From: jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg [mailto:jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 11 June, 2018 9:12 AM 

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: rickteo@eurokars.com.sg; eva.kok@eurokars.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) 

<shupei@lkkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SKR174G / OUR REF: SKC1770H THIRD PARTY CLAIM (REQUESTING FOR A DIRECT 

SETTLEMENT) ***LKK REF:CC4/ASM18009670/wb3  

 

Dear Vivian, 
 
We would appreciate it if you can kindly let us know the liability/status of this case. 
  
We are waiting for your prompt reply ASAP. 
 
Best Regards. 

 
Jobi Thomas 

Insurance Claims Executive 

 

TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD 

12 Sungei Kadut Avenue 

Singapore 729648 

T: (65) 6363 3003 D: (65) 6360 2446 F: (65) 6360 2899 

E: jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg 

 

From: Jobi Thomas  

Sent: Thursday, June 7, 2018 9:34 AM 

To: 'Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)' <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Rick Teo Fu Shen <rickteo@eurokars.com.sg>; Eva Kok <eva.kok@eurokars.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SKR174G / OUR REF: SKC1770H THIRD PARTY CLAIM (REQUESTING FOR A DIRECT 

SETTLEMENT) ***LKK REF:CC4/ASM18009670/wb3  

 

Dear Vivian, 
 
We would appreciate it if you can kindly let us know the liability/status of this case. 
  
We are waiting for your prompt reply ASAP. 
 
Best Regards. 
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Jobi Thomas 

Insurance Claims Executive 

 

TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD 

12 Sungei Kadut Avenue 

Singapore 729648 

T: (65) 6363 3003 D: (65) 6360 2446 F: (65) 6360 2899 

E: jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg 

 

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, June 4, 2018 9:31 AM 

To: Jobi Thomas <jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Rick Teo Fu Shen <rickteo@eurokars.com.sg>; Eva Kok <eva.kok@eurokars.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SKR174G / OUR REF: SKC1770H THIRD PARTY CLAIM (REQUESTING FOR A DIRECT 

SETTLEMENT) ***LKK REF:CC4/ASM18009670/wb3  

 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

Thank you for the email.  

  

Please be informed that we are pending instruction from our principal  

  

We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course. 

 

 

 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be 

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

   

 

 

Thank you 

Best Regards, 

Vivian Lau| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

  

 

 

 

From: jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg [mailto:jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 4 June, 2018 9:10 AM 

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: rickteo@eurokars.com.sg; eva.kok@eurokars.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) 

<shupei@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SKR174G / OUR REF: SKC1770H THIRD PARTY CLAIM (REQUESTING FOR A DIRECT 

SETTLEMENT) ***LKK REF:CC4/ASM18009670/wb3  

 

Dear Vivian, 
 
We would appreciate it if you can kindly let us know the liability/status of this case. 
  
We are waiting for your prompt reply ASAP. 
 
Best Regards. 

 
Jobi Thomas 

Insurance Claims Executive 

 

TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD 

12 Sungei Kadut Avenue 

Singapore 729648 

T: (65) 6363 3003 D: (65) 6360 2446 F: (65) 6360 2899 

E: jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg 

 

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, May 31, 2018 2:34 PM 

To: Jobi Thomas <jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Rick Teo Fu Shen <rickteo@eurokars.com.sg>; Eva Kok <eva.kok@eurokars.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SKR174G / OUR REF: SKC1770H THIRD PARTY CLAIM (REQUESTING FOR A DIRECT 

SETTLEMENT) ***LKK REF:CC4/ASM18009670/wb3  

 

Dear Jobi, 

 

We refer to the below matter. 

 

Please be inform that we are still pending for Direct settlement instruction from our Principal. 

 

 
Best Regards, ( On behalf of Vivian) 
 
Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

From: jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg [mailto:jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 31 May 2018 1:04 PM 

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: rickteo@eurokars.com.sg; eva.kok@eurokars.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) 

<shupei@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SKR174G / OUR REF: SKC1770H THIRD PARTY CLAIM (REQUESTING FOR A DIRECT 

SETTLEMENT) ***LKK REF:CC4/ASM18009670/wb3  
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Dear Vivian, 
 
We would appreciate it if you can kindly let us know the liability/status of this case. 
  
We are waiting for your prompt reply ASAP. 
 
Best Regards. 

 
Jobi Thomas 

Insurance Claims Executive 

 

TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD 

12 Sungei Kadut Avenue 

Singapore 729648 

T: (65) 6363 3003 D: (65) 6360 2446 F: (65) 6360 2899 

E: jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg 

 

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, May 28, 2018 6:43 PM 

To: Jobi Thomas <jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg> 

Cc: Rick Teo Fu Shen <rickteo@eurokars.com.sg>; Eva Kok <eva.kok@eurokars.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: YOUR REF: SKR174G / OUR REF: SKC1770H THIRD PARTY CLAIM (REQUESTING FOR A DIRECT 

SETTLEMENT) ***LKK REF:CC4/ASM18009670/wb3  

 

Dear Jobi, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vivian at 6841 8625. 

 

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

 

Thank you 

 

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned. 
 

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg [mailto:jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 28 May 2018 1:16 PM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: rickteo@eurokars.com.sg; eva.kok@eurokars.com.sg 

Subject: YOUR REF: SKR174G / OUR REF: SKC1770H THIRD PARTY CLAIM (REQUESTING FOR A DIRECT SETTLEMENT)  

 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 
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Kindly refer to the video link : 
https://www.dropbox.com/s/veylvzpjejpizt6/SKC1770H%20VIDEO%20FILE.avi?dl=0 
 
We would appreciate it if you can kindly let us know the liability/status of this case. 
  
We are waiting for your prompt reply ASAP. 
 
Best Regards. 

 
Jobi Thomas 

Insurance Claims Executive 

 

TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD 

12 Sungei Kadut Avenue 

Singapore 729648 

T: (65) 6363 3003 D: (65) 6360 2446 F: (65) 6360 2899 

E: jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg 

 

From: Jobi Thomas  

Sent: Friday, May 25, 2018 2:09 PM 

To: 'motor.survey@axa.com.sg' <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>; 'cst@axa.com.sg' <cst@axa.com.sg> 

Cc: Rick Teo Fu Shen <rickteo@eurokars.com.sg>; Eva Kok <eva.kok@eurokars.com.sg> 

Subject: YOUR REF: SKR174G / OUR REF: SKC1770H THIRD PARTY CLAIM (REQUESTING FOR SURVEY AND A DIRECT 

SETTLEMENT)  

 

YOUR REF: SKR174G / OUR REF: SKC1770H THIRD PARTY CLAIM (REQUESTING FOR SURVEY 
AND A DIRECT SETTLEMENT)  
 
Dear Sir/Mdm,  
 
Kindly arrange the survey of our client’s vehicle ASAP.  
 
Attached is the ESTIMATE, SAS REPORT, SKETCH PLAN for your perusal. 
 
Best Regards. 

 
Jobi Thomas 

Insurance Claims Executive 

 

TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD 

12 Sungei Kadut Avenue 

Singapore 729648 

T: (65) 6363 3003 D: (65) 6360 2446 F: (65) 6360 2899 

E: jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg 

 


