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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

— B i 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industnial Park, Singapore 408933

5 B IS
- TEL: 6256 3581 FAX" 6256 4315

Reg Mo 199607158R G5T Reg Mo 19-9607198-R

Affillated to Faderation Internationale Des Experts En Automobiie

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref CCB/EQIBODEE5S5/Keh3
o ToER o AR
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date . 28-05-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 068110
Code: EOQI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh,  SJH G6B38G Veh. Inspected SJH 70678
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 28/05/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer : Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mim
L/H Front Tyre mim
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5, General Information
Accident Date  09/05/2018 |Inspection Date 25/05/2018
Survey held at WEILEE MOTOR WORKS
BLOCK 9 SiN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
#01-32
SINGAPORE 575644
5a. Remarks
AITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
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U WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS
N BLOCK 9 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE #01-32,
" SINGAPORE 575644, _ :
TEL: 456 9830 » FAX: 4553886 -\~ o © |1
J Business Ragn No : 268436/00J '
Aoy ATy
Ly 7 054
22,May 2018 : 2 Z""'f
=
EQ Insurance Company Ltd 43"'.!
5 Maxwell Road #17-00
Tower Block MND Complex
5069110
Attn: Motor claim dept-3" party claim
Claiming against your insured vehicle No: SIH5838G
Accident involving vehicle No: SIH7067B/SIH5838G
DOA: 09/05/2018 AT Jurong East Central To Jurong East 24
Dear officer incharge
Re: Estimate cost of repair for vehicle No: SIH70678
To supply--
Description Qty Amount
Front fender,Rh 1 7 72340 —
Headlamp,Rh 1 ary 85360 ——
Front bumper 1 AL anzs0 —
Front bumper retainer,Rh 1 Lea 5360 —
Rim,Rh 1 #r 28000
Tyre 1 i~ 220.00
Parts 2,603.40
Less 25% 650.85
1,952.55
To remove damaged parts and attachments.
Repair/reshape dented areas. &%
Replace/align above parts into position 700.00
To spray paint LK Auto Consultants hance nob 600,00 ﬁﬁaf
e Repairer of the follawing. y
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Asher Snﬂ {LKKAutn!

From: karen Seah <weileemotorworks@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 25 July 2018 5:48 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: document for vehicle no: SIH70678
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Hi,Asher

We agreed the offer.
Thank u.

On Wed, Jul 25, 2018 at 5:12 PM, Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Hi 5ir,

We refer to the above matter.

On a without prejudice, for a quick and amicable settlement, we propose the settlement at Global Sum 5§51,300.00 (all-
in).

Please kindly let us have your acceptance.

Thank You.

Best Regords,
Asher Sng | Cose Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid



phone; 48416051 | email; gsherno@lkkaulo.com | fox; 7414108

"

ik 51, Pova Ubi Incusiriol Park, LD Avenue |, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: karen Seah <weileemotorworks@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 19 July 2018 6:06 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: document for vehicle no: SIH7067B

Accident invalving vehicle SIH70678/5IH5838G

Dear asher
Considering the different accident account provided by our clients,we agreed the solution of 50/50 liability..

Attached with the necessary document. Kindly send us the DV.

Thanks so much.

Best Regards,

Karen Seah

Wei Lee Motor Works

Block 9 5in Ming Industrial Estate

#01-32 Singapore 575644
Tel: 6456 9330
Fax: 6458 0128

Company registration: 269436,/00)



Best Regards,

Karen Seah

Wei Lee Maotor Warks

Block 9 Sin Ming Industrial Estate
#01-32 Singapore 575644

Tel: 6456 9830

Fax: 6458 0128

Company registration: 269436,/00J



& # A %
WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS

BLOCK 8 SIN MING INDUSTHIAL ESTATE #01-32,
SINGAPORE 575844,
TEL: 8456 9830 = FAX: 6458 0128 » EMAIL: weileemotorworks@gmail.com
Business Regn Mo: 262438/00J

19,July 2018
EQ Insurance Company Ltd
Attn: Motor claim dept-3" party claim
Claiming against your insured vehicle no: SJH5838G
Accident involving vehicle no:SIH70678/SIH5838G
ON 09/05/2018 AT Jurong East Central To Jurong East 24

Dear officer incharge
We are the workshop for the owner of vehicle no: SIH7067B

Regarding the claim for the case above, this is a liability clear case considering that your client’s
vehicle collided into the right portion of our client’s vehicle.

The claim for vehicle No: SIH70678B as follow:-

Cost of repair to SIH7067B $ 2,050.00 finalised with your surveyor
Loss of use S 320.00 $BOx04d
LTA search fee s 7.45

S 237745

Enclosed with all the necessary document for your reference,

Kindly let us have your reply soonest possible.

Thank you.



" Asher 5"2 (LKI{Autn!

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 7 June 2018 6:05 PM

To: ADMINEBILCON.COM SG'

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJH 5838G AND 514 70678 ON 09/05/2018

Our Ref: CCO/EQI8009655/Keb3
07 JUNE 2018

TAN ENG HOE

Dear Sir'Madam.
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJH 5838G AND SJH 7067B ON 09/05/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or your authorized driver
may not be absolved from blame for this accident.

If you have evidence/information 1o proof that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have them
in writing within the next 10 days, afier we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the
without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/vour driver against
the other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and vour NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully.

Asher

Case Handler

DID: 6841 6051

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: ashersng@lkkauto.com

o0 EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
(Motor Claims Dept)
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WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS

BLOCK 9 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE #01-32,

SINGAPORE 575644,
TEL: B456 0B30 = FAX: 6458 0128
Business Aegn No- 268436/00J

EQ Insurance Company Ltd INVOICE NO:12575

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 DATE:19,July 2018

Tower Block MND Complex S 069110

PARTICULARS

AMOUNT (S%)

Accident involving vehicle No: SJH7067B/SJH5838G

Cost of repair for vehicle no: SJHT067TE
Lump sum repaired as recommended by your appointed
surveyor.

2,050.00

2,050.00

Payments to be made by crossed cheque In favour of WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS



Keceipt Page | of |
. *Back to OneMotoring

Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701
GET Registration No. : M4-0006529-2
Print Date/Time : 22 May 2018 / 18:11:32

Recelpt Date/Timea - 22 May 2018 / 18:11:32

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. | ITNET-00000-180522-002179

Previous Receipt No, ;
S/N Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (S5) (55) (S5)

Result of Insurance Enguiry - SJH5838G

As at 09 May 2018/09:20:00 ‘
Insurance Co: EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD
1 Insizrance Enguiry - SJH5838G

Enquiry Fee 7.00 049 7.49
201805221810277 75056
Sub-Total 7.00 045 748
Total Before Rounding 7.00 049 745
Rounding Difference 0,04
Total Amount Payable T.45
Paid By
i Debit: eNETE Debit
20180522181048530 Eamrzﬂmu‘t Banking) T45
Total T &5
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 745
Excess Refundabls Amount 0.00

THANK ¥OU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Flease ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/completePayment?FUNCTION ID=F1301001TT 5/22/2018
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Company Registration Ng 105607158
SLUBI AVE l. mi2.2g PAYA LI N H'I'HIAI.I'-[HH SMINGAPORE 408931 TEL : TGS 02563545 FAX - TGS #2504 5

To: M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 16/08/2018

IREC LEME
SJH 5838G (Insd Veh)
SJH 70678 (TP Veh)
9/5/2018

Your H‘ef No. : DMPPHQ1?—DD-41DD
Qur Ref No. : GGBJ'EDHEUDBEEEMEHQE

: ' : ) 4 d_ays __ _ _ _ = h
I _ | i s A - .
- .300. GLOBAL SUM

Faﬂgenl instrugjign_: Payee's Brgakdgﬂn
1) [WEI LEE MOTOR WoRKs

JOANNE LEE
-KK Auto Consultants Pte Lid




' 7d 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
e B - 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6258 3561 Fax: B256 4315

Reg. No: 188607 188R GST Reg. No 19-9607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Das Experts En Automobiie

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Raf CC&/EQI18009655/Kebig2
R o B LB
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date . 16-08-2018
MND CDMPLEXSINGAPDRE 069110
Code : EQI
s | Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, SJH 5838G Veh. Inspected SJH 70878
Policy No. EMPPHQ17-004100 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No, Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 25/05/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA WISH (A) c.c 1794
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No, JTDER1WI31J'SEGDESE Colour METALLIC SILVER
Odometer 210375 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/85 R15 MICHELIN 2mm
L/H Front Tyre |195#5R15 MICHELIN 2 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/65 R15 MICHELIN 2 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |155/85 R15 MICHELIN 2mm
4, Description of Damages

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S FRONT FORTION

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

5. General Information

Accident Date  0%/052018 Inspection Date 25/05/2018

Survey held at WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS
BLOCK @ SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE

#01-32
SINGAPORE 575644

Remarks

ATTH i ou EJUDICE™ BASIS,
BllN ACCOR WE H TH FAIRS

Estimate Days of Repair

4 Working Days

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX G256 4315

Reg. No: 188607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8507128-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJH 7067B
| Estimate By | Our Adjusted
es on of Parts Con n :
Qty Description o dition |\workshop ()| ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT FENDER ,RH BENT 723.40 72340
1|HEADLAMP RH cuT B53.60 B53.80
1|FRONT BUMPER BUCKLED 472 80 472 BD
1|FRONT BUMPER RETAINER .RH DISTORTED 53.60 53.60
1|RIM ,RH DENTED 280.00 280.00
1|TYRE SERVICEABLE 22000
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -650.85 -585.85
1,852 55 1,787.55
LABOUR
TO REMOVE DAMAGED PARTS AND T00.00 400.00
ATTACHMENTS REPAIR /RESHAPE DENTED
AREAS REPLACE/ ALIGN ABOVE PARTS INTO POSITION
TO SPRAY PAINT 600.00 400.00
1,300.00 800.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,252.55 2,587.55
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,050.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CC6/EQI18009655/Keb3qg2
KONG SENG CHEONG
Licensed Appraiser
DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: - This Repart ls made solaly for the use and benafit of the Cllant named on the front page of this Report

Mo liabillty of responaibiliny srhataosyes, ko caniact a2 o




