Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 22 June, 2018 10:23 AM

To: 'Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)'

Cc: ‘assignments’

Subject: RE: YK18X / TP : GBE8930M/LKK / DOA : 23/05/2018

Catherine,

Claim no. is CDMCG18000098. Typo in our insured vehicle, it should read as YK18X

Thanks
Pei Li

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 22 June, 2018 9:44 AM

To: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)

Cc: 'assignments'

Subject: RE: YK118X / TP : GBE8930M/LKK / DOA : 23/05/2018

Dear Pei Li,
Kindly provide us the claim number.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 28 May, 2018 10:40 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: sur@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: YK118X / TP : GBE8930M/LKK / DOA : 23/05/2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.
BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 28 May 2018 9:46 AM

To: 'admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: Ol : YK118X / TP : GBE8930M/LKK / DOA : 23/05/2018
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