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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e i - 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Feg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9507198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAFPORE PL Ref : CS/SMO18009630/T1qd3
. LU
#05-01/06 Date: 28-05-2018
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code: SMO
] Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YN 2883K Veh. Inspected XE 3716M
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1802248/NSW Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GRACE TEOD Assign Date 28/05/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer 3 Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  25/05/2018 Inspection Date
Survey held at 42 SUNGAI KADUT AVENUE
Repairer WOON MENG MOTOR PTELTD
5a. Remarks

A)JTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




&1 URI AVE 1, #01-25 PAVA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 305933 TEL : (065) I‘r‘_-'il‘.v.lfml FAX : (105} 6025043135

Your Ref: CMTD1802248/NSW Date: 27" September 2018
Our Ref: CS/SMO18009630/T1gd3 Without Prejudice

The Motor Claims Department
Sompo Insurance

Attn: Grace
Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO, XE 3716M .

We thank you for the instruction on 28/05/2018.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 30/05/2018 at the premises of M/s WOON MENG MOTOR and have
the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 3.679.00
Revised Estimate Amount 1 5% 3.179.00
“Check” Items Amount ' 8% -

Market Value 1 5% - .
LTA Reimbursement Value +S$ - "
Nett Value 1 5% -

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the
n's mirror.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages consistent.

Days of repair: 3 days.
We have NOT authorized repair.

Yours faithfully

Taufikh
Automobile Assessor



Nivitha (LKK Auto)
T e R e e

From: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 28 May 2018 11:29 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com; assignments@|kkauto.com

Cc: Heng Sew Sow; Ngo, Sau Wei Shawn; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin

Subject: CMTD1802248/NSW - SUV(LKK)/ Accident involving YN2883K & XE3716M ON
250518

Attachments: 20180526191738.pdf

Cur Reference: CMTD1802248/NSW
Dear LKK AUTO/ MOHD TAUFIKH,

Please make arrangement to conduct the survey for XE3716M.

Please be informed that Shawn Ngo the handler of this case.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

m . Innovation for Wellbeing
- T
L./ SOMPO A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www facebook.com/SompaSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may caontain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the pUrposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitied/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents {acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Heng Sew Sow [mailto:woonmeng@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, May 28, 2018 11:17 AM

To: Teo, Grace

Cc: Ngo, Sau Wei Shawn; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin

Subject: RE: CMTD1802248/NSW - Accident involving YN2883K & XE3716M ON 25.05.18

Dear Taufikh

LKK Auto Consultants
Mohd Taufikh (West area)

Best Regards,



Heng Sew Sow (Ms)

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd
Tel: 6316 1131/51

Fax: 6316 7050

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.teo@sompo.com.,sg]

Sent: Monday, 28 May 2018 11:06 AM

To: Heng Sew Sow <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Ngo, Sau Wei Shawn <Shawn.Ngo@sompo.com.sg>; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye @sompo.com.sg>
Subject: CMTD1802248/NSW - Accident involving YN2883K & XE3716M ON 25.05.18

Our Reference : CMTD1802248/NSW
Your Reference: XE3716M

Without Prejudice
Date: 28" May 2018

Attention:
M/S WOON MENG MOTOR

Dear Ms. Heng,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN2883K & XE3716M ON 25.05.2018

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 26/05/2018.

Kindly re-direct your future motor claims survey request to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

Please be informed that Shawn Ngo the handler of this case.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your

client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as

Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 | Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 | LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 | Priority Services Jimmy Lee

Lawrence Ng
Jeffrey Ong
4 | JP Knights Adjusters & Surveyors Jason Lek




Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T. 6461 6555 | F. 6221 3147

Inmovation for Wellbeing
SOMPO A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited,
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Heng Sew Sow [mailto:woonmeng@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Saturday, May 26, 2018 7:25 PM

To: claimsreport

Subject: Accident involving XE3716M & YN2883K ON 25.05.18

Dear Sir/Madam

We refer to the above accident

Kindly be advised that we will be assisting our client, owner of vehicle no:

XE3716M, to submit a third party claim against your insured vehicle. We would like to proceed with direct
settlement.

Please arrange for your surveyor to liaise with us for an inspection on our client's Vehicle at your earliest
convenience,

Location : 50, Bukit Batok St 23 #01- 06 Midview Building ( 5) 659578 ( Vehicle in )

Thank you.

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd
Tel: 63161131
Fax : 63167050



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Heng Sew Sow <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 27 September 2018 7:43 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LkKAuto); Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Ce: SUR

Subject: RE: Pending Finalised Offer for YP4262D & $JQ19255 & XE3716M & XD6BIBG

Accept your offer $2350.00

Best Regards,

Heng Sew Sow (Ms)

Woon Meng Maotor Pte Ltd
Tel: 6316 1131/51

Fax: 6316 7050

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 27 September 2018 2:18 PM

To: Woon Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg=; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com:>

Subject: RE: Pending Finalised Offer for YP4262D & 51019255 & XE3716M & XDG6898G

Dear Ms Heng,
WITHOUT PREJUDISE
XE 3716M — Offer Lump Sum $2,350.00 before GST and 3 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: bas6-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: Woon Meng <woconmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 6 September 2018 2:41 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>=

Subject: RE: Pending Finalised Offer for YP4262D & 51Q19255 & XE3716M & XD6B98G

Dear Shiau Chan,
We refer to the matter below for your kind attention.
Please kindly be informed that we confirm acceptance of :

final fig $700.00 before GST and 2 repair days.

Thanks & Warmest Regards,



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 27 September 2018 2:15 PM

To: Ngo, Sau Wei Shawn; Teo, Grace; assignments

Cc Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; SUR

Subject: RE: CMTD1802248/NSW - SUV(LKK)/ Accident involving YN28B3K & XE3T16M ON
25.05.18

Attachments: CSSMO18009630T1qd3.pdf

Dear Shawn,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of XE 3716M.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@]kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | Si408033)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

sent: Thursday, 2 August 2018 3:55 PM

To: Ngo, Sau Wei Shawn <Shawn.Ngo@sompo.com.5g>; Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: CMTD1802248/NSW - SUV(LKK)/ Accident involving YN28823K & XE3716M ON 25.05.18

Dear Shawn,
Thank you for the email.
wWe will check and revert to you.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{4080933)

From: Ngo, Sau Wei Shawn <Shawn.Ngo@sompo.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 2 August 2018 3:43 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuta) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>; Teo, Grace <grace.teo(@sompo.com.sg>; assignments
<assipnments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; SUR <sur |kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: CMTD1802248/NSW - SUV(LKK)/ Accident involving YN2883K & XE3716M ON 25.05.18

Dear Shiau Chan,

Third party, M/s Woon Meng Motor had send in their letter of claims since 31.05.2018 but however till date we have
yet to receive your surveyor report.

Please confirm.



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 1 June 2018 1:20 PM

To: ‘Teo, Grace'; assignments; 'Shawn.Ngo@sompo.com.sg’

Cc: 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin’; SUR

Subject: RE: CMTD1802248/NSW - SUV(LKK)/ Accident involving YN2883K 8t XE3716M ON
25.05.18

Dear Shawn,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle XE 3716M on 30,/05/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sigwse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 28 May 2018 12:15 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com=

Cc: 'Ngo, Sau Wei Shawn' <Shawn.Ngo@sompo.com.sg=; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com:=

Subject: RE: CMTD1802248/NSW - SUV(LKK)/ Accident involving YN2883K & XE3716M ON 25.05.18

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.teo@sompo.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 28 May 2018 11:29 AM

To: admin-d@Ilkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com
Cc: Heng Sew Sow <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>; Ngo, Sau Wei Shawn <Shawn.Ngo@sompo.com.sg>; Ye, Yong

Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: CMTD1802248/NSW - SUV(LKK)/ Accident involving YN2883K & XE3716M ON 25.05.18

Our Reference: CMTD1802248/NSW

Dear LKK AUTO/ MOHD TAUFIKH,



LIWATATBDESHE | Woon Meng Molor P Lid - Sukd Batox
EMTRY DATE & TIME 25m&Z01H 18:51
SUBMITTED BY Heng Sew Sevw

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTIGE
1. Pleaza report correcily the detais of the accident to speed up the claims procass.
2. This Farm mus! be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorisad Dinver

3. Information provided must be as truthiul and accurate as passible. Any witlul misraprasanlatian or witholding of materal facts may aliow insuranca companies b

repudiate policy ability

4. The izsue ard acceptance of this Form by insurance comganies is not an admission of policy Babdity an the part of the insurance companies,

5 Any false reporting may be refemmed to the Police for [nvestigation.
B This repuorl will be forwarded by Ine insurers of the GiA Records Menagement Centre estalilished by the General Isurance Associalion of Singapore (GIA) for
archaving and that copees of 1his reporn will, Tor & lee. be made avadabls upon application by interested parbes

T By the loggement of this report (o the insurers, you hereby cansent 1o the anchiving of this report at the centre and 1o copees of the report being made available

aloraesid,

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Repart

Date Of Accident

Exact Location OF Accident
Country/Stale of Loss

26/05/2018 18:51

25/05/2018 08:40

1 BUROH LANE ( LOADING BAY )
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Mumbar
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
Co Reg No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Modal

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please stale aclion lo be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fiaet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Mame of Driver

MRIC Mo

Date Of Birth

Oeccupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Mumber

Fax Mumber

Contact Number

EMail Address

XEIT16M

WENDY TRANSPORT ENTERPRISE CO
o 15836 (Loug

MOEMAIL
OFFICE-24305264

SCANIA
P400LA-12.7 D 4X2 MSZ (M)

NO

THIRD PARTY
COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

ERGO INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
COMPREHEMNSIVE

NO

DMCV1T3023183

TOH LIANG HUAT

§7515269H
03/06M1875

QUTDOOR

03/04/1998

20 YEARS AND 1 MONTH
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-94305264

HOEMAIL

Page 1 af 12



Addrass
Postoode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured
Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own

Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accldent

Type Of Accident
Weather Conditions
Road Surface
Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?
Mumber of vehicles invalved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

¥as any injured conveyed to hospltal by

ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)

Details of Police Action

VWas the accident reporied to the police?
If ¥es, Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intendad Prosecution given?

If Yes, against whom?
Circumstances of Accident
REFER TO SKETCH PLAN

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos avallable for altachment?
Was there any video capturad by Car Camara?

Was there any audio recordad?

BLK 812A CHOA CHU KANG AVE 7 # 12- 673

681812
YES

"

COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
CLEAR
CRY

NO

MO

YES

WO

NO

YES
NO
NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Mumber
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properlles

Vehicle Category

Mame of Driver
MNRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
MNature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

YN28B3K

COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

Paga 2a112



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

Please report correctly the detalls of the accldent o speed up the claims process,

This Form must be completed by the Polleyhalder and/ar the Autharized Driver
Information provided must e as truthfyl and acourate 3s pessible. Any wilful misrepresentation or withhalding of material
facks may allow nsurance companies to repudiate policy lighility,

The issue and acceptance of this Form by Insurance companies s not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance
companies

. Tha report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Recards Managemant Centre established by the General Insurance
Assaciation of Singapore {GIA] for archiving and that coples of this report will for a fee be made avallable upon application by
inlerested partes,

. By the ledgment of this report (o the insurers, vou hereby consent to the archwving of this report at the centre and to copies of
the report being made available aforesaid.

Consent under the Persanal Data Protection Act (PDPA)

| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

fa)l My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapare ["GIA™] may/are permitted to collect, use,
discloss and/for process my personal data/persanal information set outin this [Ferm| and any other perconal informatson
provided oy me or possassed by my insurer [collectvely the “Persenal information”) and disclose and transfer such
Parsonal Information to all insurer(s] who have insured vehicle(s] involeed in this accident {all insureris) who have insured
wehicle(s) imvolved in this accident shadl b colloctively refarred to as the “Insurars”), the Insurers” lawyers/law firms, the
Maonetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant government dgency/authority (such a8 the polica], for the purpose(s)
of

i} processing, handiing and/or deating with my claims including the settiement of the claims and any necessary
investigations relating Lo the claims;

{ii] investigating the accident and/far my claims;
{8} carrying out and/or dealing with my instructions or responding to any enquines by, me;

{iv) administering my claims [including the mailing of correspondence, statements, invoices, reports or notices to me,
which could invalve disclosure af certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same a% well as on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/or

v} comphying with applicable law in administering, processing, handling and/for dealing with my claims [collectively the
“Purposes”|

[b] alf insurerls] who have msured vehicle(s) involved in this accident :Ind the Insurers’ lawyers/iow firms, mayfare peravitted
to collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personal Information for one or more of the above Purposes; and

{c]  my Persomal Information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or G14 to thelr third party service providers or
agentefincluding thesr lawyers/law firms), which may be sited gutside of Singapore, for one ar more of the above Purposes.

[d}  my Persoral information will also be collected and wsed to compibe claims history for the purpose of fraud detectson,
inwestigation and managament in present and all future claims,

[e] theinformation so coliected under {d) above may be shared [ disclosed:

1ty toall insurers andfor any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
regulators, lzw enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stited, or

(it} for complying with requiremnents under any regulations, laws or court orders

i ’
(s =25, /

'\ J) _ i
: ‘,ﬁ;{;ﬁﬁ Sbfos] (8 frosp \\\

Palicyhalder's Sigrnature Diiver's Signature Reporiing (Entr;“ﬁu&ﬁé;i Sizni.l.ture_
Date & Time: (I driver s not the policyholder) Mame: -
Diate & Tirme: NRICSFIN Mo,

Please note that vou might be able to submit an Own Damage Clalm wnder own policy within 14 days,

} Claim Own Damapge { ) Claim TP | ) Repurting Only { ) Claim OINTP at other workshap
Workshop Name ¢
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Sketch Plan Pg. 2

SKETCH PLAN
torbinh &Y

| BUREMH LRAE

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

<
y particulars are [rue in puary respect \
y
ol

F'D"E'I“‘U"_ﬂer'l Signature Oriver's 5-5‘::Itule Reparting Centra Pcn:&nnwumu
Date & Toms (I driwes is Aot the pohoyholder) Mame:
Date B Teme: HRICFIN Na.:
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Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

. 50 Bukit Batok 5t 23, #01-06 Midview Building, Singapore 659578

Office

Waorkshop: 50 Bukit Batok St 23, #01-06 Midview Building, Singapore 659578

Tel: 6316 1131 HP: 9730 2017 Fax: 6316 7050

42, Sungei Kadut Ave, Singapore 7296668 Tel : 63268523

([ Email Adress : woonmeng {@singnet.com.sg )
Co Reg Mo. 200803678M

Estimate
To Tenet Sompo Insurance Pte Ltd
Motor Claims Dept
Dear Sirs :

GS5T Reg Mo. 20-0603678M

TP CLAIM
Date : 30 May 2018

Fax : 6221 3147

RE : ESTIMATE COST FOR SCANIA P400 - XE3716M
ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE3716M & YN2883K ON 25/05/2018

ITEMS

1
2
3

D RIPTION

Front side mirror mounting kit
Front side mirror top n/s
Front side mirror casing n/s.

Labour Charge & Misc

To remove, repair, replace & |
To numbering " Wendy " logo.
To R & R wiring.

To putty & spray painting.

Total

Al prices guotad are subjected lo 7% GST.

n/s.

nstall damaged

LKK Auto Consultanis hence notify

the Repairer of the follg

el

\& i o -

.l\&\%

"‘:]_,

Qry PRICE
e § 89300
pc & 620.00 ~ =
ipe § 786.00 7 e -
$  2,290.00
) = 22 64-to
$ 600.00 790
$ 250,00 !~°
$ 80.00 =Y
$ 450,00 % v
$ 3679.00
T“Pﬁ ARy T
- wp

=

31“-". ¢ Lk{{v‘-ﬁ\-r*{’ b A
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg, No: 189607198R G3T Reg. No 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL

50 RAFFLES PLACE
#05-01/06

SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623

Ref : CS/SMO18009630/T1qd3n2

Date .

Code : SMO

03-10-2018

LA

)

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. YN 2883K Veh. Inspected XE 3716M
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1802248/NSW Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GRACE TEO Assign Date 28/05/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model SCANIA P400 c.c 12742
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. Y¥52P4X20009224063 Colour GREEN
Odometer Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification NIL
General GOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[315/80 R225 GOCDYEAR B mm
L/H Front Tyre [315/80R22.5 GOODYEAR & mm
R/H Rear Tyre | 315/80 R22.5 (D) GOODYEAR 8/8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 31580 R22.5 (D) GOODYEAR B/8 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S MIRROR.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  25/05/2018 Inspection Date 30/05/2018
Survey held at 42 SUNGAI KADUT AVENUE
Repairer WOON MENG MOTOR PTE LTD
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BN ACCORDANCE TC YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,
5b, Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days
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TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607 198R G5T Reg. No. 15-8607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. XE 3716M

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

Page Mo 1 of 1

i Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($) $)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT SIDE MIRROR MOUNTING KIT N/S DISTORTED 893.00 893.00
1|FRONT SIDE MIRROR TOP NiS CRACKED B20.00 620.00
1{FRONT SIDE MIRROR CASING NIS CRACKED 786.00 786.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -229.90
2,280.00 206910
LABOUR
TO REMOVE REPAIR REPLACE & INSTALL DAMAGED. 600,00 40000
TO NUMBERING "WENDY" LOGO 250.00 150.00
TO R&R WIRING. 80.00 30.00
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING. 450.00 300.00
1,380.00 880.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,679.00 2,949.10
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,350.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CS/SMO18009630/T1gqd3n2
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH ADRIAN LING WAI PING

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Automotive Assessor

Licensed Appraiser




