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B o mam mm Pre Lict Campany Registration No, 199607 138R

E

S1UBIAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (063) 62563561 FAX : 1065) 62563315

Your Rel: CMTDI1B02249/NSW Drate: 04 June 2018

Our Ref: CS/SMO18009623/Ksd3

The Motor Claims Department
Tenet Sompo Insurance Pte Lid

Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SKOQ 4895M

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle
on _ 30/05/2018 _ at the premises of M/s Optima Werkz Pte Ltd and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount ;88 4.150.72
Revised Estimate Amount : 8% 1,656.80
“Check” Items Amount : 5% 700.00
Market Value 2.1 1

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value 1 S8

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear n/s portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 4 Days

Yours faithfully,
Kenneth Kong
Automotive Assessor



Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

f

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 4 June 2018 10:52 AM

To: ‘Ngo, Sau Wei Shawn'; 'Teo, Grace'; ‘Sharon Ten'; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'

Cc: sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com; 'Mivitha (LKK Auto)’

Subject: RE: CMTD1802249/NSW - SUV(LKK)/ Accident involving FS7288U & SKQ4895M on
23/05/18

Attachments: SKC) A895M- Preli Advise.pdf

Dear Shawn,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SKQ 4835M.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 5256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 28 May 2018 12:02 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.cOm.sg>; assignments@|kkauto.com

Ce: 'Sharon Ten' <sharon@ow.sg>; 'Ngo, Sau Wei Shawn' <Shawn.Ngo@sompo.com.sg>; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'
<melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; sur@Ikkauto.com

Subject: RE: CMTD1802249/NSW - SUV(LKK)/ Accident involving FS7288U & SKQ4835M on 23/05/18

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignmentsé@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933)

From: Teo, Grace |maHtu:grace.teu@;nmgo.mm.sgl

sent: Monday, 28 May 2018 11:23 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com; assignments@I|kkauto.com

Cc: Riza <riza@ow.sg>; winson@ow.sg; lily.loi@ow.sg; Sharon Ten <sharon@ow.sg>; Mgo, 5au Wei Shawn
<Shawn.Ngo@sompo.com.sg>; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: CMTD1802243/NSW - SUV(LKK)/ Accident involving FS7288U & SKQ4895M on 23/05/18

Our Reference: CMTD1802249/NSW

Dear LKK AUTO,



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 28 May 2018 11:23 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: Riza; winson@ow.sg; lily.loi@ow.sg; Sharon Ten; Ngo, Sau Wei Shawn; Ye, Yong
Kang Melvin

Subject: CMTD1802249/NSW - SUV(LKK)/ Accident involving FS7288U & SKQ4895M on
23/05/18

Attachments: 25052018181202 pdf

Our Reference: CMTD1802249/NSW

Dear LKK AUTO,

Please make arrangement to conduct the survey for SKQ4895M.

Please be informed that Shawn Ngo the handler of this case,

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F; 6221 3147

@/ SOMPO A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid.
20 Raffles Place, #05-01/08 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www . facebook com/SompoSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Pelicy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom

disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
cur Privacy Policy

From: Riza [mailto:riza@ow.5qg]

Sent: Monday, May 28, 2018 11:13 AM

To: Teo, Grace

Cc: winson@ow.sg; lily.loi@ow.sg; Sharon Ten; Ngo, Sau Wei Shawn; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin
Subject: Re: CMTD1802249/NSW - Accident involving F57288U & 5KQ4895M on 23/05/18

Dear Grace,
We chose LKK to survey the above mentioned vehicle.

Thanks



Best Regards,

Riza (Ms)

Claims Executive

Tel: +65 6484-5919 [(ext.105)

Fax: +65 6481-1011

OPTIMA WERKZ ETE LTD

Head office: & Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143
[+85) 6472 2112 |

Branch: 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500
[+85) 6481 1011 I

Branch: 551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415
(+65) €452 9223 |

W . OW . SII!

www . facebook.com/optimawerksz

On 5/28/2018 10:06 AM, Teo, Grace wrote:

Our Reference : CMTD1802249/NSW

Your Reference: SKQ4895M

Date: 28" May 2018

Attention:

M/S OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

Dear Riza,

| Tel:

Tel:

Tel:

(+65) 6472 1313
(+65) 6484 9919

(+65) 6452 6868

Without Prejudice

ACCIDENT INVOLVING FS7288U & SK(Q4895M ON 23.05.18

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 25/05/2018.

Fax:

Fax:



Please be informed that Shawn Ngo the handler of this case.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s
vehicle jointly with your client/your motor workshop, We propose to use one of the motor
surveyors named in the attached list to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint

expert.
Pre-Repair Survey
Motor Surveyor
1 Raleigh Services
2 LKK Auto Consultants
3 Priority Services
4 IP Knights Adjusters & Surveyors

Surveyor Seiectiﬂn (Indicate as
tick)

Andrew Ow Yong

Vincent Ng

Kenneth Kong (North

area)

Marcus Chua (East area)

Mohd Rasul (West area)

Mohd Taufikh (West

area)

Jimmy Lee
Lawrence Ng
Jeffrey Ong
Jason Lek

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of
any of these motor surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed
motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint

expert.

Best Regards
Grace Teo
Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147



Innovation for Wellbeing
@ SOMPO A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company
named and may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised
disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited. If you are
not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose
your personal data for the purposes stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure
to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is
permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our
behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Policy

From: Riza [mailto:rizai@ow.sg]

Sent: Friday, May 25, 2018 6:23 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey

Ce: winson(@ow.sg; lilv.loif@ow.sg; Sharon Ten

Subject: Arrange survey - Accident involving SKQ4895M and FS7288U on 23/05/18

Without Prejudice

Your Ref: FS7288U

Our Ref: SKQ4895M

Hi all,

Please arrange for survey as soon as possible. Vehicle is inside our premises.
Location: 9A Serangoon North Avenue 5

**Please avoid 1-2PM

Thanks

Best Regards,

Biza ([Ms)

Claims Executive

Tel: 465 6484-9%19 (ext.105)
Fax: +65 6481-1011

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD



Head cffice: € Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 | Tel:
1313 | Fax: (465) 6472 2112 |

Branch: 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 | Tel:
9819 I Fax: (+65) 6481 1011 |

Branch: 351 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415 | Tal:
68648 | Fax: (+65) ©452 9223 |

WW,DW.SQ

www. faceboock.com/optimawerksz

{+65)
(+65)

{+65)

6472

6484

6452



OpTIMA WERKZ PTELTD

Head office

: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 158143

Tel : 485 6472 1313 Fax:+656472 3112

Branch office : 9A Serangoon North Ave S Singapore 554500 Tel : +65 6484 9919 Fax : +65 6481 1011
;D. Reg. No. 201212455W

Date: 25 MAY 2018 Third Party Insurer:  SOMPO
Vehicle No:  SKQ 4895 M Third Party Veh No:  F57288U
Model: HONDAFIT 1.3 Date of Accident: 23/05/18
Chassis: GK3-3003958
ESTIMATE B |
Qry o DESCRIPTION CUNIT S§¢ | AMOUNT S$ |
1 REAR TAILGATE LOGO EMBLEM Ae. 52460 —
1 REAR TAILGATE FIT EMBLEM e, 53460 —
1 REAR TAILLAMP LH $493.30 7./ 1/
2 REAR TAILLAMP CLIPS LH $5.80 $11.60 7>
1 REAR TAILLAMP INNER PANEL LH N 7T 5109.70| X
1 REARBUMPER | cmy /) Ba 580360 —
1  REAR BUMPER GARNISH LH Ji. 52950 X
14 RAER BUMPER CLIPS $6.80 Ay, 59520 —
"2 REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER L/R Alf g, 7 52550 $51.00 &+
1 |REAR BUMPER INNER SIDE SHIELD LH T AL 54920 X
"3 REAR BUMPER INNER SIDE SHIELD CLIPS LH $6.80 A~ 52040 X
1 |REAREND PANEL §370.10 7.
" 1 |REAR END PANEL INNER TOP GARNISH A 598.60 X
|_____fi__-'nEAR END PANEL INNER TOP GARNISH CLIPS | §5.50 n 52200 X
o o SUB TOTAL $2,213.40
Less 20% -$442.68|
/L{V o PARTSTOTAL = $1,770.72]
/rr, Y%
o

the Repairer of the follgwine
¢ To ras urvey befora ClUowWIng
L ?C :'jl'.[.lﬂ. Aam
® Farty pricis
=

LKK Auto Consultants hence ¢

E3unvey

Third party survey is
L] llegal modification(s) is alf
.5 :

Upprementary itan
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Wal from Insur

¥ Subject io fingl appro
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Signature:
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OpTiMA WERKZ PTE LTD

Head office  : & Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143

Tel : +65 6472 1313 Fax : +65 6472 2112

Branch office : 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 Tel ; +65 6484 9915 Fax : +65 6481 1011

Co. Reg. No. 20‘_1212455W

Date: 25 MAY 2018 Third Party Insurer:  SOMPO
Vehicle No:  SKQ 4895 M Third Party Veh No: F57288U
Model: HONDA FIT 1.3 Date of Accident: 23/05/18
Chassis: GK3-3003958
fary | _ SPECIALNETT ) UNIT 5§ | AMOUNT S§ |
1 |REARBUMPER REVERSESENSOR | Lok 5280.00
. ' S/NTOTAL $280.00|
LABOUR CHARGES:
TO REMOVE & REPLACED WITH PANEL BEATING ALL ACCIDENT PORTION $800.00 ""*""&(’
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING WITH SEALANT ALL ACCIDENT PORTION $800.00 ﬁ:::,,/
TO TUFF KOTE / ANTI-RUST A SRO00 X
TO CHECK WIRING, LIGHTING & WATER LEAKAGE $80.00 Zeoy

TO DISMANTLE & REINSTALL REAR INTERIOR CARPET COMPONENT TO
FACILITATE REPAIR

A $280.00 A

TO DISMANTLE & REPLACED REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR $80.00 jﬁ’/
LABOURTOTAL  $2,100.00
WINSON - - TOTAL  $4,150.72




OpTimMA WERKZ PTELTD

Head office : 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 Tel: +65 6472 1313 Fax:+65 6472 2112
Branch office : 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 Tel : +65 6484 9919 Fax ; +65 5481 1011
Co. Reg. No. 201212455W

Date: 25 MAY 2018 Third Party Insurer.  SOMPO
Vehicle No:  SKQ 4895 M Third Party Veh No:  FS7288U
Model: HONDA FIT 1.3 Date of Accident: 23/05/18
Chassis: GK3-2003958
ESTIMATE
B DESCRIPTION | UNIT S$ | AMOUNT S§ |
1 REAR TAILGATE LOGO EMBLEM 1 A, SSEER —
" 1 [REAR TAILGATE FIT EMBLEM =y [, 53480 —
1 REARTAILLAMPLH SN TN NSy $49330 7"
2 REAR TAILLAMP CLIPSLH ' l 5580 A~ $1160 KX
1 REARTAILLAMP INNERPANELLH T | /0 510970 X
1 REAR BUMPER C ok TR TR | ey J/ A SB0360 —
1 REAR BUMPER GARMNISH LH Ee | S 529500 X
14 RAERBUMPERCLIPS RSIR 2 $6.80 Ay, 59520
|2 [REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERL/R ~ls g, 52550 $51.00 &+~
1 |REAR BUMPER INNER SIDE SHIELD LH fiy 34920 X
3 pEA ouwPSRINERBIOESMEDERSEY, | J6R0 W 21048 X -
1 REAR END PANEL $370.10
"1 REAR END PANEL INNER TOP GARNISH [ A< sEE60 W
4 REAREND PANEL INNER TOP GARNISH CLIPS 5550 sne0 X
LG - SUBTOTAL | $2,213.40 |47 L7
Resdfhe | cAMERY L
PARISTOTAL ' 31,7703 )iy, o0
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Optima WERKZ PTELTD

Head office : 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 Tel: +65 6472 1313 Fax: +65 6472 2112
Branch office : 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 Tel ; «65 6484 9919 Fax: +65 6481 1011
Co. Reg. No. 201212455W

Date: 25 MAY 2018 - Third Party Insurer; SOMPO
Vehicle No:  SKQ 4895 M Third Party Veh No:  FS7288U
Model: HOMDA FIT 1.3 Date of Accident: 23/05/18
Chassis: GK3-3003958
ary . SPECIALNETT UNIT §§ | AMOUNT 8§
1 REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR o  Jhon m_smﬁu;/ﬁé#fw
= = o [EJNW © $280.00
LABOUR CHARGES: Gaok
TQ REMOVE & REPLACED WITH PANEL BEATING ALL ACCIDENT PORTION S800.00 ﬁ’?&y
bRk
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING WITH SEALANT ALL ACCIDENT PORTION $800.00 -

10 TUEF KOTE / ANTI-RUST Ame 55000 . YO f'

TO CHECK WIRING, LIGHTING & WATER LEAKAGE $80.00 .a’.p-(

TO DISMANTLE & REINSTALL REAR INTERIOR CARPET COMPONENT TO

FACILITATE REPAIR AT $280.00 #‘:Sﬂf

TO DISMANTLE & REPLACED REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR SBO.00 j‘?z
LABOURTOTAL 5210000 (o0, -
WINSON - i TOTAL  $4,150.72

P- £ 00
dN’” A0V o
L- [Yes. 0

plp- § 3257 %
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GS5T Reg. No. 19-9607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL

50 RAFFLES PLACE
#05-01/06

SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623

Ref : CS/SMO18009623/Ksd3n2

Date: 24-08-2018

Code : SMO

AN

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. FS 7288U Veh. Inspected SKQ 4895M
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1802249/NSW Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  GRACE TEO Assign Date 28/05/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDAFIT (A) c.c 1317
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. GK33003958 Colour RED
Odometer 63993 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |175/70 R14 YOKOHAMA amm
L/H Front Tyre |175/70 R14 YOKOHAMA 9 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |175/70R14 YOKOHAMA 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 175/T0R14 YOKOHAMA, 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE WEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/05/2018 Inspection Date 30/05/2018
Survey held at  OFTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD
OA SERANGOON NORTH AVE 5
SINGAPORE 554500
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




y

A,

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 193607198R GST Req. Mo. 19-9607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKQ 4835M

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Page No.:1 of 2

Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Worksh ni:B[;} ﬁi}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR TAILGATE LOGO EMBLEM MECESSARY 24 60 24 60
1|{REAR TAILGATE FIT EMELEM NECESSARY 3480 34.60
1|REAR TAILLAMP LH MTG CRACKED 4593.30 493.30
2|REAR TAILLAMP CLIPS LH @$5.80 NOT MECESSARY 11.60
1|REAR TAILLAMP INNER PANEL LH TO REPAIR SEE 109.70 -
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER CRACKED/ 803.80 803.60
BUCKLED
1|REAR BUMPER GARNISH LH SERVICEABLE 29.50 -
14|REAR BUMPER CLIPS @$%6.80 NECESSARY 95.20 95.20
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER UR @3$25.50 N/S DISTORTED 51.00 25.50
1|REAR BUMPER INNER SIDE SHIELD LH SERVICEABLE 49.20 -
3|REAR BUMPER INNER SIDE SHIELD CLIPS LH @$6.80 NOT MECESSARY 20.40 -
1|REAR END PANEL BENT 3a70.10 370.10
1|REAR END PANEL INNER TOP GARNISH SERVICEABLE 96.60 =
4|REAR END PANEL INNER TOP GARNISH CLIPS @$5.50 |NOT NECESSARY 22.00 =
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -442 B8 -369.38
1,770.72 147752
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN} SHORTED 280.00 200.00
280.00 200.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REPLACED WITH PANEL BEATING ALL 800.00 600.00
ACCIDENT PORTION.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF
REAR TAILLAMP INNER PANEL LH.
TOPUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING WIL SEALANT ALL 800.00 600.00
ACCIDENT PORTION.
TO TUFF KOTE/ANTI-RUST. 60.00 40.00
TO CHECK WIRING LIGHTING & WATER LEAKAGE £0.00 20.00
TO DISMANTLE & REINSTALL REAR INTERIOR CARPET 280.00 150.00
COMPOMNENT TO FACILITATE REPAIR.
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACED REAR BUMPER REVERSE 80.00 50.00
SENSOR.
2,100.00 1,460.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,150.72 3,137.52

Report Ref No. CS/SMO18009623/Ksd3n2
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Page No..2 of 2
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | 3,137.52
Report Ref No. CS/SMO18009623/Ksd3n2
KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser




