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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

§1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi indusinal Park, Singapore 408933

TEL 8256 3561 FAX G258 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 18-8B07198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHARTIS BUILDING

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD

78 SHENTON WAY #08-16

Ref : CCB/AIG1BO0SE13/Deb3

Date: 28-05-2018

LT

SINGAPORE 079120
Code: A&IG
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh,  SGT 1313C Veh. Inspected GBF BEGEK
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 28/05/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model C.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Req.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
RIH Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/05/2018 Inspection Date 25/05/2018
Survey held at TAN LIM MOTOR PTE LTD
51 DEFU LANE 10
SINGAPORE 538218
Ba. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
BiIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




Pai == 1EDT E )

AlGAsia Insured's Veh No : SGT1313C TAN LIM MGTOFI PTE LTD

Date of Accident : 18 May 2018 51 Defu Lane 10 Singapore 539216
Tel - 68585151 ( 24 Hours )  Fax : GBS80877

GST Regn. No. : M2-8922054-2

Messrs Ten Dollar Salon Hub Date : 23 May 2018

Estimate To Repair GBFS86EK - NISSAN NV200 1.5L MT ABS AIRBAG 2WD &
Chassis No : VSKYBAM20Z0135771

SMNo | Cuantity Description Amount
LIST ITEMS
01 |1pc rear bumper Ol lad el $ 450.00| —
02 |1pc nfs rear bumper reflector »y 1 4500 X
$ 495.00
Less 30 % $ 148 50
$ 346.50
LABOUR & MISC. CHARGES
01 Panel beating, knocking and straighten the necessary portion, B 450-80| Lo | -
remove and renewal of parts, adjust and realign the same.
02 Putty and spray painting of the affected portion. $ 500-00 | 200 |~
5 950.00
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.;

Vehicle to be Exparted:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQPF Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Business
0870B

GBFBBGEK

Yes

21 May 2018

NISSAN

NV200 1.5 MT ABS AIRBAG 2WD 60R E5S W/RC
White

2016

KZKC400D056154

VSKYBAM20Z0135771

$20,261.00
09 Dec 2016
09 Dec 2016
1

$1,014.00

Mo

$0.00

08 Dec 2026

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$39,933.00
$31,944.00
$31,9446.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 21 May 2018

OK



Asher S"E (LKKAuto)

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com=>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 August 2018 4:22 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your ref; 47809505375G-003, ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGT 1313C (Ol) & GBF BB66K
(TP) ON 1B8/05/2018

Attachments: SGT1313C.MP4

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Hi Asher

Reference to above Ol video.

Pls proceed to reject TP claim since it is clear TP reversed into insured’s stationary vehicle.

Best Regards

Bennie Tan

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

74 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(b5) 6419 1718| Fax +{65) 6835 7416

Bennie-WZ.Tan{@aig.com | www.aig com.sg

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, August 07, 2018 11:06 AM

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: 47809505375G-003, ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGT 1313C (OI) & GBF 8866K (TP) ON 18/05/2018
Hi Bennie,

We refer to the above matter.

Please kindly let us have your approval / instruction if any,

Thank You.

Best Reqards,



Asher Sng | Case Hondler
LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone: 48414050 | emall ashersng@kkoulo.oom | los: 5741-4108
Fik 51 Poya Ukl Industricl Park. Ul Avenus |, #02-25 | 5[408¥33)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 31 July 2018 4:14 PM

To: 'Tan, Bennie-WZ' <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: 47809505375G-003, ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGT 1313C (Ol) & GBF 8866K (TP) ON 18/05/2018

Hi Bennie,
We refer to the email below.
Enclosed insured video footage for your easy reference.

Thank You.

Best Reords,
Asher Sng | Cose Handisr
LEK Auto Consultants Pe Lid

phonés AB41-4051 | amail: gshersngBlkkaylo.com | lox 674)-4108
Bl 51, Paya Ul Induwitdol Pork, Ubl Avenoe 1, #02-25 | S[408%33)

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-W2Z Tan@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 June 2018 5:42 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrens@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: 47809505375G-003, ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGT 1313C (01) & GBF 8866K (TP) ON 18/05/2018

Hi Asher

Before assessing further to this case, kindly advise if you have obtained OI's video footage mentioned in his GIA report
for our consideration.

Best Regards

Bennie Tan

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +{65) b419 1718| Fax +(65) 6835 7416



Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSngi@ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, June 21, 2018 12:20 PM

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your ref: 47809505375G, ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGT 1313C (OI) & GBF BB66K (TP) ON 18/05/2018

Your ref: 47809505375G
Our Ref: CC6/AIG1B009613/Deb3

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGT 1313C (Ol) & GBF 8866K (TP) ON 18/05/2018

We refer to the above matter.

TP reported that Ol move off from stationary while he was reversing out from the parking lot and hit his rear partion.
Ol reported that TP reversed out of the parking lot and collided into his stationary vehicle.

Based on both party report third party vehicle reversed out of the parking lot, we are of the opinion that liability Is not
in third party favour.

In view of the above, we are intending to reject TP claim.

For your approval/ comments/ instruction.

Thank You,

Basl Reqords
Asher Sng | Case Hondler
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone: 4841.6051 | email: gshensng@lkkouto.com | lax: 674 1-4108
Bk 51, Payo Uik Industricl Park, Ukl Avenue |, #02.25 | 5(408933)
IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply”
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is

3



received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or

damage arising in any way from its use.



Asher Sna (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 30 August 2018 10:57 AM

To: ‘Johnsan Chua'

Ce: caymen@timotor.com.sg

Subject: RE: Check Liability - TLM Ref: TP027052018; LKK Ref: TBA; Accident involving GBFBE66K
(TLM) 8 SGT1313C (AXA) on 18.05.2018

Attachments: SGT1313C.MP4; Ol SKETCH PLAN.pdf

Without Prejudice

Hi Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We attached here with a copy of our insured’s accident statement and video for your easy reference.

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client reversed and hit
into our insured stationary vehicle,

We are of the opinion that liability is not in your client’s favor.

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable
to look into your client's claim.

Thank You.

Besl Regonds,

Asher Sng | Cose Honciler

LEK Auto Consultanis Ple Lid

phone: 484 1-6031 | emoil: oshespogillkkauto.com | lox 674 1-4108
Blk 51, Paya Up! Indusiial Pork. LBl Avenue |, #02-25 | S{408%33)

From: Johnson Chua <johnsen.chua @timotor.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 30 August 2018 9:36 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: caymen@timotor.com.sg

Subject: Check Liability - TLM Ref: TP027052018; LKK Ref; TBA; Accident involving GBF8866K (TLM) & SGT1313C (AXA)
on 18.05.2018

Importance: High

Hi Asher,
We refer to your email below
We update us on the status of this case.

Regards,



Tﬂﬂlim Tan Lim Motor Pte Lt

0, +B58558 51HM 51 Defu Lane 10
Johnson Chua F. +B5B858 0877 Singapote 536218
ohnson.c [.COMm.Si hittp
Confidantiality Notice: This email {including any altachmeants) is ntemded fob the ESipients) named above arel may contan nfermation bl s cerfidential i Tan Lim
Pl Lid. fny usa of (he infomation (noluding, bt nel imitod to, total o parial reproduction, distritaution or dessminaiion i aay form) by persons othar than the nlandod
rocifrimis) m prohibied 1 you sne oot an inlended recipent of ihis emal, pleass nolify the sandor immediately and defele it ¥Whilie Tan Lim Mator has gt in place anll

pIOGrEms. we oo nat accen! raspansibility Tor any damage caused by vinases passad on unwithingly

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 31 July 2018 3:35 PM

To: Johnson Chua <johnson.chua@tlmotor.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@lkkauto com>

Subject: RE: Check Liability - TLM Ref: TP027052018; LKK Ref: TBA; Accident involving GBF8866K (TLM) & 5GT1313C
(AXA) on 18.05.2018

Without Prejudice

Hi Johnson,

We refer to the email below.

We are still pending for our insured video to revert the liability.

Thank You.

Best Regords,
Asher Sng | Cose Handler
LEK auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone; 68414051 | emoil; gshersng@lkkouto.com | fax: 674 1-4108
Bl 51, Paya Ubl Ingustticl Park, Ubl Avanue |, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Johnson Chua <johnson.chua@timotor.com.sg»

Sent: Tuesday, 31 July 2018 2:11 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Check Liability - TLM Ref: TPD27052018; LKK Ref: TBA; Accident involving GBFBBEEK (TLM) & 5GT1313C (AXA)
on 18.05.2018

Importance: High

URGENT
Dear Asher,
We refer to our email below.

\We have not received any reply from your office so far.



Please reply to us latest by 03.08.2018 (Fri). Otherwise, our client will take over the conduct of this matter
through his solicitors.

Regards,

Tan Lim Motor Pte Lt

O, +66 8858 5151 51 Defu Lane 10
Johnson Chua F.  +65 6858 0B77 Singapare 539216
johnson.chua r.com. e Limglor.com.

Confidentiality Motlee; Thi= email (ncluding any attachiments| | intended for the reciplentia) namad gbove and may comain formintion (hat is conbdeniiai lo Tan Lam
P L1 Anvy uge-of the nfarmation (incieding, but nod limited to. totil or padal reprodochion, dissributicn or desssmminshion in any farm) by permons ofhar tan b slehdes
fecipiEntis) i5 prahibited, If you are nat an inlended recipiant of this amei. pleass nolly the sender mmediately and deleds i1 While Tan Lim Motor has pot i glaceant

progrims. v do nat accept responnibility for any demage caused by viuses pagsed on unwitfingly

From: Johnson Chua [mailte:jehpson.chua@timotor.com . sg]
Sent: Friday, 25 May 2018 4:07 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>; "Admin A’ <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Check Liability - TLM Ref: TP027052018; LKK Ref: TBA; Accident involving GBFEB6EK (TLM) & SGT1313C (AXA)
on 18.05.2018
Importance: High

Dear LKK,
We refer to the above matter.
Survey has been conducted on 25.05.2018.

As such, please reply within 4 working days whether you are agreeable to direct settle with us at 100%
liability on this matter.

Regards,

P
mnl Im Tan Lim Motor Pte Lt

Q. +65 6858 5151 51 Defu Lane 10
Johnson Chua F. +B58858 0877 Singapare 539216
jphnson.chua@timotor com.sg Hwoww lmotor com.
Confidentinfity Motice: This emad (ncluding any offachments) & intandéd for the melplants) namid above and iy condain nl:urm.;:u- thait I confidentiol to Tan Lim

Ple Lid Ay use of the information (induding but not imited (o, total or parial reproduction, distribution or dessemination in ary farm) by parsons athar U the Iitend
reciplantfs) & probibiied If you gre nol an Intended reciplent of this amail. ploate natify the sender immadiataly and delete i Nihile Tan Lim Motor kas gl in place antl
progeeEms, we do net sccepl responsibility forany damage caused by viruses passed an umaithingly



Merimen e-Claims

Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Reavoked / Mo settlement

(CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case  |Noufied Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned | Adj Rpt Ad] Submirted Ins Auth'ed SaEus
s 31 May 2018 ;3?.;"' MME | sep50.00 $$650.00 peiiing for Bureey
in 4 3
- _Etﬂ%eg | Edit Adj Rpt I Edit Estimates I View Rpt I - Cancel Case I

Reference

Claim Detalls

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

Ingured:

AHMAD DAHRY, [D: 526563071

| [Created by adjuster]

Main
Claimant:

TEN DOLLARS SALON HUB, Co. Reg. No.: 530508708

Vehicle Reg.
No.p

Claim Type:
"l"l."h'lﬂ!'-ii:‘.';

GBFBBGEK

| 18/05/2018 12:00 - :59

Date of Los5: | 137 Months and 9 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr]]

TP / 478095053756

Policy/Cover

Note N | 2100485156 {Comprehansive)

5GT1313C

Palicy Mo,

{Claimant): | A290SE023MKC

[ Excess:

Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltd (Defu) 51 Defu Lane 10, 535216 Defu Lane - Tel: 6858 5151

Handling
[REMIT:

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (Express) - Tel: 65-6410-3000 .., [Handled by Tan, Bennle-WZ - 6419 171E] Bennie-

WL Tan@aig.com

|Claimant's
[Insurer; |

MS5IG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: +55 6827 7888

(Adjustar:

| LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 .. [Handled oy BRYA

% TANI] ... [Final Rpt due 07/06/2018]

;A-EE’DCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

View All I EnmpnsctutHall-I‘

‘There are no mall for this case.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™

View All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Compiete |

Due Dats
No results.

Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler MAssigned By Completed On Created On Done?

https://singapore.merimen.comv/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_c... 3/9/2018



Merimen e-Claims

Upload bocuments |  Upload Phatos | Compose tew Letter |  Uptad video | Uplond audia |

Page | of 2

Claim Documents

*GBFBBG66K (47809505375G)
[SGT1313C]
™
TEN DOLLARS SALON HUB
May 18 2018 12:00PM
[AHMAD DAHRI]
Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltd

Ivideo 1perpoge v
[No |Finaiized On AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. (SG) | Thumbnail | Print
|1 [07/08/18 16:08 | DI Video - Accident o 0 | Loadmea

|

Photos/Images == o |3 per page ~]| &
{No_|Relabel/Reorder |LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) hasmbel Brint
1 |30/08/18 11:11 General View 0 | odec |
2 30/08/1811:11 | General View o © | Ladws | (4
3 3081811111 | General View - - . | @ | Loadies | A
|4 [30/08/18 1111 | General View © | lLoadc | A
is ID/OB/18 11:11 | General View 0 | taaws | 4
|8 |aanan'stins: @aRaitang | © | o= | B
7 30/08/18 11111 | General View O | ladic | (A
5 3008/1811:11 | Genersl View © | cacwc | o
‘9 |30/08/1B 11311 | General View O | aavc | J
10 |30/08/18 11:11 General View B '@ | wadirc | 4 |
11 30/08/16 11:11 | General View - _ O | e | M
12 ianmsnaﬁu Genaral View B o 0 | tcedies | M
13 |30/08/18 11:11 General View 0 | oadws | B
14 [I0/08/18 11:11 | General View 0 | leadirc |
15 |30/08/18 11:11  General View = © | oadies | B4 |
16 [30/08/18 11:11 ,mn_m B € | adiec | A
17 |30/08/18 11111 | General View . o ﬁ Load 1PG __E_
18 30/08/18 11:11 | General View O | Lo | @&
|19 [30/08/18 11:11 General View 0 | tsadws | [
20 30/0B/18 11:11 | General View O | weswe |
{21 30/08/18 11:11 General View E Load 317G | W
22 [30/08/18 11:11 | General View B © | oodwc | 4
|23 |30/08/18 13:11 General View D | tadwe |
24 |30/08/18 11:11 | General View O wadws | &4
25 [30/08/18 11:11 Odometer Reading B O | adws | &
2&___3-0#0:5;:;19 11111 | Chassis Number E Load PG | A
Documentation 1 per page w1 [
o |Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall Print
|1 130/05/18 09:01 TP ESTIMATE- MARKED = = = ‘_8 Load POF | |
2 30/05/1809:01 | TP GIA REPORY toad POF | |
Mo Finalized On AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. {5G) Thumbnall| Print|
‘1 [31/05/18 10:33 | O GIA REPORT - | @ | Load POF l
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico reqno1sssoriser)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CCB/AIG1B002613DEB3N2

Date: 03/09/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid,  Paolicy No; 2100485156
Clalmant Vehicle GarsseeK Insured Vehicle No : SGT1313C
Date of Loss: 18/05/2018 Natura of Claim: TP Claim No: 478095053756
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: GBFBBG6K
Make & Mode!: NISSAN NV200, 1.5 D ABS AIRBAG 2WD BDR (M) Engine No: KSKC400D056154
Reg. Date: 08/12/2016 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis No: VSKYBAM20Z0135771
Colour, White Odometer: 48200 km
Engine Capacity: 1461 cc
Market Valua/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S%): Market Value/New Car Price
| F T 1] Y
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable). Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake {Sarviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 175/70 R14C Rear Tyre Size: 17570 R14C
Front Left Side: Goodyear 8 mm Rear Left Side: Goodyear 8 mm
Front Right Side: Goodyear 8 mm Rear Right Side: Goodyear 8 mm
The above values reprasent the remaiming lyre frosds depth
GESTDF CLAIMS - ~ Repairer's Adjuster's Difference DIff %
Parts 346.50 315.00 31.50 8.09
Miscellanecus llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 850.00 500.00 450.00 47.37
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 1.296.50 B15.00 481.50 37.14
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 650.00
(SS) 1,266.50 850.00 648,50 49 87
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (58) 80.76 45.50 45.26 48 87
Nett Amount (S$) 1,387.26 695.50 691.76 49.87
Global Sum Settlement (55) 0.00
NSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 25/05/2018
Date Inspecled: 25/05/2018 Inspected At Tan Lim Molor Ple Lid (Defu)
51 Defu Lane 10
Singapare 539216
Estimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days
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Adjuster: BRYAN TANI Manager: Asher Sng RongYi

NOTE: This rapar! reprasents our findings al the time and place of inspection slated hersin. Such inspachion hes been camed ouf fo the bes! of our
khowledge and sbility but any other iabiity under any other circumsatances is heraby expressly gacluded

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_p... 3/9/2018



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR BUMPER Deformed 450.00 FL *450.00 FL
2 1 *N/S REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR Not Necessary 45.00FL *-FL
F=Franctise part L=Listhamsc.
Sub Total (53%) 485.00 450.00
- List Item Discount on L Items 30.00/30.00% (5§) 148.50 135.00
Total Parts (5§) 348.50 315.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no naw miscellansous ltems selectod.
Recommended Labour
Ne Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 PANEL BEATING ,KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTEN THE New 450.00 300.00
NECESSARY PORTION ,REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF
PARTS ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME
2 PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED PORTION New 500.00 200.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 950.00 500.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out,

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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