Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CT1 <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 6 September, 2018 9:08 AM

To: Vie (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Jowyn Tay; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Alfred Toh

Subject: RE: <SEEK MAMNDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKF9843M [(OL
SNM18D02636C02/3) AND SGGE194P (TP : LKK REF - CCe/CTIL8009514/Uha3) on
24/05/2018

LKK REF - CC6/CTI118009514/Uha3
CTI REF -~ SNM18D02636C02/3 (SKF9843M)

Dear Vic

We refer to your email of 5 September 2018 pertaining to the above matter.
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $10,332.00.

We await your payment advice to enable Jowyn to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: +6563896182

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sqg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh{@sg.cntaiping.com
www.sg.cntaiping.com

ANNIVERSARY
I SI.III'PHIIIIM 1938

Disclaimer

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid. except
where provided for in a written agreement between vou and Ching Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If vou are not the inmtended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediately.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, September 05, 2018 7:17 PM

To: Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@Ilkkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh
<alfred.toh®@sg.cntaiping.com>



FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67465405 / 67465376  Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

DATE : 16.06.2018
China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pte Lid
3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleal Tower
Singapore 079909

Attn: Motor Claim Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE: SGGO194P AND SKF9843M ON 24.05.2018

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no: SGG6194P | which was involved in
the captioned accident with your insured vehicle no:  SKF9846M . The vehicle owner has requested and authorized

us to assist him in presenting his'her claim against the partv responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
your consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

1} Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST) s 9.630.00
2} Loss Of Rental 8 T00.00
3) GIA Search Fee % 2.00

b 10,332.00

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:

a) Final Repair Invoice b) Vehicle Registration Log Card
¢) Rental Agreement/Invoice d) 'C & Driving Licence
¢) Insurance Certificate i) GIA Report/ GIA Search

g) Letter of Authorisation, etc...

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our customer’s claims
as soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank you. ¥

Y ours faithfully, /

Jason Tang (Jasonf@fasfechauto.com.sg)
For Fastech Auto Pie Lid
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A1 UBIAYE 1, #00-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (063) 625363501 FAX {65 RISALDIS
Our Ref: CC6/CTI18009514/Uha3

11 JUNE 2018

YAK ENG TIO By Post and By Email
BLOCK 551 CHOA CHU KANG STREET 52

HDH-33

SINGAPORE 680551

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKF 9843M / SGG 6194FP / OTHERS ON 24/05/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

/\

'}

f F
Vic Alpeh
DIR: 6841 2096
FAX: 6741 4108
Email: vicalpeh(@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
{Motor Claims Dept)
engtio(@iora.com.sg / yuki_8117@yahoo.com
fEmail)




Vic (LKKAuto)

e e e e A L S L AL L R T

From: Vic (LKKAUto)

Sent: Monday, 11 June, 2018 11:02 AM

To: engtio@iora.com.sg

Cc yuki_8117 @yahoo.com; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref: SKF 9843M_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKF 9843M / SGG 6194P / OTHERS

ON 24/05/2018

-" ! / Auto

oo Rty Conswitants
el BB B Fe Lid

51 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62363561 FAN : (65 HL56451 5

Our Ref: CC6/CTI18009514/Uha3

11 JUNE 2018

YAK ENG TIO By Post and By Email
BLOCK 551 CHOA CHU KANG STREET 52

#06-55

SINGAPORE 680551

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKF 9843M / 5GG 6194P / OTHERS ON 24/05/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further gqueries.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

B 74 P
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SLSR2%  NE Suve the Larthe Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient, Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any aftached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all altachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



DATE : 241 Maj 208 \L
i aypun_ I‘Ihll \
C WiteLte S.»‘*:} Jr

TO . China ’T.fa?fi”\‘] i

RE - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. ©O6LHRP  CIBFabeE51T|

i SEpqo92m

ALONG BKE  fugsets ok lowas

I/We, W\er-aisvaran (o P snnusam A

of (NRICNo./ROCNo.) 51541722

of_BIK 938 Hounpnn St 90 #14-29 55309

SGG 6194 in consideration of M/s FASTECH AUTO
PTE LTD repairing my/our vehicle S5 (1741 g my/our instruction and hereby
authorise M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD to demand claim settlement whatever

amount settled/payable by the Insurance Company and/or third party or to commence legal

owner of vehicle no.

proceedings, if necessary, under my name, for the cost of repairs, car rental and/or loss of use,

etc. and to their appointing solicitor to act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and
all claimed and/or settled shall belong to them absolutely.

I/We further agree and undertake to indemnify them against the above-mentioned claim cost
which may arisen therewith.

Jirj- ¥ 1 ‘ /“ f
Signature of Owner : / fﬁ“-{%-"f;/
L GouARAne S{v  JonNuim'y

Name of Owner :




(e

is Discha ar dnphes only to the claimant’s claim

- Eﬁn@s;ﬁ;ﬂg?@uﬁﬁsg p;m will _,rnm a_ﬁﬁct his ?ersnr-naal
injurics claim andior uninsurad lesses ciaim in a later daic.
Further, the saitlemant terms harein shot id nol be used as an
Evidence to prejudice to ing claimant's personel injuries d?."r""
andfor other uninsured losses claim ansing af "2

subject matter in this action.

MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Polioy No @ DMPCSN30AT1IA1702 Claim Mo : SNMIEDOZEI6CO2/I{SKFIRAIM)
Claimant = MARGISVARAN S5/0 PONNUSAMY
Amount i 5510,332. 00
SINGAPORE DOLLARS TEN THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED THIRTY TWO
ONLY

I/We agres Lo accept the above mentioned amount to be paid to mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries J/ damages
sustained by me/us through an accident invelwving

Claimant Venicle Na. 0 565 651347
Insured Vehicle Na, : SKF 3B43M
Dace of Loss 124 .05.2018
Place of Accident i BEE TOWARDS ELE

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementicned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE}) PTE. LTD., I/We agree absclutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/or

Insured Name : YAR ENG TIO
Driver Name r SUCK CHOOI YOKE

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss; injury or damage
sustained by me/us arising out of the said accident.

I acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIFPING INSURAMNCE (SINGAPORE} PTE. LTD.

(1] General Damages 55
(2] Cost of Repair/Excess 55 8,630.00
(3] Loss of UsafRental/Earning 55 700,00
{4} GIA/Folice Reports/
Investigation Results/Search Fees 55 Z.100
(5} Medical Reports/Expenses 55
(&) Survey Fees/P.T. Fees 55
{7} Cost including Disbursement 5%
TOTAT: o o o & = 36 & % M 55 & & & @ @oas 10, 332.00

Claimant Mame : Mctfjismmrl E/G ﬁ(’]‘ﬂﬂuﬂﬂﬁﬂc No : LS Ir5r+ :_fl BEH

vy

Signature : Date

i S€pt b
|




TAX INVOICE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax.Reg No: 200006262D

Tax Invoice : 20310
China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pte Lid

3 Anson Road Date: 16.06.2018
#16-00 Springleaf Tower Vehicle No:  SGGH194P
Singapore 079909 Make/Model: HYUNDAI ELANTRA

Accident Date:  24.05.2018
Attn: Motor Claim Department Claim No ; 0518-20310
Reference T

Policy Mo

Amount

To proceed on lump sum repair 58 9.000.00
E.& O.E. Total ; 5% 9.000.00

GST @ 7% : 5% 630.00

Amount Due - SS 9,630.00

for FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

All Invoices are subjected to GST



DYNAMIC CAR RENTAL

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-46 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 6741 7244 / 6746 5405 Fax No: 6745 8520 / 6746 5786
Co. Reg No: 52928467K

To: MARGISY ARAN S/0 PONNUSAMY Invoice : DCR-2018-05-24

Date : 31.06.2018
Agreement Mo @ 20024
Payment Term:: LOD

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Rental charges for vehicle : SLH7586X | 0518-20310 ) 5 700.00
Rental Period from 24.05.2018 to 31.05.2018
E.&O.E. Total s 700.00
MAMNCY LAM

for Dynamic Car Rental



Dynamic Car Renta

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6. #01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY, SINGAFORE 417883,

TEL: (+65) 6741 7244, 6746 5405 FAX: (+65) 6745 8520, 6746 5786
Co. Reg. Mo. 52828467K

RENTAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

{ R -t -05-Lf

No. 20024

a REG, No.
Name . MAKE MODEL [P A \D
b
|_q Mmlivarﬁ*l 5ZD Ponn uging |3LH71[33L‘F':- —gjﬁﬁ il !

ADDFESS U | | DIESEL | PETROL | E |14 | 112|314 | =
KN T OATE & TiMR IN
ke 2] S8 @ lpm
KM DATE 711r.JE auT 1
ouT 2LHSE @ 9. y5pm
KM TIME USED I
DRIVEN

NAMED DRIVER

DRIVING LICENCE NO DATE OF EXPIRY | PLACE OF ISSUE HOURS | @58

PASEPORT NO DATE OF ISSUE PLACE OF ISBUE T oavs |@ss [p D 100

ADD NAMED DRIVER WEEKS | @88

DRIVING LICENCE MO DATE OF EXFIRY PLACE OF ISSUE MONTHS | &a8

FASSPOAT NO DATE OF ISSUE PLACE OF IB5UE BY INITIALLING, RENTER | SUB-TOTAL 700
AGREES TO PAY ADD FEE
FOR COLLISION DAMAGES | i

IMPOATANT NOTES: WAIVER {C.DW.)

This vahicle s licenced 1o carry 04 passengers only

Mo refund will be given for vehicle retums aasty. TOTAL RENTAL

to refund will ba given for period laft In vehicie,

Hirar 5 Rabla 1o pay first $2000 under saction | & I in any accsdent plus loss of aarnings while DELIVERY FEE

damaged vahicha s undar repakr

Hirar 15 lable 1o pay all parking fes and traflic summonses. COLLECTION FEE

Wehicle return during office hour anly
Mo Sarvice an Pubkc Holiday and: Sunday.

ADDITIONAL CONDITIONS:
* Geographical aress: Singapors & West Malaysia
* Dhriver must ba:

a) 18 years ald and above,

b} hotding a valid relevant class of driving licenss,

= Andibonal Own Damage Excess of 551,000 is applicable for ary namad/unnamed drivers
who
a) age 22 1o 23 years oid;
b) &g 68 10 70 years obd,
o) with driving experiencea of 1 year 1o less than 2 years in Singapore on the relevant classes
of drving license

* Additional All Clalme excess of 552,000 is applicable for any named/unnamed deviars who:
a) k= 18 years old 10 21 years old andfor
b3} b3 71 years old and above andfor
) with driving experience of less Uran 1 yaar on he reéevant classes of driving license.

Upan returning the replacemant vahicle, you must ensura that all expensave and importamn
Hems o be removed away fram this replacement vahicle. We/l will not be responsible for
any reporting al such losses.

" Hirer g able to pay first $2000 under sacticon L& Il inany accident plus loss of earnirg while
damage vehicle Is under repair,

Hiral = responsitin for Adcibone! 52, GO0 00 Excess
o the THIRD PARTY DAMAGE | INJLIFY clauns

X

PER DaY PER WEEK

& § £

PER MONTH

BY INITIALLING. RENTER
AGREES TO PAY ADD FEE

FOR PERSONAL ACCI DENT
INSURANCE (P.AL)

X

PER DAY
g

PER'WEEK P
$ 5

ER MONTH

PHEPAYMENT

TOTAL CHARGE

CHECK

DERPQSIT

CASH

RECEIPT NO,

NETT CHARGE

AMOLINT QUE [ REFUND

| HAVE READ THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS ON BOTH SIDES
OF THIS RENTAL AGREEMENT AND AGREE THEREQF.

SIGNED BY THE PARATIES HERETOD ON THE oo i it fumaniisrmastsim s amsis sl 1 imbia s i meesim s

X

DYNAMIC CAR RENTAL

Foneont? 7

RENTER'S/DRIVER'S SIGNATURE




Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Si 048580
INSURANCE Phu?'le?iﬂﬁ 83524 0010 F;I:fig?jrgzzfl- 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to 5pm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-079770
Date of Request: 25/05/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 25/05/2018

Enquiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan

TF Vehicle Ma, SKF9843M

Accident Date 24/05/2018

Enguiry Result

TP Wehicle No.  |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. Mo,
SKF9843M China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 280071201 7-26/07/12018 6389 6111
Thank You,

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the cantra by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no hability whatsoever for any

loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images,

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cim?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp ... 25-May-18



invoice

GENERAL

Qur Ref No: GR-18-079770
Date of Reguest: 25/05/2018

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Lid
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

INSURANCE
ASSOCIATION

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday S8am to S5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Singapore 417883

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 25/056/2018

Enguiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan

TP Vehicle No. SKF9843M

Accident Date 240052018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT {S3%)

TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 013
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO [] Cash [ ] Chegue

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp ... 25-May-18



