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Company Registration No 198407 198R

2] UBEAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UEL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE HIKY33 TEL 1 1065) 62563561 FAX : (065] 254315

Your ref: PLEASE ADVISED

Our ref: CS/GATI8009486/R1vb

The Motor Claims Department

Date: 25/5/2018

M/s GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY

Dear SirMadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SEM 77398

We thank you for your instruction on 23/5/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

24/5/2018 at the premises of M/s
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
"Check" Items Amount
Markel Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear portion,

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMMED RASUL
Automotive Assessor

PERFORMANCE MOTORS LTD

: §%16,290.85

: 8%7,794.00

1 8%2,671.60

5%

: 5%

: 8%




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Friday, 25 May 2018 2:32 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT- SFM77395 AND YL2472Z (GA) ON 22/05/2018
Attachments: SEM 77395 PRELI REVISED.PDF

CLMOMVCDO0003257

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <yeronchen@lkkauto.com=

sent: Friday, May 25, 2018 2:02 PM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel. Tan@sg.gaig.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [External] RE: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT- SFM77395 AND YL2472Z (GA) ON 22/05/2018

Dear Rachel,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SFM 77398
Date of survey: 24/5/2018
Number of days: 6 days

Please provides us the claim number.

Best Regards,
Vveron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 23 May, 2018 1:41 PM

To: 'Tan, Rachel' <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>; 'PBSP' <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Cc: 'LKK Assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT- SFM77395 AND YL2472Z (GA) ON 22/05/2018

Dear Rachel,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

1



From: Tan, Rachel [mailto:Rachel.Tan @sp.gaig.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 23 May, 2018 11:37 AM

To: PBSP <pml-phsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Cc: LKK Assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT- SEM7739S AND YL2472Z (GA) ON 22/05/2018

Without Prejudice
Dear Caroline

Rased on description of accident, liability is not in our (YL2472Z) favor.
As requested, we will appoint LKK to conduct TP survey.

Dear LKK, please assist. Attached estimates (1pg) and TP GIA report.

Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

From: Ngian, Kelvyna

Sent: Wednesday, May 23, 2018 11:16 AM

To: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>; Tan, Rachel <Rachel. Tan@sg.gaig.com>
Subject: RE: REC FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT- SFM7739S AND insd YL2472Z ON 22/05/2018

Hi Rachel

Kindly assist

Thanks
Kelvyna

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, May 23, 2018 9:18 AM

To: Ng, Sharon <Sharon.Ng@sg.gaig.com>; Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com=>
Subject: [External] REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT- 5FM77355 AND YL2472Z ON 22/05/2018

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

We have instructions from our client to seek repair cost and loss of uselcar rental from you through Direct Settlement.
Attached is the estimates and supporting documents for your consideration.

Please let us have your confirmation that you agree that liability is clear and we may proceed with Direct Settlement.

If Direct Settlement is approved, kindly let us have your offer for LOU / rental.



Thank you. 5

Regards,

Caroline

Clo Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 6318 0174 Fax: 6479 4601

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the
named addressee ("the Recipient") and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or
proprietary to the Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws.
If you are not the intended Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding
and/or printing the Message. Please notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete
all copies of the Message. Sime Darby disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the
Message being infected by computer virus or other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions
expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and do not necessarily represent those of Sime
Darby's.”

The content of this c-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. T vou are not the inended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, of copying of this e-mail is stricthy prohibited. I you receve this message in error, ploase notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solehy for the addresses. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised thal any use, dissemination, distribution, or COpying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immadiately by reply emall and destroy the message and its attachments,



Veron Chen (LKKAuto) 3

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 25 May 2018 2:01 PM

To: 'Tan, Rachel’

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT- SEM77305 AND ¥L2472Z (GA) ON 22/05/2018
Attachments: SFM 77395 PRELI REVISED pdf

Dear Rachel,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SFM 77398
Date of survey: 24/5/2018
Number of days: 6 days

Please provides us the claim number.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d @Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 23 May, 2018 1:41 PM

To: 'Tan, Rachel' <Rachel.Tan@sg. aig.com>; 'PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg=

Cc: 'LKK Assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT- SFM77395 AND YL24722 (GA) ON 22/05/2018

Dear Rachel,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkayto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 S(408033)

From: Tan, Rachel [mailto .Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com]

sent: Wednesday, 23 May, 2018 11:37 AM

To: PBSP <pml-phsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Ce: LKK Assignments <assignments@ |kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT- SFM77395 AND YL2472Z (GA) ON 22/05/2018

Without Prejudice



Dear Caroline

Based on description of accident, liability is not in our (YL2472Z) favor.
As requested, we will appoint LKK to conduct TP survey.

Dear LKK, please assist. Attached estimates (1pg) and TP GIA report.

Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

From: Ngian, Kelvyna

Sent: Wednesday, May 23, 2018 11:16 Al

To: PBSP cgmI—Qh5g@simedarby,mm.sg>; Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan{@sg.gaig.com=
Subject: RE: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT- SFM77395 AND insd YL2472Z ON 22/05/2018

Hi Rachel

Kindly assist

Thanks
Kelvyna

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, May 23, 2018 9:18 AM

To: Ng, Sharon <Sharon. Np@sg.gaig.com>; Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>
Subject: [External] REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT- SFM77395 AND YL2472Z ON 22/05/2018

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

\We have instructions from our client to seek repair cost and loss of use/car rental from you through Direct Settlement.
Attached is the estimates and supporting documents for your consideration.

Please let us have your confirmation that you agree that liability is clear and we may proceed with Direct Settlement.

If Direct Settlement is approved, kindly let us have your offer for LOU / rental.

Thank you.

Regards,

Caroline

Clo Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 6318 0174 Fax: 6479 4801



Catherine Chnns (LKK Auto)

From: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 23 May, 2018 11:37 AM

To: PBSP

Ce: LKK Assignments

Subject: RE: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT- SFM7739S AND YL2472Z (GA) ON 22/05/2018
Attachments: SFM7739S.PDF; SKM_558e18052309140.tif

Without Prejudice
Dear Caroline

Based on description of accident, liability is not in our (YL2472Z) favor.
As requested, we will appoint LKK to conduct TP survey.

Dear LKK, please assist. Attached estimates (1pg) and TP GIA report.

Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

From: Ngian, Kelvyna

Sent: Wednesday, May 23, 2018 11:16 AM

To: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>; Tan, Rachel <Rachel. Tan@sg.gaig.com>
Subject: RE: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT- SFM77395 AND insd YL2472Z ON 22/05/2018

Hi Rachel

Kindly assist

Thanks
Kelvyna

From: PBSP <pml-phsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, May 23, 2018 5:18 AM

To: Ng, Sharon <Sharon.Ng@sg gaig.com>; Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg gaig.com>
Subject: [External] REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT- SFM77395 AND YL2472Z ON 22/05/2018

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

\We have instructions from our client to seek repair cost and loss of use/car rental from you through Direct Settlement.
Attached is the estimates and supporting documents for your consideration.

Please let us have your confirmation that you agree that liability is clear and we may proceed with Direct Settlement.

If Direct Settlement is approved, kindly let us have your offer for LOU / rental.



Thank yo'u.

Regards,

Caroline

Clo Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 158941

DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the
named addressee ("the Recipient") and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or
proprietary to the Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws.
If you are not the intended Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding
and/or printing the Message. Please notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete
all copies of the Message. Sime Darby disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the
Message being infected by computer virus or other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions

expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and do not necessarily represent those of Sime
Darby's.”

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this c-mail is sirictly prohibited. If vou receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 10 September 2018 10:37 AM
To: PBSP: Rasul (LKKAUto)

Cc SUR; Keith Leo Chi Yung

Subject: RE: FINAL REPORT / SFMTT7395

Dear Caroline,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirm $8.427.20 before GST @ 6 working days.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE

Best Regards,
Vveron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Keith Leo Chi Yung <keith.leo.chiyung@simedarby.com.sg>

sent: Thursday, 6 September 2018 12:24 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com>; PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>; Rasul (LKKAuto)
<Rasul@Ilkkauto.com=>

Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINAL REPORT / SFM77395

As requested

Warm Regards

Keith Leo

Body & Paint
DOol: 63190172
FAX: 6479 4601

THE NEW BMW 2 SERIES

ACTIVE TOURER = [
AND GRAN TOURER: B *

Find out more

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments (“the Message") is intended only for the named addressee
{"the Recipient") and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the Sime Darby group of
companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the intended Recipient, you are strictly
prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message. Please notify the sender immediately by return
e-mail and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime Darby disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising
from the Message being infected by computer virus or other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the
Message are solely those of the author’s and do not necessarily represent those of Sime Darby's.”

1



From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) i@ilm:vemnchen@lkkaum.cum]

Sent: Thursday, 06 September, 2018 10:46 AM

To: PRSP <pml-phsp@simedarby.com.sg>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com=; Keith Leo Chi Yung
<keith.leo.chiyung @simedarby.com.sg=>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: FINAL REPORT / SFM77395

Dear Keith,

Kindly forward us photos:

1) REAR BUMPER CENTRE GUIDE
2) REAR BUMPER CARRIER (ECE)

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

sent: Tuesday, 4 September 2018 4:51 PM

To: 'PBSP' <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com=>; Keith Leo Chi Yung
<keith.leo.chiyung@simedarby.com.sg>

Subject: RE: FINAL REPORT / SFM77395

Dear Keith,

Kindly forward us check items and supplementary photos.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 5256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 September 2018 4:23 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FINAL REPORT / SFM77395

Dear Rasul and Veron

We refer to the above and attached Final Report.



Please confirm COR as follows:

Total Labour : 5,510.00
Total Parts : 2,917.20
Total Labour & Parts : 8,427.20

Thank you.

Regards,

Caroline

Clo Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 65318 0174 Fax: 6478 4601

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the named
addressee ("the Recipient") and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the
sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the intended
Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message. Please
notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime Darby
disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being infected by computer virus or
other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and
do not necessarily represent those of Sime Darby's.”



Performance Motors Limited

A menber &f the Sime Darby Group
Co. Eeg. Hpo. L37401555W GST Reg He M2-0020081-%

TN Dealer

280, Kampong Arang-Road
Zagt Coast Centre
Singapore 43IBLE0

Tel 3130888 {AfrerSaled]

363, Aleyandra Road

Sima Darby Performantce Centre
Singapore 16541

Tel, 63130100 (Sales & Adnini

315, Rlexandra Road

Sime Darby Business Centre

Singapore 152344
Tel. 63130328

|AEzerSales)

£3190533 /530 (Motocrad)

53190111 (mfeerSaleal Fax &1439TT2 Fax., 4796601 {Afcersaleg]
Fax G4 T4TTTO EATSERZ4 iMotorrad)
GST REG. NO : M2 - 0020081 - X
ESTIMARTE
73 MAY 2018
'_Es1:imate No. : bl 47037 Page No. 1 of 2
Date Estimated : 22/05/2018
| Prepared By : Gary Poh Chai Hoon
(~ ESTIMATE REPAIR FOR - - ACCOUNT - 40000
Kemral Durgadas Shetty Cash Sales - Service
Blk 305 Bukit Batok Street 31 Singapore
#08-89
. Singapore 650305 y
{ REGN. NO. CHASEIS HNO. REGHN. DATE MODEL MILEAGE
SFM77395 NS37629 30/07/2014 316iAa/4 0
DESCRIPTION P

To Replace rear bumper,bootlid tail panel and attachment

knocking cause by the accident
- 7
| o - 7 -
Painting rear bumper bootlid, tail panel | trunk floor ,
left rear fender , right rear fender
q q

To carry out body cavity preservation.
{Per panel}.

To carry out body cavity preservation.
(For cul panel).

To check electrical wiring systems and lightings at the
rear section for proper function,

Sundries.

fyec

Y 7 53100

(5o o
?0 };e.‘ﬁ

Total Labour 1 11,043.00
DESCRIPTION oTY ERIC VALUE
BOOTLID 1 120480 B4 7 120480
TAIL PANEL 1 582 25 W 592 25
RR BUMPER BOTTOM REINFORCEMENT 1 66.10 ¥ /"’- 66.10
REAR BUMPER CENTRE GUIDE 1 32.10 LR/ a5 40
REAR BUMPER CARRIER (ECE) 1 432.90 M/ 7. 43290
REAR BUMPER PANEL PRIMED BASIS 1 1,100.25 e~ 1,100.25
REAR BUMPER LH SIDE GUIDE 1 57.05 st T 57.05
REAR BUMPER RH SIDE GUIDE 1 57.05 3 2 57.05
MODEL LETTERING 318l 1 62.55 AT e Y62 55
GROMMET 2 0.75 A #7150
PLAQUE 74MM 1 59.50 e <5950
TRUNK LID GASKET 1 76.40 A pam )75 40
DECOUPLING RING PDC TORQUE CONVERTE 4 5.05 M S 2020

L PDC SENSOR MINERALWEISS (A96) 4 38880 A~" 147520 )

4.

o,




iy Cealer

Performance Motors Limited

A menper of che Sime Darby Gooup
ca, Reg. Wa, 197401559W GST Reg. Ho MX-0030081-X

315, Aleaxandra Road

Sine Darkby Business Centre

Singapore 159944

Tel, 3150528 (AfrerSales)
3190533 /5830 (Mororrad)

|Afrersales)

(Metorrad]

30%, Alexandra Road A0, Eampong Arang Road

Gime Darby Pertormance Centroe East Coast Centre

gingapore 159941 gingapore 438180

Tel 6110100 (Sales & Adminl Tal. 63190888 (Aftarsales)

E3445T7T] Fax. £4796601
54796424

631150111 (AfterSales] Fax.
Fax, 64747770

GST REG. NO : M2 - 0020081 - X
ESTIMATE

|
l

L

Estimate No. : bl A7037 Fage No, 2 of 2
Date Estimated ; 22/05/2018
Frepared By : Gary Poh Chai Hoon )
REGN. NO. CHASSIS NO. REGN. DATE MODEL MILEAGE
SFM77398 NS37629 30/07/2014 316in/4 0

Total Parts 5,247.85

l6, S3€ J

Labour 1 11,043.00 ]
Parts 5,247.85
Labour 2 0.00
Excess 0.00
Total GST @ 7% 1,140.36
Grand Total 1?!431_21

"

| =~ THIS ESTIMATE IS VALID FOR A PERIOD OF 30 DAYS ONLY™

-+ PRICE FOR PARTS ARE SUBJECTED TO CHANGE WITHOUT PRIOR NOTICE **



Performance Motors Limited

A b ol 90 Sime Dartry Qi
Ca. Reg. M, 157401 235, 5T Reg. ba AP0 X

FINAL REPORT

Estimuie Mo bl 47037 Page Mo
Dat e Estimmled : 22/05/2018

Prepared By - Gary Poh Chai Hoon

REPAIR FOR - - ACCOUNT - 148376
Kemral Durgadas Shetty Great American Insurance Company
Blk 305 Bukit Batok Strest 31 3 Temasek Avenuse

#08-88 #16-01 Centennial Towaer

Singapore 035150
Singapore 650305

FEGH WO CHASSI 5 ND RE(M [ATE MIDEL M LEACGE

SFMT7395 N537629 30/07/2014 316in/4 0
DESCRIPTION QRIGINAL FRICE DISC. % METT
To replace rear bumper and attachments, boot lid include 2550.00 2,550.00

making good the tail end panel and knocking cut dents
caused by the accident

To spray paint rear bumper, boot lid and tad end panel 239900 2,399,00
Ta carmy out body cavity preservation. 100.00 100.00
{Per panel).

4 Toremove and install boot compartment carpet and 231.00 23100 (M)
gamish 1o facikitate repairs
To check electrical wiring systems and lightings at the 150.00 150.00
rear section for proper function.
Sundries. A0.00 80.00
DESCRIFTION UNIT PRICE aTy  DISC. % METT
BOOTLID 1,204.80 1.00 1,204.80
REAR BUMPER CENTRE GUIDE 3210 1.00 3210
REAR BUMPER CARRIER (ECE) 43290 1.00 432,20
REAR BUMPER PANEL PRIMED BASIS 1,100.25 1.00 1,100.25

# REAR PDG HOLDER SET * 23.10 1.00 2310 LA
GROMMET 075 200 1.50
PLAQLE T4MM 69,50 1.00 69,50

# (DGISL) ADHESIVE SET KE * 53.05 1.00 53.05

# SUPPLEMENTARY ITEMS

Total Labour ; 5,510.00
TotglParts: == 291720
Total Labour & Parts B427.20
Deduction for Excess : =

Tote Repair Costs less Excess: B427.20
GST@7%: ~ _588.90
Grand Total : 9,017,170

Final Report SFMTT395, Page 1 Finalised by: Carcline DID: 63190174 Fax 64794801



Performance Motors Limited
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SUPPLEMENTARY

Page Mo.

Estimate Mo b1 47037

Cate Estimated 22/05/2018

Prepared By Gary Poh Chai Hoon
EEPAIR FOR =

Kemral Durgadas Shetty

plk 305 Bukit Batek Streat 31

#08-89

Singapore 650305

- ACCOUNT - 148376

creat American Insurance Company
3 Temasak Avenue

#16-01 Centennial Tower
Singapore 039150

FEGN WO CHASSE 5 MO WMIEL M LEACE
SFMTT3958 HE37629 316in/4d 0
DESCRIFTION ORIGINAL PRICE DISC. % NETI_

# Toremove and install boot compartment carpet and

garnish to facilitate repairs

DESCRIPTION

# REAR PDCHOLDERSET *
# (DGISL) ADHESIVE SET K6 *

Final Report SFM7 7395, Page 1

231.00 231.00 /’
UNIT PRICE Qry DISC. % NETT
23,10 1.00 23.10M o
53.05 1.00 53.05 kst
Total Labour : 231.00
Total Parts : 78,135

Total Labour & Parts

30715

Finalised by: Cargline DID: 631590174 Fax 64794601



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
61 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapaore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4313
Reg, Mo: 199607198R GST Reg, Mo. 19-9607 198-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY Ref - CS/GAI18009486/R1vbn2
RN
#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER Date: 11-02-2018
SINGAPORE 039190
Code : GAl
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YL 24722 Veh. Inspected S5FM 77395
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CLMOMVCDD0003257 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From RACHEL TAN Assign Date 231052018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model BMW 3161186 c.c 1588
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. WEBAIATE040NSITE2D Colour WHITE
Odometer 68671 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R18 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 CONTINENTAL & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R18 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 205/60 R16 CONTINENTAL & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR F"ORTIDPI
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  22/05/2018 Inspection Date 24/05/2018
Survey held at PERFORMANCE MOTORS LTD
303 ALEXANDRA ROAD
SINGAPORE 158941
5a. Remarks
ATHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

6 Working Days

]ESTLMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

&1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SFM 77395
Estimate Qur Adjusted
Oty Description of Parts Condition Worknhopagl} tSj}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BOOTLID (SN) BENT 1,204.80 1,204 80
1| TAIL PANEL {SN) TO REPAIR SEE 592 25 -
LABOUR
1|rRR BUMPER BOTTOM REINFORCEMENT (SN} SERVICEAELE 66.10 -
1|REAR BUMPER CENTRE GUIDE (SN} CRACKED 32.10 32.10
1|REAR BUMPER CARRIER (ECE)ISN) BENT 43290 432 80
1|REAR BUMPER PANEL PRIMED BASIS (SN) DEFORMED 1,100.25 1,100.25
1|REAR BUMPER. LH SIDE GUIDE (SN} SERVICEABLE 57.05
1|REAR BUMPER RH SIDE GUIDE (SN) SERVICEABLE 57.05 -
1|MODEL LETTERING 316! (SN) NOT NECESSARY 62.55 -
2| GROMMET (SN) MECESSARY 1.50 1.50
1|PLACQIUE T4MM (SN) NECESSARY £9.50 £9.50
1| TRUNK LID GASKET (SN) NOT NECESSARY 76.40 -
4|DECOUPLING RING PDC TORQUE CONVERTE (SN} NOT NECESSARY 20.20 =
4|PDC SENSOR MINERALWEISS (A96)(SN) NOT NECESSARY 1,475.20
1|REAR PDC HOLDER SET (SN){ADDITIONAL) MECESSARY 23.10 23.10
1|(DG/SL) ADHESIVE SET K& {SN)(ADDITIONAL) NECESSARY 53.05 53.05
1|SUNDRIES (SN) NECESSARY 150.00 80.00
5,474.00 288720
LABOUR
TO REMOVE AND INSTALL BOOT COMPARTMENT 231.00 231.00
CARPET AND GARMISH TO FACILITATE REPAIRS,
(ADDITIONAL)
TO REPLACE REAR BUMPER,BOOTLID, TAIL PANEL AND 5,100.00 2,550.00
ATTACHMENT KNOCKING CAUSE BY THE ACCIDENT.
PAINTING REAR BUMPER,BOOTLID TAIL PANEL TRUNK 4.967.00 2,3959.00
FLOOR LEFT REAR FENDER RIGHT REAR FENDER.
TO CARRY OUT BODY CAVITY PRESERVATION (PER 118.00 100.00
PANEL)
TO CARRY OUT BODY CAVITY PRESERVATION (FOR NOT NECESSARY 531.00 =
CUT PANEL).

Report Ref No. CS/GA|18009486/R1vbn2




' Vd 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl Y= ey 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
/—!-! TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607188 GST Reg. Mo. 10-0607108-R Page Mo 2 of 2
Description of Parts Condition Estimate By | Our Adjusted

Y 3 Workshop S)  (5)

TO CHECK ELECTRICAL WIRING SYSTEMS AND 177.00 150.00

LIGHTINGS AT THE REAR SECTION FOR PROPER

FUNCTION

11,124.00 £.430.00

GRAND TOTAL 16,598.00 8,427.20

[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | 8,427.20|

Report Ref No. CS/GAI18009486/R1vbn2

M ‘g‘
MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Automotive Assessor B.Eng, AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:: This Report is made solaly for the uss and benelit of the Client namsd on the fron page of this Repor.

Mo llability of responsitility whatsoever, in centact or tort, Is
Beport, 0 whose or in pas, dees so at his or her cwn sk,



