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MOTOR SPORT PTE LTD

F -

Bik 3007 Ubi Road 1 #01-448 Singapore 408701

Tel 67488717/8

Fax 67416718
Our Ref 11012017/M5

Date: 11 January 2017

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTELTD
#04-205 iob Building
Singapors (048711)

To: Motor Vehicle Accident Claim Depl.

Dear SirMadam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVED WITH FBJ5762A AND SHD3684Z

CR No. 198002311
GST No mmﬂﬁéﬂmmmw
Reparer of the lollowing:

1= reirory belore'afr sgray paniing

» T Sapluy damaged past(s) duning rescevey

* Party ohees ae subjoct 1 confemation

= Trord pany survey @ on B Withoul Preputics” basia

* b ilagal ~oafcaton(s) & sicwsd
mﬂl“h:w-

Azincwlaggmd ty Rupaser
e

We will requested by our client FBJ5762A to claim against vehicle SHD3664Z which

you are the insurer.
The damages Is as balow:-

FRONT COVER ‘-*’t
LH FRONT COVER SIDE
LH BRAKE LEVER -,;'"
HANDLE BAR % -1
LEGSHIED .~ M
LH SIDE SKIRT .~ NS
LH SIDE SKIRT EMBLEM 75 ’
LH SIDE SKIRT REAR - MM
LH FOOT FLOOR BOARD —~~
10 LHPILLION FOOTREST .~ AR
11 AR FILTER COVER -~ ot
LH ENGINE COVER .~ l|

- Gk

0m -~ bR -

SIDE STAND -~
MAIN STAND -
REARBOX .~
SPRAY PAINTING
LABOUR CHARGE

\BT

LH ENGINE COVER FRONT COVER (BLACK) .~

$239.00
$39.00
$47.00

' $108.00
$103.00
$144.00
$8.00
171.00
$54.00
$33.00
$40.00
$115.00
$25.00
$20.00
$88.00

- 00

et .

33333338383338388483

220 $28000 SET

IS0 $180.00

—__$1,970.00

TOTAL

We attach the Singapore Accident Statement for your reference.

We would appreciate that you assign a surveyor tc our designated address above soonest

poet by gt

1558

Thank you Aﬂf’(’”’ 'I"I-f""" Pl\rf'u; .

Yours faithfully, Guo (R Oy — hfser §2
’ Dlws .

Herbert T \ 17 %S

Manager
Mobile; 96638118

Bfer 241 . < (255

1X3

-

4



Vic (LKKAuto)

e ——— e —————

From: kymco <kymco@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 15 February, 2020 11:57 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: Picture after repair for FBIS762A *** LKK REF: CC4/117000881/Gha3q2-1
Attachments: Credit Authorisation Form jpg; Express Settlement.jpg

Dear Vic,

Kindly refer to the attachment for the credit settlement.
Let us know if you need any assistance.
Thank you.

Herbert Teh
Manager

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, February 14, 2020 4:26 PM

To: kymco@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Picture after repair for FBI5762A *** LKK REF: CC4/11117000881/Gha3q2-1

Without Prejudice
Dear Herbert,
We refer further to our below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability to our
Insured’s part, we have our principal’s mandate and we offer below amount to settle your client’s claim.

Cost of Repair {w/gst) S 1,742.17
Loss of Use [S30 x 3 days) 5 90.00
Subtotal 5 1,832.17

@50% S5 916.09
LTA Search Fee 5 535
TOTAL $ 92144

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV then forward back the original signed hard copy to us
(LKK) together with a copy of the GIRO FORM for payment processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to MOTOR SPORT PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without
prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our

1



MOTOR SPORT PTE LTD

Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1, #01-448
Singapore 408701
Tel 87496717, Fax 67416719
Co's Reg. 1880023110
GST Reg. M2-0093053-3
Date' 21 Feburary 2017

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD
#04-#05 10B BUILDING

Singapore 049711

Motor Claim Dept.

Dear SirfMadam,

3rd PARTY CLAIM FOR FBJST62A

We are claiming the repair for the above motor scooter FBJSTE2A as below:-

1 Repair as Invoice. 21022019 £ 81410
2 GST™® -] 56.00
3 LTA search fee 5 5.35
4 Lostof use 3 days @ $30.00 S 80.00
Total Ciaim 396644

Attach is the Invoice and DV voucher and LTA search fee for your reference.

If you have any doubts, kindly contact me at 96638118

Thank you.

Yours truly,




MOTOR SPORT PTE LTD s NN
BLK 3007 UBI RQAD 1

#01-146, SINGAPORE (408701)

TEL +8587406717 FAX 8567416718

CR No 1980023110 GST Reg No M2-0093053

— - INVOICE -
Cuslomer N
MName INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD Date 21102017
Address  HDA-#05 icb hUILDING Order No
Caouniry E'W‘ P code g4a7T11 —r
MOTOR CLAIM DEPT : 3
aty | Description UnitPrice |  TOTAL |
*  |FRONT COVER O 230.00
1 LH FRONT COVER SIDE CENTER L w00 |
1 LH BRAKE LEVER 1 47.00
1 LEGSHIED i 103.00
1 LH SIDE SKIRT £ 144.00
1 LH SIDE SKIRT REAR | § 171.00
+  |LH FOOT FLOOR BOARD | 8 54.00
| 'LH PILLION FOOTREST |8 3300
1 |AIR FILTER COVER (1 40.00
1 LH ENGINE COVER i 11500
1 |LH ENGINE COVER FRONT COVER (BLACK) $ 25.00
t | SIDE STAND 5 2000
1 MAIN STAND 5 BB.0D
1 REAR BOX $ 280.00
TOTAL [ . 1,398.00
LESS 10% § 139,80 |
TOTAL 5 1,250.20
1 SPRAY PAINTING ] 220.00
LABOUR CHARGE ] 150.00
TOTAL § 162820 |
LIABILITY 50% 3 814.10 |
TOTAL GLAIM $ #1410 |
|
ACCIDENT GLAIM FOR FEJSTEZA ,
| [ | SubTolnl | $814.10
Payment Delails [
o Cash
o 710
@ Others #VALUE!
BANK:
BRANCH :

ACCOUNT NOS:




MOTOR SPORT PTE LTD

Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1, #01-446

Singapore 408701
Tel: 67496717, Fax: 67416718
Co's Reg. 1880023110 GST NO. M2-0083053-3

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

|/We, hereby declare that I/\We have examined my/our vehcle after repair by
Motor Sport Pte Ltd of Blk 3007 Ubl Road 1 #01-446 S(408701) and I/We satisfied that they
have carried out he repairs and replacement of the parts as per the repair bill or lump sum
repair to my complete satisfaction.

Please payto _ MOTOR SPORT PTE LTD whao is
autharised lo receive the above payment on my behalf.

Date and time of the collection 02 "D\ \"(\ “;;df Lt

* 1
Vehicle nos. FBJS762A
Name of Claimant: YEO ZHI XIANG, JACKSON Signature %
NRIC NO S8838261G 5
proda a0 M2-b8) S(123)
Name of Witness TEH SIN CHIN Signature §Y
NRIC NO S1508841F "\
Tel No. 96638118

Address BLK 3007 UB! ROAD 1, #01-446 S(408701)




. Display Receipt Page 1 of |

T |..I|-.T,«-1Ix1-.‘-i"- Pl

Land Transport 3¢ Authority

Land Transport Autharty
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapare STET01
GST Regmstraien No Ma-0006525-2
Prinl Data/Time ; 12 Jan 2017 / 08 52.52
Receipt DmaTime 12 Jan 2017 1 085252
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receint Ng  LTACT-0B8S-170112-000010
Previcus Rasept No
SiN Item Description/ Amount GET Amount
Business Transaction Reference Belore Amount After GST
Na. GST (5%) (55} {5%)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SHDIE64Z
As 8108 Jan i‘ﬂ‘l?ﬂ‘-ﬁ.g
irsurance Co: INDIA INTLING PTELTD
1 Insurance Enguiry - SHOAGS4Z
Enquiry Fas 500 0as 538
26170V 2085226655324
Sub-Toul 500 03% 535
Towl Bafore Rounding 500 035 535
Rounding Differance 000
Total Amount Payable 53
Paud By
Cash 836
Totsl 535
Caah Changs ood
Tendered Amount 505
Excess Refundable Amgunt Do
THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Flease ensure htlummnmwthtlumﬂwlumodlndmmlmﬂmhmmmtuniu
pravider | linancial institution, nﬂm.hmu::gnnﬂnumhmlduldvﬂdwinm
may apply.

| PriniReceipt |[OK|[ SaveasPDF |

Tﬂdlh rﬂ" IL B ? =
xoM - ggr VOU ot

roe4i)

e Vit famSy

i B 108

hitps/vri-ilink. ltn.gov.sg/ta/vilaction/completePayment ?FUNCTION_ID=F1 01001, 1212017



211472020 Merimen a-Claims
Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

“FBJ5762A (MCT17010180)
[SHD36642)
™

YEO ZHI XIANG, JACKSON
Jan 6 2017 8:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD)
Moltor Sport Pte Lid - Ubl

From india International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (I_SG), sent on 14/02/2020 12:23 PM.
To LKK_HO
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$921.44) - FBJ5762A - Claim Handler: Pool Chin Han Danijel

Approved:921.44,

hitps //singapore. merimen.com/claims/index cfm?lusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_PrintACFID=670617008CFTOKEN=a1dc3fBleal5bles-8A.. 11



MOTOR SPORT PTE LTD

Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1, #01-446
Singapore 408701
Tel 67496717, Fax: 67416719
Co's Reg. 198002311D GST NO. M2-0093053-3

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/We, hereby declare that |/We have examined my/our vehcle after repair by
Motor Sport Pte Ltd of Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1 #01-446 S(408701) and I/We satisfied that they
have carried out he repairs and replacement of the parts as per the repair bill or lump sum
repair to my complete satisfaction.

Pleasepayto = MOTOR SPORT PTE LTD who is
authorised to receive the above payment on my behalf.

Date and time of the collection » e ol B [, 34

Vehicle nos. EBJ5762A

Name of Claimant: YEO ZH| XIANG, JACKSCON Signature o L
NRIC NO $8838261G ;

Adress A 21 Pvecect Kd g ja-6ft £(H{ve7 )
Name of Witness TEH SIN CHIN Signature

NRIC NO S1508641F 7

Tel No. 96638118

Address BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1, #01-448 S(408701)




Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settleament

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case | Motihed Eut Submitted | Adj Assigned [Ad) Apt {4d) Submitted | Ins Auth'ed Status
: Pending for Survey
‘ o120 2007 o adad S$1,620.20 58162820 ot

Main

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]

Insured: COMFORT TRANSPORTATIDN PTE LTD, Co Feg, No: 1993038218

a":“m: YEO ZHI XIANG, JACKSON, 1D: SEEIBISIG

o™ | FBIS762A Dets of Loss: g’m“u:m“: l’:ﬁmﬁ From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r}]
Claim Type: | TP / MCT17010180 | ""'m'“'ﬁ“"" MCOMDO 16

N | osssez ml MC/00219919/02

{trsured)

Excess
Repairer: Maolor Sport Pte Lid - Ubl (HQ) BLE 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-445, 406701 Ubi - Tel:
Indis International Insursnce Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 .. [Handled by Pool Chin Han Dankel ]

Direct Asia Insurance [Singapore) Pte Ltd (HQ] - Tel: 65322868
A juster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 5256-3561 . [Handled by XING GUO QIANG] ... [Final Rpt due 03/06/2019]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED Vigw All | l:tmpuul:lunllij

o [I_SG (14/02/2020): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (S5921.44) - FRJ5762A - Claim Handler: Pool Chin Ha...
o [N_SG (18/01/2017); Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved ($%0.00) - FEIS762A - Claim Handler: MATALTE LEE

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view 4l | Searcy Tasis | Comate New Task | comgiete |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handier Assigned By Completed On Cruated On Dana?
No results.

https://singapore.mernimen.comy/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=ds... 2/3/2020



Mernimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*FBIS762A (MCT17010180)
[SHD3664Z]
™

YEO ZHI XIANG, JACKSON
Jan 6 2017 8:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Motor Sport Pte Ltd - Ubl

Page 1 of 2

View [V in Srowser| v |

Video

No | Finalized On India International Insurance Pta Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
i |so/osyeasi3s | Videe - Accident © | Lood Mea
Photos/Images Gpwone 5] @
tin | Aelabel/Recrder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |17/01/17 11:23 | Chassis Number 0| Leadws | A
I 17011711123 | Ganeral View @ waws | B
3 |17/01/1711:23 | General View B arc | A
4 [17/001711:31 | General View | tocrws | A
§ 1701171123 | General View @ | adres | B4 |
& |17/01/17 11:21 | Genarsl View Q| lsaws | A
7 170117 11:23 | Genarsl View Q| toadies | B
B |17/01/17 11:23 | Genaral View @ | aws | A
8 |17/00/17 11:23 Ganeral View 0| lcadirc | &
10 (17/01/17 1123 | General View 0| lcadrs | A
11 |17/01/17 11:23 Ganeral View 0 | leedirs | A
12 [17/01/17 11:23 | General View O | waaws | B
13 17001717 11:23 Ganeral View )| woaws | A
14 |17/00/17 11:23 General View 0| ledirc | A
15 [17/00/1711:23 | General View 0| airs | A
16 [17/01/17 11:23 | Genaral View O cvs | 2
17 [17/01/17 11:23 | General View @ | iooaws | B
18 |17/01/17 11:23 | General View 0 | 1ooaws | A
19 |17/00/17 11:21 General View | leadirs | &4
0 100117 11:23 | General View 0 lccaws | B
21 |17/0117 11-23 | Genaral View @ | owdws | A
22 170117 11:23 | Genersl View 0| wawrs | B
23 |17/01/1711:23 | General View 0| weocrs | B4
24 |17/00/17 11:23 General View g load 1pG | B
25 [12/01/1711:33 | General View 0| coars | A
26 |12/01/17 11227 | General View O leadirc | HA
27 |37047 11:33 General View @ woirs | HA
(28 [17/01/17 11123 | Genersl View 0| toodirs | &4
28 (170117 11:27 | General View | loadiro | A
30 [17/01/17 11:21 | Genersl View 0! toarws | B
3 |a70017 11:23 Ganaral View 0| losaws | B |
32 |17/011711:23 | General View @ | acc | 4
13 |17/01/17 11:24 Ganeral View 0| woeaws | M4
34 | 1700017 11:24 General View D loadic | B4
15 [12/00/17 11:24 | Ganaral View @ | leadwc | A
36 |17/01/17 11:34 | General View Q| adws | B
I7 | 37/01/17 1124 General View Q| waws | A
38 |17/01/17 11124 | General View 0| woows | B
38 |17/00/17 11:24 | General View | taaws | A

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_d...

2/3/2020



Merimen e-Claims

Page 2 of 2

Video 1 per pag _E |
ho | Finalized On India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbmnall | Print
lan [17/01/17 1124 | General View O s [ A
a1 [1W01/17 11:38 | Genersl View 0 | icedwc | BA
A |30/05/19 15:11 Reoinspection Photo g Load 176 | B
41 [30/05/1915:11 | Reinspection Photo Q| aws | H
44 |30/05/19 15:11 | Reinspection Photo Q| e | A
45 |20/05/19 15:11 Reinspection Photo 0| wdws | A
46 | 30/05/19 15111 Reinspection Phato 0| werwc | A
|47 | 30/05/19 1513 Rainspection Photo g Loaa G | BA |
46 | 30/05/19 1511 | Relnapection Photo B wews | A
49 | 30/05/19 15:11 | Melnspection Photo 0 | load PG
Documentation I@ "]
No | RelabelfReorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |13/01/17 16:02 | ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL ITI DD 13012017 Load POF

2 |13/01/17 16:02 | TP ESTIMATE & TP GIA REPORT Laad POF

3 16/01/17 10:26 | SAS Alert Accident Involving SHDI6642Z (O1) and FBIS762A (TP) ON 06.01.2017 Load POF

4 [1701/17 11:22 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load POF

5 |001/02/18 11:43 | EMAIL INFORMED TO NATALIE Lowd FOF

6 |01/02/18 11:43 | EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH MOTOR Load POF

7 |12/02/20 11:51 | LTA SEARCH Load POF

8 |owpaen 16:47 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF

8 |00/03/20 16:47 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM @ | Loes roF

10 |02/03/20 16:47 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER Lowd POF

11 |02/03/20 16:47 | GIRD FORM Lgad POF

12 |o/maso 16:47  [LOD Load POF

No | Finaliped On India International Insurance Pis Ltd {HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |13/01/17 17:38 | Singapore Accident Statement-IV Laed POF

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

Resst | Save | e |

There ame no document checklists configured.

Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid {HQ)

Show Remarks Tor L Handling Insurer
Mot BEmasen g prvate v v shew 8 i olhes parten

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_d... 2/3/2020



Adjuster Report

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co regne 1essorisen
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapora 408933

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 5844-8805 Email sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@kkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No:  CC4/1l117000881/GHA3Q2-1

Date: 02/03/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer- India Intermational Insurance Pte Lid  Policy No MCOMOD16
Claimant .
Vehicle No : FBJSTB2A insured Vehicle No : SHD36642
Date of Loss: 06/0172017 Mature af Claim: TP Claim Ne: MCT17010180
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: FBJSTE2A
Make & Model: KYMCO XCITING 400, 399%¢cc Engine No. HIDDEN
Reg, Date: 2210712014 (Man. Year: 2014) Chassis No: RFBDG0010E3300130
Colour: White Odometer: 26677 km
Engine Capacity: 389 cc
Market Value/New Car NIA
Price:
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable); Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes

Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Fronl Tyre Size: 120/T0 -15 Rear Tyre Size: 150/70-14
Front Left Side Metzeler 4 mm Rear Left Side: Metzeler 4 mm
Front Right Side: 0 mm Rear Right Side: 0 mm
The above valses represent (e FemMairng Iyre neaas dopm
\COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Pans 1.510.00 1.258.20 251.80 16.68
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 480.00 370.00 90.00 18.57
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 1,970.00 1,628.20 341.80 17.35
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$) 137.90 113.97 2383 17.35
Nett Amount (S§) 2,107.90 1,742.17 365.73 17.35
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x $$30,00/day) (S§) 80.00
(s§) 1,832.17
Liable Amount {50.00%) (S§) 816.09
+ Doc/Search Fee (S§) 5.35
Nett Liability (S$) 921.44
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment:
Date Inspecled: 13012017  Inspected Al Motor Sport Pie Lid - Ubi (HQ)
BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-446
Singapore 408701
Estimated Period of Repair:

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=ge... 2/3/2020



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: XING GUO QIANG Manager: VIC ALPEH

NOTE. This report repreasnts our findings af the lime and place of ingpection stafod hemen. Such inspection has been camied oul o Me best of our
knowledge and ability but any afer lalilily under sty other croumstances is hemby sxpressly secluded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference |
Part Source: {Last Synchronised: 12 Feb 2020)

Parts: N/A, KYMCO XCITING 4001 388¢cc (Model not avallable in database)

Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List) |

Print Code: (Unsubmitted. no print-code for FBJSTE2A) |

Validity: These estimales are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimale page

Further Info: ltems/values nat in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *. |

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's  Amount
11 *FRONT COVER Cut 230.00F *238.00FL
2 1 *LH FRONT COVER SIDE CENTER Scratched 3900F *39.00FL
3 1 *LH BRAKE LEVER Bent 4700F  *47.00FL
4 1 *HANDLE BAR *Check 106.00F “FL
5 1 *LEGSHIED Cut 10300F *103.00FL
68 1 *LH SIDE SKIRT Cut 144 00F *144 DOFL
7T 1 *LH SIDE SKIRT EMBLEM Not Necessary 6.00F “FL
B 1 *LH SIDE SKIRT REAR Cut 171.00F *171.00FL
g 1 *LH FOOT FLOOR BOARD Cul 54 00F *54.00FL
10 1 *LH PILLION FOOTREST Broken 33.00F *33.00FL
11 1 *AIR FILTER COVER Cu 40.00F  *40.00FL
122 1 *LH ENGINE COVER Cul 115.00F =115.00FL
13 1 *LH ENGINE COVER FRONT COVER (BLACK) Cu 2500F *2500FL
14 1 *SIDE STAND Bent 2000F  *20.00FL
15 1 *MAIN STAND Bent 88.00F *B8.O0FL
1% 1 *REAR BOX Cut 280.00F *280.00FL

F=Franchise part L=LisiHamDisc
Sub Total (5§) 1,510.00 1,398.00
- List Item Discount on L ltems 0.00/10.00% (5%) 0.00 13880

Total Parts (58) 1,510.00 1,258.20

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out =il
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Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items
Thare are no new miscallaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repalrer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 SPRAY PAINTING MNew 280.00 220.00

2 LABOUR CHARGE New 180.00 150.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 460.00 370.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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