Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 6 June, 2018 10:11 PM

To: CS A Team

Subject: FW: POLICE REPORT FOR SKP2627P ***LKK REF:CC6/11118009390/Amb3
Attachments: LOA.jpg; SKP2627P & SHD6614Z.pdf; invoice.pdf

From: chan pick yuen

Sent: Wednesday, 6 June 2018 10:10:06 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Re: POLICE REPORT FOR SKP2627P ***| KK REF:CC6/11118009390/Amb3

Dear Sir / Mdm,,

Enclosed is our client's GIA report, invoice , LOA .
As request following :

1. RC $4119.50 ( $3850 + 7% GST)
2. LOU S400 ( S100 X 4 DAYS - 3 days recommend + 1 day waiting PRS ( accident on sunday )

@ 100%

Total $ 4519.50

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen
ZEN WERKZ LLP

HP: 92712214

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 23, 2018 4:06 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: POLICE REPORT FOR SKP2627P ***LKK REF:CC6/11118009390/Amb3

Dear Shu Pei,

Enclosed is report .
Please confirm liability . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen



From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 23, 2018 4:02 PM

To: chan pick yuen

Cc: Admin A; Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: POLICE REPORT FOR SKP2627P ***LKK REF:CC6/11118009390/Amb3

Dear Chris,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our insured'’s GIA report.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Bevan at DID: 6749 4274.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Thank you

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris chanbebe@hotmail.com]
Sent: Monday, 21 May, 2018 7:28 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Subject: Fw: POLICE REPORT FOR SKP2627P

Dear Catharine,
SHD6614Z : INDIA INSURANCE

Enclosed is our client's GIA & TP REPORT .
Please arrange Mr Adrian survey our client's car tomorrow morning .
Please check liability & your insured got file report & revert to us asap . Thanks

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen
ZEN WERKZ LLP

HP: 92712214

From: Zen Werkz <zenwerkzllp@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, May 21, 2018 1:23 PM

To: chan pick yuen

Subject: POLICE REPORT FOR SKP2627P

Hi Chris,



Attached FYI



