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£ UV AVE 1, #02-25 PAVA UBT INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 308933 TEL : (065] 62503561 FAX @ (065) 62564315

Your ref: D1B8004070MFSH
Our ref: CS/FCI18009372/T1sd3 Date: 3/9/2018
The Motor Claims Department Without Prejudice

M/s FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear SirfMadam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NOSJG 1834

We thank you for your instruction on  23/5/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

28/8/2018 at the premises of M/s PERFORMANCE MOTORS LIMITED
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : §37.046.05
Revised Estimate Amount : 5%3,520.85
"Check" Items Amount : 551,694.20
Market Value : 8%
LTA Reimbursement Value : 58
Nett Value 158

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the ol
rear portion.

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
M.MATAIL AMSAE-A
Automobile Assessor



H H M5 First Capital Insurance Limited (oReg ho 1950001060 GST Rex Ho. M2 00016759
MS ‘ FITS tca pltal & Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580

Tel: (65) 6222 2311 Fax (B5) 6222 3547
Clalmes & Hotor Undenwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 Gty House Sangapore 0BBATT

Tel: (65) 6507 36848 Fax (65} 6507 3849
wowewi. mefirstcapital.oom.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 22-05-2018 Our Ref No. D18004070MFSH
Accident Date 20-05-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHCO722P Third Party Vehicle. SJG183A
Survey Location 303 ALEXANDRA ROAD SIME DARBY PFERFORMANCE CENTRE
Contact Person. CAROLINE
Contact No. 63190174/ 0 Fax No. 64794601
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:
Appointed

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MNA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Worksho FER ORI IRE Attention. NIL
5 ntion.
P MOTORS LIMITED
Cc ;: TP Solicitor NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge SITHARA,
IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is @ computer generated letter, no signature required.




Sr2af20e

Claim Worklow System

Job Sheet (/ClaimWS/Surveyor/JobSheet/240619) é’; PRI Documents 9 | Close %
PRI Header Details
Claimant
Claim No D18004070MFSH Policy No D-1B0BB937MFSH S.Ne & 1 & PERFORM
Name
PERFORMANCE MOTORS | Survey 303 ALEXANDRA ROAD SIME DARBY PERFORMANCE CEI
Workshop | LIMITED Location -
Nama (Contact Parson : % Contact Mobile: 0 , Phone: 63150174 , Fax: 64794601
‘ E ilId: PML-PBESP MEDARBY, .
CAROLINE) Details ma SP@SIMEDARBY.COM.S5G
our LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS | Instructions | 1oy i1 pREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM *
Surveyor FTE LTD To Surveyor
Insured Insured L1y
CITYCAB PTE LTD SHCO722P Vehicle SJG183A
Name Vehicle No
No
PRI Surveyor Surveyor
Recieved 22-05-2018 03:09:44 PM Appointed 22-05-2018 05:34:47 PM Accept 23-05-20180
Date Date Date
Survey Report Upload
Surveyor SiiayoE :5:::: I
Lnspe:tmn o Report Date | 23°05-2018 Remort | Choose File
ate *: Ry 2T
Vehicle Particulars
Make Please Select Make ¥| | Model Please Select Model ¥ Year 'Select Year "
Chasis No f Engine No | Mileage |
Color ] Cubic = |
Capacity
Multiple Documents Upload
Upload Multiple Documents
File Name Action

Surveyor Job Remarks

| |

Remarks

https:/ficlaims.com:3001/ClaimWS/Surveyor/Details/2406 18 112



Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 November 2018 12:00 PM

To: ‘PRSP

Cc Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR; 'Sharon Heng L K'; 'Toh ling Xuan’; "Keith Leo Chi Yung'
Subject: RE: FINAL REPORT / SIG1B3A

Dear Caroline,
Confirmed final fig of $ 3,600.85 (@ 3 days of repairs before GST.

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Sharon Heng L K [mailto:sharon.heng.leekun@simedarby.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 13 November 2018 10:45 AM

To: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>; Keith Leo Chi Yung
<keith.leo.chiyung@simedarby.com.sg>; Toh Jing Xuan <toh.jing.xuan@simedarby.com.sg>

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINAL REPORT / 5JG183A

Dear Taufikh

Please find attach photos for your perusal :

Best Regards

Sharon Heng

PML — Body and Paint
DID : 63190123

Fax : 64743229

From: PBSP

Sent: Monday, 12 November, 2018 4:05 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto); Keith Leo Chi Yung; Sharon Heng L K; Toh Jing Xuan
Ce: Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: Re: FINAL REPORT / SJG183A



Dear Sharon / Jing Xuan
Please assist to forward photographs since Keith is not in office this week.

Thank you.

Regards,
Caroline

From: PBSP
Sent: Thursday, 8 Novermber 2018 1:54:18 PM
To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto); Keith Leo Chi Yung
Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: Re: FINAL REPORT / 5JG183A

Dear Keith

Please assist to forward photographs to the surveyor.
Photographs not in our shared folder.

Thank you.

Regards,
Caroline

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 8 November 2018 10:37:11 AM

To: PRSP

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: RE: FINAL REPORT / SIG183A

Hi Caroline,

Kindly provide us the before paint photo.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auta Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email; Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: PBSP [mailto:pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 9 October 2018 2:22 PM

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FINAL REPORT / 51G183A

Dear Sirs

We refer to the above and attached Final Report.



Please confirm COR as follows:

Total Labour : 2,014.00
Total Parts : 1,586.85
Total Labour & Parts : 3,600.85

Repair days: 3

Thank you.

Regards,

Carcline

CJo Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the
named addressee ("the Recipient") and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or
proprietary to the Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws.
If you are not the intended Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding
and/or printing the Message. Please notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete
all copies of the Message. Sime Darby disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the
Message being infected by computer virus or other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions
expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and do not necessarily represent those of Sime
Darby's.”



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
T e L ——

—— #
From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 3 September 2018 3:31 PM
To: ‘Claim Workflow System’
Ce: SITHARA@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004070MFSH/1, 5JG 183A
Attachments: SJG 183A PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SJG 183A
Date of survey: 28/8/2018
Number of days : 3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 23 May 2018 2:13 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cec: SITHARA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004070MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg

Sent: Tuesday, 22 May 2018 5:35 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SITHARA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL COM.S5G
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18004070MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

1



Best Regards.

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.
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Performance Motors Limited

A member of the Sime Darby Group
Go. Beg. Moo 19T40XSE9W GET Feg. Mo M2-0020081-X

BMM Dealer

280, Kampong Arang Road 344 El-‘f"'-"‘:“]:"\:: ~
sime Darby Businesn Centre
East Coast Centre e e N
1t re 155%44
1 !

303y ARlexandra Eoad
Elme :\5,:]_?:.' Fer formanca Centee

Singa
PE 1599041

Silngapore 438180 o
=31150100 (Sales & Admini TEl 3480858 |AfterSales) B
B31%0111 (AfrerSales) Fax. S3445773

Fax. B4T4TI7C

AfcerSalen)
{Moborrad)
ales]

E 3530
Fax. SaTHaLLL
EATIEETH

GST REG. NO M2 - 0020081 - X 21
MA
ESTIMATE Y 2018
[ Estimate Ho. : bl 47016 Page HNo. 1l of 2
Date Estimated : 21/085/2018
| Prepared By : Kevin Leong Wai EKit
[ - ESTIMATE REPAIR FOR - - ACCOUNT - 303

Lim Hock Leong
14 Sunrise Lane

MS First Capital
6 Raffles Quay
#21-00

Singapore 04B580

Insurance Limited

Singapore 806475

REGN. NO. CHASSIS NO. REGN. DATE MODEL MILEAGE
SJG183A G245381 12/12/2017 730Li ]
To replace rear bumper assembly & all attachments K So 255000
cause by accident.
Painting on rear bumper assembly y G 4 1,038.00
To check electrical wiring systems at the rear section (59 177.00
for proper function.
it

Sundries. £ /BD.DD

Total Labour 3,845.00
DESCRIPTION OTY PRIC VALUE
REAR BUMPER ADAPTER 1 7765 "7 7765
REAR BUMPER CARRIER 1 B9850 7 898,50
REAR BUMPER CENTRE GUIDE 1 51.50 T 5150
REAR BUMPER CENTRE GUARD 1 84.20 “K 7 B4.20
EUMPER GUARD REAR 1 102.95 7 102.95
REAR BUMPER COVER 1 107.05 7 107.05
TRIM REAR PRIMED 1 21645 1 21645
REAR BUMPER PANEL PRIMED (PDC/PMA) 1 1,586.85 de .~ 1.586.85
REAR BUMPER TOWING EYE COVER PRIMED 1 55.70 « ) 7 55.70
DECOUPING RING PDC TORQUE CONVERTER 4 5.05 w2020

Total Parts 3,201.05

i



Performance Motors Limited

A member of the Sime Darby Group
Cei. Rég. Mo 197401809W 38T Reg, Wo MI-0030081-x

BMM Dealer

303, Alexandra Road

Sime Darby Performance Centre

Singapore 159941

Tel. €3130100° |Sales & Adnin)
IAafterSalas]

280, Eampong Arang Road
East Toast Centre
Singapore 418180
Tal
Fax

§3190111 E3445773

Fax. &47477T0

GST REG. NO

EST

&3190888 [AfterSales)

5

315, Alexansdra Road

Sime Darby Business Oentre

Singapore 159944

Tel. £31R0528 {AfterSales)
§3190533/%20 [HWozorrad]

Fax. 64796601 (afrargales]
G4A7IRED4 [MotorTad|

1 M2 0020081 - X
IMATE

-

[ Estimate No. : bl 47016 Page No. 2 of 2 ]
Date Estimated : 21/05/2018
LPrepared By : Kevin Leong Wai Kit )
s R
REGN. HOC. CHASSTS HNO. REGN. DATE MODEL MILEARGE
SJG1B3A G245381 12/12/2017 730Li 0
LEK Ay onsullants hence notify
the Repa [
= To e airfing
« Parfs prices ara i
= Third party survey s on @ "Wilr rejudice” bass
# No lll=g TWE
» Supplamer itermis) yed ang
5 Subject bo final appraval from Insurance Lompany
Acknowledged by Repamer
Signature:
Dats:
z:a/gﬁ.&
A 9% 49549
BN .
W\ om
\1- L{;{\\ %“r{\hj.\ @{m‘.jﬁ.w._“.
-:;, pii:?sE}.
Fol,.6 ¢
Labour 1 3,845.00
Parts 3,201.05
Labour 2 . 0.00
Excess 0.00
Total GST & 7% 493.22
Grand Total 7.539.27

** THIS ESTIMATE IS VALID FOR A PERIOD OF 30 DAYS ONLY**
** PRICE FOR PARTS ARE SUBJECTED TO CHANGE WITHOUT PRIOR NOTICE **




Performance Motors Limited

& maritnsd oF [ Sirma Cuarityf Groun
B Ang Mo, 1974015508, O5T Ang Mo, M2-{Kp0081-X

FINAL REPORT
Estimte Mo 3 Bl 47016 Page Mo. @
Cat e Estl mat ed ; 21/05/2018
Prepared By : Kevin Leong Wal Kit
REPAIR FOR - = ACCOUNT - 303
Lim Hock Leong MS First Capital Insurance Limited
14 Sunrise Lane & Raffles Quay

#21-00

Singapore 048580
Singapora BOG6475

FEGH N2 CHASS 5 MO FECH DATE NCDEL M LEAZE
SJGLE3A G245381 12/12/2017 T30Li Q
DESCRIFTION ORIGINAL PRICE  DISC. % NETT
To replace rear bumper in removing attachments to 850.00 850.00
facilitate repairs include knocking out dents caused by
the accident
To spray paint rear bumper 834.00 934.00
To check electrical wiring systems at the rear section 150.00 150.00

for proper function,

Sundries. 80.00 80.00
DESCRIPTION B UNIT PRICE QTY  DISC. % NETT
REAR BUMPER PANEL PRIMED [PDCIPMA) 1,586.85 1.00 1,586.85

# SUPPLEMENTARY [TEMS

Total Labour 2,074.00
Total Parts : 1,586.85
Total Labour & Parts : 3,600.85
Deduction for Excess :

Total Repair Costs less Excess: 3,600.85
GST @7%: 252.06
Grand Total 385291

Final Repart SJG183A, Page 1 Finalised by: Caroline DID: 63190174 Fax: 64794607



T Pl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

B BE 51 Lbi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No: 199807T198R GST Reg. No, 19-9607198-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCIB009372M1sd3n2
i?sscﬁsclzﬁlf\? ESL?;EDSINGﬁPDRE 068877 Dies: Ml NHII'IIW'“”N“
Code: FCIZ
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 722P Veh. Inspected 5JG 183A
Policy No. D-1B0BBS3TMFSH Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D1B00407OMFSH Excess (3$) 0.00
Assign From SITHARA Assign Date 23/05/2M8
24 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model  BMW 730LI c.c 1908
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. WBATEDZ0S0G245381 Colour BLACK
Odometer 15547 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Siza Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |245/50 R18 PIRELLI 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/50 R18 PIRELLI & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |245/50 R18 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |245/50 Ri8 PIRELLI & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTIOM.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5. Genaeral Information
Accident Date  20/05/2018 Inspection Date 28/08/2018
Survey held at PERFORMANCE MOTORS LTD
303 ALEXANDRA ROAD
SINGAPORE 1598841
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CiIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR! 3 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJG 183A

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199507198R GST Reg. No. 13-9807198-R

Page MNo.:1of 1

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |, orkshop ($)) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER ADAPTER (SN} NOT NECESSARY 77.65 -
1|REAR BUMPER CARRIER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 898.50
1|REAR BUMPER CENTRE GUIDE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 51.50
1|REAR BUMPER CENTRE GUARD (SN} NOT NECESSARY 84.20 -
1|BUMPER GUARD REAR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 102.95 =
1|REAR BUMPER COVER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 107.05 -
1|TRIM REAR PRIMED [SN) NOT NECESSARY 216.45 -
1|REAR BUMPER PANEL PRIMED (PDC/PMA)(SN) DEFORMED 1,586.85 1,586.85
1|REAR BUMPER TOWING EYE COVER PRIMED (SN) NOT NECESSARY 55.70 -
4|DECOUPING RING PDC TORQUE CONVERTER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 2020 -
1|SUNDRIES (SN) MECESSARY 80.00 B0.00
3,281.05 1666.85
LABOUR
TC REPLACE REAR BUMPER ASSEMBLY & ALL 2,5650.00 850.00
ATTACHMENTS CAUSED BY ACCIDENT
PAINTING ON REAR BUMPER ASSEMBLY 1,038.00 934.00
TCO CHECK ELECTRICAL WIRING SYSTEMS AT THE 177.00 150.00
REAR SECTION FOR PROPER FUNCTION.
3,765.00 1,934.00
GRAND TOTAL 7.046.05 3,600.85
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS 3,&00.85]

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18009372/T1sd3n2

M .

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A MMATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TD THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Repon.
o labiikty of responsibility whatseever, in sontact o ten, is accepted 1o any third g B
Bopod, n whole or in gl does 50 alhis or Dir own sk,




